VERO BEACH . CORAL GABLES

ROSSWAY MOORE SWAN, P.L. THE MODERN ONE BUILDING 2101 INDIAN RIVER BOULEVARD, SUITE 200 VERO BEACH, FL 32960 Telephone (772) 231-4440 Facsimile (772) 231-4430

Mr. Timothy Michaud 1791 Wekiva Drive Melbourne, FL 32940

December 4, 2009

File #: 1682-001 Inv. #: 51917

Total Due:

\$0.00

RE: Post-judgment issues

Please write the FILE number on your check to insure proper crediting.

SUMMARY

*Balance Fwd:

\$0.00

Payment received:

\$0.00)

Current Invoice Amount:

\$0.00

TOTAL DUE:

\$0.00

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	ATT'Y/L.A.
Oct-09-09	Telephone conference with Tim Michaud regarding modification	0.60	105.00	DML
	Meet with Mr. Rossway to discuss proceedings filed against Mr. Michaud by Former Wife	0.20	35.00	DML
Nov-11-09	N/C - Meet with Mr. Rossway and Tim Michaud	0.50	0.00	DML
	Office conference with Mr. Michaud after review of extensive materials concerning North Carolina proceeding and contempt hearings in Brevard County, Florida	0.75	262.50	BWR
Nov-12-09	N/C - Telephone conference with North Carolina attorney Carolyn Peacock's office regarding November 24, 2009 and Mr. Michaud's upcoming hearing	0.40	0.00	DML
	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding him being served with Motion to Set Aside Final Judgment;	0.50	87.50	DML

	review e-mail memorandum received from Mr. Michaud and respond to same		Pag	e 2 of 324
Jv-13-09	N/C - Review voice message from North Carolina attorney Carolyn Peacock and return call; meet with Tim regarding the jurisdictional issues and the Motion to Set Aside Final Judgment served on him yesterday	2.10	0.00	DML
	Review e-mail memorandum received from Tim Michaud; telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding North Carolina attorney; telephone calls to North Carolina attorneys	0.30	52.50	DML
Nov-16-09	Preparation of Notice of Appearance	0.20	25.00	EALA
	Telephone conference with Paisley in Cynthia Carroll's office regarding possible representation of Mr. Michaud	0.20	25.00	EALA
	Extensive telephone conference with Tim Michaud regarding discussions with Cynthia Carroll's office concerning possible representation; discussion of new allegations made by Former Wife and Mr. Michaud's concerns of possible arrest; discussion of Notice of Appearance being filed and Motion for Protective Order to be filed; discussion of Mr. Michaud's conversation with Former Wife's current husband; etc.	0.60	75.00	EALA
	Preparation of first draft of Emergency Motion for Protective Order; make revisions and additions to same	0.50	62.50	EALA
	N/C - Organize and index Florida and North Carolina pleadings	0.50	0.00	EALA
	N/C - Preparation of Legal Representation Agreement; email to Mr. Michaud for review and execution	0.20	0.00	EALA
	N/C - Telephone conference with Debra in Attorney Pierce's office regarding reschedule of deposition	0.10	0.00	EALA
	N/C - Scan and email Chronological Timeline of Events to Paisley at Attorney Carroll's office per Tim Michaud	0.10	0.00	EALA
	Review Chronological Timeline of Events and documents provided by Tim Michaud	0.80	100.00	EALA
	Meet with Tim Michaud regarding having been served with a notice of the therapist's deposition; research and review Motion for Protective Order	1.50	100.00	DML
	Deal with crisis and deposition issue	0.30	105.00	BWR
Nov-17-09	N/C - Telephone conferences with Debra in Attorney Pierce's office regarding reschedule of deposition;	0.20	0.00	EALA

Page 3 of 324

	discussion of hearing on November 24th in North Carolina and our client's need to attend hearing; etc.		i aç	JC 0 01 024
	Review e-mail from Tim Michaud regarding North Carolina DCF involvement in allegations of sexual abuse; telephone conference with Sherry Daniels with North Carolina DCF regarding their investigation	0.40	70.00	DML
	Telephone conference with Tim Michaud regarding status of therapist's deposition scheduled for this Thursday and the status of the North Carolina DCF investigation	0.20	35.00	DML
	Telephone call to North Carolina Attorney Cynthia Caroll regarding North Carolina DCF investigation	0.10	17.50	DML
	Review e-mail memorandum received from Tim Michaud regarding his consultation with Cynthia Caroll and draft response; meet with Mr. Rossway regarding case strategy	0.20	35.00	DML
	Review facsimile correspondence received from Florida attorney Julie Glocker Pierce regarding deposition of Riley's counselor Dr. Huryn	0.20	35.00	DML
	Review additional e-mail memorandum from Tim regarding his discussion with his North Carolina attorney relating to his not planning on attending the North Carolina hearing on November 24th and draft response	0.20	35.00	DML
	Review situation regarding additional pleadings having been filed against Mr. Michaud in Florida; meeting with paralegal and associate, provide instruction for North Carolina attorney to be immediately engaged and have a Motion for Protective Order filed concerning deposition; provide instruction regarding research for jurisdictional claims; receive information from North Carolina attorney regarding her suggestions on moving forward cooperatively to protect Mr. Michaud's interests	0.30	105.00	BWR
Nov-18-09	Receipt and review of correspondence from Attorney Pierce with enclosed Emergency Motion to Suspend Visitation	0.20	70.00	BWR
	N/C - Telephone conference with Paisley in Attorney Carroll's office regarding attorney contact information	0.10	0.00	EALA
77.	Review e-mail memorandum received from Tim Michaud regarding North Carolina DCF investigator Sherry Daniels request to meet with him and draft response	0.20	35.00	DML
	Telephone call to North Carolina Attorney Cindy Carroll regarding her discussion with Tim Michaud and plans to proceed in North Carolina	0.30	52.50	DML

			Pag	e 4 of 324
	Telephone conference with Florida attorney for Aimee Casey, Julie Pierce's paralegal regarding Florida proceedings and her Emergency Motion regarding Thanksgiving visitation	0.30	52.50	DML
	Review e-mail memorandum from Tim Michaud regarding his correspondence from Aimee Casey's North Carolina counsel Leslie Fritscher requesting a stipulation regarding no visitation	0.30	52.50	DML
	N/C - Review additional e-mail memorandum from Tim Michaud regarding DCF investigation	0.10	0.00	DML
Nov-19-09	Review e-mail memorandums received from Tim regarding the North Carolina's therapist and draft responses	0.40	70.00	DML
	N/C - Meet with Mr. Rossway to discuss case strategy and DCF investigation	0.20	0.00	DML
	Preparation of letter to Tim Michaud enclosing correspondence from Attorney Pierce and Emergency Motion to Suspend Visitation	0.10	12.50	EALA
Nov-20-09	Telephone call to North Carolina attorney Cynthia Carroll regarding North Carolina proceedings	0.10	17.50	DML
	Draft e-mail memorandum to Tim Michaud regarding case strategy, review and respond to his response; telephone conference with Tim regarding case strategy and the North Carolina proceedings	0.60	105.00	DML
Nov-23-09	N/C - Attend portion of telephone conference with Mr. Michaud	0.20	0.00	EALA
	N/C - Review e-mail memorandums received from Tim Michaud and from North Carolina counsel Cynthia Carroll; telephone conference with Tim Michaud, Mr. Rossway and paralegal Erin Arena	1.20	0.00	DML
	Review three e-mail memorandums received from Tim Michaud forwarded from North Carolina counsel, Cynthia Carroll	0.20	35.00	DML
	Review file; extensive telephone conference with Mr. Michaud to discuss North Carolina proceeding, and the Florida proceeding; receive authorization to proceed on modification of custodial situation in Florida; review information regarding administrative proceedings with children and family services departments in Florida and North Carolina; provide instruction to paralegal and associate to move case forward and to communicate with North Carolina lawyer	0.40	140.00	BWR
Nov-24-09	Prepare e-mail memorandum to North Carolina attorney, Cynthia Carroll regarding today's hearing	0.20	35.00	DML

			Page	e 5 of 324
Nov-25-09	Review e-mail memorandum received from Tim Michaud regarding his conversation with North Carolina DCF investigator, Sherry Daniels and prepare response	0.20	35.00	DML
	Preparation of Notice of Production from Non-Party and Subpoena Duces Tecum Without Deposition directed to Jean S. Huryn, LPA	0.30	37.50	EALA
	Preparation of Civil Cover Sheet, Notice of Social Security Number and UCCJEA Affidavit	0.70	87.50	EALA
	N/C - Review of information regarding progress of the case in North Carolina	0.20	0.00	BWR
Nov-30-09	Work on setting hearing earlier than the original date; work on issues relating to pleadings filed in two states; work on modification proceedings	0.20	70.00	BWR
	Totals	18.85	\$2,275.00	

DISBURSEMENTS		Disbursements	Receipts
Dec-04-09	Payment for invoice: 51917 Michaud, 1682-001		43.80
	Payment for invoice: 51917 Michaud, 1682-001		752.50
	Payment for invoice: 51917 Michaud, 1682-001		1,097.50
	Payment for invoice: 51917 Michaud, 1682-001		425.00
Nov-12-09	Westlaw Online Research Access	26.60	
Nov-13-09	Photocopies	0.25	
Nov-16-09	Photocopies	0.75	
	Photocopies	4.50	
	Facsimile Charges	2.00	
	Facsimile Charges	3.00	
	Telephone Charges	0.90	
	Postage	1.32	
	Postage	1.32	
Nov-17-09	Telephone Charges	0.30	
Nov-19-09	Photocopies	2.25	
C.	Postage	0.61	
	Totals	\$43.80	\$0.00

Current Fees & Disbursements	Page 6 of 324 \$0.00
Previous Balance	\$0.00
Previous Payments	\$0.00
BALANCE DUE	\$0.00

51917

TRUST STATEMENT

Page 7 of 324

		Disbursements	Receipts
Nov-13-09	Received From: Timothy Michaud		2,500.00
	1682-001 Michaud, Retainer Funds		
Dec-04-09	Paid To: Rossway Moore & Taylor	2,318.80	
	Payment for invoice: 51917 Michaud, 1682-001		
	Total Trust	\$2,318.80	\$2,500.00
	Trust Balance		\$181.20



VERO BEACH . CORAL GABLES

ROSSWAY MOORE SWAN, P.L. THE MODERN ONE BUILDING 2101 INDIAN RIVER BOULEVARD, SUITE 200 VERO BEACH, FL 32960 Telephone (772) 231-4440 Facsimile (772) 231-4430

Mr. Timothy Michaud 1791 Wekiva Drive Melbourne, FL 32940

February 9, 2010

File #: 1682-001 Inv. #: 52881

Total Due:

\$0.00

RE: Post-judgment issues

Please write the FILE number on your check to insure proper crediting.

SUMMARY

*Balance Fwd:

\$0.00

Payment received:

\$0.00)

Current Invoice Amount:

\$0.00

TOTAL DUE:

\$0.00

######################################				
DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	ATT'Y/L.A.
Nov-11-09	Research Florida case law regarding jurisdiction when invoked by opposing party; research Florida case law regarding motions filed in separate states and jurisdictional issues and determinations	1.20	210.00	DML
Dec-02-09	Review e-mail memorandum received from Tim regarding status of DCF investigation; continue researching Florida Statutes and case law regarding initial and subsequent jurisdiction of Florida courts; review Florida appellate cases Florida Field Provides Ballingsey and Changles Changles Preview Florida Statutes 6.322.615.196.320.01 regarding the U.C.C.J.E.A. and jurisdictional issues when simultaneous proceedings have been filed	1.50	262.50	DML
	N/C - Review e-mail memorandum received from Tim regarding reimbursement of daycare charges and prepare response to same	0.30	0.00	DML
Dec-03-09	N/C - Process Notice of Production from Non-Parties, i.e. Jean S. Huryn, LPA	0.20	0.00	PCLA

	N/C - Review e-mail memorandum received from Tim regarding North Carolina proceedings	0.10	0.00	DML
	N/C - Prepare letter to Tim regarding additional retainer	0.20	0.00	DML
Dec-04-09	Review e-mail memorandum received from Tim regarding status of North Carolina case and draft response	0.20	35.00	DML
	Review documents received from Tim regarding Riley's daycare expense and medical reimbursements	0.60	105.00	DML
	N/C - Draft letter to Tim regarding additional retainer	0.20	0.00	DML
	N/C - Office conference with Erin Arena, Paralegal, for transfer of file, obtain background on North Carolina and Florida cases, and status of cases	0.30	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Update pleading and correspondence files	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Review Pleadings, correspondence, and Mr. Michaud's Chronological Timeline; office conference with Attorney Martin-Lee regarding preparing response to Motion to Set Aside Final Judgment	0.70	0.00	PCLA
Dec-07-09	N/C - Telephone conference with Judge Wohn's Judicial Assistant regarding moving the hearing scheduled for January 7, 2010 on Former Wife's Motion to Set Aside Final Judgment	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Dec-09-09	Work on obtain service of Subpoena Duces Tecum on Jean S. Huryn, LPA; telephone conference with Attorney Carroll	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	N/C - Check Request to Craven County Sheriff's Department for service of Subpoena	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Draft Memo to Attorney Carroll forwarding Subpoena Duces Tecum to be served on Jean S. Huryn, LPA via Craven County Sheriff's Department	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Draft correspondence to Mr. Michaud regarding hearing and Subpoena	0.20	25.00	PCLA
-11-09	N/C - Receipt of Notice of Unavailability for Attorney Pierce and calendar dates	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Dec-14-09	N/C - Receipt and review of Notice of Non-Availability for Attorney Pierce	0.10	0.00	BWR

Dec-18-09	Begin work on issues for jurisdictional arguments to be	0.40	Page	10 of 324 BWR
	made in January	0.40	140.00	BWR.
Dec-29-09	Telephone conference with Attorney Carroll's assistant regarding status of service of process of Subpoena directed to Jean S. Huryn, LPA	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	E-mail from and to Mr. Michaud regarding status of preparations for hearing and North Carolina therapist response to Subpoena	0.10	12.50	PCLA
Dec-30-09	Prepare file and exhibits for hearing to set aside Final Judgment	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	Telephone conference with North Carolina attorney's office for status of Subpoena	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Dec-31-09	Telephone call to North Carolina Attorney Carroll regarding service of subpoena on therapist and update status of North Carolina case - left message; research file regarding status update	0.20	35.00	DML ·
	Telephone call to Sherri Daniels with North Carolina Children Services regarding status of investigation	0.10	17.50	DML
	Further research on jurisdictional issues and court's discretion of review jurisdiction after Final Judgment of Dissolution	0.60	105.00	DML
Jan-04-10	Continue researching Florida case law and statutes regarding jurisdiction of initial determination of custody; telephone conference with North Carolina Attorney Cindy Carroll's office regarding status of subpoena for therapist's records; prepare e-mail memorandum to Cindy Caroll regarding status of North Carolina case and review response; prepare e-mail memorandum to North Carolina child services investigator Sherry Daniels regarding status of investigation and review response	5.00	400.00	DML
	N/C - Telephone conference with Paisley in Cindy Carroll's office regarding issue with Craven County Sheriff's Department	0.10	0.00	EALA
	Begin extensive preparations for complex jurisdictional argument relating to subject matter jurisdiction; meeting with associate to provide input regarding materials necessary for Memorandum of Law for case, factual information for case, and strategy to employee regarding asking the Florida Court to retain jurisdiction and find that Final Judgment entered is a valid binding Florida Final Judgment binding upon parties; begin review of case law prepared by associate	1.00	350.00	BWR
Jan-05-10	N/C - Draft e-mail memorandum to Tim regarding Thursday's hearing	0.20	0.00	DML

Telephone conference with Tim regarding status of North Carolina and Florida cases and investigations	0.40	Page ^{70.00}	11 of 324 DML
Prepare e-mail memorandum to Sherry Daniels with North Carolina, DSS regarding their investigation into the allegations against Tim	0.10	17.50	DML
Research North Carolina DSS regarding notice of allegations to alleged perpetrator and general information about North Carolina law regarding DSS investigations	1.50	262.50	DML
Review additional e-mail received from DSS investigator Sherry Daniels regarding investigation in North Carolina	0.20	35.00	DML
N/C - Meet with Mr. Rossway to discuss strategy for Thursday's hearing on Motion to Set Aside Final Judgment	0.40	0.00	DML
Review and study additional statutory requirements to assert that Florida has continuing jurisdiction; review case law prepared by associate and initial draft of Memorandum of Law for the judge's education and information; begin preparing arguments for the hearing Thursday January 7, 2010	0.50	175.00	BWR
N/C - Draft e-mail memorandum to Tim regarding additional retainer and review response	0.20	0.00	DML
Review e-mail memorandum received from Tim regarding additional retainer check and his thoughts on tomorrow's hearing and draft response	0.40	70.00	DML
Two telephone conferences with Attorney Julie Pierce and her office regarding the Exhibit A to her Motion to Set Aside Final Judgment	0.20	35.00	DML
Additional telephone call to Attorney Julie Pierce regarding Exhibit A to her Motion to Set Aside Final Judgment	0.10	17.50	DML
Review facsimile of Exhibit A to Motion to Set Aside Final Judgment received from Attorney Julie Pierce	0.20	35.00	DML
N/C - Telephone conference with Kathy, Judge Wohn's judicial assistant regarding providing memorandum of law to Judge	0.10	0.00	EALA
Preparation of Notice of Filing Former Wife's Complaint filed in North Carolina	0.10	12.50	EALA
Interoffice conference with Bradley Rossway and Deborah Martin-Lee in preparation for hearing; assist	1.40	175.00	EALA

-06-10

Jan-07-10

with preparation for heari use as exhibits at hearing;	ng; duplicate documents for etc.		Page	: 12 01 324
Law Regarding Motion to final review of Florida Sta regarding home state of m of proceedings; final review regarding jurisdictional is Miles v. Hyman. Review reference in the Motion to Chapoteau v. Chapoteau;	revisions to Memorandum of Set Aside Final Judgment; atutes 61.503 and 61.514 ninor child at commencement ew of Florida case law sues, Yurgel v. Yurgel and opposing counsel's case law as Set Aside Final Judgment, review Notice of Filing North ew Counter petition filed by	5.30	400.00	DML
assist Mr. Rossway in arg	County Courthouse in Viera to uing against Motion to Set garding Custody and Visitation	3.50	0.00	DML
study all previous pleadin Memorandum of Law; fur packets to be provided to formulate complete legal case; work on contemplat arguments to be made by to and attend hearing; pre materials to the Court; for Mr. Michaud and work w forward aggressively in the determine that subject ma	Judge Won; prepare and arguments to be presented to ed potential defense of former spouses attorney; travel sent arguments and all ward additional information to ith associate on proceeding	5.50	1,925.00	BWR
same; preparation of lette Answer and Counter petit Filing the Former Wife's Carolina; Former Husban Regarding Initial Custody		0.40	50.00	EALA
	a Carroll regarding yesterday evard County regarding Motion	0.20	35.00	DML
Review e-mail memorand regarding North Carolina	lum received from Tim attorney and draft response	0.20	35.00	DML
Attorney Cynthia Carroll	th Paisley in North Carolina is office regarding status of orth Carolina hearing and also ecords	0.30	52.50	DML

Jan-08-10

	N/C - Review voice message received from Attorney Julie Pierce regarding possible solution to this matter	0.10	Page _{0.00}	13 of 324 DML
Jun-11-10	Preparation of second Subpoena Duces Tecum to Jean S. Huryn; preparation of letter to Paisley enclosing same	0.30	37.50	EALA
	Review e-mail memorandum received from North Carolina Attorney Cynthia Caroll and prepare response	0.10	17.50	DML
Jan-12-10	Review e-mail memorandum received from Tim regarding therapist's subpoena and prepare response	0.20	35.00	DML
	Telephone conference with Tim regarding the North Carolina therapist's preliminary findings	0.20	35.00	DML
Jan-13-10	N/C - Telephone conference with Tim regarding Judge's order; prepare e-mail correspondence to Tim and North Carolina Cynthia Carroll regarding Judge's order	0.40	0.00	DML
	Review extremely favorable ruling from Florida trial court; begin formulation of strategy to move forward on contempt hearings and potentially filing modification proceedings against former wife based upon her inappropriate and fraudulent activities concerning minor child and potential alienation of child's affection	0.60	210.00	BWR
-16-10	Review two e-mail memorandums received from Tim regarding his plans to meet with North Carolina therapist and the outstanding Motion for Contempt in Florida	0.20	35.00	DML
Jan-18-10	Begin work on contempt issue; begin work on further strategy to return child to Florida	0.50	175.00	BWR
Jan-20-10	Review e-mail memorandum received from Tim regarding North Carolina hearing and draft response	0.20	35.00	DML
	N/C - Attempt to contact Ms. Frank's at North Carolina Sheriff's Department regarding Subpoena	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Prepare Check Request for Sheriff's Department	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Jan-21-10	N/C - Second attempt to contact Sheriff's department and leave message	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Jan-22-10	Review facsimile correspondence received from Attorney Pierce regarding stipulation on visitation; review e-mail memorandum received from Tim regarding North Carolina therapist investigation; prepare response to Tim's e-mail memorandum and correspondence regarding the stipulation received from Attorney Pierce	0.60	50.00	DML

	Review additional e-mail memorandum received from Tim regarding North Carolina investigation and draft response	0.20	Page 35.00	14 of 324 DML
Jan-25-10	Review e-mail correspondences received from North Carolina attorney Cynthia Carroll requesting certified documents and draft response; review e-mail correspondence received from Tim regarding the North Carolina investigation and draft response	0.30	52.50	DML
Jan-26-10	Review e-mail memorandum received from Tim regarding subpoena for therapist's records and draft reply	0.10	17.50	DML
	Totals	41.00	\$5,960.00	

DISBURSEMENTS		Disbursements	Receipts
Feb-09-10	Payment for invoice: 52881 Michaud, 1682-001		243.26
	Payment for invoice: 52881 Michaud, 1682-001		162.50
	Payment for invoice: 52881 Michaud, 1682-001		2,975.00
	Payment for invoice: 52881 Michaud, 1682-001		2,547.50
	Payment for invoice: 52881 Michaud, 1682-001		275.00
c-01-09	Westlaw Online Research Access	25.00	
Dec-02-09	Westlaw Online Research Access	35.12	
Dec-03-09	Photocopies	2.25	
	Postage	1.32	
Dec-07-09	Photocopies	0.10	
	Postage	0.44	
Dec-09-09	Photocopies	0.80	
	Photocopies	0.70	
	Photocopies	0.40	
	Postage	1.05	
	Postage	0.44	
Dec-17-09	Photocopies	0.40	
Dec-30-09	Photocopies	8.70	
04-10	Photocopies	0.10	
	Photocopies	1.20	
	Westlaw Online Research Access	23.50	

			Page 15 of 324
	Westlaw Online Research Access	30.00	-
ր-06-10	Photocopies	0.30	
	Photocopies	0.50	
	Telephone Charges	0.10	N.
	Westlaw Online Research Access	20.00	
Jan-07-10	Photocopies	7.80	
	Photocopies	0.90	
	Photocopies	0.60	
	Photocopies	5.10	
	Photocopies	1.20	
	Photocopies	0.90	
	Photocopies	2.10	
	Photocopies	3.30	
	Photocopies	8.10	
	Westlaw Online Research Access	50.00	
-08-10	Photocopies	3.50	
	Postage	3.19	
Jan-12-10	Photocopies	0.70	
	Postage	1.83	
Jan-25-10	Photocopies	0.30	
	Postage	1.32	
	Totals	\$243.26	\$0.00
	Current Fees & Disbursements	_	\$0.00
	Previous Balance		\$0.00
	Previous Payments		\$0.00
	BALANCE DUE		\$0.00

52881

Invoice #:

TRUST STATEMENT

Page 16 of 324

		Disbursements	Receipts
	Trust Balance Forward		181.20
Dec-09-09	Paid To: Craven County Sheriff's Department	15.00	
	1682-001 Michaud, Service of Subpoena DT: Jean S. Huryn,		
Jan-11-10	LPA Received From: Timothy Michaud		7,500.00
	1682-001 Michaud, Fee & Cost Retainer		
	Paid To: Craven County Sheriff's Department	15.00	
	1682-001 Michaud, Service of Subpoena DT: Jean Huryn, LPA		
Jan-20-10	Paid To: Craven County Sheriff's Department	15.00	
	1682-001 Michaud, Service oif Subpoena, Jean Huryn, LPA		
Feb-09-10	Paid To: Rossway Moore & Taylor	6,203.26	
	Payment for invoice: 52881 Michaud, 1682-001		
Apr-11-11	Paid To: Craven County Sheriff's Department	-15.00	
	1682-001 Michaud, Service of Subpoena DT: Jean S. Huryn, LPA - Void-Never cashed		
	Total Trust	\$6,233.26	\$7,681.20
	Trust Balance		\$1,447.94

VERO BEACH . CORAL GABLES

ROSSWAY MOORE SWAN, P.L. THE MODERN ONE BUILDING 2101 INDIAN RIVER BOULEVARD, SUITE 200 VERO BEACH, FL 32960 Telephone (772) 231-4440 Facsimile (772) 231-4430

Mr. Timothy Michaud 1791 Wekiva Drive Melbourne, FL 32940

March 5, 2010

File #: 1682-001 Inv. #: 53112

IIIV. #. JJ112

Total Due:

RE: Post-judgment issues

Please write the FILE number on your check to insure proper crediting.

SUMMARY

*Balance Fwd:

\$0.00

Payment received:

Ψ0.00

\$982.54

Current Invoice Amount:

\$0.00) \$982.54

TOTAL DUE:

\$982.54

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	ATT'Y/L.A.
Feb-03-10	Work on preparations for moving case forward to conclusion or settlement of issues after further information received from North Carolina	0.50	175.00	BWR
Feb-08-10	Draft Notice of Filing Affidavit of Service of Subpoena on Jean S. Huryn, LPA	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Review two e-mail memorandums received from Tim regarding status of North Carolina investigation and prepare response	0.20	35.00	DML
Feb-09-10	Receipt of voice mail from Attorney Pierce's assistant regarding scheduling a hearing; office conference with Attorney Martin-Lee regarding pending motions	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Telephone conference with Attorney Pierce's assistant regarding hearing; office conference with Mr. Rossway; telephone conference with Attorney Pierce's assistant to advise of Mr. Rossway position not to schedule a hearing on a motion has not been filed and reviewed for	0.30	37.50	PCLA

	response, possible discovery and time required before the court to address		Page	18 of 324
	N/C - Office conference with Attorney Rossway and Martin-Lee regarding preparing a Petition for Modification to change custody and incorporate alienation of affection	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Begin review of pleadings for background information for preparing documents for modification of parenting plan and child support; draft Summons; begin UCCJEA	0.60	75.00	PCLA
	Begin work on modification pleadings based upon Court's rulings	0.50	175.00	BWR
Feb-10-10	Receipt and review of facsimile Motion to Decline Jurisdiction for Inconvenient Forum	0.10	35.00	BWR
Feb-11-10	Receipt and review of Motion to Decline Jurisdiction for Inconvenient Forum	0.20	70.00	BWR
	Begin drafting Petition for Modification to include background information	0.40	50.00	PCLA
Feb-16-10	N/C - Receipt of voice mail from Attorney Pierce's paralegal regarding hearing dates in May; attempt to contact the Judge's Judicial Assistant; telephone conference with Attorney Pierce's paralegal	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Review Motion to Decline Jurisdiction for Inconvenient Forum received from Attorney Julia Pierce; research Florida Statutes, Florida Family Law Rules of Procedure and Florida Civil Rules of Procedure regarding legal sufficiency of motion and requirements for verification of pleadings	0.80	140.00	DML
Feb-17-10	N/C - Attempted conference call between Attorney Pierce's paralegal and the Judge's Judicial Assistant to schedule a hearing on inconvenience forum matter	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Telephone conference with Judge Wohn's Judicial Assistant and Attorney Pierce's paralegal to schedule hearing; obtain address for Judge Wohn	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Continue drafting Petition for Modification	0.60	75.00	PCLA
	Work on issues relating to Petition for Modification; work on issues regarding potential Motion to Strike Current Pleadings; work on setting motions and Motion for Contempt	0.30	105.00	BWR
	Research additional jurisdictional and transfer of venue issues	1.50	262.50	DML

عنندر

- 1	1 1 V I	HUC	#

Feb-18-10	Finalize drafting of Petition for Modification; prepare Summons; prepare Financial Affidavit and Parenting Plan for Mr. Michaud	2.70	337.50 Page	e 19 of 324 PCLA
Feb-19-10	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's review amend and refine Petition for Modification; draft UCCJEA; complete draft of Parenting Plan	1.60	200.00	PCLA
Feb-22-10	Receipt and review of Notice of Hearing on Former Wife's Motion to Decline Jurisdiction for Inconvenient Forum	0.10	35.00	BWR
	Research and review modification of timesharing with minor child including visitation schedule after minor child reaches the age of six years old and U.C.C.J.E.A. information	0.80	140.00	DML
	Review progress of Petition for Modification; provide input to associate and paralegal regarding further extensive allegations be contained in a verified pleading; task associate with further research regarding defending Motion to Change Jurisdiction and Venue	0.40	140.00	BWR
Feb-23-10	Meet with Tim regarding Supplemental Petition to Modify Timesharing and Parenting Plan and to discuss status of North Carolina proceedings	2.00	350.00	DML
	Prepare e-mail memorandum to North Carolina DSS investigator Sherry Daniels regarding status of investigation	0.20	35.00	DML
	Additional research on North Carolina DSS investigations and rights of parents who are under investigation	0.60	105.00	DML
	Office conference with Mr. Michaud, Attorney Martin-Lee and Mr. Rossway; review of all issues for Florida modification and status of North Carolina issues	2.00	250.00	PCLA
	Begin amending Petition for Modification to incorporate additional information pursuant to meeting; amend UCCJEA and Notice of Social Security Number; prepare Summons	0.70	87.50	PCLA
	Conference with Mr. Michaud	0.40	140.00	BWR
Mar-05-10	Courtesy write off 25% (\$ 776.25) Courtesy write off per BWR		-776.25	BWR
	Totals	18.50	\$2,328.75	

DISBURSEMENTS

Disbursements

Receipts

Mar-05-10	Payment for invoice: 53112 Michaud, 1682-001		Page 20 of 324
	Payment for invoice: 53112 Michaud, 1682-001		379.37
	Payment for invoice: 53112 Michaud, 1682-001		462.82
	Payment for invoice: 53112 Michaud, 1682-001		36.73
Feb-08-10	Photocopies	1.50	
	Postage	1.83	
Feb-09-10	Telephone Charges	0.20	
Feb-16-10	Westlaw Online Research Access	29.10	
Feb-17-10	Telephone Charges	0.20	
Feb-23-10	Photocopies	0.90	
	Photocopies	3.00	
	Totals —	\$36.73	\$0.00
	Current Fees & Disbursements		\$982.54
	Previous Balance		\$0.00
	Previous Payments		\$0.00
	BALANCE DUE		\$982.54

invoice #:

05112

TRUST STATEMENT

Page 21 of 324

		Disbursements	Receipts
	Trust Balance Forward		1,447.94
Mar-01-10	Paid To: Brevard County Clerk of Court	50.00	
Mar-05-10	1682-001 Michaud, Reopen Case Fee, Case No. 05-2004-DR-019706 Paid To: Rossway Moore & Taylor	1,382.94	
	Payment for invoice: 53112 Michaud, 1682-001		
	Total Trust	\$1,432.94	\$1,447.94
	Trust Balance		\$15.00

VERO BEACH . CORAL GABLES

ROSSWAY MOORE SWAN, P.L. THE MODERN ONE BUILDING 2101 INDIAN RIVER BOULEVARD, SUITE 200 VERO BEACH, FL 32960 Telephone (772) 231-4440 Facsimile (772) 231-4430

Mr. Timothy Michaud 1791 Wekiva Drive Melbourne, FL 32940

May 5, 2010

File #: 1682-001 Inv. #:

53901

Total Due:

\$4,479.94

RE: Post-judgment issues

Please write the FILE number on your check to insure proper crediting.

SUMMARY

*Balance Fwd:

\$982.54

Payment received:

\$0.00)

Current Invoice Amount:

\$3,497.40

TOTAL DUE:

\$4,479.94

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	ATT'Y/L.A.
Mar-01-10	Finalize amending and incorporating additional language in Petition for Modification; research fee for modification in Brevard County	1.00	125.00	PCLA
	N/C - Prepare check request for filing fee	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Amend Petition pursuant to Mr. Rossway's review and e-mail to Mr. Michaud for review	0.40	50.00	PCLA
Mar-02-10	Review finalize pleadings	0.30	105.00	BWR
Mar-03-10	N/C - E-mail Mr. Michaud for status of review of Petition for Modification	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Mar-05-10	N/C - Receipt of e-mails from and to Mr. Michaud regarding minor child's North Carolina doctor's report and Petition for Modification; office conference with Ms. Martin-Lee regarding records from North Carolina therapist	0.20	0.00	PCLA

	Receipt and review of Mr. Michaud's e-mailed changes to Parenting Plan and Petition	0.10	Page 12.50	23 of 324 PCLA
	Review e-mail memorandum received from Tim Michaud regarding modification of daughter Riley's physical residence; review Supplemental Petition to Modify Physical Residence regarding former wife's actions to prevent visitation	0.40	70.00	DML
Mar-08-10	N/C - Review e-mail memorandum received from Tim Michaud regarding daughter Riley's therapist subpoena and prepare response	0.20	0.00	DML
	N/C - E-mail to Mr. Michaud requesting hard copy of his amendments to Parenting Plan and Petition	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Modify Petition to incorporate requirements under Statute 61.13 for modifying parental responsibly and parenting plans	0.60	75.00	PCLA
	Pursuant to Mr. Michaud's requests, make changes to Petition regarding supervised visitation in February; review prior Agreement for attorney's fees language; advise Mr. Rossway of issue of losing party responsible for attorney's fees	0.40	50.00	PCLA
Mar-09-10	Amend Petition pursuant to Mr. Rossway's review	0.40	50.00	PCLA
	N/C - Office conference with Attorney Martin-Lee regarding attorney's fees and the Rosen case	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Research Florida case law regarding attorney fees, including Rosen v. Rosen, which held that other factors may be included in determination of attorney fees, including the total circumstances of the case	0.40	70.00	DML
	Review and revise extensive Petition for Modification	0.20	70.00	BWR
Mar-10-10	Refine and finalize Petition and all initial documents for Mr. Michaud's signature and filing with the Court; amend UCCJEA to include Wife residence in Virginia	0.60	75.00	PCLA
	N/C - E-mail to Mr. Michaud to request appointment to come in and review and sign initial documents for modification	0.10	0.00	PCLA
C	N/C - Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud to schedule appointment to review and sign initial documents; e-mail documents to Mr. Michaud for review	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Review completed Supplemental Petition to Modify Final Judgment as to Primary Physical Residence; research North Carolina and Florida pleadings as well as	0.70	122.50	DML

correspondence with Tim Michaud regarding Aimee Casey's move to Virginia; research and review DSS proceedings and status of investigation;		Page	e 24 of 32
Telephone call to North Carolina therapist, Jean Huryn, regarding our subpoena for copies of her records on Riley Michaud	0.10	17.50	DML
Draft e-mail memorandums to North Carolina DSS Investigator, Sherri Daniels and North Carolina Attorney, Cindy Carroll regarding status of the investigation	0.20	35.00	DML
Review pleadings and file in preparation for this morning's meeting with Tim Michaud	0.30	52.50	DML
Draft e-mail memorandum to North Carolina Attorney, Cindy Carroll regarding status of investigation, review her response and prepare reply	0.20	35.00	DML
Meet with Tim Michaud regarding status of North Carolina investigation and case strategy going forward	0.60	105.00	DML
Office conference with Mr. Michaud for review and signing of Petition and initial documents; discussions regarding case in North Carolina and DSS investigation and resulting affect in Florida case	0.90	112.50	PCLA
N/C - Prepare Petition and initial documents for filing with Clerk of Court, and return filed documents	0.30	0.00	PCLA
N/C - Receipt of e-mail from Mr. Michaud regarding review of Petition prior to office appointment to sign documents	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Receipt of Mr. Michaud's requested changes to Petition; amend Petition for Mr. Michaud review and signature	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Final review of extensive Petition for Modification; sign and authorize filing of document on behalf of Mr. Michaud	0.20	70.00	BWR
N/C - Office conference with Ms. Martin-Lee regarding receipt of notification of Wife's North Carolina's attorney withdrawing and DSS report finalized and to be sent out on March 15, 2010	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Review e-mail memorandum received from Sherri Daniels, the North Carolina DSS investigator regarding investigation findings and prepare response and telephone call to Tim Michaud regarding investigator's report; prepare e-mail memorandum to Tim Michaud regarding same; prepare e-mail memorandum to Tim Michaud regarding Sherri Daniels report and review his response	0.40	70.00	DML
	Casey's move to Virginia; research and review DSS proceedings and status of investigation; Telephone call to North Carolina therapist, Jean Huryn, regarding our subpoena for copies of her records on Riley Michaud Draft e-mail memorandums to North Carolina DSS Investigator, Sherri Daniels and North Carolina Attorney, Cindy Carroll regarding status of the investigation Review pleadings and file in preparation for this morning's meeting with Tim Michaud Draft e-mail memorandum to North Carolina Attorney, Cindy Carroll regarding status of investigation, review her response and prepare reply Meet with Tim Michaud regarding status of North Carolina investigation and case strategy going forward Office conference with Mr. Michaud for review and signing of Petition and initial documents; discussions regarding case in North Carolina and DSS investigation and resulting affect in Florida case N/C - Prepare Petition and initial documents for filing with Clerk of Court, and return filed documents N/C - Receipt of e-mail from Mr. Michaud regarding review of Petition prior to office appointment to sign documents Receipt of Mr. Michaud's requested changes to Petition; amend Petition for Mr. Michaud review and signature Final review of extensive Petition for Modification; sign and authorize filing of document on behalf of Mr. Michaud N/C - Office conference with Ms. Martin-Lee regarding receipt of notification of Wife's North Carolina's attorney withdrawing and DSS report finalized and to be sent out on March 15, 2010 Review e-mail memorandum received from Sherri Daniels, the North Carolina DSS investigator regarding investigation findings and prepare response and telephone call to Tim Michaud regarding investigator's report; prepare e-mail memorandum to Tim Michaud regarding Sherri Daniels report and review his	Casey's move to Virginia; research and review DSS proceedings and status of investigation; Telephone call to North Carolina therapist, Jean Huryn, regarding our subpoena for copies of her records on Riley Michaud Draft e-mail memorandums to North Carolina DSS Investigator, Sherri Daniels and North Carolina Attorney, Cindy Carroll regarding status of the investigation Review pleadings and file in preparation for this morning's meeting with Tim Michaud Draft e-mail memorandum to North Carolina Attorney, Cindy Carroll regarding status of investigation, review her response and prepare reply Meet with Tim Michaud regarding status of North Carolina investigation and case strategy going forward Office conference with Mr. Michaud for review and signing of Petition and initial documents; discussions regarding case in North Carolina and DSS investigation and resulting affect in Florida case N/C - Prepare Petition and initial documents for filing with Clerk of Court, and return filed documents N/C - Receipt of e-mail from Mr. Michaud regarding review of Petition prior to office appointment to sign documents Receipt of Mr. Michaud's requested changes to Petition; amend Petition for Mr. Michaud review and signature Final review of extensive Petition for Modification; sign and authorize filing of document on behalf of Mr. Michaud N/C - Office conference with Ms. Martin-Lee regarding receipt of notification of Wife's North Carolina's attorney withdrawing and DSS report finalized and to be sent out on March 15, 2010 Review e-mail memorandum received from Sherri Daniels, the North Carolina DSS investigator regarding investigation findings and prepare response and telephone call to Tim Michaud regarding investigator's report; prepare e-mail memorandum to Tim Michaud regarding Sherri Daniels report and review his	correspondence with Tim Michaud regarding Aimee Casey's move to Virginia; research and review DSS proceedings and status of investigation; Telephone call to North Carolina therapist, Jean Huryn, regarding our subpoena for copies of her records on Riley Michaud Draft e-mail memorandums to North Carolina DSS Investigator, Sherri Daniels and North Carolina Attorney, Cindy Carroll regarding status of the investigation Review pleadings and file in preparation for this morning's meeting with Tim Michaud Draft e-mail memorandum to North Carolina Attorney, Cindy Carroll regarding status of investigation, review her response and prepare reply Meet with Tim Michaud regarding status of North Carolina investigation and case strategy going forward Office conference with Mr. Michaud for review and signing of Petition and initial documents; discussions regarding case in North Carolina and DSS investigation and resulting affect in Florida case N/C - Prepare Petition and initial documents for filing with Clerk of Court, and return filed documents N/C - Receipt of e-mail from Mr. Michaud regarding review of Petition prior to office appointment to sign documents Receipt of Mr. Michaud's requested changes to Petition; amend Petition for Mr. Michaud review and signature Final review of extensive Petition for Modification; sign and authorize filing of document on behalf of Mr. Michaud N/C - Office conference with Ms. Martin-Lee regarding receipt of notification of Wife's North Carolina's autorney withdrawing and DSS report finalized and to be sent out on March 15, 2010 Review e-mail memorandum received from Sherri Daniels, the North Carolina DSS investigator regarding investigation findings and prepare response and telephone call to Tim Michaud regarding investigator's report; prepare e-mail memorandum to Tim Michaud regarding Sare; prepare e-mail memorandum to Tim Michaud regarding sare; prepare e-mail memorandum to Tim Michaud regarding sare; prepare e-mail memorandum to Tim Michaud regarding Servi Daniels report and r

Mar-16-10	N/C - Review Report and Recommendation	0.10	Page 0.00	e 25 of 324 PCLA
<u>(C.</u>	N/C - Telephone conference with Attorney Pierce's assistant regarding scheduling a hearing on Wife's Emergency Motion to Suspend Visitation	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Review facsimile received from North Carolina DSS investigator regarding her reports and therapist Maggie Yankov's recommendations	0.10	17.50	DML
	N/C - Review e-mail memorandum received from Tim Michaud regarding Aimee Casey's new North Carolina counsel and prepare response and information regarding the North Carolina DSS report and recommendations	0.20	0.00	DML
Mar-18-10	N/C - Receipt and response to e-mail from Mr. Michaud regarding status of filing Petition for Modification	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Review Tim Michaud's e-mail regarding North Carolina therapist subpoena	0.10	0.00	DML
Mar-19-10	Additional research regarding out of state non-party subpoenas to produce documents and Florida case law regarding therapist privilege	0.60	105.00	DML
r-22-10	N/C - Receipt of Mr. Michaud's e-mail regarding spring time-sharing	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Draft correspondence to Attorney Julie Glocker Pierce regarding acceptance of service of Former Husband's Petition for Modification; draft Acceptance of Service	0.40	50.00	PCLA
	Draft Notice of Related Cases	0.40	50.00	PCLA
	N/C - Update North Carolina and Florida pleading files; research Clerk's website for filing of Former Wife's Motion to Decline and confirm filing of Former Husband's UCCJEA	0.30	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Review e-mail memorandum received from Tim Michaud regarding spring break visitation	0.20	0.00	DML
	Prepare e-mail memorandum to North Carolina Attorney, Cynthia Carroll regarding status of her Motion to Dismiss Aimee Casey's complaint and spring break visitation issues	0.10	17.50	DML
	Research North Carolina pleadings and advise Ms. Martin-Lee of Order continuing Husband's Motion to Dismiss to March 22, 2010	0.10	12.50	PCLA
Mar-23-10	N/C - Office conference with Ms. Martin- Lee to provide information regarding North Carolina case and	0.20	0.00	PCLA

	pending Motion to Dismiss for response to Attorney Carroll's e-mail		Page	26 of 324
	Review e-mail memorandum received from North Carolina Attorney Cynthia Carroll regarding Easter visitation issues and draft response regarding her Motion to Dismiss	0.20	35.00	DML
	Review additional e-mail memorandum received from North Carolina Attorney Cynthia Carroll regarding status of North Carolina court proceedings	0.10	17.50	DML
Mar-26-10	Pursuant to Attorney Pierce's lack of response regarding acceptance of service on behalf of Former Wife, prepare correspondence to Craven County Sheriff's Department regarding service of Petition for Modification and attached documents on Ms. Casey	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	N/C - Prepare check request for Craven County Sheriff's Department for service of process on Ms. Casey	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Receipt and review of correspondence from Attorney Pierce	0.10	35.00	BWR
	Telephone conference with Tim Michaud regarding Easter and Spring Break visitation with daughter Riley	0.20	35.00	DML
	Telephone conference with Tim Michaud regarding issues with spring break visitation with Riley; review e-mail correspondence received from Tim regarding correspondence with former wife Aimee Casey regarding spring break visitation	0.30	52.50	DML
Mar-29-10	Review Final Judgment and MSA for indications of responsibility for delivery of minor child for visitation; office conference with Ms. Martin-Lee regarding service and Attorney Pierce's correspondence omitting indication or accepting or declining service of process for Ms. Casey; review Mr. Michaud's e-mails	0.40	50.00	PCLA
	N/C - Pull Final Judgment and MSA, scan and e-mail to Mr. Michaud for review regarding transportation responsibilities for visitation; further discussions with Ms. Martin-Lee regarding Mr. Michaud and spring break visitation, and involvement of client's North Carolina attorney in assistance with visitation	0.30	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Scan and e-mail correspondence to Craven County Sheriff's Department to Mr. Michaud	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Õ	N/C - E-mail to Mr. Michaud request he attempt to obtain complete Report from North Carolina	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Amend Mr. Michaud's Notice of Related Cases and e-mail to him	0.20	25.00	PCLA

			Page	27 of 324
	Review e-mail memorandum received from Tim Michaud regarding spring break visitation with Riley and draft response	0.20	35.00	DML
	Telephone call to Attorney Pierce regarding letter received from her with regard to Deborah Day evaluation and related issues	0.10	17.50	DML
	Review and respond to additional e-mail memorandums received from Tim Michaud regarding spring break visitation with Riley	0.20	35.00	DML
	Review additional e-mail memorandums from Tim Michaud regarding spring break visitation; review DSS recommendations regarding visitation	0.20	35.00	DML
Mar-30-10	Telephone call to Attorney Pierce; review e-mail memorandums received and telephone message received from Tim Michaud regarding his spring break visitation issues and prepare responses	0.40	70.00	DML
	N/C - Receipt of Mr. Michaud's e-mail regarding frustration with spring break visitation	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Apr-01-10	Review e-mail memorandum received from Tim Michaud regarding spring break visitation, meet with Mr. Rossway regarding same and draft response	0.20	35.00	DML
	Review additional e-mail memorandums received from Tim Michaud; telephone call to Attorney Pierce regarding visitation with Riley; review two additional e-mails received from Tim Michaud and draft responses; draft letter to Attorney Pierce regarding spring break visitation	0.80	140.00	DML
	Telephone conference with Attorney Pierce regarding spring break visitation	0.40	70.00	DML
	Telephone conference with Tim Michaud regarding spring break visitation	0.40	70.00	DML
	N/C - Office conference with Attorney Martin-Lee regarding correspondence to Attorney Pierce regarding visitation	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Copy and file Notice of Related Cases	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Scan and e-mail Ms. Martin-Lee's correspondence to Attorney Pierce to Mr. Michaud; fax to Attorney Pierce	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Apr-08-10	Receipt and review of Notice of Hearing	0.10	35.00	BWR

Apr-09-10	N/C - Review e-mail memorandum received from Tim Michaud regarding visitation	0.10	Page 0.00	e 28 of 324 DML
	N/C - Review additional e-mail from Tim Michaud regarding North Carolina DSS investigation report	0.10	0.00	DML
	Prepare e-mail memorandum to North Carolina Attorney, Cindy Carroll and DSS investigator Sherry Daniels regarding report of DSS investigation	0.20	35.00	DML
	N/C - Review e-mail memorandum received from Tim Michaud regarding e-mail memorandum he received from North Carolina DSS social worker Sherry Daniels with regard to the safety plan being rescinded.	0.20	0.00	DML
	N/C - Telephone conference with Mr. Moore; advise Mr. Rossway of Mr. Michaud's concerns	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Begin drafting Motion for Contempt; review pleadings and court files for Florida and North Carolina; review DSS "Recommendations"	1.60	200.00	PCLA
	Amend Motion for Contempt to incorporation new information received from Mr. Michaud regarding Sherry Daniel's March 13, 2010 e-mail	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Receipt and review of Acceptance of Service by Attorney Pierce	0.10	35.00	BWR
	Work on issues related to emergency motion; work on issues related to continued retention of jurisdiction by the State of Florida; receive information regarding further rotation of Judges in Brevard County; receive information regarding new judge	0.30	105.00	BWR
Apr-10-10	Office conference with Mr. Rossway for review of issues, pending motion and hearing; pursuant to Mr. Rossway's review amend Motion for Contempt and finalize for filing	0.50	62.50	PCLA
	N/C - E-mail to Mr. Michaud regarding Motion for Contempt and hearing dates	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Apr-15-10	N/C - Attempt to contact Judge Wohn's Judicial Assistant to attempt to schedule Motion for Contempt on May 10, 2010 hearing	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Telephone conference with Judicial Assistant; telephone conference with Attorney Pierce's assistant; telephone conference with Judicial Assistant to advise of Attorney Pierce's objection to Former Husband's Motion for Contempt being set on May 10, 2010 hearing; advise Mr. Rossway	0.40	0.00	PCLA

invoice #:

	Draft Notice of Filing Affidavit of Service and original Summons served on Mrs. Casey	0.20	Page 25.00	29 of 324 PCLA
	Work on emerging issue concerning summer visitation based upon Courts back log due to changing of judges; work with paralegal to expedite filing of Verified Motion to gain the Court's attention concerning upcoming plight of Mr. Michaud for summer access	0.40	140.00	BWR
Apr-16-10	Receipt and review of fax correspondence from Attorney Pierce regarding Dr. Day	0.10	35.00	BWR
Apr-19-10	Review e-mail memorandum received from North Carolina Attorney, Cynthia Carroll regarding DSS investigation report and prepare response	0.20	35.00	DML
	Review e-mail memorandum received from North Carolina DSS investigator, Sherry Daniels regarding the safety plan no longer in place and no findings on investigation	0.20	35.00	DML
Apr-26-10	N/C - Attempt to contact Attorney Pierce's assistant to schedule a telephone conference	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Apr-27-10	Review Attorney Pierce's Motion to Dismiss Supplemental Petition to Modify Final Judgment	0.20	35.00	DML
r-28-10,	N/C - Review e-mail correspondence received from Tim Michaud regarding DSS report and Therapist Jean Huryn's records	0.10	0.00	DML
	Telephone conference with Tim Michaud regarding issue DSS report and therapist's records	0.40	70.00	DML
	Review Sherry Daniels' April 19, 2010 correspondence and draft correspondence to Attorney Pierce regarding Ms. Casey signing of Release of Records from Promise Place; prepare Release of Records	0.50	62.50	PCLA
	Totals	26.00	\$3,367.50	

DISBURSEMENT	S	Disbursements	Receipts
Mar-08-10	Photocopies	0.10	
Mar-10-10	Photocopies	1.00	
Mar-12-10	Photocopies	5.50	
	Postage	4.99	
Mar-19-10	Westlaw Online Research Access	36.97	
Mar-22-10	Photocopies	0.20	

	mvoice #:	33901	
	Photocopies	3.40	Page 30 of 324
	Facsimile Charges	5.00	. age ee e. e
	Facsimile Charges	13.00	
(Postage	1.90	
Mar-23-10	Photocopies	0.10	
Mar-26-10	Photocopies	0.40	
Mar-29-10	1682-001 Michaud, Craven County Sheriff, Service of Process,	30.00	
	Aimee Casey Photocopies	1.20	
	Photocopies	0.20	
	Postage	1.73	
Apr-01-10	Photocopies	0.10	
	Photocopies	1.20	
	Facsimile Charges	2.00	
	Postage	1.32	
Apr-06-10	Telephone Charges	0.20	
	Telephone Charges	0.30	
	Telephone Charges	0.20	
Apr-12-10	Photocopies	3.00	
	Facsimile Charges	6.00	
	Postage	0.88	
Apr-15-10	Telephone Charges	0.20	
	Telephone Charges	0.30	
	Telephone Charges	0.20	
	Telephone Charges	0.10	
Apr-19-10	Photocopies	1.80	
	Postage	1.83	
Apr-25-10	Photocopies	0.30	
Apr-26-10	Telephone Charges	0.20	
	Postage	0.44	
-28-10	Photocopies	0.20	

3.00

Facsimile Charges

invoice #:

JJYU1

Apr-29-10	Postage	0.44	Page 31 of 324
	Totals	\$129.90	\$0.00
	Current Fees & Disbursements		\$3,497.40
	Previous Balance		\$982.54
	Previous Payments		\$0.00
	BALANCE DUE		\$4,479.94

TRUST STATEMENT

Page 32 of 324

	Disbursements	Receipts
Trust Balance Forward		15.00
Total Trust	\$0.00	\$15.00
Trust Balance		\$15.00

VERO BEACH . CORAL GABLES

ROSSWAY MOORE SWAN, P.L. THE MODERN ONE BUILDING 2101 INDIAN RIVER BOULEVARD, SUITE 200 VERO BEACH, FL 32960 Telephone (772) 231-4440 Facsimile (772) 231-4430

Mr. Timothy Michaud 1791 Wekiva Drive Melbourne, FL 32940

June 8, 2010

File #: 1682-001 Inv. #: 54522

RE: Post-judgment issues

Total Due: \$7,637.68

Please write the FILE number on your check to insure proper crediting.

SUMMARY

*Balance Fwd:

\$4,479.94

Payment received:

\$2,000.00)

Current Invoice Amount:

\$5,157.74

TOTAL DUE:

\$7,637.68

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	ATT'Y/L.A.
May-04-10	Research and review Florida case law regarding transfer of venue in preparation for Monday, May 10th hearing on Former Wife's Motion to Decline Jurisdiction for Inconvenient Forum	0.70	122.50	DML
May-05-10	Research and review Florida case law regarding declining or waiving jurisdiction	1.50	262.50	DML
May-06-10	Additional research of Florida case regarding Florida Statute 61.520 regarding inconvenient forum; prepare Former Husband's Affidavit Regarding Forum; prepare e-mail memorandum to Tim Michaud with Affidavit; telephone call to Tim Michaud to discuss Affidavit; make necessary revisions to Affidavit in preparation for his signature	4.00	700.00	DML
	Additional telephone call to Tim Michaud regarding potential witnesses in Florida	0.20	35.00	DML
	N/C - Additional review of Florida Statutes and case law	0.40	0.00	DML

gara.	regarding inconvenient forum; review of pleadings filed by Aimee Casey's Florida counsel, Julia Pierce		Page 34 of 324	
	Review Affidavit and make suggested amendments	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	N/C - Prepare Federal Express to Court for filing of Affidavit	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Review materials in preparation for conference with opposing counsel; review materials prepared by associate and paralegal to oppose Motion to Transfer Venue	0.30	105.00	BWR
May-07-10	Review pleadings and documents in preparation for Monday, May 10th hearing on former wife's Motion to Decline Jurisdiction	0.60	105.00	DML
	Review former wife's Amended Affidavit on Motion to Dismiss	0.20	35.00	DML
	Work on hearing matters for May 10th on Former Wife's Motion to Decline Jurisdiction for Inconvenient Forum; telephone conference with Mr. Michaud; review Amended Affidavit in Support of Motion to Dismiss; advise Mr. Rossway of receipt of Amended Affidavit	0.50	62.50	PCLA
	N/C - Telephone conference with Attorney Pierce's assistant regarding court reporter; telephone calls to several court reporters to schedule court reporter for May 11th hearing; telephone conference with Judge Wohn's Judicial Assistant to verify that only pending matter for May 11th is Former Wife's Motion to Decline Jurisdiction for Inconvenient Forum; e-mail Amended Affidavit to Mr. Michaud and forward his response Ms. Martin-Lee	0.40	0.00	PCLA
	Prepare file and exhibits for May 11, 2010 hearing on Former Wife's Motion to Decline Jurisdiction for Inconvenient Forum	0.40	50.00	PCLA
	Prepare Notice of Hearing on Former Husband's Motion for Contempt and to Enforce Final Judgement scheduled for July 8, 2010	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Telephone conference with opposing counsel regarding various issues for upcoming hearing; discussions regarding Mr. Michaud's various positions; discussion regarding expert to be hired in Florida with a reservation of who will pay based upon expert's findings; discussion regarding Motion to Dismiss; discussion regarding Motion to Change Venue; discussion regarding Motion for Contempt; review file prepared by associate and paralegal regarding affidavit, motions, legal arguments, and case law; check with Court regarding the status of 8:00 AM hearing on Monday	0.75	262.50	BWR

			Page 35 of 324	
	Receive additional information from opposing counsel including updated scandalous affidavit; provide additional direction to associate and paralegal for preparation for hearing	0.40	140.00	BWR
May-08-10	N/C - Continue to search for court reporter available for May 11, 2010 hearing; telephone conference with Gloria at King Reporting to schedule court reporter; prepare "copy" Notice of Hearing and e-mail to King Court Reporting	0.50	0.00	PCLA
May-09-10	N/C - Telephone conference with Mr. Rossway regarding Amended Affidavit in Support of Motion to Dismiss; telephone conference with Ms. Martin-Lee	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Extensive Sunday preparation for Motion to Transfer case to North Carolina based upon the allegations of inconvenience for him; prepare arguments; review case law; review all scandalous materials filed by former wife; pull additional material regarding Brevard County Sheriff's Department reporting and results, of Florida Department of Children and Family Services report and finding of unsubstantiated claims; review North Carolina administrative proceedings findings of unsubstantiated claims; prepare arguments for Court; review entire file; work on anticipated arguments be made by opposing counsel and manner to refute arguments based upon former wife's invoking of jurisdiction and venue for her purposes; factual witnesses being involved in Florida and allegations of inappropriate activity having occurred in Florida	1.50	525.00	BWR
May-10-10	N/C - Return telephone call to Tim Michaud - left message	0.10	0.00	DML
	Review Florida case Thomas v. Thomas regarding jurisdictional issue	0.20	35.00	DML
	Two telephone conference with Tim Michaud regarding	0.20	35.00	DML
	N/C - Travel to Brevard County Courthouse	1.00	0.00	BWR
	Final preparation for and attend motion before the Hon. Judge Wohn; argue Mr. Michaud's position; meeting with Mr. Michaud; based upon new schedule allegations were based upon mother's conduct before any contact between father and child; telephone call to Attorney Andrew Metcalf, regarding potential legal opinion concerning alleged criminal activity by North Carolina police without full knowledge of facts and circumstances of case	1.00	350.00	BWR
		0.00	25.00	D141
May-11-10	Telephone conference with Tim Michaud regarding	0.20	35.00	DML

	N/C - Review e-mail memorandum received from Tim Michaud regarding North Carolina Department of Social Services and follow up with telephone conference with Tim	0.20	Page _{0.00}	36 of 324 DML
May-12-10	N/C - Office conference with Attorney Martin-Lee for update on Florida and North Carolina investigation of new allegations and regarding Florida Sheriff's opinion of new Affidavit from North Carolina	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Prepare Mr. Rossway's correspondence to Mr. Michaud regarding case and RMT invoice	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Telephone conference with Tim Michaud regarding his discussion with the Sheriff of Brevard County	0.20	35.00	DML
	N/C - Review e-mail memorandum received from Tim Michaud regarding his e-mail correspondence from North Carolina DSS regarding their investigation	0.10	0.00	DML
	Telephone call to Tim Michaud regarding his e-mail correspondence from North Carolina DSS Investigator Sherri Daniels	0.10	17.50	DML
	N/C - Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud to discuss developing issues	0.20	0.00	BWR
.v.ay-14-10	Review e-mail memorandum received from Tim Michaud regarding	0.10	17.50	DML
	N/C - Review Judge Wohn's Order denying Former Wife's Motion to Decline Jurisdiction	0.10	0.00	DML
	Review Attorney Julia Pierce's facsimile correspondence regarding stipulating to Dr. Deborah Day and other issues; review Consent for Release of Dr. Huryn's records	0.20	35.00	DML
	Research Florida Evidence Code and case law regarding testimony of child victim hearsay	0.80	140.00	DML
	Draft correspondence to Jean Huryn enclosing medical release and request for copies of Riley's records; draft correspondence to North Carolina attorney regarding dismissing case; telephone conference with Attorney Pierce's assistant regarding Motion for Hearsay Testimony and hearing and depositions of North Carolina people; office conference with Mr. Rossway; review of Stipulation for Mediator	0.90	112.50	PCLA
	Review Order of Court retaining jurisdiction and refusing to transfer case to North Carolina; discussion with Mr. Michaud; review fax materials from opposing counsel; provide information to associate to further defend against claims by Florida attorney and ex-wife	0.30	105.00	BWR

May-17-10	Receipt and review of correspondence from Attorney Pierce with enclosed Stipulation	0.10	Page 35.00	e 37 of 324 BWR
	N/C - Review e-mail memorandum from Tim Michaud regarding Judge's Order Declining Jurisdiction	0.10	0.00	DML
	Research issue of introducing child therapist's records into evidence	0.60	105.00	DML
	Work on stipulation for Dr. Day; work on issue regarding attempts to set a deposition without a state therapist; provide materials to associate to research appropriateness of objecting to the therapist testifying	0.40	140.00	BWR
May-18-10	N/C - Amend and finalize correspondence to Attorney Carroll pursuant to Mr. Rossway's review	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Review proposed Stipulated Order on Appointment of Dr. Day; pull new Florida Statute 61.13(3); draft proposed Stipulated Order to include detailed language of Fla.Stat 61.13(3) and issues of change in custody and time-sharing	1.90	237.50	PCLA
	N/C - Research Florida Statutes regarding Dr. Deborah Day's evaluation of the parties and daughter, Riley	0.20	0.00	DML
	N/C - Review letter to North Carolina Attorney Cynthia Carroll regarding dismissal of Aimee Casey's North Carolina Complaint	0.10	0.00	DML
May-19-10	N/C - Review letter from Florida Attorney Julia Pierce regarding scheduling hearings and depositions	0.10	0.00	DML
May-20-10	Review Stipulated Order Appointing Licensed Psychologist and Evaluation of the Parties and Minor Child and research Florida Statutes regarding same	0.30	52.50	DML
	Research Florida Family Law Rules of Procedure and Florida case law regarding testimony of therapist and therapist/child privilege; research evidential issue with obtaining therapist Jean Huryn's records; draft correspondence to Attorney Julia Pierce regarding objection to Jean Huryn's testimony	1.50	262.50	DML
	N/C - Meet with Mr. Rossway and Paralegal, Patti Cain, to discuss case strategy	0.20	0.00	DML
C	N/C - Office conference with Mr. Rossway and Ms. Martin-Lee regarding opposing counsel's request for depositions and hearsay testimony, investigations and evaluation	0.30	0.00	PCLA
**************************************	N/C - Telephone conference with Attorney Pierce's assistant regarding scheduling a telephone conference	0.20	0.00	PCLA

Ŧ: 343ZZ

	with Mr. Rossway and Ms. Pierce to be covered by Ms. Martin-Lee		Page	38 of 324
ı√lay-21-10	N/C - Receipt and review of Request for Copies	0.10	0.00	BWR
	Review Florida case law regarding child hearsay and review all correspondence and pleadings in preparation for this afternoon's telephone conference with Attorney Julia Pierce	1.00	75.00	DML
	Telephone conference with Attorney Julie Pierce regarding stipulation for Dr. Day's evaluation and visitation issues	0.40	70.00	DML
	N/C - Prepare memorandum regarding telephone conference with Attorney Julie Pierce	0.00	0.00	DML
	N/C - Attend telephone call with Attorney Martin-Lee and Attorney Pierce; discussion with Ms. Martin-Lee on Attorney Pierce's indications that Mrs. Casey had no intent to allow Mr. Michaud summer visitation and issues with our amended Stipulated Order not agreed to by Attorney Pierce	0.50	0.00	PCLA
	Work on contempt issue after receiving information from associate	0.20	70.00	BWR
May-24-10	N/C - Review facsimile correspondence received from Attorney Julie Pierce regarding depositions	0.10	0.00	DML
	N/C - Draft Notice of Unavailability	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Receipt and review of correspondence dated May 19, 2010 from Attorney Pierce	0.10	35.00	BWR
	Work on Dr. Deborah Day's stipulation after receiving information from Attorney Deborah Martin Lee confirming that mother will violate Court Order and not return child to Florida	0.20	70.00	BWR
May-25-10	Review Attorney Julie Pierce's facsimile correspondence regarding Dr. Deborah Day's evaluation and the notarized affidavit of North Carolina deputy who interviewed Riley Michaud	0.10	17.50	DML
	Review letter received from Attorney Julie Pierce's Motion to Continue	0.10	17.50	DML
	Review Attorney Pierce's fourteen page facsimile correspondence regarding Stipulated Order appointing Psychologist, Amended Notice of Hearing and Motion to Allow Child Victim Hearsay; review Attorney Pierce's letter regarding Motion to Continue; review Attorney Pierce's Motion to Continue and to Require	0.40	70.00	DML

	Coordination of Depositions and Hearings or Permit Unilateral Setting; review Tim Michaud's e-mail correspondence regarding status of case		Page	e 39 of 324
May-26-10	Receipt and review of correspondence from Attorney Pierce regarding timesharing and access during the summer	0.10	35.00	BWR
	Review Attorney Pierce's amended Stipulated Order for changes proposed by Mr. Rossway; telephone conference with Dr. Day for retainer/evaluation fee	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Receipt of and respond to e-mail from Mr. Michaud; gather all recent correspondence and pleadings received from Attorney Pierce for e-mail to Mr. Michaud	0.10	12.50	PCLA
	N/C - Scan and e-mail pleadings and correspondence to Mr. Michaud	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Telephone conference with Judge Wohn's Judicial Assistant regarding filing and setting Motion to Compel Visitation for emergency hearing	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Review additional letter received from Attorney Pierce regarding revisions to Agreed Stipulated Order Appointing Evaluator	0.60	105.00	DML
	Review facsimile correspondence from Attorney Pierce with Motion for Appointment of Evaluator	0.20	35.00	DML
	Prepare e-mail memorandum to Tim Michaud regarding Emergency Motion to Enforce Visitation	0.10	17.50	DML
	Research Florida case law regarding objection to deposition of privileged communications; begin drafting Emergency Motion to Enforce Visitation	1.20	210.00	DML
	Work on issues regarding stipulation for Dr. Day; work on issues regarding emergency motion based upon opposing attorney's statements that her client will not comply with Court Orders, as basis for emergency motion to have child turned over to Mr. Michaud; short meeting with team to work on best plan for moving forward regarding Dr. Day with stipulation to be provided to the Court	0.50	175.00	BWR
May-27-10	Receipt and review of correspondence from Attorney Pierce together with the Stipulated Order Appointing Psychologist, Motion to Allow Child Victim Hearsay and Amended Notice of Hearing	0.30	105.00	BWR
	Prepare Mr. Rossway's extensive correspondence to Mr. Michaud in response to Mr. Michaud's e-mail regarding investigation and therapy reports and summer visitation	0.80	100.00	PCLA

54522

	Work on issues for emergency motion; work on materials received from opposing counsel; receive e-mail from Mr. Michaud; draft correspondence to Mr. Michaud explaining options and pointing out potential issues regarding upcoming visitation, and related matters	0.40	Page 140.00	e 40 of 324 BWR
	Review e-mail memorandum received from Tim Michaud regarding summer visitation with Riley and issues with Dr. Day	0.10	17.50	DML
	N/C - Meet with Mr. Rossway and Patti Cain to discuss case strategy and Emergency Verified Motion to Enforce Visitation	0.20	0.00	DML
	Continue drafting Emergency Verified Motion for Enforcement of Final Judgment Regarding Timesharing	1.50	262.50	DML
	N/C - Prepare all forwarding envelopes, return envelopes, and fax cover sheets for Former Husband's Emergency Motion; amend Emergency Motion to substitute and remove "visitation" with "timesharing"	0.50	0.00	PCLA
May-28-10	Telephone conference with Tim Michaud regarding emergency motion for visitation and his conversation with the Sheriff in North Carolina	0.40	70.00	DML
	N/C - Revise and finalize Former Husband's Emergency Motion for Summer Visitation	1.20	0.00	DML
	N/C - Prepare letter to Judge Wohn regarding Former Husband's Emergency Motion for Summer Visitation	0.00	0.00	DML
Jun-08-10	15% Courtesy write off (\$ 894.75) per BWR		-894.75	BWR
	Totals	37.55	\$5,070.25	

DISBURSEMENTS		Disbursements	Receipts
May-06-10	Photocopies	2.20	
	Telephone Charges	0.10	
	Fedex to Clerk of Court, Brevard County, Melbourne, FL	9.56	
May-07-10	Photocopies	1.20	
	Photocopies	0.10	
	Photocopies	0.40	
	Photocopies	0.40	
	Photocopies	0.40	

54522

Page 41 of 324

	Photocopies	0.10
	Facsimile Charges	5.00
	Facsimile Charges	2.00
	Telephone Charges	0.70
	Telephone Charges	0.20
	Telephone Charges	0.20
	Telephone Charges	0.20
	Postage	1.32
May-08-10	Telephone Charges	0.30
May-09-10	Photocopies	1.50
	Photocopies	1.00
May-13-10	Photocopies	0.10
	Postage	0.44
May-14-10	Telephone Charges	0.20
	Telephone Charges	0.30
.ay-19-10	Photocopies	0.60
	Facsimile Charges	3.00
	Postage	0.88
May-20-10	Photocopies	0.50
	Telephone Charges	0.40
	Westlaw Online Research Access	37.00
May-21-10	Telephone Charges	0.10
	Westlaw Online Research Access	20.60
May-24-10	Photocopies	. 0.70
	Facsimile Charges	8.00
	Postage	0.61
May-26-10	Photocopies	0.60
	Telephone Charges	0.40
	Postage	0.88
May-27-10	Photocopies	0.30
	Postage	0.44

invoice #:

F: 34322

15% courtesy write down	-15.44	Page 42 of 324
Totals	\$87.49	\$0.00
Current Fees & Disbursements	-	\$5,157.74
Previous Balance		\$4,479.94
Previous Payments		\$2,000.00
BALANCE DUE	-	\$7,637.68

Jun-08-10

54522

TRUST STATEMENT

Page 43 of 324

	Disbursements	Receipts
Trust Balance Forward		15.00
Total Trust	\$0.00	\$15.00
Trust Balance		\$15.00

VERO BEACH . CORAL GABLES

ROSSWAY MOORE SWAN, P.L.
THE MODERN ONE BUILDING
2101 INDIAN RIVER BOULEVARD, SUITE 200
VERO BEACH, FL 32960
Telephone (772) 231-4440 Facsimile (772) 231-4430

Mr. Timothy Michaud 1791 Wekiva Drive Melbourne, FL 32940

July 12, 2010

File #: 1682-001 Inv. #: 55109

Total Due:

\$1,823.15

RE: Post-judgment issues

Please write the FILE number on your check to insure proper crediting.

SUMMARY

*Balance Fwd:

\$7,637.68

Payment received:

\$7,637.68)

Current Invoice Amount:

\$1,823.15

TOTAL DUE:

\$1,823.15

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	ATT'Y/L.A.
Jun-01-10	N/C - Revise and finalize letter to Judge Wohn regarding Emergency Motion for Summer Visitation; prepare e-mail memorandum to Tim Michaud regarding date summer visitation with Riley is to begin; telephone call to Tim Michaud to schedule appointment with Mr. Rossway	0.60	0.00	DML
Jun-02-10	N/C - Telephone conference with Judge Wohn's office regarding emergency motion	0.10	0.00	DML
Jun-03-10	Revise Stipulation Order Appointing Licensed Psychologist and Evaluation of the Parties and Minor Child	0.40	70.00	DML
	N/C - Telephone call to Judge Maxwell's office regarding emergency motion	0.10	0.00	DML
Jun-04-10	N/C - Review pleadings and correspondence from Attorney Pierce in preparation for this morning's meeting with Tim Michaud	0.60	0.00	DML

55109

	N/C - Meet with Tim Michaud and Mr. Rossway regarding case status and strategy	2.00	Page 0.00	45 of 324 DML
	Extensive office conference with Mr. Michaud to refine strategy; discussion regarding strategy in North Carolina and moving case forward with Dr. Deborah Day	1.00	350.00	BWR
Jun-09-10	Telephone conference with Tim Michaud regarding his upcoming visit to Bern, North Carolina and summer visitation	0.40	70.00	DML
Jun-10-10	Telephone conference with Tim Michaud regarding Stipulation to Appoint Evaluator and issues with visitation; review background information on Jean Huryn and Deputy Whitfield	0.30	52.50	DML
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, draft correspondence to Mr. Michaud	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Draft correspondence to Attorney Pierce regarding Stipulated Order Appointing Licensed Psychologist	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Jun-14-10	N/C - Review telephone voice message from Tim Michaud	0.10	0.00	DML
	N/C - Voicemail and telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding research of file for signed Final Judgment and forwarding to North Carolina attorney for hearing; several attempts to fax Final Judgment	0.40	0.00	PCLA
Jun-15-10	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud; fax Craven County Department of Social Services correspondence regarding closing of case and statement of "unfounded" allegations	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Telephone conference with Tim Michaud regarding the trespass charge and the North Carolina hearings	0.30	52.50	DML
	Telephone conference with Tim Michaud and North Carolina Attorney Cynthia Carroll regarding this morning's hearing in North Carolina	0.30	52.50	DML
Jun-16-10	N/C - Office conference with Attorney Martin-Lee for update on ruling by North Carolina court on summer time-sharing	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Jun-17-10	Review former wife's North Carolina pleading filed in response to North Carolina Attorney Carroll's Motion to Register Florida Final Judgment; review trespass documents Tim Michaud received in North Carolina	0.30	52.50	DML
Jun-20-10	Sunday review of all Florida case law regarding child victim hearsay and child therapist hearsay including Allison v. State; Department of Health and Rehabilitative Services v. M.B.; Bridges v. Bridges;	1.50	262.50	DML

	Devereux Florida Treatment Network v. McIntosh; Florida Statute 90.503(c)(1) and (2); Florida Family Law Rules of Procedure 12.363(b)(2)(c); Dinter v. Brewer and Nicewander Treatise on Child Hearsay on competency of child, statements of doctors and counselors, reliability factors and other corroborative evidence of the abuse or neglect			
Jun-21-10	Research North Carolina therapist Amanda Aceves with Port Human Services, and Attorney Lee W. Bettis	0.40	50.00	KMLA
	Draft Response and Objection to Former Wife's Motion to Allow Child Victim Hearsay and Motion to Waive Therapist's Privilege	0.80	140.00	DML
Jun-23-10	Review facsimile correspondence from Attorney Pierce regarding Stipulated Order to Appoint Psychologist	0.20	35.00	DML
Jun-24-10	Prepare e-mail memorandum to North Carolina Attorney Cynthia Carroll regarding dismissing proceedings in North Carolina	0.10	17.50	DML
	N/C - Review e-mail memorandum received from North Carolina Attorney Cynthia Carroll regarding dismissing North Carolina pleading to register Florida Final Judgment of Dissolution of Marriage	0.20	0.00	DML
	N/C - Review Attorney Pierce's Revised Stipulated Order Appointing Licensed Psychologist and Evaluation of the Parties and Minor Child	0.20	0.00	DML
	Review and finalize stipulation concerning Dr. Day; review information concerning North Carolina experience and alleged trespass; begin work on arguments for upcoming Motion for Contempt	0.40	140.00	BWR
Jun-25-10	Review all pleadings filed by Attorney Pierce; review Attorney Pierce's revisions to Stipulated Order Appointing Licensed Psychologist and Evaluation of the Parties and Minor Child	0.20	35.00	DML
Jun-27-10	N/C - Office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding Former Wife's Petition for Relocation and pending Stipulation regarding Dr. Day	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Jun-28-10	Receipt and initial review of Petition to Relocate and Stipulated Order Appointing Licensed Psychologist and Evaluation of the Parties and Minor Child	0.30	105.00	BWR
Ċ	N/C - Review revised Joint Stipulation to Appoint Deborah Day and letter to Attorney Pierce regarding same	0.20	0.00	DML
	N/C - Review facsimile received from Attorney Pierce regarding Petition to Relocate	0.20	0.00	DML

			Page	47 of 324
)	N/C - Review telephone voice message from Attorney Pierce regarding her receipt of Joint Stipulation to Appoint Deborah Day and return call (left message)	0.20	0.00	DML
	Review relocation situation; review pleadings; begin work on responsive materials	0.30	105.00	BWR
	N/C - Office conference with Attorney Martin-Lee regarding amending Stipulation appointing Dr. Day in light of Former Wife's Petition for Relocation	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Pursuant to Attorney Martin-Lee, draft changes to Paragraph 6 of Stipulation appointing Dr. Day; draft correspondence to Attorney Pierce regarding amending Stipulation, resolution of Stipulation by July 8th hearing, and service of Petition to Relocate to be served on Mr. Michaud via service of process	0.50	62.50	PCLA
Jun-29-10	N/C - Review Petition to Relocate received by facsimile from Attorney Pierce	0.20	0.00	DML
	Totals	13.80	\$1,727.50	

DISBURSEMI	ENTS	Disbursements	Receipts
-01-10	Photocopies	0.20	
	Photocopies	0.80	
	Photocopies	0.80	
	Photocopies	0.60	
	Photocopies	0.80	
	Photocopies	0.10	
	Facsimile Charges	9.00	
	Facsimile Charges	9.00	
	Telephone Charges	0.20	
	Postage	2.44	
Jun-10-10	Facsimile Charges	8.00	
	Westlaw Online Research Access	32.50	
	Postage	1.22	
J:14-10	Facsimile Charges	3.00	
	Facsimile Charges	4.00	
	Facsimile Charges	1.00	

	Invoice #:	55109	
Telephone Charges	0.1	0	Page 48 of 324
Telephone Charges	0.2	.0	Ū
Facsimile Charges	2.0	0	
Photocopies	0.4	+ O	
Photocopies	3.0	60	
Facsimile Charges	8.0	0	
Telephone Charges	3.0	60	
Fedex to Attorney Julie Glocker Pierce, Indiatlantic,	FL 9.6	i9	
Totals	\$95.6	<u> </u>	\$0.00
Current Fees & Disbursements			\$1,823.15
Previous Balance			\$7,637.68
Previous Payments			\$7,637.68
BALANCE DUE			\$1,823.15

(i-15-10

Jun-19-10

Jun-28-10

55109

TRUST STATEMENT

Page 49 of 324

	Disbursements	Receipts
Trust Balance Forward		15.00
Total Trust	\$0.00	\$15.00
Trust Balance		\$15.00

VERO BEACH . CORAL GABLES

ROSSWAY MOORE SWAN, P.L. THE MODERN ONE BUILDING 2101 INDIAN RIVER BOULEVARD, SUITE 200 VERO BEACH, FL 32960 Telephone (772) 231-4440 Facsimile (772) 231-4430

Mr. Timothy Michaud 1791 Wekiva Drive Melbourne, FL 32940

August 12, 2010

File #: 1682-001 Inv. #: 55487

Total Due: \$7,953.18

RE: Post-judgment issues

Please write the FILE number on your check to insure proper crediting.

SUMMARY

*Balance Fwd:

\$1,823.15

Payment received:

\$1,823.15)

Current Invoice Amount:

\$7,953.18

TOTAL DUE:

\$7,953.18

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	ATT'Y/L.A.
Jul-01-10	N/C - Prepare request for research regarding service of Petition for Relocation pursuant to Fla. Stat. 61.13001	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Conduct legal research FSA 61.13001 (service process on party with a pending court action); draft memorandum	0.80	80.00	DLR
	Receipt and review of fax correspondence from Attorney Pierce regarding service of Petition to Relocate	0.10	35.00	BWR
Jul-02-10	Research Final Judgment of Dissolution regarding relocation; review Aimee Casey's e-mail to Tim regarding daughter Riley and her non-communication	0.20	35.00	DML
	Research Florida Statutes regarding relocation; research Final Judgment of Dissolution of Marriage regarding relocation;	0.40	70.00	DML
	N/C - Review Attorney Pierce's facsimile communication regarding serving Petition of Relocation	0.10	0.00	DML

Jul-06-10

Prepare file and documents for office conference between Mr. Rossway and Mr. Michaud	0.30	Page 5 37.50	51 of 324 PCLA
N/C - Attend meeting and record facts and issues relative for use at hearing on July 8, 2010; research file for e-mails regarding recital; review abuse report for contradictions	1.20	0.00	PCLA
Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding Craven County Sheriff's Detail Report forwarded to employees of Mr. Michaud	0.20	25.00	PCLA
N/C - Office conference with Mr. Rossway to advise of Sheriff's report provided to Mr. Michaud's place of employment and instructions to prepare Motion for Contempt and Sanction	0.20	0.00	PCLA
N/C - Confirm court reporter for hearing on July 8, 2010; telephone conference with Attorney Pierce's office with confirmation	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Additional telephone call with Mr. Michaud regarding mailing of Sheriff's Report and issues for hearing; receipt of faxed Sheriff's Detail Report mailed to Mr. Michaud's business associates and employees	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Work on hearing materials, including review of pleadings, all e-mails between parties and evidence for use at hearing	0.70	87.50	PCLA
N/C - Attempt to reach Dale Young, Brevard Sheriff's Department and leave message for return call	0.10	0.00	PCLA
N/C - Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding dismissal of North Carolina case with reserve on attorney fees pending Florida case, and possibility of Detective Whitfield appearing at July 8, 2010 hearing; advise Mr. Rossway and Ms. Martin-Lee	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Begin extensive preparations for Contempt Hearing, Access Hearing, and Motion to Restrict Visitation; extensive conference with Mr. Michaud to discuss testimony and strategy for hearing; discussion regarding anticipating next issue to be raised by ex-wife based upon her previous behaviors	1.25	437.50	BWR
N/C - Continue researching Florida case law regarding child victim hearsay testimony and visitation issues including Pallay v. Pallay, State v. Townsend, Attorney Ad Litem v. Parents of D.K., Hughes v. Schatzberg, Ross v. Blank; R.U. v. Department of Children and Families, State of Florida v. Dupree, Baron v. Baron, Coberly v. Coberly, Allison v. State, Department of Health and Rehabilitative Services v. M.B., Bridges v. Bridges, Devereux v. McIntosh; revise Former Husband's Response and Objection to Allow Child Victim Hearsay;	4.50	0.00	DML

			Page	52 of 324
Jul-07-10	N/C - Assist Deborah Martin-Lee by preparing case law to present at hearing	0.70	0.00	KMLA
	N/C - Telephone conference with Agent Dale Young regarding investigation; advise Mr. Rossway of mvestigation and Agent Dale Young	0.30	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding preparing time-line of North Carolina and Florida pleadings and investigations, and request to Agent Young to testify at hearing; additional telephone conference with Agent Young regarding testifying at hearing; prepare Subpoena for Hearing	0.40	0.00	PCLA
	In preparation for important hearing, review North Carolina and Florida pleading files, and all investigative documents in Florida and North Carolina and prepare time-line of pleadings filed and investigations in both Florida and North Carolina	1.70	212.50	PCLA
	N/C - Office conference with Ms. Martin-Lee regarding issues and discussion with Craven County Sheriff's Department regarding release "Detail" report	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding issues for hearing including mailing of Sheriff's Detail report	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, prepare all exhibits and motions to be heard, to include all investigative documents, e-mails, and time-line for review in preparations for hearing	0.80	100.00	PCLA
	Meet with paralegal and associate regarding case law to be presented at hearing; work on issue regarding subpoena for investigator in Florida; work on defensive position for potential out-of-state investigator to provide testimony; provide direction to paralegal for oversight of time lines, additional evidence to be presented, issues to be argued and defended	0.75	262.50	BWR
	Review police report and affidavit received from Tim Michaud that was sent to his work associates; two telephone conferences with Craven County Sheriff's office regarding police reports and public information; preparation for tomorrow's hearing on Motion for Contempt regarding visitation; telephone conference with Captain Joe Heckman with the Craven County Sheriff's office regarding the affidavit and police report of Detective John Whitfield;	4.50	400.00	DML
11 98-10	Final preparations for hearing; assist Mr. Rossway with review of exhibits, telephone call with North Carolina attorney's assistant regarding Order dismissing case; receipt of Order; receipt of Former Wife's Amend Motion; prepare additional exhibits, telephone call with Agent Dale Young regarding review of issues with Mr.	1.80	225.00	PCLA

Rossway; scan and e-mail Agent Young Former Wife's Amended Motion; research Promise Place regarding "goals" of sexual abuse and child abuse counseling; research Jean Huryn for degrees and license		Pag	ge 53 of 324
N/C - Telephone conference with Mr. Rossway regarding status of hearing and scheduling status conference for attorneys and Dr. Day	0.20	0.00	PCLA
N/C - Hearing preparation including preparing case law and exhibits; review e-mail memorandum received from Captain Heckman from Craven County Sheriff's Office regarding the detail reports and narrative that were mailed to Tim Michaud's business associates; review Amended Motion to Allow Child Victim Hearsay and Waive Therapist Privilege and exhibits to motion including Detective Whitfield's interview with Riley	3.00	0.00	DML
Extensive morning preparations for hearings on contempt and for a Protective Order; review all case law, prepared testimony of investigator, cross examination North Carolina investigator, testimony of Mr. Michaud, cross examination of former wife, and preparation of arguments for judge; review and prepare order of exhibits for case	2.50	875.00	BWR
N/C - Travel to Brevard County Court complex	1.00	0.00	BWR
Meeting with Mr. Michaud and witnesses before hearing; attend extensive evidentiary hearing with Judge Maxwell; take testimony and make legal arguments; take information regarding Courts required Order	3.00	1,050.00	BWR
N/C - Returned to Vero Beach	1.00	0.00	BWR
Receipt and review of copy of correspondence to Judge Maxwell from Attorney Pierce enclosing Stipulated Order Appointing Licensed Psychologist; receipt and review of Amended Motion to Allow Child Victim Hearsay and Motion to Waive Psychotherapist Privilege for the Minor Child filed by Attorney Pierce	0.20	70.00	BWR
N/C- Office conference with Mr. Rossway for receipt of Judge's ruling and instructions for preparing order and directions to schedule status conference with Judge's Judicial assistant to include Mr. Rossway, Ms. Pierce, and Dr. Day, prepare draft order upon receipt of court reporter providing transcript of hearing, and instructions to call Mr. Michaud regarding lawsuit	0.40	0.00	PCLA
N/C - Telephone conference with Mr. Rossway and Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant; telephone conference with Dr. Day's office; telephone conference with Attorney Pierce's assistant; attempt to contact Judge Maxwell's assistant to confirm July 23rd for status conference for Mr. Rossway and Attorney Pierce;	0.50	0.00	PCLA

Jul-09-10

Page 54 of 324

	Rossway's advise of tentative status conference date pending Dr. Day's availability		Pa	ge 54 01 32
	N/C - Reorganize file post hearing on July 8, 2010	0.40	0.00	PCLA
	Work on issues relating to Court Order; Dr. Deborah Day, information relating to mother's activities, and discovery to be employed concerning relocation	0.75	262.50	BWR
Jul-11-10	Receipt and initial review of July 8, 2010 hearing transcript e-mailed by King Court Reporting for drafting Order	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	N/C - Office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding service of Petition for Relocation on Mr. Michaud and calendar answer, and provide discovery on Former Wife	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Jul-12-10	Receipt and review of correspondence dated July 9, 2010 from Attorney Pierce together with the enclosed Amended Motion	0.20	70.00	BWR
	N/C - Telephone call with Dr. Day's assistant; telephone conference with Judge Maxwell's assistant regarding delay in Dr. Day's confirming availability for July 23rd status conference	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Jul-13-10	Work on relocation of case; meet with paralegal regarding extensive discovery to be propounded upon ex-wife including interrogatories, Request to Produce, and Request for Omissions	0.40	140.00	BWR
	N/C - Office conference with law clerk regarding relocation and preparations and drafting of request for production, request for admissions, and interrogatories, and provide background information	0.30	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Attempt to contact Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant for clarification regarding Dr. Day's appearance by phone and if clients are to appear at status conference	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Telephone conference with Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant confirming Judge's request for parties and Dr. Day to appear for July 23rd Status Conference	0.10	0.00	PCLA
<i>(</i> - 0	N/C - Receipt of voice mail from Agent Dale Young of Brevard Sheriff's Department with request for status of July 8, 2010 hearing	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Ju-14-10	Receipt and review of transcript of Motion Proceedings taken on July 8, 2010	0.20	70.00	BWR

Work on Order for Court; work on Dr. Deborah Day's appearance at the hearing on Friday July 23; review e-mail from Mr. Michaud	0.20	70.00	Page 55 of 32 BWR
N/C - Telephone conference with Attorney Pierce and Dr. Day's offices to advise of hearing time and requirement for client and Dr. Day's appearance at court; telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding appearance at hearing and possible meeting with Mr. Rossway regarding Former Wife's Petition for Relocation	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Prepare Notice of Hearing for Status Conference on July 23, 2010	0.20	25.00	PCLA
N/C - Telephone conference with Dr. Day's office regarding pre-paid cost for Dr. Day to appear in person for hearing and telephone conference cost; telephone conference with Judge Maxwell's assistant to advise of Dr. Day's fees	0.20	0.00	PCLA
N/C - Receipt of voice mail from Dr. Day's assistant advising of revised cost for appearance at hearing to be at hourly rate	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Receipt and review of Motion for Award of Temporary Attorney's Fees	0.10	35.00	BWR
Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud	0.30	105.00	BWR
N/C - Telephone conference with Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant and Dr. Day's assistant regarding Dr. Day's appearance via phone for hearing	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Amend Notice of Hearing regarding Dr. Day's telephonic appearance	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Draft correspondence to Mr. Michaud regarding Status Conference hearing, costs for Dr. Day's telephonic appearance and costs for evaluation available at hearing	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Review transcript of Judge's Order on hearing held on July 8, 2010; preparation of draft Order on hearing on Motions including all findings of fact set forth by Judge Maxwell and all orders set forth in the transcript	2.10	262.50	CRLA
N/C - Review partial transcript of Judge Maxwell's findings and order on Emergency Motion for Visitation, Emergency Motion for Contempt and Motion for Child Victim Hearsay; review proposed Order on motions	0.40	0.00	DML
Refine Requests for Admissions to Former Wife	0.60	75.00	PCLA

Jul-15-10

Jul-16-10

MIVOICO II. JJ701

	Work on issues relating to extensive discovery, Request	0.50	175 00 Pag	ge 56 of 324
	for Admissions, Interrogatories and Request to Produce; work on Order of the judge based upon garbled transcript	0.50	175.00	BWK
Jul-18-10	Work on Court's Order; work on discovery issues; provide notes and materials to paralegal for preparation on Monday July 19	0.30	105.00	BWR
Jul-19-10	Continue work on refining and amending Interrogatories to the Wife regarding relocation; review and amend Request for Production of documents	2.40	300.00	PCLA
	Prepare Answer to Petition to Relocate	0.40	50.00	PCLA
Jul-20-10	N/C - Telephone conference with Dr. Day's assistant to confirm attendance at hearing, confirm payment for hearing, and discussion regarding payment of evaluation by credit card; e-mail to Mr. Michaud regarding hearing fee and evaluation payment	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Work on refining extensive Court Order on July 8, 2010 Hearing to including Findings of Facts and additional rulings; further review transcript for Florida Status and case law; research case law for inclusion in Order	1.80	225.00	PCLA
	N/C - Draft forwarding correspondence to Attorney Pierce enclosing proposed Order	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, draft correspondence to Attorney Pierce requesting the minor child be brought to Florida for the July 23rd hearing	0.10	12.50	PCLA
	N/C - Schedule court reporter for hearing on July 23, 2010; fax Notice of Hearing to King Court Reporter	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Extensive work on issues relating to case in chief and modification; work with paralegal on Answer; work on review and refinement of Request for Admissions, Interrogatories, and other discovery requests; work on and review Order of Court; sign off on Order and correspondence to opposing counsel	1.00	350.00	BWR
Jul-21-10	N/C - Draft correspondence to Mr. Michaud enclosing King Reporting Invoice 20121 for May 10, 2010 hearing	0.10	0.00	PCLA
(N/C - Receipt of e-mail from Mr. Michaud advising of payment of Dr. Day's hearing appearance fee; telephone call with Attorney Pierce's assistant to confirm court reporter for July 23, 2010 hearing	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Review of Judge's Order; receive objection from opposing counsel; begin preparation of arguments for	0.50	175.00	BWR

JUTU!

7. ^m	Friday hearing with Judge concerning various case management issues		Paç	ge 57 of 324
22-10	Draft Affirmative Defenses and Request for Attorney's Fees to Husband's Answer to Petition to Relocate	0.40	50.00	PCLA
	Prepare file and all documents, including proposed Order on July 8, 2010 hearing and transcript, for hearing	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	Receipt and review of correspondence from Attorney Pierce regarding minor child will not be in Florida the week of July 21	0.10	35.00	BWR
Jul-23-10	Early morning preparations with Mr. Rossway for Status Conference Hearing	0.40	50.00	PCLA
	Attend Status Conference, record discussions between Judge, Dr. Day, attorneys, and parties; record Judge's ruling regarding Dr. Day's evaluation	1.10	137.50	PCLA
	N/C - Travel to Brevard County Courthouse	0.90	0.00	BWR
	Final preparation for hearing; attend extensive case management hearing with Judge Maxwell; meeting with Mr. Michaud review materials with judge; make arguments to Court and receive Court's direction concerning forensic psychologist and related issues	2.00	700.00	BWR
	N/C - Return to Vero Beach	0.80	0.00	BWR
	N/C - Travel to and from Courthouse for Status Conference	1.60	0.00	PCLA
Jul-26-10	N/C - Review Judge Maxwell's proposed order on Friday, July 23rd case management conference	0.20	0.00	DML
	N/C - Telephone conference with Laurie in Attorney Paul Ferrin's office regarding their request for update and status of case	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Telephone conference with Dr. Day's assistant regarding scheduling evaluation; scan and e-mail Stipulated Order appointing Dr. Day	0.20	0.00	PCLA
,	Draft Stipulated Order Shorting Former Wife's Discovery Responses to Facilitate Depositions; draft e-mail correspondence to Attorney Pierce regarding depositions and appointments with Dr. Day	0.40	50.00	PCLA
ار کار	N/C - Receipt of and respond to several e-mails from Mr. Michaud regarding RMT invoices, relocation, and visitation	0.30	0.00	PCLA

N/C - Telephone conference with Attorney Pierce's 0.20 0.00 PCLA

paralegal; telephone conference with Attorney Pierce
regarding scheduled appointment for Former Wife and
minor child with Dr. Day and dates for depositions;
advise Mr. Rossway

Totals

58.85

\$7,670.00

DISBURSEMENTS		Disbursements	Receipts
Jul-01-10	Westlaw Online Research Access	50.00	
Jul-06-10	Photocopies	10.40	
	Photocopies	3.20	
	Telephone Charges	0.10	
	Telephone Charges	0.10	
	Telephone Charges	0.10	
	Westlaw Online Research Access	50.00	
Jul-07-10	Photocopies	0.30	
	Photocopies	7.70	
	Facsimile Charges	2.00	
	Telephone Charges	0.10	
	Telephone Charges	0.40	
	Telephone Charges	0.20	
	Telephone Charges	0.10	
	Telephone Charges	0.40	
	Westlaw Online Research Access	16.09	
	Postage	0.44	
Jul-08-10	Photocopies	8.70	
	Photocopies	2.40	
	Photocopies	1.20	
	Photocopies	1.20	
	Photocopies	0.40	
(**	Facsimile Charges	5.00	
	Telephone Charges	2.10	

		invoice #:	5548/	
	Telephone Charges		0.10	Page 59 of 324
	Telephone Charges		0.50	
09-10	Telephone Charges		0.50	
	Telephone Charges		0.20	
	Telephone Charges		0.20	
	Telephone Charges		0.60	
	Telephone Charges		0.10	
Jul-12-10	Telephone Charges		0.30	
	Telephone Charges		0.50	
	Telephone Charges		0.40	
	Telephone Charges		0.20	
Jul-13-10	Telephone Charges		0.20	
Jul-14-10	Telephone Charges		0.30	
	Telephone Charges		0.20	
	Telephone Charges		0.10	
· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	Telephone Charges		0.20	
.5-10	Photocopies		0.50	
	Telephone Charges		2.20	
	Telephone Charges		0.20	
	Telephone Charges		0.30	
	Postage		1.76	
	Postage		0.44	
Jul-16-10	Photocopies		2.50	
Jul-20-10	Photocopies		7.80	
	Photocopies		2.60	
	Photocopies		0.20	
	Facsimile Charges		1.00	
	Facsimile Charges		6.00	
	Facsimile Charges		6.00	
V.	Facsimile Charges		8.00	
	Facsimile Charges		2.00	

		шуоке п. ээчот	
	Facsimile Charges	23.00	Page 60 of 324
	Telephone Charges	0.40	-
or en	Westlaw Online Research Access	30.00	
	Postage	5.87	
Jul-21-10	Photocopies	0.20	
	Postage	0.44	
	Postage	0.44	
Jul-22-10	Photocopies	1.20	
	Photocopies	1.60	
	Facsimile Charges	4.00	
	Telephone Charges	0.40	
	Postage	1.32	
Jul-26-10	Facsimile Charges	4.00	
	Telephone Charges	0.30	
	Postage	0.44	
Jul-27-10	Postage	0.44	
0-10	Telephone Charges	0.40	
	Totals	\$283.18	\$0.00
	Current Fees & Disbursements		\$7,953.18
	Previous Balance		\$1,823.15
	Previous Payments		\$1,823.15
	BALANCE DUE		\$7,953.18

TRUST STATEMENT

Page 61 of 324

	Disbursements	Receipts
Trust Balance Forward		15.00
Total Trust	\$0.00	\$15.00
Trust Balance		\$15.00

HIVUICE #.

VERO BEACH . CORAL GABLES

ROSSWAY MOORE SWAN, P.L. THE MODERN ONE BUILDING 2101 INDIAN RIVER BOULEVARD, SUITE 200 VERO BEACH, FL 32960 Telephone (772) 231-4440 Facsimile (772) 231-4430

Mr. Timothy Michaud 1791 Wekiva Drive Melbourne, FL 32940

September 13, 2010

File #: 1682-001 Inv. #: 55874

Total Due: \$7,151.11

RE: Post-judgment issues

Please write the FILE number on your check to insure proper crediting.

SUMMARY

*Balance Fwd:

\$7,953.18

Payment received:

\$7,953.18)

Current Invoice Amount:

\$7,151.11

TOTAL DUE:

\$7,151.11

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	ATT'Y/L.A.
Aug-02-10	Receipt and initial review of Attorney Pierce's correspondence enclosing proposed Temporary Stipulation Allowing Temporary Relocation of the Minor Child, Reply to Request for Admissions, Request to Produce, and Notice of Service of Standard Family Law Interrogatories for Modification Proceedings	0.40	140.00	BWR
	N/C - Draft correspondence to Mr. Michaud enclosing Request for Production of Documents and Notice of Service of Interrogatories	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Telephone conference with Attorney Pierce's office to schedule depositions for August 12, 2010; telephone conference with King Court Reporting; e-mails with Mr. Michaud advising of depositions and pre-deposition meeting with Mr. Rossway	0.30	0.00	PCLA
	Draft Notice of Taking Deposition of Aimee and Christopher Casey	0.20	25.00	PCLA

mvoice #:

			Pag	e 63 of 324
Aug-03-10	Receipt and initial review of Former Wife's Answers to Interrogatories	0.40	140.00	BWR
g-04-10	N/C - Forward Stipulated Order Appointing Psychologist to Dr. Day; telephone conference with Dr. Day's office; attempt to contact Detective Young and leave message for return call regarding records	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Aug-05-10	Gather contact information for Det. Young, Maggie Yankov, Sherri Daniel's and Brevard DCF and provide to Dr. Day's assistant; provide Dr. Day's information to Det. Young	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	N/C - Receipt of e-mail from Attorney Pierce; telephone conference with Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant regarding temporary relocation hearing scheduled for August 19, 2010; telephone conference with Attorney Pierce regarding rescheduling depositions to August 18th to accommodate Mr. Casey's availability; telephone conference with King Reporting; e-mail to Mr. Michaud	0.30	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Amend Notice of Taking Deposition	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - E-mail to Sherry Daniels enclosing Judge Maxwell's Order appointing Dr. Day with request to provide complete file and records to Dr. Day	0.10	0.00	DML
(/ 	Further review and study of Former wife's response materials to discovery regarding relocation; begin preparation materials for deposition of wife and overview of issues, not only relating to relocation but case in chief for deposition testimony in two weeks	0.40	140.00	BWR
Aug-09-10	N/C - Receipt and review of Notice of Taking Deposition of Timothy Michaud set for August 18, 2010 at 9:00 a.m.	0.10	0.00	BWR
	Receipt and review of letter from Julie Glocker Pierce regarding hearing on temporary relief on Petition to Relocate and depositions	0.10	35.00	BWR
	Further review and study of Request to Produce materials from Former Wife to prepare for upcoming depositions	0.50	175.00	BWR
Aug-13-10	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, draft correspondence to Attorney Pierce regarding moving forward with depositions prior to resolving relocation	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	N/C - Prepare all Former Wife's discovery responses for providing via hand delivery to Mr. Michaud	0.30	0.00	PCLA
Vanish Control of the	N/C - Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding hand delivery of Former Wife's discovery	0.10	0.00	PCLA

, π. JJ014

6	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud; task paralegal and associate to prepare additional materials for upcoming deposition	0.30	_{105.00} Pag	e 64 of 324 BWR
Aug-16-10	Receipt and review of facsimile letter from Attorney Pierce regarding no contact between the minor child and Mr. Michaud	0.10	35.00	BWR
	N/C - Short office conference with Mr. Rossway and Ms. Martin-Lee for tasks to be completed in preparation for depositions and temporary relocation hearing	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Begin initial drafting of deposition questions for Mr. Casey regarding background information	0.40	50.00	PCLA
	Drafting of deposition materials for Aimee Casey's deposition scheduled for August 18,2010	0.90	157.50	DML
Aug-17-10	Receipt and review of facsimile Request to Take Judicial Notice filed by Attorney Pierce	0.10	35.00	BWR
Ç	Continue drafting deposition questions for Christopher Casey regarding employment, relocation, minor child issues, residence, etc.; review documents provided by Ms. Casey for relocation matters; amend questions pursuant to review; prepare exhibits for Mr. Casey's deposition	1.70	212.50	PCLA
	Draft Former Husband's Verification to Answer to Petition for Relocation; receipt of Mr. Michaud's questions for Mrs. Casey, Mrs. Casey and bullet points for hearing; amend Mr. Casey's deposition questions to incorporate Mr. Michaud's additional questions; prepare and include Mr. Michaud's questions for Mrs. Casey	0.80	100.00	PCLA
	N/C - Final review of status of deposition preparations with Mr. Rossway and Ms. Martin-Lee, and discussion regarding preparations for temporary relocation hearing; final prepare of file, including exhibits, deposition questions, and supplemental documents	0.30	0.00	PCLA
	Review materials and exhibits prepared by associate and law clerk in preparation for depositions	0.60	210.00	BWR
	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud in preparation for depositions	0.40	140.00	BWR
Aug-18-10	Extensive pre-hearing preparations; draft bullet points for the temporary relocation hearing to be held August 19, 2010; update Timeline of case; prepare exhibits for hearing	2.50	312.50	PCLA
	N/C - Office conference with Mr. Rossway for review of status of relocation and time-sharing issues; amend Bullet Points in incorporate Mr. Michaud's additional request, including gag order	0.40	0.00	PCLA

ווויסוסט וו. טטטוד

	N/C - Travel to Melbourne to King reporting for depositions	0.80	_{0.00} Page	e 65 of 324
	Meet with Mr. Michaud; attend extensive depositions of Mr. Michaud, former wife, and stepfather of minor child; settlement discussions with opposing counsel	8.00	2,800.00	BWR
	N/C - Return to Vero Beach	0.80	0.00	BWR
	Numerous telephone calls with opposing counsel to discuss potential avenues of settlement prior to the evidentiary hearing; transmit e-mails; further discussions; prepare for hearing	0.50	175.00	BWR
Aug-19-10	Receipt and review of various pleadings	0.10	35.00	BWR
	Early morning hearing preparations with Mr. Rossway, including review of Former Wife's settlement bullet points; prepare amended settlement bullet points to incorporate Former Husband's settlement requirements; review of exhibits; prepare file	0.50	62.50	PCLA
	N/C - Travel to and from court house for temporary relocation and access schedule hearing	2.20	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Attend pre-hearing preparations with Mr. Rossway and Mr. Michaud; attend settlement negotiations between attorneys and parties and record amendments and additional bullet points for settlement; attend hearing with Judge Maxwell and telephone conversation with Dr. Day and record there statements	2.50	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Travel to Viera Courthouse	1.00	0.00	BWR
	Extensive settlement discussions at Viera Courthouse to attempt to resolve temporary contact and access schedule; meeting with Mr. Michaud; meet with opposing counsel; negotiations, and further settlement discussions in chambers; review and finalize settlement; temporary arrangements concluded; telephone conference with the Judge Maxwell and Dr. Deborah Day; work on refining settlement	2.50	875.00	BWR
	N/C - Return to Vero Beach	0.90	0.00	BWR
Aug-20-10	N/C - Receipt of e-mails from Mr. Michaud with request for August 18, 2010 deposition transcripts of Mr. and Mrs. Casey, and request for Notice of Hearing for August 19, 2010 hearing; telephone conference with Attorney Pierce's assistant to request copy of Notice of Hearing; advise Mr. Rossway of Mr. Michaud's request for deposition transcripts	0.30	0.00	PCLA

G.	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, review Attorney Pierce's faxed proposed Order on Temporary Relocation and Access Schedule	0.40	Pag 50.00	e 66 of 324 PCLA
Aug-23-10	N/C - Receipt and review of Stipulated Order for Temporary Relocation of the Minor Child	0.10	0.00	BWR
	N/C - E-mails with Mr. Michaud regarding discovery and receipt of e-mailed Answers to Interrogatories and Response to Request for Production	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Telephone conference with Attorney Pierce's office for request to e-mail proposed Stipulated Order to make red-line changes pursuant to Mr. Rossway's review	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Scan and e-mail, and mail, King Reporting invoice to Mr. Michaud for court reporter's attendance at the Casey depositions; order Casey deposition transcripts from King Reporter pursuant to Mr. Michaud's request on August 20, 2010	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Aug-24-10	N/C - Telephone conference with Attorney Pierce regarding Stipulated Order for Temporary Relocation of Minor Child and Access Schedule	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Amend in "red-line" the Former Wife's proposed Stipulated Order and e-mail to Attorney Pierce	0.40	50.00	PCLA
	Draft Former Husband's Answers to Interrogatories	1.90	237.50	PCLA
	Begin drafting Former Husband's Response to Request for Production of Documents	0.40	50.00	PCLA
Aug-25-10	N/C - E-mail drafted Answers to Interrogatories to Mr. Michaud for review	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Continue drafting Former Husband's Responses to Request for Documents; prepare list of additional documents required	1.30	162.50	PCLA
	N/C - E-mail list of omitted discovery documents to Mr. Michaud	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Prepare Exhibits to Response to Request for Documents	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	Begin drafting Husband's Family Law Financial Affidavit	0.90	112.50	PCLA
?6-10	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding discovery responses and additional documents to be provided	0.20	25.00	PCLA

22014

	Receipt of and prepared bank and credit card statements as exhibits to Response to Request for Documents	0.40	50.00 P	age 67 of 324 PCLA
	Update Answers to Interrogatories to include current balance due RMT; draft Notice of Service of Answers to Interrogatories	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	N/C - Redact account and social security numbers from all discovery to be produced	0.40	0.00	PCLA
Aug-27-10	Finale reconciliation of Answers to Interrogatories with Financial Affidavit with review of documents produced; amend Answers and Financial Affidavit; e-mail to Mr. Michaud for clarification of illegible information on draft Financial Affidavit; finalize and e-mail all discovery response documents to Mr. Michaud for review and signing	1.50	187.50	PCLA
Aug-28-10	Receipt of Mr. Michaud's signature pages to Financial Affidavit and Answers to Interrogatories; prepare Notice of Filing Former Husband's Family Law Financial Affidavit	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Totals	42.40	\$7,047.50	

BURSEMENTS		Disbursements	Receipts
Sep-09-10	Overpayment of invoice #55487		46.82
Aug-02-10	Photocopies	3.00	
	Postage	2.00	
Aug-05-10	Photocopies	0.80	
	Facsimile Charges	3.00	
	Facsimile Charges	3.00	
	Postage	1.32	
Aug-13-10	Photocopies	16.70	
	Photocopies	0.20	
	Facsimile Charges	2.00	
	Telephone Charges	2.50	
	Telephone Charges	0.10	
	Postage	0.88	
16-10	Photocopies	41.60	
	Photocopies	1.80	

		шүокс #.	JJ014	
	Photocopies	4	4.80	Page 68 of 324
	Photocopies	(0.40	
	Photocopies	(0.80	
	Photocopies	?	2.30	
	Photocopies	f	0.20	
	Photocopies	(0.10	
Aug-17-10	Photocopies	•	0.70	
	Photocopies	1	0.60	
	Photocopies	!	0.40	
	Photocopies		2.40	
	Photocopies		0.60	
	Photocopies		8.70	
	Photocopies		1.00	
	Photocopies		1.00	
	Photocopies		2.00	
1	Photocopies	1	7.40	
	Photocopies		0.20	
	Telephone Charges		0.10	
	Telephone Charges		0.10	
	Telephone Charges		0.20	
Aug-18-10	Photocopies		0.60	
Aug-20-10	Telephone Charges		0.20	
Aug-23-10	Photocopies		0.10	
	Telephone Charges		0.20	
	Telephone Charges		0.20	
Aug-24-10	Telephone Charges		0.20	
Aug-25-10	Photocopies		0.60	
Aug-26-10	Telephone Charges		0.90	
Aug-30-10	Photocopies	;	14.00	
	Telephone Charges		1.90	
Andrew Control of the	Postage		8.63	

HIVOICE #.

4/٥८८

Totals	\$150.43	Page 69 of 324 \$46.82
Current Fees & Disbursements		\$7,151.11
Previous Balance		\$7,953.18
Previous Payments		\$7,953.18
BALANCE DUE		\$7,151.11

TRUST STATEMENT

Page 70 of 324

	Disbursements	Receipts
Trust Balance Forward		15.00
Total Trust	\$0.00	\$15.00
Trust Balance		\$15.00

VERO BEACH . CORAL GABLES

ROSSWAY MOORE SWAN, P.L. THE MODERN ONE BUILDING 2101 INDIAN RIVER BOULEVARD, SUITE 200 VERO BEACH, FL 32960 Telephone (772) 231-4440 Facsimile (772) 231-4430

Mr. Timothy Michaud 1791 Wekiva Drive Melbourne, FL 32940

October 8, 2010

File #: 1682-001 Inv. #: 56168

RE: Post-judgment issues

Total Due: \$7,883.41

Please write the FILE number on your check to insure proper crediting.

SUMMARY

*Balance Fwd:

\$7,151.11

Payment received:

\$0.00)

Current Invoice Amount:

\$732.30

TOTAL DUE:

\$7,883.41

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	ATT'Y/L.A.
Sep-08-10	N/C - Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's instruction and Mr. Michaud's voice mail, attempt to contact Mr. Michaud and leave message to return call regarding Dr. Day	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding Dr. Day and visitation issues	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Sep-09-10	Work on issue regarding Dr. Day	0.10	35.00	BWR
	Telephone conference with Attorney Pierce's paralegal; telephone conference with Attorney Pierce regarding status of Stipulated Order on Relocation and Timesharing; finalize Stipulation for Mr. Rossway signature and forwarding to Attorney Pierce for signature and forwarding to Judge Maxwell for entry of the Order	0.40	50.00	PCLA
	N/C - Advise Mr. Rossway of telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding Dr. Day and evaluation	0.10	0.00	PCLA

111 10100 //.	20100

	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding his evaluation by Dr. Day, Former Wife's new employment and salary, and health insurance issues	0.10	_{12.50} Pag	e 72 of 324
Sep-10-10	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding Ms. Marto's employment issues with appearance at Court and for evaluation for supervising visitation	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	N/C - Receipt and review of Mr. Michaud's e-mail attaching Mr. Casey's pay stub evidencing insurance	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Advise Mr. Rossway of Ms. Marto's employment issues due to attendance at hearing and for evaluation	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Receipt and review of Mr. Michaud's e-mail regarding Ms. Casey's objections to Mr. Michaud contacting Riley's after school care facility and issues with billing for daycare	0.10	12.50	PCLA
Sep-13-10	Receipt and review of copy of correspondence to Judge Maxwell together with enclosed stipulated order	0.10	35.00	BWR
Sep-16-10	Pursuant to Mr. Michaud's request and Mr. Rossway's directions, draft correspondence for Amy Marto to provide to employer regarding requirement to appear at hearing and evaluation; amend and finalize correspondence pursuant to Mr. Rossway's review	0.50	62.50	PCLA
Sep-17-10	N/C - Attempt to contact Mr. Michaud to advise of receipt of the Casey's deposition transcripts and Mr. Rossway correspondence for Ms. Marto	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Sep-20-10	N/C - Attempt to contact Mr. Michaud and leave message	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding next appointments for Former Wife, minor child and Mr. Michaud with Dr. Day, and discussion regarding status Stipulated Order on relocation and time-sharing; research Brevard County Courthouse website for entry of Stipulated Order	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	N/C - Arrange for delivery of Casey deposition transcripts and correspondence regarding Ms. Marto to Mr. Michaud in Sebastian	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Sep-22-10	Office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding status of Order on relocation and time-sharing; review file for date Attorney Pierce forwarded the Stipulated Order to Judge Maxwell; attempt to contact Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant regarding status of Order; advise Mr. Rossway of dates of parties and minor child's next meetings with Dr. Day; telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding Amy Marto's employment issues	0.30	37.50	PCLA

			Pag	e 73 of 324
	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding lack of telephone contact with Riley, the conflicts between Mrs. Casey's statements regarding the "trespass" issues and the New Bern Police Dept. Report, Mr. Michaud's contact with Riley's daycare to obtain information and Mrs. Casey's refusal to include Mr. Michaud in information release, Mrs. Casey's misunderstanding regarding Mr. Michaud's portion of health insurance obligation, and Mr. Michaud advising that Ms. Marto's received Mr. Rossway's letter and employment issues are resolved; advise Mr. Rossway of all issues of concern with Mrs. Casey and the minor child	0.40	50.00	PCLA
	Work on issues relating to former wife's failure to comply already with Order from Court	0.10	35.00	BWR
Sep-23-10	Receipt and review of Answer to Supplemental Petition for Modification	0.20	70.00	BWR
	N/C - Attempt to contact Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant regarding status of Order on Relocation and Time-sharing	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Sep-24-10	N/C - Attempt to contact Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant; telephone conference with Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant regarding status of Order on relocation and time-sharing	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Receipt and review of e-mails from Mr. Michaud regarding school costs and attempted telephone contact with Riley; amend excel spreadsheet to include September telephone attempts	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	Receipt and review of Stipulated Order for Temporary Relocation entered by the Judge	0.20	70.00	BWR
Sep-28-10	Receipt and review of facsimile correspondence from Attorney Pierce	0.10	35.00	BWR
	N/C - Telephone conference with Dr. Day's assistant to schedule telephone conference by and between Dr. Day, Mr. Rossway and Attorney Pierce	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Sep-29-10	Receipt and review of correspondence from Attorney Pierce dated September 27, 2010	0.10	35.00	BWR
C	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding October 6, 2010 telephone conference between Mr. Rossway, Attorney Pierce and Dr. Day, and discussion regarding Dr. Day's indications of not addressing visitation at this time, insurance and aftercare issues	0.30	37.50	PCLA
S_0-10	N/C - review file and meet with paralegal to get updated on current situation with Dr. Day in contemplation of next week's telephone conference	0.20	0.00	BWR

56168

Totals

5.60

Page 74 of 324 \$702.50

SBURSEMEN	TS	Disbursements	Receipts
Sep-08-10	Telephone Charges	0.20	
Sep-09-10	Telephone Charges	0.30	
Sep-10-10	Photocopies	5.50	
	Photocopies	18.90	
Sep-17-10	Photocopies	0.90	
Sep-20-10	Telephone Charges	0.20	
Sep-22-10	Telephone Charges	1.60	
Sep-24-10	Telephone Charges	0.30	
Sep-28-10	Telephone Charges	0.60	
Sep-29-10	Telephone Charges	1.30	
	Totals	\$29.80	\$0.00
	Current Fees & Disbursements		\$732.30
	Previous Balance		\$7,151.11
	Previous Payments		\$0.00
	BALANCE DUE		\$7,883.41

invoice #:

20108

TRUST STATEMENT

Page 75 of 324

	Disbursements	Receipts
Trust Balance Forward		15.00
Total Trust	\$0.00	\$15.00
Trust Balance		\$15.00

VERO BEACH . CORAL GABLES

ROSSWAY MOORE SWAN, P.L. THE MODERN ONE BUILDING 2101 INDIAN RIVER BOULEVARD, SUITE 200 VERO BEACH, FL 32960 [Selenbarg (772) 231 4440 Featingle (772) 231 443

Telephone (772) 231-4440 Facsimile (772) 231-4430

Mr. Timothy Michaud 1791 Wekiva Drive Melbourne, FL 32940

November 4, 2010

File #: 1682-001 Inv. #: 56468

Total Due:

\$844.44

RE: Post-judgment issues

Please write the FILE number on your check to insure proper crediting.

SUMMARY

*Balance Fwd:

\$7,883.41

Payment received:

Ψ7,000.41

Current Invoice Amount:

\$7,883.41) \$844.44

TOTAL DUE:

\$844.44

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	ATT'Y/L.A.
Oct-04-10	Review Former Wife's Counter Petition for Modification for drafting of Former Husband's Answer	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	N/C - Telephone conference with Dr. Day's assistant; telephone conference with Attorney Singer's assistant; additional telephone conference with Dr. Day's assistant confirming change in time for conference call on October 6, 2010	0.30	0.00	PCLA
	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding aftercare contact issues, and unresolved health insurance payment for Riley	0.10	12.50	PCLA
Oct-05-10	N/C - Scan and e-mail Attorney Pierce's September 27, 2010 correspondence to Mr. Michaud	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Receipt of e-mail from Mr. Michaud regarding visitation, Dr. Day, Riley's recent episode, and Attorney Pierce's latest correspondence; receipt of voicemail from Dr. Day's office confirming conference call scheduled for October 6, 2010; return call to Dr. Day's office	0.20	25.00	PCLA

and the second s	Draft of Former Husband's Answer to Counter-Petition and Affirmative Defenses for review	0.60	Pag 75.00	ye 77 of 324 PCLA
₹-06-10	Prepare file for conference call between Mr. Rossway, Dr. Day and Attorney Pierce, to include Order appointing Dr. Day and Order on temporary time-sharing during evaluation	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	N/C - Telephone conference with Attorney Pierce's assistant to advise of correct time for conference call	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Attend conference call between Mr. Rossway, Dr. Day and Attorney Pierce and note status of evaluation and meetings with parties by Dr. Day and projected date for final report	0.30	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Attend telephone conference between Mr. Rossway and Mr. Michaud and note information regarding insurance and daycare, and receive directions to prepare Motion to Compile, and Motion for Expedited Final Hearing upon Dr. Day issuing her report	0.50	0.00	PCLA
	Review file, prepare for and attend telephone conference with Dr. Day and Attorney Pierce regarding Dr. Day's time-line for completion of interviews of the parties and providing her report and discussion regarding the Mother's indications of the minor child's additional "episode"	0.40	140.00	BWR
	Telephone call with Mr. Michaud to relay Dr. Day's comments regarding the Riley's issues as asserted by the Former Wife and her time-line for completion of the evaluation process and presenting her report, and further discussions regarding the health insurance and contact issues to be addressed in a motion for contempt and/or to compel	0.50	175.00	BWR
Oct-07-10	N/C - Receipt of e-mail from Mr. Michaud containing discussions between Mr. Michaud and Ms. Casey regarding Riley's "episode"	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Oct-11-10	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's review, amend and finalize Former Husband's Answer to Supplemental Counter Petition for Modification	0.30	37.50	PCLA
Oct-14-10	N/C - Receipt of e-mail from Mr. Michaud advising of not receiving Former Wife's Answer to Petition and Counter-Petition; scan and e-mail to Mr. Michaud	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Oct-18-10	Receipt and review of Notice of non-read of deposition of Tim Michaud	0.10	35.00	BWR
X.	N/C - Draft correspondence to Mr. Michaud enclosing King Reporting's past due invoice for the Casey's depositions and transcripts	0.20	0.00	PCLA

Oct-19-10	Review Final Judgment and Orders regarding sharing of information regarding minor child; begin draft of Motion to Compel Former Wife's Compliance	0.40	Pag ^{50.00}	e 78 of 324 PCLA
į	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding receipt of Riley's pediatrician's information and last interview with Dr. Day	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Oct-20-10	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding ongoing health insurance and daycare issues, and finalizing Motion to Compel	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Oct-21-10	E-mail from and to Mr. Michaud regarding his question regarding "gag order" and advise of Order on Relocation and Temporary Time-Sharing containing language pursuant to Judge Maxwell's ruling	0.10	12.50	PCLA
	N/C - E-mail to Mr. Michaud requesting updated telephone log	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Oct-22-10	Continue drafting Motion to Compel regarding telephone contact with Riley; review file for cell phone bills regarding telephone calls to and from Riley; additional e-mail Mr. Michaud to request updated cell phone bills	0.40	50.00	PCLA
-25-10	N/C - Office conference with Attorney Rollin regarding amending and finalizing Motion to Compel	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Attempt to contact Mr. Michaud; e-mail to Mr. Michaud advising of unavailability until November 1st and to contact Attorney Rollin	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Conference with Patti regarding Motion For Contempt and to compel	0.30	0.00	KMR
Oct-27-10	Continue to draft Motion For Contempt and to Compel	1.00	150.00	KMR
Oct-28-10	Continue to draft Motion for Contempt including specific citations to specific provisions in the various orders which the Former Wife has violated; e-mail complete draft of Motion For Contempt to Mr. Michaud for his review	1.10	165.00	KMR
	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding Motion for Contempt	0.60	90.00	KMR
Oct-29-10	Review and revise Motion for Contempt pursuant to Mr. Rollin's request	0.90	112.50	CRLA
	Revise Motion For Contempt consistent with Mr. Michaud's comments and concerns expressed in telephone conference yesterday and with Mr. Rossway's comments	1.00	150.00	KMR

56468

invoice #:

Nov-04-10

Courtesy write off 40% (\$552) Courtesy write off Brad

Rossway

-552.00

Page 79 of 324 BWR

11.00 Totals \$828.00

DISBURSEMEN	NTS	Disbursements	Receipts
Oct-05-10	Telephone Charges	0.10	
Oct-06-10	Telephone Charges	2.80	
Oct-12-10	Photocopies	1.60	
	Postage	1.32	
Oct-18-10	Postage	0.44	
Oct-20-10	Telephone Charges	0.20	
Oct-29-10	Photocopies	1.60	
	Facsimile Charges	5.00	
	Courier Expense	2.50	
	Postage	0.88	
₹	Totals	\$16.44	\$0.00
	Current Fees & Disbursements		\$844.44
	Previous Balance		\$7,883.41
	Previous Payments		\$7,883.41
	BALANCE DUE		\$844.44

invoice #:

30408

TRUST STATEMENT

Page 80 of 324

	Disbursements	Receipts
Trust Balance Forward		15.00
Total Trust	\$0.00	\$15.00
Trust Balance		\$15.00



VERO BEACH . CORAL GABLES

ROSSWAY MOORE SWAN, P.L. THE MODERN ONE BUILDING 2101 INDIAN RIVER BOULEVARD, SUITE 200 VERO BEACH, FL 32960 Telephone (772) 231-4440 Facsimile (772) 231-4430

Mr. Timothy Michaud 1791 Wekiva Drive Melbourne, FL 32940

December 3, 2010

File #: 1682-001 Inv. #: 56840

Total Due: \$3,082.64

RE: Post-judgment issues

Please write the FILE number on your check to insure proper crediting.

SUMMARY

*Balance Fwd:

\$844.44

Payment received:

\$0.00)

Current Invoice Amount:

\$2,238.20

TOTAL DUE:

\$3,082.64

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	ATT'Y/L.A.
Nov-01-10	N/C - Prepare Mr. Rossway's Notice of Unavailability	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Nov-11-10	Office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding Dr. Day's visit to Former Wife's resident; telephone conference with Dr. Day's office to confirm the Dr. Day has returned; e-mail to Mr. Michaud that Dr. Day has returned to Orlando but, no communication received	0.40	50.00	PCLA
	N/C - Attempt to contact Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant to obtain hearing dates for Former Husband's Motion to Compel & Contempt	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Nov-15-10	Receipt of e-mails from Mr. Michaud regarding medical issues and attached records	0.10	12.50	PCLA
	N/C - Attempts to contact Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Telephone conference with Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant to obtain hearing dates; telephone conference	0.20	25.00	PCLA

	with Attorney Pierce; return call to Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant to advise of January 18, 2011 at 2:00 p.m. hearing on Former Husband's Motion for Contempt and to Compel; telephone conference with court reporter		Pa	ge 82 of 32
	Draft Notice of Hearing for January 18, 2011 on Former Husband's Motion for Contempt and to Compel	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Nov-16-10	N/C - Check on status of proceeding; review materials from Mr. Michaud, meeting with paralegal	0.20	0.00	BWR
Nov-17-10	E-mails from and to Mr. Michaud regarding Former Wife's request for medical records and Mr. Michaud's contact with Evelyn at Dr. Day's office regarding status of preliminary report	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Nov-23-10	N/C - Review file; telephone conference with King Reporting to verify invoice for what event; draft correspondence to Mr. Michaud enclosing King Reporting's Invoice 21719	0.30	0.00	PCLA
Nov-24-10	Telephone conference with Dr. Deborah Day; telephone conference with Mr. Michaud; work on review of extensive comprehensive and complete findings by psychological professionals exonerating Mr. Michaud and finding complete fault with mother and her actions	1.00	350.00	BWR
	N/C - Office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding Motion for Holiday Visitation	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Telephone conference with Dr. Day's office requesting update from Dr. Day on report and advise of holiday visitation issues	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	N/C - Attempt to contact Mr. Michaud and leave message	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Attend telephone conference with Mr. Rossway and Dr. Day; attend telephone conference with Mr. Michaud and Mr. Rossway; review first two letters of Dr. Day's Report	0.40	0.00	PCLA
	Office conference with Mr. Michaud for his review of Dr. Day's Report; read Dr. Day's timeline and analysis of testing; short discussion with Mr. Michaud regarding moving forward with trial and Christmas visitation	2.20	275.00	PCLA
Nov-26-10	Finish first review of forensic report	0.60	210.00	BWR
-29-10	Receipt and review of original report from Dr. Day	0.20	70.00	BWR
Yest	Receipt and review e-mail from Mr. Michaud attaching crisis center evaluation and report	0.40	50.00	PCLA

56840

N/C - Office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding moving case forward in light of Dr. Day's report	0.20	Pag _{0.00}	e 83 of 324 PCLA
Draft Notice of Trial	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, draft correspondence to Attorney Pierce regarding Dr. Day's report not being disseminated to client or third parties	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Finalize Motion for Winter Break Time-Sharing	0.50	62.50	PCLA
Continue extensive work on complete report filed by forensic psychologist; study report for specifics relating to mother's conduct to insure Mr. Michaud's makeup visitation, change in custody issues; work on additional discovery to prove issues relating to mother's conduct; work with paralegal on motion to provide immediate holiday visitation pursuant to Court Order; work on letter regarding confidential report not to be sent to clients but rather to be viewed; instruct paralegal to prepare letter to opposing attorney regarding non transfer of reports	1.50	525.00	BWR
Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, review Orders for reference to confidentiality of Dr. Day's Report; amend correspondence to Attorney Pierce	0.30	37.50	PCLA
Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's review, amend Motion for 2010 Winter Break/Holiday Time-Sharing	0.20	25.00	PCLA
N/C - Attempt to contact Mr. Michaud to verify proposed holiday travel schedule	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Draft correspondence to Attorney Pierce regarding Mr. Michaud's upcoming holiday timesharing	0.50	62.50	PCLA
Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud to confirm Riley's travel for Holiday time-sharing and discussion regarding possibility of Ms. Casey having copy of Dr. Day's Report and next steps for moving forward	0.30	37.50	PCLA
Pursuant to Mr. Michaud's information amend and finalize Motion for Time-Sharing and correspondence to Attorney Pierce	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Work on Christmas holiday access schedule information; review motions, review letters, provide information to opposing counsel demanding holiday access; task paralegal with additional work to prepare for ultimate trial of case; review Notice for Trial	0.75	262.50	BWR
Totals	12.35	\$2,205.00	

Nov-30-10

DISBURSEME	NTS	Disbursements	Page 84 of 324 Receipts
~-03-10	Telephone Charges	2.70	
1	Postage	0.44	
Nov-04-10	Telephone Charges	2.50	
Nov-12-10	Telephone Charges	0.10	
Nov-15-10	Telephone Charges	0.20	
	Telephone Charges	0.20	
	Telephone Charges	0.10	
Nov-16-10	Photocopies	0.50	
	Facsimile Charges	2.00	
	Facsimile Charges	2.00	
	Postage	1.32	
Nov-23-10	Postage	1.76	
Nov-24-10	Photocopies	3.20	
Nov-30-10	Photocopies	2.60	
	Facsimile Charges	2.00	
	Facsimile Charges	6.00	
	Telephone Charges	0.20	
	Telephone Charges	2.40	
	Postage	2.98	
	Totals	\$33.20	\$0.00
	Current Fees & Disbursements		\$2,238.20
	Previous Balance		\$844.44
	Previous Payments		\$0.00
	BALANCE DUE		\$3,082.64

TRUST STATEMENT

Page 85 of 324

	Disbursements	Receipts
Trust Balance Forward		15.00
Total Trust	\$0.00	\$15.00
Trust Balance		\$15.00

VERO BEACH . CORAL GABLES

ROSSWAY MOORE SWAN, P.L. THE MODERN ONE BUILDING 2101 INDIAN RIVER BOULEVARD, SUITE 200 VERO BEACH, FL 32960 Telephone (772) 231-4440 Facsimile (772) 231-4430

Mr. Timothy Michaud 1791 Wekiva Drive Melbourne, FL 32940

January 6, 2011

File #: 1682-001

Inv. #: 57315

(

Total Due:

\$7,884.29

RE: Post-judgment issues

Please write the FILE number on your check to insure proper crediting.

SUMMARY

*Balance Fwd:

\$3,082.64

Payment received:

\$0.00)

Current Invoice Amount:

\$4,801.65

TOTAL DUE:

\$7,884.29

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	ATT'Y/L.A.
Dec-01-10	Lengthy telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding Massachusetts' Department of Social Services contact to advise of investigation regarding Riley and need for psychotically counseling, and related matters; advise Mr. Rossway	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	Receipt and review of e-mails from Mr. Michaud of summary of Massachusetts' DSS telephone call, e-mails from Riley's babysitter, Lisa Beaulieu, and e-mails from Mrs. Casey	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Dec-03-10	N/C - Receipt and review of e-mails from Mr. Michaud regarding his time-line of contact with Riley's pediatrician, Dr. Camera; e-mail to Mr. Michaud	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Receipt of e-mail from Mr. Michaud regarding discussions between Apryl Thomas, Mass DFS and Dr. Day and Mr. Michaud and Ms. Thomas	0.10	12.50	PCLA
Dec-06-10	N/C - Telephone conferences with Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant and Attorney Pierce's assistant to	0.30	0.00	PCLA

6	schedule hearing on holiday time-sharing and, issues of Ms. Pierce substituting out for a new attorney, William Orth, Esq. and Ms. Pierce advising Mr. Orth of scheduled hearing		Pa	ge 87 of 32
	N/C - E-mail to Mr. Michaud with hearing date; e-mail from Mr. Michaud	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Draft Notice of Hearing on Former Husband's Motion for 2009 Winter Break/Holiday Timesharing	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud to advise of hearing and discuss issues of Former Wife's new counsel and possible hearing issues, and discussion regarding babysitter's offer for Mr. Michaud to contact her to discuss Riley's time with her	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	Work on issues relating to attorney leaving case and new attorney coming onto case; review materials regarding Motion for Christmas Visitation Access and related issues; work on moving up Motion for Contempt if possible; review information on new attorney	0.30	105.00	BWR
Dec-07-10	N/C - Receipt of Mr. Michaud's e-mail requesting update on Mr. Rossway's discussion with Massachusetts' Department of Children and Family Services	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Compile Orders to be provided to Apryl Thomas and Mr. Michaud's accounting of discussions with Ms. Thomas for Mr. Rossway's reference	0.20	25.00	PCLA
•	Attend Mr. Rossway's telephone conference with Ms. Thomas and record Ms. Thomas request for Dr. Day's Report and instructions for preparing an Emergency Motion and contact with Dr. Day to confirm approval of providing Report to Mass. DCF under seal	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	N/C - E-mail to Mr. Michaud to advise of Mr. Rossway's discussion with Apryl Thomas of Mass. DCF and, instructions from Mr. Rossway to prepare and file emergency motion for release of Dr. Day's Report to Ms. Thomas and DCF	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Telephone conference with April Turner, Massachusetts DCF; review CV for new attorney, Mr. Orth; receive telephone message from Attorney Orth	0.20	70.00	BWR
Dec-08-10	N/C - Receipt of copy of voicemail from Attorney Orth regarding his intent to file motions and to propose a time-sharing schedule; office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding telephone conference with Attorney Orth	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	E-mail from Mr. Michaud attached e-mails with Mrs. Casey regarding her indications that Mass. DCF will be at her home Friday, December 10th; telephone	0.30	37.50	PCLA

	conference with Dr. Day's assistant regarding Dr. Day's approval for Report to be released to Mass. DCF		Pag	e 88 of 324
	N/C - Additional e-mail by and between Mrs. Casey regarding her refusal to provide her home or cell number	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Attend Mr. Rossway's telephone call with Apryl Thomas and Mr. Michaud	0.30	0.00	PCLA
	Upon receive of Dr. Day's approval of the release of her Report to Mass DCF, begin drafting Emergency Motion; review all related documents; telephone conference with Mr. Michaud to clarify timelines	1.40	175.00	PCLA
	N/C - Telephone conference with Apryl Thomas for address for Department of Children and Families	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Telephone conference with Apryl Thomas; telephone conference with Mr. Michaud; work with paralegal on Emergency Motion to Release Information; attempt to contact Dr. Day's office; telephone call to Attorney Orth's office; begin preparation for December hearing regarding holiday access	1.40	490.00	BWR
Dec-09-10	Receipt and review of Motion to Permit Testimony by Telephone and Notice of Appearance	0.10	35.00	BWR
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway review, amend Emergency Motion	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	N/C - E-mail Emergency Motion to Mr. Michaud for review; make minor correction pursuant to Mr. Michaud's review	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Attempt to contact Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant to advise of Emergency Motion	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Work on issues regarding upcoming hearing; work on issue regarding new attorney; work on emergency motion issues after speaking to Massachusetts investigator	0.30	105.00	BWR .
Dec-10-10	N/C - Fax Notice of Hearing on Former Husband's Motion for 2010 Winter Break/Holiday Time-Sharing to Attorney Orth	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Telephone conference with Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant regarding need for hearing and fax Former Husband Motion	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Draft Notice of Hearing for December 22, 2010 on Former Husband's Motion for holiday time-sharing; e-mail to Mr. Michaud	0.20	25.00	PCLA

	Begin work on preparations for December 22nd hearing on holiday time-sharing, including gathering of exhibits and initial draft of bullet points of issues	0.60	Pag 75.00	ge 89 of 324 PCLA
Dec-13-10	Research whether consent of opposing party is necessary in order to permit testimony by telephone and research under what grounds we may object to telephonic testimony; retriever case law from Westlaw in preparation of analyzing applicable legal principles	0.30	45.00	TMZ
	Work on emergency motion issues; receive telephone call from Attorney Orth	0.30	105.00	BWR
Dec-14-10	N/C - Telephone call with Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant regarding Judge's request for scheduling Emergency Hearing via conference call on December 15, 2010 on Former Husband's Emergency Motion for Release of Dr. Day's Report; telephone call with Attorney Pierce's office; telephone conference with Attorney Orth's office	0.30	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Attempt to contact Apryl Thomas and leave message regarding emergency hearing for December 15th on release of report	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Dec-15-10	Pre-hearing preparations for Court's Emergency Telephonic Hearing on Former Husband's Emergency Motion for Release of Dr. Deborah Day's Evaluation Report; attend hearing with Mr. Rossway, Judge Maxwell, Attorney Orth and briefly Attorney Pierce, and record statements and Judge's ruling; attend telephone conference between Mr. Rossway and Mr. Michaud	0.50	62.50	PCLA
	N/C - Telephone conference with Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant; copy and fax Dr. Day's Report to Judge Maxwell pursuant to his request; prepare copies of Report for providing to Apryl Thomas, Mass. DCF and for Riley's pediatrician pursuant to Judge Maxwell's ruling	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Begin drafting Order on Former Husband's Emergency Motion for Release of Deborah Day, PsyD.'s Evaluation Report to Massachusetts Department of Children and Families and Court Sua Sponte Order on Appearance of Former Wife and Minor Child for December 22, 2010 Hearing on Former Husband's Motion for 2009 Winter Break/Holiday Time-Sharing	0.60	75.00	PCLA
	Attempt to contact Apryl Thomas of Mass. DCF and leave message that Court released report	0.10	12.50	PCLA
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's review, amend proposed Order and forward to Attorney Orth for approval	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Early morning preparation for emergency hearing; set up telephone hearing with paralegal, judge, and opposing counsel; attend hearing regarding withdrawal of counsel,	0.80	280.00	BWR

I ago oo oi oz	Page	90	of	324
----------------	------	----	----	-----

	Attorney Pierce, from ex-wife's representation; attend emergency motion; receive favorable ruling including requirement that minor child be brought to Florida and that mother be present at Court hearing in Florida; provide information to paralegal for preparation and approval of Order; Approve sending of Order to opposing counsel			
	N/C - Short telephone conference with Mr. Michaud to report results and discuss hearing for next week	0.20	0.00	BWR
Dec-16-10	N/C - Receipt of Attorney Orth's approval of proposed Order; attempt to e-mail proposed Order to Judge Maxwell; telephone conference with Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant; resend proposed Order	0.30	0.00	PCLA
	Telephone conference with Apryl Thomas from Mass. DCF regarding status of investigation, time-line for conclusion pending receipt of Dr. Day's Report, and attorney's decision to "view" rather than interview Riley; telephone conference with Mr. Michaud	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Review Order; begin preparations for contested hearing set by the Court for Winter break visitation	0.40	140.00	BWR
Dec-17-10	Prepare HIPPA Release for providing to Massachusetts' DCF	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Receipt and review of e-mails by and between Mr. Michaud and Mrs. Casey regarding holiday time-sharing and her claim for outstanding costs due, and between Mr. Michaud and Riley babysitter regarding Riley's behavior	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	N/C - Telephone conference with Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant to request copy of signed Order	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Receipt of Order on Release of Dr. Day's Report to Mass DCF; prepare e-mail correspondence to Apriyl Thomas and attached Dr. Day's Report and Order	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	N/C - E-mail to Mr. Michaud advising of Dr. Day's Report sent to DCF and request for his signature to HIPPA for providing to DCF	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Dec-20-10	Continue preparing for hearing; meet with paralegal to provide instruction for materials and evidence to be presented if necessary at the hearing; receive Motion for Secondary Evaluation of Minor Child; work on defending new attorney's posturing strategy	0.60	210.00	BWR
	E-mails from and to Mr. Michaud regarding Massachusetts' investigation and release to be forwarded for records	0.10	12.50	PCLA

	Receipt of Mr. Michaud signed Release for records from Massachusetts' DCF to be provided to RMTS; forward Release to Apryl Thomas	0.20	Paç 25.00	ge 91 of 324 PCLA
Dec-21-10	Prepare for hearing on Former Husband's Motion for 2010 Winter Break/Holiday Time-Sharing, including preparing Bullet Points of issues and preparations of exhibits; office conference with Mr. Rossway for additional hearing preparations	2.40	300.00	PCLA
	Review and study file and previous Orders; provide information to paralegal for additional bullet points to bring the judge up to speed; further review and study of Dr. Day's report; prepare for anticipated arguments to be made against unrestricted access to father as pled for in motion	0.50	175.00	BWR
Dec-22-10	Early morning hearing preparations with Mr. Rossway, including review of exhibits	0.40	50.00	PCLA
	Travel to Viera Courthouse for hearing on Former Husband's Motion for 2010 Winter Break/Holiday Time-Sharing	0.80	100.00	PCLA
	Attend pre-hearing meeting with Mr. Rossway and Mr. Michaud; attend hearing and record testimony, findings of facts and Judge Maxwell's ruling; attend exchange of minor child for time-sharing	2.50	312.50	PCLA
	N/C - Travel to Melbourne	0.80	0.00	BWR
	Final preparation with Mr. Michaud and attend extensive motion with judge; participate in proceedings and observe turnover of child; telephone call to judge to notify him of transfer completion; discussions with opposing counsel and Mr. Michaud	2.50	875.00	BWR
Dec-23-10	N/C - Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, scan and e-mail proposed Order to Mr. Orth and Judge Maxwell	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Work on Order of Court; transmit materials to opposing counsel; instruct paralegal to communicate with judge that order has not been approved by opposing counsel; instruct paralegal on information necessary to change contempt hearing to a status conference to move case to trial	0.30	105.00	BWR
	N/C - Evening telephone conference with Mr. Michaud to get update on current status of child and access schedule; discussion regarding North Carolina drop-off	0.20	0.00	BWR
	Draft proposed Order on Former Husband's Motion for Winter Break/Holiday Time-Sharing	0.60	75.00	PCLA

5/315

Dec-28-10	Receipt and review of Order of Substitution of Counsel	0.10	35.00 Pag	ge 92 of 324 BWR
	Office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding changes required to Order on holiday visitation to include amended paragraph on returning Riley to North Carolina at former wife's request, and addressing changing the contempt hearing to a case management conference, and need to contact Attorney Orth on amending Order and Case Management Conference	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	N/C - Review e-mails between Mr. Michaud and Mrs. Casey regarding contact with Riley and costs Mrs. Casey claims are past due from Mr. Michaud	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, draft e-mail correspondence to Attorney Orth regarding need to amend Order regarding holiday time-sharing to include paragraph for return of minor child to North Carolina on January 2, 2011	0.10	12.50	PCLA
	Amend proposed Order on Former Husband Motion for 2010 Winter Break/Holiday Time-Sharing to include minor child to be returned to North Carolina per former wife's request	0.30	37.50	PCLA
e C	Forward amended proposed Order to Attorney Orth for review and comment	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Work on revisions to Order and send amended Order on to opposing counsel based on information received from Mr. Michaud concerning pickup truck and related information	0.10	35.00	BWR
Dec-29-10	N/C - Attempt to contact Attorney Orth via e-mail, office, and cell phone for status of approval of amended proposed Order	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Receipt of Attorney Orth's approval of the amended proposed Order Granting Former Husband Motion for 2010 Winter Break/Holiday Time-Sharing	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Draft correspondence to Judge Maxwell advising of revision to proposed Order on Winter Break and attaching Mr. Orth's approval regarding return of Riley to North Carolina verses Massachusetts; pursuant to Mr. Rossway directions, amend Order to nunc pro tunc to date of hearing	0.40	50.00	PCLA
, ~ ~ ~	Review and finalize Order; review e-mail from opposing counsel approving Order; direct paralegal to facilitate Order in spite of the judge being on vacation	0.10	35.00	BWR
Dec-30-10	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding upcoming hearing, case management, Riley, and Mass DCF telephone call with Mr. Michaud and closing the case	0.30	37.50	PCLA

5/313

Page 93 of 324

,				
	N/C - Scan and e-mail King Court Reporter's invoice for appearance at December 22, 2010 hearing	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Dec-31-10	N/C - Receipt of e-mail from Judge Maxwell advising of signing Order Granting Former Husband's Motion for 2010 Winter Break/Holiday Time-Sharing nunc pro tunc to December 22, 2010; forward information to Mr. Michaud and Mr. Rossway	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Receipt of copy of Mr. Michaud's e-mail to and from Mrs. Casey regarding her instructions not to contact her but send all communications to her via Mr. Casey	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Totals	28.20	\$4,682.50	

DISBURSEMENT	rs ·	Disbursements	Receipts
Dec-02-10	Telephone Charges	1.60	
	Telephone Charges	0.90	
7-03-10	Telephone Charges	0.20	
	Telephone Charges	0.60	
Dec-06-10	Photocopies	0.50	
	Photocopies	0.30	
	Facsimile Charges	2.00	
	Telephone Charges	0.30	
	Telephone Charges	0.30	
	Telephone Charges	0.20	
	Postage	1.76	
Dec-07-10	Telephone Charges	0.90	
Dec-08-10	Telephone Charges	0.50	
	Telephone Charges	0.20	
	Telephone Charges	1.10	
	Telephone Charges	0.10	
	Telephone Charges	1.30	
Dec-09-10	Telephone Charges	0.10	

		ווויטונכ #.	J/31J	
Dec-10-10	Photocopies		2.80	Page 94 of 324
	Facsimile Charges		7.00	. ago o . o. o <u>-</u> .
	Facsimile Charges		7.00	
	Facsimile Charges		7.00	
	Facsimile Charges		2.00	
	Telephone Charges		0.30	
	Telephone Charges		0.10	
	Postage		4.54	
Dec-13-10	Westlaw Online Research Access		28.55	
Dec-14-10	Telephone Charges		0.40	
	Telephone Charges		0.10	
	Telephone Charges		0.20	
Dec-15-10	Facsimile Charges		3.00	
	Facsimile Charges		26.00	
	Facsimile Charges		7.00	
	Telephone Charges		0.10	
	Telephone Charges		0.10	
	Telephone Charges		1.00	
	Telephone Charges		0.40	
	Telephone Charges		0.20	
Dec-16-10	Telephone Charges		0.20	
	Telephone Charges		0.70	
Dec-17-10	Telephone Charges		0.10	
Dec-21-10	Telephone Charges		0.10	
	Telephone Charges		0.50	
	Telephone Charges		2.40	
Dec-22-10	Photocopies		2.10	
Dec-29-10	Photocopies		0.30	
	Telephone Charges		0.10	
30-10	Telephone Charges		0.20	
	Telephone Charges		1.80	

Totals	\$119.15	Page 95 of 324 \$0.00
Current Fees & Disbursements	_	\$4,801.65
Previous Balance Previous Payments		\$3,082.64 \$0.00

BALANCE DUE

invoice #:

3/313

\$7,884.29

57315

TRUST STATEMENT

Page 96 of 324

	Disbursements	Receipts
Trust Balance Forward		15.00
Total Trust	\$0.00	\$15.00
Trust Balance		\$15.00

VERO BEACH . CORAL GABLES

ROSSWAY MOORE SWAN, P.L. THE MODERN ONE BUILDING 2101 INDIAN RIVER BOULEVARD, SUITE 200 VERO BEACH, FL 32960 Telephone (772) 231-4440 Facsimile (772) 231-4430

Mr. Timothy Michaud 1791 Wekiva Drive Melbourne, FL 32940

February 7, 2011

File #: 1682-001 Inv. #: 57732

Total Due: \$2,962.60

RE: Post-judgment issues

Please write the FILE number on your check to insure proper crediting.

torno the table manager on Jose energies many broken energies

SUMMARY

*Balance Fwd:

\$7,884.29

Payment received:

\$7,884.29)

Current Invoice Amount:

\$2,962.60

TOTAL DUE:

\$2,962.60

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	ATT'Y/L.A.
Jan-02-11	Review materials in preparation for telephone conference with Mr. Michaud on Monday, January 3; review materials provided from paralegal and Mr. Michaud's e-mails	0.20	70.00	BWR
Jan-03-11	N/C - Prepare for Mr. Rossway's telephone call with Mr. Michaud, including review of file for copies of Motion for Contempt and Notice of Hearing	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud to discuss strategy, moving case forward, and switching contempt hearing to a case management hearing; telephone call to Mr. Orth's office to again request a return telephone call regarding access schedule; review e-mail regarding February access with minor child	0.50	175.00	BWR
Jan-04-11	N/C - Receipt and review of Order to Private Family Mediation	0.10	0.00	BWR
Jan-05-11	Work on issues relating to February time-sharing and access; review and study Court Order regarding required	0.20	70.00	BWR

	mediation; attempt to work out situation where mediation can occur during winter visit; work on issues regarding makeup visitation; task paralegal to draft motions		Page	e 98 of 324
Jan-06-11	N/C - E-mail Mr. Michaud and advise of cancellation of office conference with Mr. Rossway to prepare for contempt hearing in light of amending hearing to a case management conference	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Prepare correspondence to Attorney Orth regarding Mr. Michaud's spring break time-sharing in February 2011	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	Receipt and review of correspondence from Attorney Orth mediation and financial payments	0.10	35.00	BWR
Jan-10-11	N/C - Attempt to contact Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant regarding substituting hearing on contempt for case management conference	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, draft correspondence to Attorney Orth regarding mediation and health insurance issues	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	N/C - Attempt to contact Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant	0.10	0.00	PCLA
<u>(11-11</u>	N/C - Review and sign letter to opposing counsel regarding proposed timesharing	0.10	0.00	KMR
Jan-12-11	Review and sign letter to opposing counsel regarding scheduling of case management conference	0.10	17.50	KMR
	N/C - Review and sign correspondence to Mr. Orth regarding spring-break timesharing	0.10	0.00	KMR
	N/C - Several attempts to contact Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Telephone conference with Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant; e-mail to Mr. Michaud with update on issues regarding mediation, spring break time-sharing and case management conference	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	N/C - Attempt to contact Attorney Orth and leave message	0.10	12.50	PCLA
•	Draft Joint Notice of Private Mediation; on-line research for contact information for Joel Wilson, Esquire - mediator	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	N/C - Telephone conference with Jennifer of Attorney Orth's office to confirm January 18, 2011 Case Management Conference	0.10	0.00	PCLA

			Pag	e 99 of 324
Jan-18-11	N/C - Receipt and review of Order granting timesharing	0.10	0.00	BWR
	Draft Bullet Points for Case Management Conference; prepare pending orders and motions	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding case management conference, proposed mediator and, counseling for Riley; research file for Former Wife's proposed counselor and mediator; research online website for St. Frances	0.40	50.00	PCLA
	E-mails with Mr. Michaud regarding St. Francis and need for clarification of Former Wife's proposed counselor	0.10	12.50	PCLA
	N/C - Attend Case Management Conference via telephone and record Judge's requirement to prepare Order continuing trial and to schedule five minute hearing on spring break time-sharing and to schedule mediation if unable to resolve	0.30	0.00	PCLA
	Prepare for and attend Case Management Conference; receive the Court's direction regarding how to proceed regarding mediation, notification of trial, and specific person to notify regarding setting trial date	0.30	105.00	BWR
19-11	Telephone conference with Joel Wilson, Esq.'s office to schedule mediation; telephone conference with Attorney Orth to provide mediation dates	0.40	50.00	PCLA
	N/C - Attempt to contact Mr. Michaud and leave message	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Begin drafting Order on Continuation of Trial	0.30	37.50	PCLA
Jan-20-11	Review Final Judgment and Marital Settlement Agreement for clauses regarding daycare and attorney's fees; office conference with Attorney Rollin regard research on Mr. Michaud's entitlement to attorney's fees	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud to provide outcome of Case Management Conference regarding mediation, mediator, spring break and motion, and discussion regarding Mrs. Casey's claims regarding outstanding daycare costs, life insurance amount, and health insurance costs	0.30	37.50	PCLA
Car	Continue drafting of Order on Continuation of Trial and finalize for review by Attorney Orth	0.50	62.50	PCLA
) Jan-21-11	E-mail Attorney Orth proposed Order Continuing Trial; draft correspondence to Judge Maxwell	0.20	0.00	PCLA

	E-Mail to Attorney Orth requesting confirmation to schedule mediation for February 21, 2011 and status of Mrs. Casey's position on spring break time-sharing	0.10	Pag 12.50	e 100 of 324 PCLA
Jan-24-11	N/C - Attempt to contact Attorney Orth and leave message requesting status of setting mediation on dates provided on January 19, 2011	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Scan and e-mail Mr. Michaud past due King Reporting Invoice 21719 for July 14, 2010 hearing and request status of payment	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Jan-25-11	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, draft correspondence to Attorney Orth regarding scheduling mediation, spring-break, and discussions of amount alleged due from Mr. Michaud to be discussed at mediation	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud to relay Mr. Rossway's advice to pay his present and past calculated amount for Riley's health insurance and daycare amount, and discussion regarding the ongoing daycare issues and costs as presented by Mrs. Casey	0.40	50.00	PCLA
	Prepare Former Husband's Motion to Compel Mediation	0.60	75.00	PCLA
	Analyze pleadings to determine provisions that have bearing on Mr. Michaud's entitlement to attorney's fees; research case law regarding entitlement to attorneys fees in family law proceedings, application of prevailing party attorney's fees provisions in child related cases, and effect of public policy that interests of child should not be adversely affected by prevailing party fee provision; research Ulbrich v. Coolidge, Hutchinson v. Hutchinson, Engelsen v. Landers, Bane v. Bane, Spano v. Spano, Sanchez v. Sanchez, Bernstein v. Bernstein, Tietig v. Boggs, Rosen v. Rosen, Fla. Stat. 61.16, and related cases; outline memorandum regarding application of prevailing party fee provisions in child related cases and commence drafting memorandum of law regarding same; draft issue, rule, and commence drafting explanation of the law including application of Fla. Stat. 61.16, general rule for application of prevailing party fees, exceptions to the rule, and possible interpretations of case law which may be used to argue against Mr. Michaud being able to collect attorneys fees pursuant to the prevailing party fee provision contained within the parties' agreement	6.30	500.00	KMR
	Review file regarding opposing counsel's response; task paralegal with information regarding filing motions for mediation and winter break access if no response is received from correspondence sent this week	0.20	70.00	BWR
Jan-26-11	Receipt and review of e-mails between Mr. Michaud and Mrs. Casey and from Mrs. Casey's North Carolina attorney regarding daycare and health insurance costs,	0.30	37.50	PCLA

J.,J.

	including Mrs. Michaud's accounting of money she is due and Mr. Michaud's Counterpetition		Pag	2 101 01 32
	Research case law regarding requirement to plead specific contractual provision allowing attorneys fees; research Stockman v. Downs, Bull v. Bull, and Moss v. Moss; draft paragraph in explanation of the law discussing requirement to plead entitlement to attorney's fees; revise issue, rule, and conclusion to address pleading of attorney's fees, draft analysis and argument section of memorandum; proofread and revise complete draft of memorandum	2.50	100.00	KMR
Jan-27-11	Research case law originating out of the 5th District Court of Appeal on enforcement of prevailing party fee provisions in child related cases; revise memorandum to include cases from the 5th District Court of Appeal	2.40	420.00	KMR
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, review Attorney Orth's correspondence of January 26, 2011 and attached Baystate Family Advocacy Center Report on Riley Michaud dated January 18, 2011; flag information pertinent to preparing an Emergency Motion for Change of Custody; review file for prior Massachusetts ES Comprehensive Assessment in September 2010	0.80	100.00	PCLA
	N/C - Telephone conference with Attorney Orth's office to request re-faxing of Report due to illegible portions in prior fax	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Receipt of faxed Massachusetts' DCF Report of December 22, 2010 advising no cause regarding allegations of abuse	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Receive information regarding the mother's, intentional violation of Court Order, by virtue of taking the child to additional diagnostic testing; review materials from Baystate Family Advocacy Center; review Court Order regarding requirements for notification to be made only to Dr. Deborah Day; begin work on issue for Motion for Attorneys' Fees, and potential amendment to pleadings to seek emergent measures including transfer of custody immediately	0.75	262.50	BWR
Jan-28-11	Work on sole custody issue; work on issues relating to Dr. Day and updating opinion based upon materials received from Law offices of William Orth under date of January 26, 2011 including forwarding of materials on Monday, January 31, 2011 to court-appointed psychologist	0.30	105.00	BWR
Jan-31-11	N/C- Preparation of draft correspondence to Dr. Boos regarding Riley Michaud pursuant to Mr. Rossway's direction	0.20	0.00	CRLA
	Telephone call to Attorney Orth's office; begin work on materials for sole parental responsibility; draft	0.30	105.00	BWR

....

Totals

22.95

\$2,822.50

DISBURSEMENTS		Disbursements	Receipts
Jan-31-11	Overpay payment of outstanding invoices		0.71
Jan-03-11	Telephone Charges	3.90	
	Telephone Charges	0.10	
Jan-06-11	Postage	0.88	
Jan-11-11	Telephone Charges	0.60	
	Telephone Charges	0.20	
	Postage	1.76	
	Postage	0.88	
Jan-12-11	Photocopies	1.50	
	Facsimile Charges	3.00	
inger Den	Facsimile Charges	6.00	
	Telephone Charges	0.20	
	Telephone Charges	0.10	
Jan-18-11	Telephone Charges	1.50	
	Telephone Charges	0.10	
	Telephone Charges	0.10	
	Telephone Charges	0.10	
	Telephone Charges	0.50	
Jan-19-11	Telephone Charges	0.70	
	Telephone Charges	0.30	
	Telephone Charges	0.10	
Jan-20-11	Telephone Charges	2.30	
Jan-21-11	Photocopies	0.30	
	Postage	1.05	
4-11	Telephone Charges	0.10	
Jan-25-11	Photocopies	2.60	

		myolee ii.	134
	Facsimile Charges	2.00	Page 103 of 324
	Facsimile Charges	7.00	G
	Telephone Charges	0.10	
	Telephone Charges	0.30	
	Westlaw Online Research Access	50.00	
	Postage	1.83	
Jan-26-11	Facsimile Charges	2.00	
	Westlaw Online Research Access	16.08	
Jan-27-11	Westlaw Online Research Access	32.43	
Jan-31-11	Telephone Charges	0.20	
	Totals	\$140.81	\$0.71
	Current Fees & Disbursements		\$2,962.60
	Previous Balance		\$7,884.29
	Previous Payments		\$7,884.29
	DAY ANDE DUE		£2.062.60
	BALANCE DUE		\$2,962.60

μιινυιου π.

11112

TRUST STATEMENT

Page 104 of 324

	Disbursements	Receipts
Trust Balance Forward		15.00
Total Trust	\$0.00	\$15.00
Trust Balance		\$15.00

VERO BEACH • CORAL GABLES

ROSSWAY MOORE SWAN, P.L. THE MODERN ONE BUILDING 2101 INDIAN RIVER BOULEVARD, SUITE 200 VERO BEACH, FL 32960 Telephone (772) 231-4440 Facsimile (772) 231-4430

Mr. Timothy Michaud 1791 Wekiva Drive Melbourne, FL 32940

March 8, 2011

File #: 1682-001 Inv. #: 58178

Total Due: \$12,570.97

RE: Post-judgment issues

Please write the FILE number on your check to insure proper crediting.

SUMMARY

*Balance Fwd:

\$2,962.60

Payment received:

\$2,702.00

Current Invoice Amount:

\$0.00)

\$9,608.37

TOTAL DUE:

\$12,570.97

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	ATT'Y/L.A.
Feb-01-11	N/C - Review e-mails between Mr. Michaud and the "babysitter" regarding Riley	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, review draft correspondence to Stephen C. Boos, M.D.	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, begin drafting Former Husband's Emergency Motion for Temporary Change in Custody, with review of Dr. Boos' Medical Report, Dr. Day's report and other pertinent documents	2.20	275.00	PCLA
	N/C - Scan and e-mail Dr. Boos Medical Report to Mr. Michaud	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Scan and e-mail draft correspondence to Dr. Boos to Mr. Michaud	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Research case law regarding temporary and permanent change in timesharing due to mother's frustration of timesharing and disobedience of court; research Bon v. Rivera, Morales v. Morales, Compton v. Compton,	1.70	297.50	KMR

11110100 II. 30170

Schweinberg v. Click, and Clark v. Clark; conference with Patti Cain to discuss drafting of Amended Petition and Emergency Motion		Page	106 of 324
N/C - Review psychological reports and pleadings to begin outlining Verified Amended Supplemental Petition for Modification of Final Judgment of Dissolution of Marriage To Award Sole Parental Responsibility, Majority Timesharing, and Other Relief	1.20	0.00	KMR
Draft Verified Amended Supplemental Petition for Modification of Final Judgment of Dissolution of Marriage To Award Sole Parental Responsibility, Majority Timesharing, and Other Relief	2.80	490.00	KMR
N/C - Revisions to correspondence to Dr. Boos pursuant to Mr. Rossway's direction and finalize same	0.20	0.00	CRLA
Work on emergency issues concerning minor child; formulate and task assignments regarding Emergency Motion to Change Custody, Motion to Amend Pleadings to claim more sole parental responsibility over decision-making for minor child; review pleadings from opposing counsel; begin drafting on pleading to seek emergency change of custody	0.80	280.00	BWR
N/C - Draft Motion For Leave to Amend; substantially revise Amended Petition pursuant to strategy session with Mr. Rossway	4.10	0.00	KMR
N/C - Review draft of letter to Dr. Boos	0.40	0.00	KMR
N/C - Review and revise Emergency Motion	0.80	0.00	KMR
N/C - Early morning office conference with Mr. Rossway and Mr. Rollin for review of issues for amending Petition for sole custody and additional information to be included in Emergency Motion, and all Motions to be set for hearing, including Motion to Compel Mediation and Motion for Spring Break Time-Sharing	0.30	0.00	PCLA
E-mails with Mr. Michaud regarding Dr. Camera being put on notice and procedure to set hearings	0.20	25.00	PCLA
N/C - Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's review and directions, amend Emergency Motion to include statement regarding Mr. Michaud uneventful time-sharing with Riley during Christmas Break and transfers of custody prior to and at end of time-sharing	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Pursuant to review by Attorney Rollin with regarding case law, amend Emergency Motion regarding modifying timesharing	0.40	50.00	PCLA

Feb-02-11

	N/C - Scan and e-mail Mr. Michaud draft Emergency Motion for his review	0.20	Page 107 of 324 0.00 PCLA	
	Receipt and review of additional e-mail from Mr. Michaud regarding Officer Dale Young	0.10	12.50	PCLA
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's review, amend and finalize correspondence to Dr. Stephen Boos to be e-mailed and Federal Expressed	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	N/C - Prepare Federal Express to Dr. Boos	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Continue to work with associate and paralegal on emergency motions and pleadings; review current case law provided by associate to allow for Court to temporarily change custody based on complete inappropriate actions taken by mother	0.50	175.00	BWR
Feb-03-11	N/C - Revise Amended Petition pursuant to Mr. Rossway's notes; revise Amended Petition to include all rights under the Amended Marital Settlement Agreement for which Mr. Michaud may seek prevailing party fees and costs; draft additional provision requesting that Court rule on Motion for Contempt reserved on in Order on Oct. 8 Hearing and seek prevailing party fees for that motion	2.20	0.00	KMR
V.	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's further review, make amendments to Emergency Motion	0.40	50.00	PCLA
	Receipt of e-mails from Mr. Michaud providing comments on Emergency Motion and information on "Amanda Aceves"	0.10	12.50	PCLA
	N/C - Draft correspondence to Dr. Day enclosing Dr. Boos Medical Report on Riley	0.30	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Draft correspondence to Judge Maxwell regarding Emergency Motion and request to set Motions regarding mediation and spring break timesharing	0.30	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Office conference with Mr. Rollin for review of proposed Emergency Motion and draft Amended Petition	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Pursuant to additional review, make final revisions to Emergency Motion and finalize for review and signing by Mr. Michaud	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	Office conference with Mr. Michaud for review and signing of Emergency Motion and Amended Petition, discussion regarding possible time-frame for expedited hearing and, suggested psychologists in Brevard County	0.60	75.00	PCLA

	Continue completion of motions, amended pleadings, and related documentation; provide additional input to associate and paralegal to provide information necessary for the judge to make a decision regarding an emergency hearing at the same time as required mediation and spring break issues to require minor child to travel to Florida with mother based upon course of conduct; review materials to be provided to Dr. Deborah day on Friday	0.50	Pag 175.00	e 108 of 324 BWR
Feb-04-11	N/C - Telephone conference with Attorney Singer's paralegal for referral of psychologists in Brevard County; provide Mr. Michaud with three proposed psychologists	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	E-mails from Mr. Michaud regarding e-mails with Mrs. Casey	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	N/C - Finalize Emergency Motion and correspondence to Judge Maxwell; telephone conference with Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant; fax Emergency Motion to Judge Maxwell and Attorney Orth; prepare Federal Express to Brevard County Courthouse with Emergency Motion and Motion for Leave to Amend with Amended Petition; fax Motion for Leave to Amend and attached Amended Petition to Attorney Orth	0.40	0.00	PCLA
RC .	N/C - Advise Mr. Michaud for Emergency Motion and Motion for Leave to Amend faxed and Federal Expressed to Court with copy via e-mail to Mr. Michaud	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's review, make minor revision to correspondence to Dr. Day enclosing Dr. Boos' Medical Report	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Review and finalize materials for filing with Court; review and sign off on emergency motion, motion to amend, and amended pleadings; draft correspondence to Dr. Day and materials to use and send on to opposing counsel; review opposing counsel's previously filed motion; meeting with paralegal and associate to complete process	0.75	262.50	BWR
Feb-07-11	N/C -Receipt from Attorney Orth of clean copy of Dr. Boos' Medical Report	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - E-mail King Reporting Invoice No. 23297 for January 18, 2011 hearing to Mr. Michaud	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Continue work on emergency situation regarding child being taken to additional advocacy groups; work on additional motion to supplement, previously filed emergency motion to further convince the judge of a need for an emergency hearing; review defamatory materials; respond to same; telephone calls to Attorney Orth's office	0.40	140.00	BWR

Feb-08-11	N/C - Revisions to correspondence to Mr. Orth pursuant to Mr. Rossway's direction	0.20	Pag€ 0.00	e 109 of 324 CRLA
	N/C - Revisions to Emergency Motion pursuant to Mr. Rossway's direction	0.20	0.00	CRLA
	Receipt and review of e-mailed copy of Dr. Camera's report on Riley's office visit of January 5, 2011 and Mr. Michaud's attached comments	0.10	12.50	PCLA
	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding Dr. Camera's report and questions to be clarified, and Mr. Michaud advising of payment of Riley's daycare costs	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's instructions, review Attorney Orth's e-mailed correspondence of January 88, 2011 and prepare response objecting to therapy through Baystate Family Advocacy; research Baystate Family Advocacy Center	0.90	112.50	PCLA
	Receipt and review of an inflammatory e-mail from Riley's babysitter, Lisa Breaulien to Mr. Michaud	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Receive confirmation regarding one-day hearing; begin work on Notice of Hearing and potential suggested order for Court to sign, with paralegal; leave voicemail with Mr. Michaud regarding the Courts granting of an emergency hearing; telephone call to Attorney Orth's office to seek response to demands for babysitter to be restricted	0.20	70.00	BWR
Feb-09-11	Review and revise correspondence to Attorney Orth regarding Lisa Beaulieu	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	N/C - Receipt of e-mail from Mr. Michaud with accounting for daycare	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Telephone conference with Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant with instructions for preparing Notice of Hearing for March 4, 2011 also, advise of forthcoming Supplement to Former Husband's Emergency Motion; advise Mr. Rossway of Judge's decision and instructions that Mrs. Casey and Minor Child are to attend	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	Draft Notice of Emergency Hearing for March 4, 2011 for all day hearing and include Judge's requirement for minor child to attend	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	N/C - Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's review make final revisions to correspondence to Attorney Orth	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Receipt and review of e-mail from Mr. Michaud regarding Massachusetts DCF refusal to provide their documentation to Mr. Michaud	0.10	0.00	PCLA

Review e-mail correspondence from Mr. Michaud and Lisa Beaulieu; review pertinent Court Orders; draft correspondence to Mr. Orth regarding e-mail from Ms. Beaulieu	1.00	Page 175.00	e 110 of 324 KMR
N/C - Review correspondence form Mr. Other to Mr. Rossway regarding contempt and therapy	0.10	0.00	KMR
Review criminal statute referenced by Mr. Michaud	0.10	17.50	KMR
N/C - Receipt and review of copy of correspondence from Attorney Orth to Judge Maxwell with Response to Former Husband's Emergency Motion	0.10	0.00	BWR
Review draft Notice of Hearing regarding compelling mother and child to appear in open Court; work on alternative to provide the Court with an order requiring parties to attend hearing; additional telephone call to Attorney Orth's office regarding objection to babysitter based upon extreme defamatory communication to Mr. Michaud; confirm with associate that Mr. Michaud will need to report the defamatory communication as a crime to his local police department; work with paralegal concerning updating the Court of the conduct; further refinements to supplemental factual information for the Court to receive with redacted defamatory communication	0.20	70.00	BWR
N/C - Receipt and review of Order on Continuation of Trial	0.10	0.00	BWR
N/C - Several attempt to contact Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant regarding possible need for an Order Setting Hearing verses Notice of Hearing due to requirement to be included that Former Wife and Child ordered/required to appear at hearing	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Telephone conference with Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant who provided instructions to forward a proposed Order Setting Hearing and Mr. Rossway's Notice of Hearing for the Judge to make a determination	0.10	12.50	PCLA
Draft Order Setting Hearing	0.30	37.50	PCLA
Office conference with Mr. Rossway for review of Supplemental Motion and Allegations in Support of Former Husband's Emergency; amend Supplemental Motion; telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding his relationship with Lisa Beaulieu, and discussion regarding additional therapist disclosed in Dr. Boos report - Amanda Aceves and Mr. Michaud's attempts to obtain the report regarding Riley	0.50	62.50	PCLA
Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding potential criminal charges	0.30	52.50	KMR

Feb-11-11

0/18C

	N/C - Revisions to correspondence pursuant to Mr. Rossway's direction	0.20	Pago 0.00	e 111 of 324 CRLA
	N/C - Second attempt to contact Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant and reach voicemail advising no mail box available to leave message	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Feb-14-11	N/C - Continue to attempt to fax correspondence to Mr. Orth's office from Friday, fax finally successful Monday morning	0.10	0.00	CRLA
	Assist Mr. Rossway with email correspondence to Mr. Michaud	0.20	25.00	CRLA
	N/C - Research through Clerk of Court's office regarding filed Notice of Hearing	0.20	0.00	CRLA
	N/C - Telephone conference with Mr. Orth's office regarding receipt of Notice of Hearing, receive information that notice is not yet received but will call when it is	0.10	0.00	CRLA
7	Work on confirming March for hearing materials; receive communication from Mr. Michaud; respond to same; confirm order has been sent to judge along with Notice of Hearing	0.20	70.00	BWR
15-11	N/C - Preparation of email correspondence to Mr. Michaud forwarding various pleadings and correspondence for his records	0.20	0.00	CRLA
	Check on status of Notice of Hearing and/or Court Order	0.10	35.00	BWR
Feb-16-11	Research State Department Passport Form	0.40	70.00	KMR
	Work on notice materials; work on potential notification to United States State Department regarding potential passport issue in light of seriousness of hearing to be held on March 3, 2011	0.20	70.00	BWR
Feb-17-11	N/C - Exchange of e-mail correspondence with Mr. Michaud regarding various questions with regard to the documents for the upcoming hearing	0.10	0.00	CRLA
	N/C - Meeting with Mr. Rossway regarding Mr. Michaud's questions and discussions regarding possible passport issues	0.10	0.00	CRLA
	Further exchange of email correspondence with Mr. Michaud regarding the upcoming hearing, witnesses and passport issue	0.20	25.00	CRLA

			Pag	e 112 of 324
	Preparation of Motion for Contempt with regard to the Mediation Order	0.30	37.50	CRLA
	N/C - Preparation of correspondence to Mr. Michaud regarding passport alert program and provide form for completion	0.20	0.00	CRLA
	N/C - Exchange of email correspondence with Mr. Michaud regarding various issues with regard to the DSS in MASS	0.10	0.00	CRLA
	Work on witness issues; continue to monitor notice issue provided to Court; begin formulation of ideas for witness testimony at March 3, 2011 hearing	0.50	175.00	BWR
	N/C - Exchange of email correspondence with Mr. Michael regarding telephone conference with Mr. Cerda	0.20	0.00	CRLA
	N/C - Place telephone call to Judge Maxwell's J.A., Melissa; receive word to call back on Tuesday	0.20	0.00	CRLA
Feb-18-11	Work on notice issue; work on confirmation of hearing and requirement for a court reporter to be present; provide additional information to associate regarding memorandum to provide to the Court confirming judge's ability to immediately change custody on emergent basis	0.20	70.00	BWR
21-11	N/C - Office conference with Cindy Rednour regarding status of notice of March 4, 2011 hearing from Court; pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions due to Judge Maxwell's assistants' unavailability, file Notice of Hearing; telephone conference with King Court Reporting to schedule court reporter; telephone conference with Attorney Orth's assistant to confirm their awareness of hearing; telephone conference with Dr. Day's assistant to advise of hearing and possible contact by Judge Maxwell to Dr. Day during hearing	0.60	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding preparations for March 4, 2011 hearing, including research required on use of reports as evidence at hearing	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Review Massachusetts' DCF Report provided by Mr. Michaud and mark notes of conversation between DCF Investigator and Dr. Day	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Receipt and review of Notice of Appearance of Attorney Jay for former wife	0.10	0.00	BWR
	Research admissibility of DCF and related reports	2.30	100.00	KMR
Marin 1	Begin preparation for extensive evidentiary hearing; work on issue regarding alleged urinary tract infection; review medical records from Dr. Camera	1.00	350.00	BWR

Begin review and organization of documents, pleadings and exhibits for use at March 4, 2011 hearing/trial	0.70	Page 87.50	113 of 324 PCLA
N/C - Conference with Patti Cain and Bradley Rossway regarding potential evidentiary issues, objections, and arguments	0.50	0.00	KMR
N/C - Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud and Mr. Rossway regarding new attorney coming into the case, Dr. Day, and latest report	0.50	0.00	KMR
Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding Pediatrician report for January 4, 2011, and discussion regarding report of Amanda Aceves, MA, LPC, NCC; research Port Human Services and Amanda Aceves	0.20	25.00	PCLA
N/C - Short office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding issues and strategy for hearing and, request to research Former Wife's new attorney William R. Jay, Esquire	0.20	0.00	PCLA
N/C - Office conference with Mr. Rossway and Attorney Rollins for review of issues and preparations for March 4, 2011 trial	0.30	0.00	PCLA
Trial work consisting of review of all pleadings and orders and prepare Important Pleadings Notebook; review all documents and for requests for attorney's fees and all other court orders violated by the Former Wife	1.20	150.00	PCLA
Review all reports, investigative documents and evaluation in North Carolina, Florida and Massachusetts, together with Dr. Day's timeline, and prepare a comprehensive Notebook of all documents	2.30	287.50	PCLA
Begin gathering exhibits and pending motions for Trial Notebook	0.40	50.00	PCLA
Extensive preparation for upcoming hearing; meeting with paralegal to pull out all potential evidentiary documentation; review information concerning new attorney on case; review and compare new attorney's qualifications; review pleadings; provide information to associate for preparation of memorandum to provide Court with comfort level concerning exigent circumstances to allow temporary change to custodial arrangement; work on issues that may be of concern to the judge. under the present factual circumstances; work on Dr. Deborah Day issues including getting Dr. Day to attend hearing; plan strategy for presentation of former husband's side of proceeding; begin review of doctor's notes etc.	2.00	700.00	BWR
Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud to discuss strategy for case, witnesses, planning for contingencies, update concerning additional attorney, and potential	0.50	175.00	BWR

m voice π .

	preparations to prepare for additional hostile questioning		Pag	e 114 of 324
	Telephone conference with former state attorney Mr. Mark Fromang to discuss Mr. William R Jay and Mr. William Orth; receive background information; telephone conference with Mr. Michaud to update him	0.30	105.00	BWR
Feb-23-11	Receipt and review of fax copy of letter to Judge Maxwell together with a copy of Motion to Permit Testimony by Skype or Video Conference and Order on Motion filed by Mr. Orth	0.10	35.00	BWR
	N/C - Receipt and review of Order Setting Hearing signed by Judge Maxwell	0.10	0.00	BWR
	N/C - Review correspondence from Mr. Orth and Motions to allow research case law regarding objection to late disclosed expert witness appearing by phone or skype	0.70	0.00	KMR
	N/C - Receipt of e-mail from Mr. Michaud advising of delay in obtaining proposed therapist for Riley in Massachusetts	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, draft correspondence to Dr. Day regarding Dr. Camera's report from January 5, 2011	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding list of proposed therapists for Riley and support for March	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Telephone conference with Evelyn of Dr. Day's office to coordinate Dr. Day's testimony on March 4, 2011	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Additional telephone conference with Dr. Day's assistant regarding Dr. Day's appearance for trial and expert fee	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding Dr. Day's testimony and fee	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Draft correspondence to Attorney Orth regarding Mr. Michaud's proposed therapists for Riley in Florida and Massachusetts; research contact information for Brevard therapists; research Massachusetts and Connecticut therapists to determine if child psychologists; telephone conference with Mr. Michaud and go to Cigna website; prepare exhibit of therapists	1.30	162.50	PCLA
(C)	N/C - Draft Notice of Compliance regarding providing proposed therapists	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Draft Subpoena for Trial for Dr. Day	0.20	25.00	PCLA

N/C - Draft forward correspondence to Dr. Day enclosing Subpoena	0.20	Pag ^{0.00}	e 115 of 324 PCLA
N/C - Review Attorney Orth's correspondence to Judge Maxwell regarding Former Wife's proposed expert witnesses	0.10	0.00	PCLÁ
N/C - Office conference with Mr. Rollin regarding Mr. Michaud's expert witness to attend trial and issue regarding response to Former Wife's proposed expert witnesses	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding irregularities in Dr. Camera's report	0.20	25.00	PCLA
N/C - E-mail to Mr. Michaud regarding certified copies of records	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding additional report from Massachusetts' DCF and request for certified copies	0.20	25.00	PCLA
N/C - Draft Correspondence to Attorney Orth and Jay advising of Subpoena for Trial and Dr. Day's appearance on March 4, 2010	0.20	0.00	PCLA
N/C - Office conference with Mr. Rollin regarding specific Orders entered by the Court which were violated by the evaluation by Baystate and Former Wife's expert witnesses to testify at the March 4, 2011 hearing	0.30	0.00	PCLA
Continue work on determination and preparations of exhibits for March 4, 2011 hearing; e-mail requests to Mr. Michaud for all e-mails with the babysitter in January and February 2011 and e-mails with Mrs. Casey in December and January 2011 regarding communication through third parties	3.70	462.50	PCLA
N/C - Attend telephone conference with Mr. Rossway, Mr. Michaud, and Carlos Creda	1.20	0.00	PCLA
N/C - Attempt to contact Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant and be advised Melissa is out until February 28, 2011	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Research objections to yet undisclosed experts testifying by telephone and violations of court's orders as well as rules of procedure; draft response to Former Wife's Motion to Permit Testimony by Skype or Video Conference; conference with Bradley Rossway to refine response, arguments, and strategy to exclude experts	6.50	500.00	KMR
Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding Response to motion to permit testimony of undisclosed	0.50	87.50	KMR

Feb-24-11

1117 U100 II. JU110

	experts by telephone; e-mail Mr. Michaud the draft proposed response and correspondence from Mr. Orth		Page	e 116 of 324
	Work on response objection and motion to strike motion filed on behalf of former wife asking for two unnamed experts to be able to testify via video conference or "Skype"; meeting with associate to further refine arguments; review case law provided by associate; further review of extensive pleadings in preparation for sending to the Court on Friday morning; meeting with paralegal to discuss various issues in organization for potential exhibits to be used at extensive hearing; provide direction and input to associate and paralegal	1.25	437.50	BWR
	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud and potential witness Carlos Cerda	0.80	280.00	BWR
Feb-25-11	Review, amend and finalize Former Husband's Response to Former Wife's Motion for [Expert] Testimony	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	N/C - Draft correspondence to Judge Maxwell enclosing Former Husband Response	0.20	0.00	PCLA
V	Receipt of e-mail from Mr. Michaud from Ms. Casey regarding additional doctor visit for Riley; telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding address for Ms. Marto, and request Mr. Michaud attempt to obtain additional doctor reports	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Prepare additional exhibits and finalize Important Pleadings, Orders, etc. Notebook for Mr. Rossway's review and use at trial	1.30	162.50	PCLA
	N/C - Draft correspondence to Attorney Orth enclosing Massachusetts DCF December 22, 2010 correspondence	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Finalize Exhibit Notebook for Mr. Rossway's review and use at March 4, 2011 hearing; review all reports from evaluators, doctors and DCF and highlight items of interest and at issue for March 4th hearing	1.40	175.00	PCLA
	N/C - Attempt to contact Evelyn at Dr. Day's office	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Receipt and review of Amended Response to Former Husband's Motion	0.10	35.00	BWR
	N/C - Review Amended Response to Former Husband's Verified Emergency Motion For Temporary Change In Timesharing	0.20	0.00	KMR
	Scan and e-mail response from Mr. Orth to Mr. Michaud; review pleading to determine whether exhibit was not properly attached; conference with Patti Cain to discuss letter to be drafted to opposing counsel addressing the fact that Exhibit A was properly attached	0.30	52.50	KMR

I ago III oloz	Page	11	7	of	324	1
----------------	------	----	---	----	-----	---

	to Verified Motion and but not to disclose report acquired after Verified Motion was initially filed		Page	9 117 OT 324
	Research applicability of rule excluding witnesses from trial to Dr. Day; research §90.616, Fla. Stat., Hernandez v. State, Strausser v. State, and Baker v. Air-Kaman of Jacksonville, Inc.; research Trawick's Practice and Procedure on the rule of sequestration; draft memorandum regarding same	3.30	100.00	KMR
	Meet with paralegal and associate to task out additional preparations for extensive hearing; authorize and file response to request for out-of-state experts to appear; provide information to associate regarding a Memorandum of Law; direct paralegal on preparation of three binders including evidentiary folder binder, pleading folder binder, and reports of various professionals reviewing child from before inception of case binder	0.40	140.00	BWR
Feb-28-11	Office conference with Patti Cain and Mr. Michaud regarding preparation of Memorandum in support of temporary modification of timesharing	0.20	35.00	KMR
	N/C - Office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding Mr. Michaud becoming familiar with timeline; attempt to contact Mr. Michaud and leave message	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Telephone conference with Dr. Day's office regarding receipt of Dr. Camera's January 5, 2011 office visit report and babysitter's e-mail	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding Mrs. Casey's failure to request Mr. Michaud's co-pays for all therapy and evaluations in North Carolina and Massachusetts	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Office conference with Mr. Michaud prior to second review of Dr. Day's Report and discussion after Mr. Michaud's review of the Report	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	Office conference with Mr. Rollin regarding time-line of events since July 8, 2010 order for use in Memorandum of law	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	Complete review of report from Dr. Deborah Day to study issues to present to Judge Maxwell and prepare for testimony of Dr. Day at hearing	1.25	437.50	BWR
	Totals	77.95	\$9,277.50	

UNSEMENTS

Disbursements

Receipts

	•	30170	
Feb-02-11	Photocopies	4.00	Page 118 of 324
	Facsimile Charges	3.00	1 ago 110 01 02 1
open of the second	Postage	1.32	
	Fedex to Dr. Stephen Boos, Springfield, MA	17.36	
Feb-03-11	Telephone Charges	0.40	
Feb-04-11	Photocopies	0.30	
	Facsimile Charges	7.00	
	Facsimile Charges	10.00	
	Facsimile Charges	11.00	
	Facsimile Charges	5.00	
	Telephone Charges	0.20	
	Telephone Charges	0.30	
	Postage	3.80	
	Postage	1.49	
	Fedex to Brevard County Courthouse, Melbourne, FL	13.92	
Feb-08-11	Photocopies	0.40	
	Facsimile Charges	3.00	
	Postage	0.44	
Feb-09-11	Photocopies	0.20	
	Photocopies	0.60	
	Facsimile Charges	4.00	
	Telephone Charges	1.20	
	Postage	0.44	
Feb-11-11	Photocopies	1.20	
	Photocopies	3.00	
	Photocopies	0.40	
	Telephone Charges	0.20	
	Telephone Charges	1.00	
Feb-14-11	Facsimile Charges	8.00	
₹ -11	Photocopies	0.60	
	Postage	0.61	•

myoroo n.

111 VOICC π. 301/0

Feb-21-11	Photocopies	1.00	Page 119 of 324
	Facsimile Charges	3.00	Ç
Jan	Facsimile Charges	3.00	
	Telephone Charges	0.30	
	Telephone Charges	0.20	
	Westlaw Online Research Access	24.01	
	Postage	1.76	
Feb-22-11	Photocopies	0.90	
	Photocopies	0.60	
	Facsimile Charges	4.00	
	Telephone Charges	2.00	
	Telephone Charges	0.20	
	Telephone Charges	2.20	
	Courier Expense	2.50	
	Postage	0.44	
Feb-23-11	Photocopies	5.10	
	Facsimile Charges	5.00	
	Facsimile Charges	4.00	
	Facsimile Charges	1.00	
	Facsimile Charges	4.00	
	Facsimile Charges	4.00	
	Telephone Charges	1.80	
	Telephone Charges	0.40	
	Telephone Charges	0.30	
	Telephone Charges	0.10	
	Telephone Charges	0.10	
	Telephone Charges	0.10	
	Telephone Charges	0.50	
	Postage	3.25	
`4-11	Telephone Charges	0.30	
The same of the sa	Westlaw Online Research Access	35.00	

		Invoice #. Joi	10
	Postage	3.05	Page 120 of 324
Feb-25-11	Photocopies	4.00	3
	Photocopies	3.30	
	Photocopies	2.40	
	Facsimile Charges	8.00	
	Facsimile Charges	8.00	
	Facsimile Charges	1.00	
	Facsimile Charges	7.00	
	Facsimile Charges	3.00	
	Facsimile Charges	3.00	
	Westlaw Online Research Access	35.00	
Feb-28-11	Telephone Charges	0.10	
	Telephone Charges	0.80	
	Totals	\$330.87	\$0.00
Market Company	Current Fees & Disbursements		\$9,608.37
	Previous Balance		\$2,962.60
	Previous Payments		\$0.00
	BALANCE DUE		\$12,570.97

58178

TRUST STATEMENT

Page 121 of 324

	Disbursements	Receipts
Trust Balance Forward		15.00
Total Trust	\$0.00	\$15.00
Trust Balance		\$15.00

VERO BEACH . CORAL GABLES

ROSSWAY MOORE SWAN, P.L.
THE MODERN ONE BUILDING
2101 INDIAN RIVER BOULEVARD, SUITE 200
VERO BEACH, FL 32960
Telephone (772) 231-4440 Facsimile (772) 231-4430

Mr. Timothy Michaud 1791 Wekiva Drive Melbourne, FL 32940

April 6, 2011

File #: 1682-001 Inv. #: 58647

Total Due: \$13,980.28

RE: Post-judgment issues

Please write the FILE number on your check to insure proper crediting.

SUMMARY

*Balance Fwd:

\$12,570.97

Payment received:

\$12,000.00)

Current Invoice Amount:

\$13,409.31

TOTAL DUE:

\$13,980.28

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	ATT'Y/L.A.
Feb-23-11	Continue trial work, including organization, preparation, and categorizing all possible exhibits for Former Husband's Trial Notebook with review of all e-mails, reports and other documents	1.10	137.50	PCLA
Mar-01-!1	Receipt and review of e-mails from Mr. Michaud regarding Thanksgiving visitation; e-mail to Mr. Michaud to advise of deadline for payment of Dr. Day's expert witness fee	0.10	12.50	PCLA
	Office conference with Mr. Rollin regarding preparation of case law and argument for objections to exhibits; office conference with Mr. Rollin regarding time-line of Massachusetts DCF report and Former Wife's Amended Response indicating DCF investigation regarding therapy and referral to Dr. Boos for use in Memorandum of Law	0.30	37.50	PCLA
-	Office conference with Mr. Rollin to review all reports and assist in drafting language for Memorandum Of Law on Temporary Change of Majority Timesharing	0.80	100.00	PCLA

				e 123 of 324
	Draft Memorandum of Law in Support of the Former Husband's Verified Emergency Motion for Temporary Change in Timesharing	3.80	665.00	KMR
	Continue extensive preparations for upcoming hearing on Friday; further work on exhibits; meeting with associate regarding time line and arguments to be placed into a Memorandum of Law; discussions with paralegal regarding additional materials to be prepared and available should questions arise during hearing and issue regarding Carlos	1.00	350.00	BWR
Mar-02-11	Continue to draft Memorandum in Support of the Former Husband's Verified Emergency Motion for Temporary Change in Timesharing; draft law section outlining proper legal standards and potential pitfalls for trial judge to avoid when making temporary modification of timesharing and parental rights; complete law section, draft analysis and conclusions section, print and review first complete draft	4.50	787.50	KMR
	Continue work on preparations for Friday's evidentiary hearing; work on former husband's exhibits and notebook of important pleadings; review documents; further work with associate on Memorandum of Law	1.25	437.50	BWR
Mar-03-11	Review Plaintiff's Verified Complaint Pursuant to Massachusetts law, Emergency Motion, and related documents; research Massachusetts general statutes regarding emergency jurisdiction in child custody disputes; research lawyers in Massachusetts; research Trawick's on judicial disqualification; research Fla. Stat. 38.10; conference with Mr. Rossway and Mr. Michaud; draft Memorandum of Law regarding recusal; research law regarding contempt in expectation that Riley will not be in Court tomorrow	7.50	1,312.50	KMR
	N/C - Preparation of correspondence to Dr. Day regarding recent Massachusetts Court filing by Ms. Casey	0.20	0.00	CRLA
	N/C - Prepare files for office conference with Mr. Rossway and Mr. Michaud to prepare for March 4, 2011 hearing	0.30	0.00	PCLA
	Short office conference with Mr. Rossway and Mr. Rollin in preparation of March 4, 2011 hearing on Emergency Motion for Temporary Change in Timesharing	0.30	37.50	PCLA
(1°	Review and prepare Massachusetts pleadings filed by Mrs. Casey as exhibits for hearing	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	N/C - Telephone conferences with Brevard Clerk of Court, Clerk of the Melbourne Court, Judge's Judicial Assistant regarding providing Judge Maxwell with Former Husband's Emergency Motion for Emergency	0.60	0.00	PCLA

Page 124 of 324

Status Conference and possible timetable for call from Judge Maxwell regarding recent court filings in Massachusetts by Former Wife and Wife's Motion to Disqualify or Recuse Judge		Pag	e 124 of 3
Draft Former Husband's Emergency Motion for Emergency Status Conference; amend Emergency Motion pursuant to Mr. Rossway's review	1.30	162.50	PCLA
Research contact information for Wolf Swamp School; amend Emergency Motion to Verified Emergency Motion and finalize for providing to Judge Maxwell	0.30	37.50	PCLA
N/C - Telephone conference with King Court Reporting to confirm court reporters appearance at hearing and location of courthouse	0.10	0.00	PCLA
N/C - Telephone call with Dr. Day's assistant, Evelyn, and advise of additional documents to be provided to Dr. Day via e-mail	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Draft correspondence to Dr. Day advising of Mr. Rossway's receipt of additional reports from Dr. Camera, Massachusetts DCF reports in January and Former Wife's Emergency Motion to Stay Case	0.40	50.00	PCLA
Attend trial preparation conference with Mr. Rossway and Mr. Michaud and record bullet points for testimony at hearing	0.80	100.00	PCLA
Prepare Bullet Points of Issues for hearing; prepare Bullet Points of Examination of Mr. Michaud; prepare Bullet Points of Mrs. Casey's examination; prepare case law for Memorandums of Law	4.60	575.00	PCLA
Update and finalize Hearing Exhibit Notebook (4), Notebook of Important Pleadings and Notebook of Reports, Evaluations, etc. upon review of Mr. Rossway and receipt of additional documents and pleadings	3.90	0.00	PCLA
Extensive preparation for trial tomorrow on issues of emergency relocation a minor child to Florida and Motion to Amend Pleadings; receive materials from Massachusetts regarding proceeding filed in Massachusetts; review pleadings, affidavits and filings; telephone conference with Florida counsel for Ms. Casey; telephone conference with Massachusetts counsel regarding ex parte motion; receive information that an Order denying petition was entered by Massachusetts Court acknowledging and confirming Florida Court's jurisdiction over the matter; meet with paralegal and associate regarding an emergency motion for status conference; receive Motion to Recuse Judge Maxwell from case; work on response to motion including defenses to having the Court recuse itself from the current proceeding; review case law materials with associate and Mr. Michaud; work with Mr. Michaud on	7.00	2,450.00	BWR

Page 125 of 324

	preparations for hearing; work on testimony; telephone conferences with opposing counsel; telephone conference with the Court for hearing to deny Ex Parte Motion to Recuse Judge Maxwell; review three memorandums prepared by associate for presentation to Court regarding Dr. Days ability to be present in the Courtroom, Courts ability to meet higher standard regarding change of child in custody matters during proceedings, and memorandum regarding evidentiary issues; continue preparations for hearings; review evidence books; work on testimonial issues			
Mar-04-11	Prepare for hearing with Mr. Rossway; draft bullet point outline of Dr. Day's report for quick reference to support Mrs. Casey's misconduct as a substantial change	0.80	140.00	KMR
	Early morning preparations with Mr. Rossway for hearing on Former Husband's Emergency Motion for Temporary Change in Timesharing	0.60	75.00	PCLA
	N/C - Travel to Melbourne Courthouse for hearing	1.00	0.00	PCLA
	Attend morning session of hearing and assist Mr. Rossway with exhibits and record Mr. Michaud's testimony and examination of Mr. Michaud by Judge Maxwell; attend afternoon session of hearing and assist Mr. Rossway and Mr. Rollin with exhibits and documents, record cross-examination of Mr. Michaud, and testimony of Mrs. Casey, Ms. Marto, and Dr. Day's testimony; record Judge Maxwell's pronouncements regarding therapy and instructions for preparations of proposed Order to be provided in letter format	8.00	1,000.00	PCLA
	N/C - Travel back to RMTS	0.90	0.00	PCLA
	Early morning preparation and review of materials for opening statement, timeline, and suspended arguments to Court; review legal materials prepared by associate and testimonial and expert materials prepared by paralegal	1.00	350.00	BWR
	N/C - Travel to Melbourne Courthouse	1.00	0.00	BWR
	Attend morning session of trial hearing on issues relating to relocation of the child; provide opening statements, information to the Court and testimony of Mr. Michaud; afternoon continue testimony including Amy Marto, Mrs. Casey and Dr. Day	8.00	2,800.00	BWR
(N/C - Returned to Vero Beach	0.90	0.00	BWR
Maraga (Attend hearing regarding temporary change in timesharing	0.80	140.00	KMR

	N/C - Travel to Melbourne Courthouse for hearing	1.00	Pag 0.00	ge 126 of 324 KMR
	N/C - Return to Vero Beach	0.90	0.00	KMR
Mar-05-11	N/C - Re-organize file and exhibits; gather information for preparing proposed order	0.80	0.00	PCLA
Mar-07-11	Begin drafting letter to Judge Maxwell providing proposed language for "order" on March 4, 2011 hearing with review of pleadings and orders; begin with findings of facts including background of scheduled hearing, pending motions of former wife, former wife's failure to bring Riley to Florida based on DCF and third parties' instructions, Dr. Camera	2.40	300.00	PCLA
	N/C - Telephone conference with King Reporting regarding status of transcript of Dr. Day's testimony on March 4, 2011	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Work on issues relating to Friday's testimonial hearing; meet with paralegal regarding specifics be placed into letter regarding suggested findings of facts and rulings of law; check on status of transcript; review case law memorandum to insure appropriate standards are met in the Order	0.75	262.50	BWR
Mana-08-11	N/C - Office conference with Mr. Rollin regarding statements to be included in proposed "Letter/Order" language from March 4, 2011	0.30	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Several attempts to contact Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant regarding pending receipt of hearing transcript of Dr. Day's recommendations	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Review Attorney Orth's March 3, 2011 correspondence to Judge Maxwell	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, draft correspondence to Judge Maxwell regarding pending receipt of hearing transcript of Dr. Day's recommendations, and drafting of letter containing proposed language for Order on March 4, 2011 hearing	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	N/C - Telephone conference with Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant to advise of correspondence from Mr. Rossway to be faxed to Judge Maxwell	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Receipt of e-mail from Mr. Michaud regarding Mrs. Casey's new proposed daycare in Massachusetts and forward to Mr. Rossway	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Monaver	Continue drafting proposed statements to be provided to Judge Maxwell for an Order on the March 4, 2011 hearing; short office conference with Mr. Rossway	2.70	337.50	PCLA

	regarding Dr. Day's recommendations, review of Mr. Orth's recommendations to Judge Maxwell, and the depth of our statement of facts to be included in our recommendations to Judge Maxwell to substantiate a position of temporary change in timesharing		Pag	e 127 of 324
Mar-09-11	Receipt and review of fax correspondence dated March 9, 2011 from Attorney Orth	0.10	35.00	BWR
	Receipt and review of excerpt of Transcript of Proceedings regarding recommendations of Dr. Day	0.10	35.00	BWR
	Review proposed letter to Judge Maxwell regarding findings of fact	0.50	87.50	KMR
	E-mail from and to Mr. Michaud regarding status of correspondence to be sent to Judge Maxwell providing language for Order on March 4, 2011 hearing	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Read Excerpt Transcript of March 4, 2011 Hearing - Dr. Day's Recommendations (and testimony)	0.40	50.00	PCLA
	Continue drafting final findings; begin drafting portion of correspondence to include Dr. Day's testimony and recommendations	2.90	362.50	PCLA
	N/C - Review Mr. Orth's March 9, 2011 correspondence to Judge Maxwell with revised recommendations	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Upon review by Mr. Rossway, amend extensive (10 page) correspondence to Judge Maxwell	0.70	87.50	PCLA
	N/C - Upon additional review by Mr. Rollin, make further amendments and revisions to Judge Maxwell correspondence	0.40	0.00	PCLA
	Receive additional facsimile from Attorney Orth's office; review, correct, and amend, extensive findings of fact and conclusions to present to the judge to assist the Court with potential ruling on change of custody on a temporary basis; review case law to ensure findings of fact are in compliance with case law requirements; review and finalize with associate and paralegal materials to send to the judge first thing Thursday morning	0.75	262.50	BWR
Mar-10-11	N/C - Fax and mail correspondence and hearing transcript to Judge Maxwell; e-mail to Mr. Michaud; telephone conference with Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant; e-mail correspondence to Judge Maxwell; fax correspondence and transcript to Attorney Orth	0.50	0.00	PCLA
	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding issues with Mrs. Casey's proposed daycare providers; office conference with Mr. Rossway to advise of Mr. Michaud advice on issue of daycare for Riley	0.30	37.50	PCLA

).20 70	100 1000
	0.00 BWR
2.20 2.5	5.00 PCLA
.30 37	7.50 PCLA
.20 (0.00 PCLA
.20 70	0.00 BWR
.20 25	i.00 PCLA
.20 0	.00 PCLA
.10 0	.00 PCLA
30 37	.50 PCLA
30 37	.50 PCLA
20 0	.00 PCLA
30 105	.00 BWR
	.20 25 .30 37 .20 0 .20 0 .20 37 .20 0 .20 0 .20 0 .20 0

Mar-16-11	Continue drafting detailed correspondence to Judge Maxwell in response to Attorney Orth's March 14th correspondence to Judge Maxwell, with review of exhibits from trial and transcript of Dr. Day's testimony, our trial notes, and Mr. Rossway's correspondence to Judge Maxwell of March 10, 2011	2.20	Pag 275.00	ge 129 of 324 PCLA
Mar-17-11	N/C - Short office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding additional statement to be included in correspondence to Judge Maxwell per his review	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway review, make final amendments to correspondence to Judge Maxwell; office conference with Mr. Rossway; amend correspondence to include statement that Dr. Day was served with a Subpoena for Hearing to appears as neutral psychologist appointed by Court	0.70	87.50	PCLA
	N/C - Telephone conference with Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant; fax correspondence to Judge and Attorney Orth	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Receipt and review of Attorney Jay's Motion to Withdraw as Co-Counsel and proposed Order	0.10	35.00	BWR
	Review materials prepared by paralegal at direction of BWR for response to latest, incorrect statements made by opposing counsel to provide to judge; review finalized materials and authorize sending to Judge Maxwell	0.20	70.00	BWR
Mar-22-11	N/C - Pursuant to Mr. Michaud's inquiries, research Brevard County Court on-line for entry of Order; attempt to contact Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant, who was not available, for status of possible Order on March 4, 2011 hearing	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - E-mail to Mr. Michaud attaching Judge Maxwell's Order Denying Respondent's Motion to Disqualify or Recluse Trial Judge and provide Mr. Rossway's position that	0.10	0.00	PCLA .
Mar-28-11	N/C - Attempt to contact Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant; check Court website for entry of additional Order	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Review e-mails from Mr. Michaud regarding status of Court Order; receive confirmation from paralegal that judicial assistant is away until Monday	0.10	35.00	BWR
79-11	N/C - Receipt and review of e-mails by and between Mr. Michaud and Mrs. Casey	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding current issues and provide Riley's social security	0.30	37.50	PCLA

mvoice #.

	number; attend further conference with Mr. Rossway and Mr. Michaud regarding filing a motion advising court of ongoing issues of Ms. Casey		Pago	e 130 of 324
	Receipt and review of additional e-mails by and between Mr. Michaud and Mrs. Casey regarding Riley's schooling and medical issues	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Begin drafting Emergency Motion for Determination and for Entry of Order on March 4, 2011 Hearing regarding ongoing issues with the Former Wife regarding minor child's pediatrician and medical record, Former Wife's continued false statements, and spring break	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	Continue drafting Emergency Motion for Determination and Order; review Dr. Tapper's report and e-mail of Ms. Casey's statements to Mr. Michaud	1.40	175.00	PCLA
	Review e-mails from Mr. Michaud; meeting with Patti Cain; short discussion with Mr. Michaud; formulate strategy, plan and dictate portions of motion to paralegal for additional drafting	0.30	105.00	BWR
Mar-30-11	Receipt of e-mail by and between Mr. Michaud and Ms. Casey; amend Emergency Motion for Determination and Order to include Former Wife's attempts to interfere with the Mr. Michaud's spring break timesharing	0.60	75.00	PCLA
	Amend Emergency Motion pursuant to Mr. Rossway's review and to incorporate spring break information; pull latest doctor's report and prepare as exhibit to Emergency Motion	0.50	62.50	PCLA
	Telephone call with Mr. Michaud regarding Emergency Motion and issues with new pediatrician, spring break and delay in entry of order on March 4, 2011 hearing;	0.30	37.50	PCLA
Mar-31-11	Amend Emergency Motion pursuant to Mr. Michaud's review; office conference with Mr. Rossway; e-mails to Mr. Michaud regarding finalized Emergency Motion ready for review and signature	0.40	50.00	PCLA
	N/C - Attempt to contact Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant and send e-mail with request to fax Emergency Motion	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Office conference with Mr. Michaud for review and signing of the Emergency Motion and discussion regarding researching a pediatrician in Massachusetts for Riley and discussion regarding spring break	0.40	50.00	PCLA
	N/C - Receipt of e-mail from Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant with approval to fax Emergency Motion to Judge Maxwell; fax Emergency Motion to Judge Maxwell and Attorney Orth	0.20	0.00	PCLA

	N/C - Receipt of additional e-mails between Mr. Michaud and Mrs. Casey regarding a new pediatrician for Riley not within Dr. Camera's practice	0.10	Paç 0.00	ge 131 of 324 PCLA
	N/C - Short discussion with Mr. Rossway regarding Mr. Orth's voice mail alluding to the parties communications and request to resolve spring break issue	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Review, approve, and finalize emergency motion to court; receive two voice mail messages from opposing counsel regarding attempts to avoid spring break visitation	0.20	70.00	BWR
Apr-06-11	Courtesy write off per BWR		-2,500.00	BWR
	Totals	92.75	\$12,812.50	

DISBURSEMENTS		Disbursements	Receipts
Feb-24-11	Telephone conference charges	94.37	
Mar-02-11	Photocopies	0.70	
	Telephone Charges	1.10	
<u> </u>	Westlaw Online Research Access	39.00	
	Westlaw Online Research Access	50.00	
Mar-03-11	Photocopies	24.00	
	Photocopies	1.20	
	Photocopies	10.80	
	Photocopies	6.90	
	Photocopies	11.90	
	Photocopies	2.20	
	Photocopies	3.50	
	Photocopies	8.20	
	Facsimile Charges	8.00	
	Facsimile Charges	23.00	
	Facsimile Charges	36.00	
	Facsimile Charges	34.00	
	Facsimile Charges	1.00	
	Facsimile Charges	13.00	

mvoice #: 3804/

132 of 324

Facsimile Charges	5.00	Page
Facsimile Charges	20.00	
Facsimile Charges	9.00	
Facsimile Charges	4.00	
Facsimile Charges	5.00	
Facsimile Charges	22.00	
Facsimile Charges	23.00	
Facsimile Charges	9.00	
Facsimile Charges	13.00	
Telephone Charges	0.20	
Telephone Charges	0.30	
Telephone Charges	0.80	
Telephone Charges	1.90	
Telephone Charges	0.20	
Telephone Charges	0.10	
Telephone Charges	0.50	
Postage	2.92	
Postage	2.71	
Photocopies	3.50	
Photocopies	0.80	
Facsimile Charges	2.00	
Facsimile Charges	2.00	
Telephone Charges	0.20	
Facsimile Charges	1.00	
Facsimile Charges	4.00	
Facsimile Charges	2.00	
Facsimile Charges	1.00	
Facsimile Charges	24.00	
Facsimile Charges	24.00	
Telephone Charges	1.60	
Telephone Charges	0.10	

Mar-04-11

Mar-08-11

Mar-10-11

		Invoice #:	58647	
	Telephone Charges		0.30	Page 133 of 324
	Telephone Charges		0.10	
~12-11	Facsimile Charges		2.00	
Mar-15-11	Postage		0.44	
Mar-16-11	Photocopies		0.50	
	Postage		1.76	
Mar-17-11	Photocopies		0.60	
	Facsimile Charges		4.00	
	Facsimile Charges		4.00	
	Telephone Charges		0.20	
	Postage		0.88	
Mar-30-11	Telephone Charges		0.20	
	Telephone Charges		1.60	
Mar-31-11	Photocopies		3.60	
	Facsimile Charges		10.00	
	Facsimile Charges		10.00	
	Telephone Charges		0.10	
	Postage		1.83	
	Totals	\$	596.81	\$0.00
	Current Fees & Disbursements			\$13,409.31
	Previous Balance			\$12,570.97
	Previous Payments			\$12,000.00
	BALANCE DUE			\$13,980.28

5864/

invoice #:

TRUST STATEMENT

Page 134 of 324

	Disbursements	Receipts
Trust Balance Forward		15.00
Total Trust	\$0.00	\$15.00
Trust Balance		\$15.00

VERO BEACH . CORAL GABLES

ROSSWAY MOORE SWAN, P.L.
THE MODERN ONE BUILDING
2101 INDIAN RIVER BOULEVARD, SUITE 200
VERO BEACH, FL 32960
Telephone (772) 231-4440 Facsimile (772) 231-4430

Mr. Timothy Michaud 1791 Wekiva Drive Melbourne, FL 32940

May 9, 2011

File #: 1682-001 Inv. #: 59127

Total Due:

RE: Post-judgment issues

Please write the FILE number on your check to insure proper crediting.

SUMMARY

*Balance Fwd:

\$13,980.28

\$17,203.89

Payment received:

\$0.00)

Current Invoice Amount:

\$3,223.61

TOTAL DUE:

\$17,203.89

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	ATT'Y/L.A.
Apr-04-11	N/C- Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud to relay Mr. Rossway's thoughts on delay in order and, request for payment of past due fees and costs	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Pursuant to Judge Maxwell's request and Mr. Rossway's directions, research Jean S. Huryn, LPA; e-mail information to Mr. Orth with request for approval to provide to Judge Maxwell; receipt of Attorney Orth's approval; telephone conference with Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant; e-mail Judge Maxwell, via his Judicial Assistant, Jean Huryn, LPA's information	0.40	50.00	PCLA
Apr-05-11	N/C - Receipt and review of e-mails by and between Mr. Michaud and Mrs. Casey; e-mail to Mr. Michaud regarding Mr. Rossway forwarding correspondence to Attorney Orth in attempt to resolve spring break issues	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, draft detailed correspondence to Attorney Orth advising of issues between parties regarding the Former Wife's demands to shorten timesharing and proposed alternative pick-up	0.80	100.00	PCLA

	and drop-off location for timesharing and other issues regarding upcoming spring break timesharing		Pag	e 136 of 324
	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud; additional e-mails with Mr. Michaud regarding Riley's church and first communion	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	N/C - Office conference with Mr. Rossway to provide information regarding issues of Former Wife's request for Mr. Michaud to pick-up Riley in North Carolina; research county for Wilson, North Carolina; advise Mr. Rossway that Wilson is located in Wilson County, North Carolina about 50 miles west of Raleigh, North Carolina	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's review, amend and finalize correspondence to Attorney Orth	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Receipt and review of lengthily e-mails between Mr. Michaud and Mrs. Casey regarding pediatricians and specialist appointment	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Apr-06-11	Review and revise Emergency Motion to Compel regarding spring break timesharing	0.30	52.50	KMR
	Receipt and review of Attorney Orth's correspondence; telephone conference with Mr. Michaud to advise of Mr. Orth's correspondence with does not confirm Mrs. Casey's compliance with spring break requirements	0.20	25.00	PCLA
·	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, draft Emergency Motion for Compel Former Wife's Compliance with Spring Break; telephone conference with Mr. Michaud to advise of prepared draft Emergency Motion for his review	1.20	150.00	PCLA
	N/C - Office conference with Attorney Rollin for review of draft Emergency Motion prior to review by Mr. Michaud	0.33	0.00	PCLA
Apr-07-11	N/C - Receipt and review in Mr. Rossway's absence of Order Granting Co-Counsel Motion to Withdraw	0.10	0.00	KMR
	N/C - Receipt and review in Mr. Rossway's absence of Order Granting Former Husband's Motion for Leave to Amend	0.10	0.00	KMR
	N/C - Receipt of e-mail from Mr. Michaud regarding Emergency Motion; amend Emergency Motion pursuant to Mr. Michaud's corrections	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Office conference with Mr. Michaud for review and signing of Emergency Motion and review of Attorney Orth's April 6, 2011 correspondence	0.30	37.50	PCLA

			Page	e 137 of 324
Apr-08-11	N/C - Receipt of e-mail from Mr. Michaud regarding Clerk's website indication of entry of order; attempt to contact Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant; telephone conferences with clerk of court; e-mail to Judge Maxwell's JAT; e-mail to Mr. Rossway; e-mail to Mr. Michaud; receipt of e-mails from Judge Maxwell's regarding order forwarded via mail	0.50	0.00	PCLA
Apr-11-11	N/C -Telephone conference with Mr. Rossway and advise that order on March 4, 2011 hearing not received; e-mail from Mr. Michaud regarding Emergency Motion	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Draft correspondence to Mr. Michaud enclosing past due invoice no. 23989 from King Reporting	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Check mail for April 4, 2011 Order Granting Motion/Petition; check Clerk website; attempt to contact Judicial Assistant; telephone conference with Clerk of Court; e-mails with Judicial Assistant; additional telephone conference with Clerk of Court regarding Order being found and scanned; e-mail to Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant with request to please e-mail or fax Order to Mr. Rossway	0.50	0.00	PCLA
(7) 	N/C - Office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding April 4, 2011 Order and attempts to obtain copy; attempt to contact Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant; telephone conference with Mr. Michaud to provide Mr. Rossway's suggest to obtain copy from Viera courthouse; attempt to contact	0.30	0.00	PCLA
Apr-12-11	N/C - Review Order Granting emergency motion; conference with Bradley Rossway to discuss potential remedies for potential non-compliance of former wife with Order; attend telephone conference between Mr. Rossway and Mr. Michaud	0.50	0.00	KMR
	N/C - E-mail from and to Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant regarding obtaining copy of Order of March 4, 2011; receipt of faxed Order Granting Former Husband's Motion to Amend; telephone conference with Mr. Michaud; telephone conference with Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant regarding Emergency Motion and "lost" Order on majority timesharing	0.40	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Office conference with Mr. Rossway for update on March 13, 2011 emergency hearing and "lost" order	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Draft Notice of Emergency Hearing; telephone conference with Mr. Michaud	0.40	50.00	PCLA
	N/C - E-mail from and to Judicial Assistant providing Attorney Orth's fax number; receipt and review, with Mr. Rossway and Mr. Rollin the Order Granting Former Husband Timothy Michaud's Emergency Verified Motion for Temporary Change in Timesharing; attend	0.60	0.00	PCLA

telephone conference between Mr. Rossway and Mr. Michaud; e-mail Order to Mr. Michaud		Page	138 of 324
N/C - Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud to confirm registration of Riley's passport, issues of school, contact with Mrs. Casey to coordinate exchange of Riley, and counseling	0.20	0.00	PCLA
N/C - Draft cover letter to Attorney Julie Pierce providing courtesy copy of Order Granting Verified Emergency Motion for Temporary Change in Timesharing	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding telephone call received from Mrs. Casey; short office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding correspondence to Attorney Orth advising of Mrs. Casey offensive phone call	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Review and study Order granting Former Husband's Verified Emergency Motion for Change in Time-Sharing; short telephone conference with Mr. Michaud; receive e-mail from Mr. Michaud; begin to formulate strategy to force relocation of child if the child is not voluntarily surrendered on April 18, 2011	0.50	175.00	BWR
Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, draft correspondence to Attorney Orth regarding Mrs. Casey's inappropriate telephone call to Mr. Michaud; telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding neutral location to pick-up Riley in Massachusetts and obtain name of family attorney in Massachusetts	0.60	75.00	PCLA
N/C - Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's review, amend and finalize correspondence to Attorney Orth	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Receipt of e-mail from Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant; telephone conference with Judicial Assistant regarding five minute hearing on April 14 regarding Former Wife's Motion for Reconsideration	0.20	25.00	PCLA
N/C - Attempt to contact Attorney Orth's office regarding Motion for Reconsideration and leave message	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Telephone conference with Attorney Orth with request for Motion; review faxed Motion; office conference with Mr. Rossway	0.30	37.50	PCLA
N/C - Attempt to contact Mr. Michaud and leave message regarding hearing on Motion for Reconsideration and request for return call	0.10	0.00	PCLA
N/C - Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud to advise of short hearing and relay Mr. Rossway's suggested response; advise Mr. Rossway of Mr. Michaud's	0.30	0.00	PCLA

^nr-13-11

Page	139	of	324

	agreements to be presented to the Judge including tickets bought for April 18th, Riley to take first communion in Florida with Mrs. Casey to attend with Court's permission, and offer of neutral location for		Pagi	e 139 OI 32
Apr-14-11	exchange N/C -Short office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding hearing on Former Wife's Motion for Reconsideration	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Attend telephonic hearing and record Judge's ruling; attend telephone conference between Mr. Rossway and Mr. Michaud	0.50	62.50	PCLA
	N/C - Scan and e-mail Motion for Reconsideration of Time Frames Stated In Court's Order on March 4, 2011 Hearing to Mr. Michaud	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Receive emergency motion from opposing counsel; receive input concerning Court hearing; facilitate hearing; receive favorable ruling; telephone conference with Mr. Michaud; begin work on potential issues that may arise by virtue of Judge Maxwell denying requested relief of former wife	0.75	262.50	BWR
Apr-15-11	Work on issues regarding order having not been provided from opposing counsel; instruct paralegal to contact judges office; telephone call to opposing counsel to leave extensive message; afternoon receipt of call from opposing counsel; discuss various options for pickup and drop-off; discussion regarding order; receive authorization to provide order to judge indicating that pickup and drop-off shall occur at a neutral location using the assistance of the stepfather; review order prepared by paralegal, approved same for faxing to judge Friday p.m.; copies to opposing counsel	0.40	140.00	BWR
	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding issues with pick-up location for spring break timesharing; telephone conference with Mr. Orth's assistant regarding status of proposed Order on Former Wife's Motion for Reconsideration	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	N/C - Receipt of proposed Order from Mr. Orth; office conference with Mr. Rossway for omissions in proposed Order	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Draft proposed Order to include neutral location for pick-up and no law enforcement	0.30	37.50	PCLA
C.	N/C - Draft correspondence to Judge Maxwell regarding proposed Order on Former Wife's Motion for Reconsideration	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud advising of proposed Order e-mailed and faxed to Judge Maxwell	0.10	0.00	PCLA

	N/C - Receipt of e-mail from Mr. Michaud	0.10	Page	e 140 of 324 PCLA
-16-11	Saturday telephone call to opposing counsel to leave an extensive message regarding order and information received from to e-mails from Mr. Michaud; telephone conference with Mr. Michaud to discuss various options and protection for Monday morning	0.50	175.00	BWR
Apr-18-11	N/C - Attend telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding former wife's attempt to get restraining order	0.30	0.00	KMR
	Research attorneys in Springfield and Longmeadow; telephone conference with John D. McNally regarding representation of Mr. Michaud; telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding Mr. McNally; telephone conference with Mr. McNally to give him a heads up that Mr. Michaud is headed to his office and that Chris Casey has made threats of physical violence, also discuss that Mr. McNally has recently relocated his office; telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding Mr. McNally's new location; scan and e-mail additional court and evidence documents to Mr. McNally; telephone conference with Mr. McNally regarding documents received and potential outcome of hearing	1.40	245.00	KMR
	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding Mrs. Casey filing for restraining order in Massachusetts; advise Mr. Rossway	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	N/C - Office conference with Mr. Rossway and Mr. Rollin regarding finding Mr. Michaud a Massachusetts attorney and contacting Judge Maxwell for Order on Former Wife's Motion for Reconsideration	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Telephone conference with Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant; receipt of signed Order	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding contents of Restraining Order and documents to be scanned and e-mail to Mr. Michaud; pull Order on March 4th Hearing, DCF documents for Florida, Massachusetts and North Carolina	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	N/C - Scan and e-mail Order on March 4th hearing to Mr. Michaud; scan and e-mail Florida and NC DCF documents to Attorney John McNally; e-mail Judge Maxwell's information to Attorney McNally	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Attend additional telephone conference with Mr. Rollin and Mr. Michaud regarding Attorney in Massachusetts and hearing scheduled for Tuesday, April 19, 2011 on Restraining Order	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Receipt of stream of e-mails between Mr.	0.20	0.00	PCLA

	rs. Casey with request for school, iseling information, etc.		Page	e 141 of 32
seeking injunctive telephone confermate to associate regards assachusetts; prepare and proprepare information to particle of the properties of the propertie	ncy situation concerning former wife we relief in Massachusetts; two rences with Mr. Michaud; provide input rding identification of law firms in provide instruction to paralegal to wide information Mr. Michaud and ion to send to attorney;, provide ralegal regarding calling the judges ing to gather latest order; receive latest Judge and give instructions to forward ud; leave. Extensive message with	0.75	262.50	BWR
review materials conference with he was unaware provided to Ms.	one conference with Mr. Michaud; from Mr. Michaud; telephone Attorney Orth, receive confirmation that of activities; receive information that he Casey regarding her actions; instruct information to Massachusetts attorney Maxwell	0.30	105.00	BWR
of Massachusetts	conference with Mr. Michaud for status hearing; advise Mr. Rossway of Judge Casey's cases in Massachusetts	0.10	12.50	PCLA
on-going Massac	rences with Mr. Michaud on status of husetts hearing on Former Wife's r; advise Mr. Rossway	0.20	25.00	PCLA
regarding status of for Judge Maxwell's Judici from Massachuse Mr. Michaud for e-mail to Judge M	none conference with Mr. Michaud of hearing in Massachusetts and request all's telephone number; e-mail to Judge al Assistant to advise of possible call etts Judge; telephone conference with status and request for Judge's name; Maxwell's Judicial Assistant to provide to of Massachusetts Superior Court	0.30	37.50	PCLA
Casey's testimon an appeal of Judg	Mr. Michaud's e-mail advising of Mrs. to Massachusetts court of intent to file Maxwell's Order Granting Former for Temporary Change in Majority ise Mr. Rossway	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Massachusetts Co telephone call wi	ence with Mr. Michaud regarding ourt ruling and closing case; attend th Mr. Michaud and Mr. Rossway for essed by Florida court due to Mrs. Massachusetts	0.30	37.50	PCLA
Judge Maxwell's	Mr. Rossway's directions, e-mail to Judicial Assistant to advise of outcome	0.10	0.00	PCLA

of Massachusetts' hearing on Former Wife's Restraining

Order

Apr-19-11

invoice #: 59127

	Work on issues regarding emergency hearing; facilitate additional information to be provided to Mr. Michaud; telephone conference with Mr. Michaud; receive information concerning ruling	0.30	Pago 105.00	e 142 of 324 BWR
	Extensive telephone conference with Dr. Gary Edwards to provide background of case, factual information, and information regarding potential meeting with Mr. Michaud and myself with Dr. Edwards	0.30	105.00	BWR
Apr-20-11	Receipt and review of fax from Mr. Michaud enclosing Order of Dismissal from out of state court	0.10	35.00	BWR
	N/C - Receipt of voice mail from Mr. Michaud; telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding pick-up of Riley	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Receipt of copy of e-mail from Mrs. Casey to Mr. Michaud regarding demand for school, doctor, and therapist information; discussion with Mr. Rossway regarding filing motions to restrict Ms. Casey information due to recent actions in Massachusetts	0.20	25.00	PCLA
1	N/C - Receipt of faxed copies of Judge Sacks' Judgment of Dismissal regarding restraining order and copy of Judge Sacks' Judgment of Dismissal of prior case which denied jurisdiction	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Receipt of e-mail from Mr. Michaud; telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding Riley's counseling, school, and doctor and issues with "family and friends" texting and calling to speak with Riley and need for schedule; pull Order on temporary change of timesharing and provide Mr. Michaud with language restricting Massachusetts babysitter from contact with Riley	0.40	50.00	PCLA
	N/C - Check on status of proceeding; confirm child's return to Florida; receive numerous questions from Mr. Michaud; begin working on formulation of answers; receive e-mail from Mr. Michaud regarding apology	0.20	0.00	BWR
Apr-25-11	Begin work on Motion for Contempt and Sanctions; begin work on mental health evaluation issue; begin work on strategy to restrict mother's access to health care providers and educational providers in order to protect child from scandalous allegations made by mother in the past based upon past actions and recent history in the State of Massachusetts	0.50	175.00	BWR
Apr-26-11	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud to gather additional factual information for Motions for Contempt and Sanctions; receive information regarding proceedings in Massachusetts and information concerning the recorded transcript; receive approval and instruction to begin to plan strategy discussed; receive	0.50	175.00	BWR

Page 143 of 324

	Totals	24.23	\$3,162.50	
	Telephone conference with Attorney Bill Orth regarding questions concerning whether he will continue representation of Ms. Casey; discussion regarding Motion for Contempt and Sanctions; meeting with paralegal to provide input and instruction regarding Motion for Sanctions and Motions to protect Mr. Michaud and his child from negative actions of his former spouse; continue to work on potential of seeking mental health evaluation through contempt process, by virtue of Ms. Casey's continued and repeated flagrant violations of court orders potentially indicating psychiatric problems; provide copy of judge's order to Dr. Deborah Day in anticipation of discussions with Dr. Day at American Academy of Matrimonial Lawyers meeting in Orlando	0.50	175.00	BWR
	N/C - Scan and e-mail Order Granting Former Husband Timothy Michaud's Verified Emergency Motion for Temporary Change in timesharing	0.10	0.00	PCLA
.:-27-11	N/C - Office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding preparing motions for contempt, sanctions, limitation of access to minor child's information, and for mental health evaluation, and research court's ability to order mental health evaluation	0.30	0.00	PCLA
	information regarding minor child's positive adjustment to Florida surroundings		Γα	ye 143 01 32

DISBURSEMENTS		Disbursements	Receipts
Apr-04-11	Telephone Charges	0.10	
	Telephone Charges	0.10	
	Telephone Charges	0.40	
	Telephone Charges	0.10	
Apr-05-11	Photocopies	0.40	
	Facsimile Charges	3.00	
	Telephone Charges	1.10	
	Postage	0.88	
Apr-06-11	Telephone Charges	0.40	
	Telephone Charges	0.20	
	Postage	0.78	
Apr-07-11	Facsimile Charges	6.00	

		invoice #:	391 27	
	Facsimile Charges		6.00	Page 144 of 324
	Telephone Charges		0.10	J
1 - 1 - 1 - 1 - 1 - 1 - 1 - 1 - 1 - 1 -	Postage		1.32	
Apr-08-11	Telephone Charges		0.90	
	Telephone Charges		0.10	
Apr-11-11	Telephone Charges		2.10	
	Telephone Charges		1.00	
Apr-12-11	Photocopies		5.10	
	Telephone Charges		0.50	
	Telephone Charges		0.80	
	Telephone Charges		0.90	
	Telephone Charges		1.30	
	Telephone Charges		0.40	
Apr-13-11	Photocopies		0.40	
	Photocopies		1.90	
	Facsimile Charges		3.00	
	Telephone Charges		0.70	
	Telephone Charges		0.20	
	Telephone Charges		0.20	
	Telephone Charges		0.20	
	Postage		1.83	
Apr-14-11	Telephone Charges		0.10	
	Telephone Charges		1.30	
Apr-15-11	Facsimile Charges		3.00	
	Facsimile Charges		3.00	
	Telephone Charges		0.60	
	Telephone Charges		0.20	
	Telephone Charges		0.20	
	Telephone Charges		0.20	
	Telephone Charges		0.50	
Apr-16-11	Telephone Charges		0.30	

		Invoice #:	59127	
	Telephone Charges		0.30	Page 145 of 324
	Telephone Charges		2.50	
~-18-11	Telephone Charges		0.40	
	Telephone Charges		0.20	
Apr-21-11	Telephone Charges		2.10	
Apr-26-11	Telephone Charges		3.10	
Apr-27-11	Telephone Charges		0.70	
	Totals		\$61.11	\$0.00
	Current Fees & Disbursements		- Andrews of the Control of the Cont	\$3,223.61
	Previous Balance			\$13,980.28
	Previous Payments			\$0.00
	BALANCE DUE		-	\$17,203.89

invoice #:

TRUST STATEMENT

Page 146 of 324

	Disbursements	Receipts
Trust Balance Forward		15.00
Total Trust	\$0.00	\$15.00
Trust Balance		\$15.00

ROSSWAY MOORE SWAN, P.L. THE MODERN ONE BUILDING 2101 INDIAN RIVER BOULEVARD, SUITE 200 VERO BEACH, FL 32960 Telephone (772) 231-4440 Facsimile (772) 231-4430

Mr. Timothy Michaud 1791 Wekiva Drive Melbourne, FL 32940

June 6, 2011

File #: 1682-001 Inv. #: 59457

RE: Post-judgment issues

Total Due: \$5,624.51

Please write the FILE number on your check to insure proper crediting.

SUMMARY

*Balance Fwd:

\$17,203.89

Payment received:

JI / 5200.00

\$14,000.00)

Current Invoice Amount:

\$2,420.62

TOTAL DUE:

\$5,624.51

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	ATT'Y/L.A.
May-02-11	Research Rashid case regarding sole parental authority	0.20	35.00	KMR
May-04-11	N/C - Receipt and review of Notice of Appeal filed by Attorney Sirianni	0.10	0.00	BWR
	N/C - Receive Notice of Appeal and work on issues relating to Notice of Appeal	0.40	0.00	BWR
May-05-11	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, research Ms. Casey's appellate attorneys on Martindale Hubble website and the Florida Bar; follow-up with appellate attorney Brownstone's website; determine proximity to former wife's current Florida attorney; telephone conference with Attorney Singer's office for recommendation of an appellate attorney in Brevard	0.40	50.00	PCLA
	N/C - Telephone conference with Attorney Singer's paralegal for referral of Brevard appellate attorney	0.20	0.00	PCLA

	Research appellate lawyers; telephone conference with Mr. Michaud to discuss options concerning moving case forward, additional discovery, etc.	0.50	Page 175.00	e 148 of 324 BWR
May-06-11	Receipt and review of Limited Notice of Appearance of Attorney Sirianni and Attorney Brownlee	0.10	35.00	BWR
May-09-11	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding Notice of Limited Appearance of appellate attorneys	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Research Maureen Matheson, Esquire, suggested appellate attorney by Attorney Elise Singer	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	N/C - Attempt to contact Mr. Michaud regarding Notice of Limited Appearance on appeal matter	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Receipt of Mr. Michaud's e-mail regarding Ms. Casey's threats to Amy Marto and providing issues she is appealing	0.10	12.50	PCLA
4	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud to advise of Notice of Limited Appearance by Former Wife's appellate attorney and provide explanation, discussion regarding two issues Former Wife has advised she is appealing, further discussion regarding suggested appellate attorney for Mr. Michaud, Riley's school and counseling, and Mr. Michaud's visit with Dr. Edwards	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	N/C - Receipt of additional e-mails from Mr. Michaud from Mrs. Casey to him	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Scan and e-mail contact information for appellate attorney suggested by Elise Singer - Maureen M. Matheson, and Notice of Limited Appearance	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Work on emerging issues regarding appeal, Notice of Limited Appearance, and issues raised by Attorney Orth	0.20	70.00	BWR
May-10-11	N/C - Receipt and review of Notice of Filing Original transcript of March 4, 2011 hearing	0.10	0.00	BWR
	Draft correspondence to Mr. Michaud enclosing past due King Reporting invoice	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	N/C - Receipt of e-mail from Mr. Michaud with therapist appointments	0.10	0.00	PCLA
(Receipt and review of e-mail from Mr. Michaud regarding Brevard Sheriff Department's receipt of Mr. Casey's calls advising of Dr. Boo's findings of abuse	0.10	12.50	PCLA
	Work on situation regarding former wife's continued malicious actions and threats against Ms. Marto	0.20	70.00	BWR

			Pag	e 149 of 324
May-11-11	Receipt and review of correspondence from Attorney Orth dated May 9, 2011	0.10	35.00	BWR
y-13-11	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's review, amend extensive responsive correspondence to Attorney Orth	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud to obtain school and therapist information	0.20	25.00	PCLA
May-16-11	Receipt of e-mail from Mr. Michaud; office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding status of Mr. Michaud picking up Riley	0.30	37.50	PCLA
May-17-11	Receipt and initial review of Appellant's Initial Brief and Appendix and Petition for Writ of Prohibition and Appendix	0.20	70.00	BWR
	Review appellate rule regarding timing for interlocutory appeals and partial memorandum of law drafted regarding recusal of a Judge; discuss need for appellate counsel with Mr. Rossway	0.20	35.00	KMR
	N/C - Receipt and review of Petition for Writ of Prohibition; telephone conference with Mr. Michaud to relay Mr. Rossway's suggestion to obtain an appellate attorney; scan and e-mail Petition to Mr. Michaud	0.30	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding appellate attorney; telephone conference with Maureen Matheson to schedule telephone conference with Mr. Rossway and pleadings that may be required by Attorney Madison; research Attorney Matheson	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Arrange for copying of two sets of Initial Brief and Appendix as well as Appendix to Notice of Writ for Prohibition; provide to Mr. Michaud and Attorney Matheson; telephone conference with Attorney Matheson; scan and e-mail Appellants Initial Brief to Attorney Matheson and Mr. Michaud; e-mail to Mr. Michaud	0.40	0.00	PCLA
	Work on emerging issues regarding appeal, appellate brief and filings with the District Court of Appeal, to negate issue regarding late filed appeal on recusal issue based upon recusal order having been issued earlier than 30 days from filing of Notice of Appeal; begin review of documentation; task associate and paralegal with getting materials out to appellate lawyer and Mr. Michaud expedited to assist in all possible defense of issues; work on contempt issues; task associate with responsibility to research and prepare brief on	1.30	455.00	BWR
May-18-11	Receipt of e-mail from Mr. Michaud regarding Mr. Casey's contact with Brevard Sheriff's Department to institute an abuse investigation after December 2010	0.10	12.50	PCLA

	timesharing and Massachusetts' Sheriff's Department contacted for a criminal investigation		Page	e 150 of 324
	Work on discovery issues; work on contempt issues	0.75	262.50	BWR
May-19-11	N/C - Receipt and review of Acknowledgment of New Case and Docketing Statement	0.20	0.00	BWR
	N/C - E-mails from and to Mr. Michaud regarding appellate documents ready to be picked up, and regarding issue for the Court to deny the Former Wife's request for Dr. Boos and Dr. Camera to appear at the hearing via Skype	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Short office conference with Mr. Michaud regarding appeal and to provide Appendix for Appeal and Append for Writ; discussion regarding issues of filing motions pending Appellate Court's determination regarding Writ of Prohibition	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	Work on appeal briefs and information to be considered for appellate attorney based upon facts presented at hearing at the trial court level; task paralegal with confirming information received by Mr. Michaud to transfer to appellate lawyer; work on issues for appellate lawyer	0.40	140.00	BWR
Ny-20-11	Receipt of e-mail from Mr. Michaud regarding Former Wife's advising of contacting Riley's school teacher	0.10	12.50	PCLA
	Scan and e-mail Appellate Court's Acknowledgement of New Case and Notice to Attorneys and Parties to Attorney Matheson	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	N/C - Open new client matter and physical file for Appeal	0.20	0.00	PCLA
May-21-11	Lengthy telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding Riley's counseling and if counselor can have copy of Dr. Day's report, Mrs. Casey's attempts to contact Riley's teacher, Mr. Michaud's meeting with principal, Mr. Casey's attempts to instigate a criminal case in Brevard County after Riley began living with Mr. Michaud, and information received from Brevard Sheriff that criminal case pending in Massachusetts, and if contempt motions should wait pending Appellate Court's ruling on Writ of Prohibition	0.40	50.00	PCLA
May-24-11	Continue drafting Motion for Contempt with review of prior orders and notes from Mr. Michaud regarding Massachusetts hearing on April 19, 2011; telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding criminal investigations in Massachusetts and Florida in 2011, and discussion regarding Riley's therapy and Former Wife's texting the minor child on her cell phone in violation of the April 6, 2011 Order	1.60	200.00	PCLA

0.20

0.10

2.30

			Pag	ge 151 of 324
May-25-11	Receipt and review of e-mails from Mr. Michaud regarding Massachusetts hearing transcript and request for clarification regarding reimbursement from Mrs. Casey for out-of-pocket therapist costs for Riley, and texts and gifts to Riley from Mrs. Casey	0.10	12.50	PCLA
	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding therapist request to talk to Mrs. Casey, removal of cell phone from Riley, gifts and texts, and requesting clarification from the Court on Mrs. Casey additional text and gift contact with Riley	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	N/C - Office conference with Mr. Rossway; office conference with Law Clerk for review of transcript of April 6, 2011 hearing for reference to Dr. Day's report to be provided to Riley's therapist	0.20	0.00	PCLA
May-26-11	Confirm that Transcript of March 4, 2011 hearing, included in Index to Appeal, does not include information regarding Riley's therapist receiving Dr. Day's report; advise Mr. Rossway that transcript included in the Appeal Index is a partial transcript omitting Dr. Day's testimony and the following hearing transcript; e-mail to Attorney Matheson to advise of omitted transcript; telephone conference with King Court Reporting to obtain number of pages omitted and cost to obtain	0.70	87.50	PCLA
	Read Volume II of the March 4, 2011 hearing transcript; e-mail to Attorney Matheson; telephone conference with Mr. Michaud	0.40	50.00	PCLA
May-27-11	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding his retaining Attorney Matheson and status of Motion for Contempt and receipt of the "disk" transcript of the Massachusetts hearing of April 18, 2011	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Research pleadings for Page 2 of Stipulated Order appointing Dr. Day; scan and e-mail Volume 2 of the March 4, 2011 hearing and Page 2 of the Stipulated Order to Mr. Michaud and Attorney Matheson	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	Totals	14.05	\$2,257.50	
DISBURSEMENT	S	Disburseme	ents	Receipts
Jun-06-11	Payment for invoice: 59457, Michaud, 1682-001			15.00
May-02-11	Westlaw Online Research Access	11	.90	

Telephone Charges

Telephone Charges

Telephone Charges

May-05-11

		Invoice #:	59457	
May-09-11	Telephone Charges		0.20	Page 152 of 324
May-10-11	Photocopies		0.20	
	Postage		0.88	
May-13-11	Facsimile Charges		4.00	
	Telephone Charges		0.40	
	Postage		0.44	
May-17-11	Photocopies		51.20	
	Telephone Charges		0.40	
	Telephone Charges		0.50	
	Telephone Charges		0.40	
May-18-11	Photocopies		71.20	
	Photocopies		13.40	
	Photocopies		7.70	
May-21-11	Telephone Charges		2.40	
May-24-11	Telephone Charges		4.40	
	Telephone Charges		1.20	
	Telephone Charges		2.40	
May-26-11	Telephone Charges		1.20	
	Telephone Charges		0.40	
May-27-11	Telephone Charges		0.70	
	Totals	\$1	78.12	\$0.00
	Current Fees & Disbursements			\$2,420.62
	Previous Balance			\$17,203.89
	Previous Payments			\$14,000.00
	BALANCE DUE		BARNARIA	\$5,624.51

59457

TRUST STATEMENT

Page 153 of 324

		Disbursements	Receipts
	Trust Balance Forward		15.00
Jun-06-11	Paid To: Rossway Moore Taylor & Swan Payment for invoice: 59457, Michaud, 1682-001	15.00	
	Total Trust	\$15.00	\$15.00
	Trust Balance		\$0.00

ROSSWAY MOORE SWAN, P.L. THE MODERN ONE BUILDING 2101 INDIAN RIVER BOULEVARD, SUITE 200 VERO BEACH, FL 32960 Telephone (772) 231-4440 Facsimile (772) 231-4430

Mr. Timothy Michaud 1791 Wekiva Drive Melbourne, FL 32940

July 2, 2011

File #: 1682-001 59853

Inv. #:

Total Due: \$3,494.84

RE: Post-judgment issues

Please write the FILE number on your check to insure proper crediting.

SUMMARY

*Balance Fwd:

\$5,624.51

Payment received:

Current Invoice Amount:

\$5,624.51) \$3,494.84

TOTAL DUE:

\$3,494.84

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	ATT'Y/L.A.
Jun-03-11	Receipt and review of Order of Court of Appeal denying Petition for Writ of Prohibition filed by Wife	0.10	35.00	BWR
Jun-05-11	Receipt of e-mail from Attorney Matheson and provide information regarding Volume II of hearing transcript	0.10	12.50	PCLA
Jun-06-11	Pursuant to Attorney Matheson's request, pull file, scan and e-mail Order Granting Former Husband's Emergency Motion for Temporary Change in Timesharing, and advise Attorney Matheson of additional missing pages from various documents in Appendix to Initial Brief	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	N/C - Telephone conference with King Reporting for status of providing Volume II of March 4, 2011 hearing transcript	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Pull file and copy all pages/documents omitted from Appendix to Initial Brief, and scan and e-mail to Attorney Matheson	0.20	25.00	PCLA

Jun-07-11	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding Mrs. Casey calling Riley's therapist and related issues and provide status of preparations of Motion for Contempt	0.30	Page 37.50	e 155 of 324 PCLA
	N/C - Scan and e-mail Appellate Court's Order Denying Writ of Prohibition to Mr. Michaud	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Telephone conference with King Court Reporting; e-mail to Attorney Matheson regarding Vol. II of transcript	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	E-mails from and to Mr. Michaud regarding health insurance issues for Riley	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Telephone conference with Attorney Matheson regarding Volume. II to March 4, 2011 hearing attached to Index for Writ and providing Appellate Court with Volume. II to Answer Brief in Appeal and need for certified copy for filing Appellate Court	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	N/C - Telephone conference with King Court Reporting to request Certified Copy and advise of Attorney Matheson to pick-up	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Jun-08-11	Short office conference with Mr. Michaud regarding CD provided of Massachusetts hearing, and discussion regarding Riley insurance issues with Mrs. Casey and her attempts to instigate new investigations in Florida and Mass in March 2011	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	N/C - Receipt of e-mail thread between Mr. Michaud and Mrs. Casey regarding her prohibiting Mr. Michaud from using Riley's insurance through her employment and accusations of Mr. Michaud accessing her personal information	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Jun-10-11	Begin review of Massachusetts' Court proceedings (Disk) and record statements made by Mrs. Casey and her attorney and the Court for use in drafting Motion for Contempt, Sanctions, and Clarification	0.80	100.00	PCLA
	N/C - Prepare correspondence to Mr. Michaud regarding King Court Reporting's Invoice 25221 for copy of Volume II of March 4, 2011 hearing	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Receipt of and provide Mr. Rossway with Answer Brief and Motion for Attorney's Fees; read Answer Brief	0.40	0.00	PCLA
Jun-13-11	N/C - E-mail with Mr. Michaud regarding status of Motion for Contempt and Sanctions and Mr. Rossway's receipt of Answer Brief	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Continue drafting Motion for Contempt and Sanctions in conjunction with review of CD of hearing transcript	1.20	150.00	PCLA

Jun-14-11	Review remaining disk on Massachusetts hearing; incorporate statements by Mrs. Casey into Motion for Contempt and Sanctions	2.60	Pag 325.00	ge 156 of 324 PCLA
	N/C - Receipt of e-mails between Mr. Michaud and Mrs. Casey regarding status of Riley and Mrs. Casey's issues with contact with Riley's doctor, therapist and teacher, and other matters	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Jun-15-11	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding DCF agents at his home; telephone conference with Amy Marto while DCF agent and Sheriff are at home	0.90	157.50	KMR
	Receipt and review of e-mailed Brevard County Sheriff's Report from February 2, 2011	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	Continue drafting Motion for Contempt regarding new Brevard County Sheriff's report from Christopher Casey and statements regarding Mrs. Casey's attempts to contact Riley school and doctor and, regarding Ms. Casey's false statements regarding Dr. Day and the Florida Courts	0.70	87.50	PCLA
	Lengthily telephone call with Mr. Michaud regarding Mrs. Casey's telephone conference with Riley's therapist, Riley's trip to the doctor and health insurance issues, and amounts of funds expended by Mr. Michaud regarding the Massachusetts hearing for inclusion in Motion for Contempt regarding award of fees and costs	0.40	50.00	PCLA
	Receipt of initial emergency voicemail from Mr. Michaud advising of Brevard Department of Children and Families and Sheriff's Department at his home requesting to speak with Riley regarding allegations of abuse received on June 15, 201; telephone conference with Mr. Michaud; office conference with Mr. Rolling; additional telephone conferences with Mr. Michaud; attend telephone conference with Mr. Rollin and Amy Marto and DCF and Sheriff; research files for July 8th Order restricting any investigation of Riley and April 6th Order and scan for providing to DCF agent; further telephone conference with Mr. Rolling and Amy Marto and DCF investigator, Lisa Zmuda, to provide background information and to obtain information regarding investigation; provide Mr. Rolling with recent Brevard Sheriff's Report from February 2011; additional telephone conference with Mr. Michaud	1.10	137.50	PCLA
Jun-16-11	N/C - Conference with Patti Cain to discuss events at Michaud household	0.40	0.00	KMR
	Receipt and review of e-mail from Mr. Michaud with detailed accounting of DCF/BCSO visit on June 16, 2011	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud for status of investigation of Mrs. Casey's most recent report to DCF	0.20	25.00	PCLA

	of abuse and request for hospital, doctor, and police		Pag	e 157 of 324
	reports and advising Dr. Day of the new allegations			
	Office conference with Mr. Rollin to advise of all indicators pointing to Mrs. Casey as the person who contacted DCF with allegations of abuse based on information provided by the BCSO and DCF only known by Mrs. Casey other than Mr. Michaud, doctor, and to include most recent allegations in Motion for Contempt	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Amend Motion for Contempt to incorporate most recent report to Brevard County DCF by Mrs. Casey; review prior Brevard and Massachusetts cases instigated by Mrs. Casey for incorporation in Motion with new allegation	2.80	350.00	PCLA
	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud for second request hospital and doctor reports from June 8 and 9, 2011, and request status of DCF investigation and BSO's intent to seek investigation for false allegations against Mrs. Casey	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Jun-17-11	Receipt and review of Viera Hospital and pediatric doctor reports; additional drafting of Motion for Contempt to incorporate emergency room and pediatric information and findings; review and refine Motion for review by Mr. Rossway and Mr. Michaud	1.30	162.50	PCLA
Jun-20-11	N/C - Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding status of his review of Motion for Contempt	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Prepare correspondence to Mr. Michaud enclosing King Reporting past due invoice	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Prepare all Exhibits to Motion for Contempt; research duplicating audio CD of Massachusetts hearing transcript for providing to the Court and subsequent hearing on Motion for Contempt	0.60	75.00	PCLA
	N/C - Receipt of e-mail from Mr. Michaud regarding Mr. Rossway filing Order Denying Writ of Prohibition in civil case	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Office conference with Mr. Rossway to provide information and status of June 17, 2011 allegations by Mrs. Casey resulting in new DCF and BSO investigations, and possible criminal investigation of Mrs. Casey by BSO for continued false reporting of abuse	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Work on contempt issues; review pleadings prepared; refine same	0.30	105.00	BWR
Jun-21-11	N/C- Receipt of e-mail from Mr. Michaud regarding ability to file civil suit against former wife for false	0.10	0.00	PCLA

ye.	reporting and letter from Mr. Rossway to DCF and Brevard County Sheriff's office requesting investigation		Page	e 158 of 324
	and prosecution of former wife			
Jun-22-11	Work on refining extensive Motion for Contempt based on additional contemptuous conduct of ex-spouse	0.50	175.00	BWR
Jun-23-11	Draft Motion for Entry of Default regarding Former Wife's failure to file an answer or responsive pleading to the Amended Petition; draft proposed Order Granting Former Husband's Motion for Entry of Default; research clerk's website to confirm at Mrs. Casey did not file a response to the Amended Petition	0.50	62.50	PCLA
	N/C - E-mail to Attorney Matheson regarding filing the Appellate Court Order Denying of Writ of Prohibition	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - E-mail to Mr. Michaud with request he obtain copy of "Response" documents noted on Clerk's website and May 15 and 16, 2011 appellate documents	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Draft Motion for Release of Dr. Day's Report to Minor Child's Therapist	0.50	62.50	PCLA
	N/C - Receipt of Attorney Matheson's advise regarding filing the Appellate Court's denial of Writ of Prohibition	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Draft Notice of Filing Fifth District Court of Appeal's Order Denying Former Wife's Writ of Prohibition dated June 1, 2011	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Work on final materials for extensive Motion for Contempt; sign off on Motion for Release of Reports; short review of materials for meeting with Dr. Edwards; review filing materials for trial court concerning, appellate courts approval that Judge Maxwell appropriately presided over hearings; check on status of second appellate brief dealing with actual testimony and evidence at hearing	0.40	140.00	BWR
Jun-24-11	Research termination of parental rights	0.10	17.50	KMR
	N/C - E-mails from and to Mr. Michaud regarding Motion for Default and Former Wife's failure to file a response to Amended Petition	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Office conference with Mr. Rossway for detailed review of Motion for Contempt and Sanctions	0.30	0.00	PCLA
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, amend Motion for Contempt for further review	0.40	50.00	PCLA
Jun-26-11	Review extensive Motion for Contempt concerning sanctions; work on issues regarding privacy and redaction, assert materials while keeping crux of	0.50	175.00	BWR

Page 159 of 324

	motion clear for courts review; work on notes for third-party Request to Produce; if necessary, to attorneys who previously provided legal services to account for amounts of money paid by former spouse to counsel and to ascertain source of income		Page	e 159 of 32
Jun-27-11	Continued research potential termination of parental rights	0.90	157.50	KMR
Jun-28-11	N/C - Office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding review of Motion for Contempt and amendments, and status of Mr. Michaud's account with RMTS	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Jun-29-11	N/C- Provide directions to law clerk for review and redaction of Exhibits attached to Motion for Contempt for removal of personal information for protection of minor child	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Pursuant to final review, finalize Motion for Contempt and Sanctions for forwarding to Mr. Michaud for final review and signing; review all attached Exhibits to Motion and redact	0.50	62.50	PCLA
Jun-30-11	Initial office conference with Mr. Michaud for review and signing of Motion for Contempt and discussion regarding hearing on same and status of obtaining Sheriff's Report of latest report by Mrs. Casey	0.40	50.00	PCLA
	Office conference with Mr. Michaud regarding Riley's therapist testing of Riley and statements made by Riley, Mrs. Casey's statements and contact with the therapist; research file for orders regarding therapy and Dr. Day's Report; office conference with Mr. Rollin's regarding current issues with therapist and providing Dr. Day's Report; draft correspondence to therapist; office conference with Mr. Rollin and Mr. Rossway; pull Court's March 6, 2011 Order; provide Mr. Michaud with documents to be provided to therapist with Mr. Rossway instructions to advise therapist that Mr. Michaud not in position to provide Massachusetts' medical or other reports and would require a court's order	1.60	200.00	PCLA
	N/C - Attempts to contact Dr. Day's assistant to advise of issue with Riley's therapist and leave message to return call	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Pull file and scan and e-mail Order Granting Motion to Amend and Amended Petition to Attorney Orth	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Telephone call with Mr. Michaud regarding providing therapist with Brevard Sheriff's Report which sets out findings which may clarify issues, and Order on July 2010 hearing restricting anyone from speaking with Riley regarding allegations	0.20	25.00	PCLA

N/C - Pull Order on July 8, 2010 hearing and scan and	0.10	Page 0.00	160 of 324 PCLA
e-mail to Mr. Michaud			
Conferences with Mr. Michaud, Mr. Rossway, and Patti Cain regarding request made by Riley's current therapist, Ms. Vicki	0.40	70.00	KMR
Work on emergent issue concerning therapist's request for information; work with associate and paralegal on best manner to expedite providing therapist information to assist her in understanding purpose of therapy and to provide information pursuant to Dr. Day's review that resulted in Court Order awarding temporary physical custody of minor child to Timothy Michaud	0.20	70.00	BWR
Totals	27.10	\$3,402.50	

DISBURSEMENTS		Disbursements	Receipts
Jun-02-11	Telephone Charges	0.20	
Jun-06-11	Telephone Charges	0.20	
Jun-07-11	Telephone Charges	1.40	
	Telephone Charges	0.20	
4-11	Postage	0.44	
Jun-15-11	Telephone Charges	0.10	
	Telephone Charges	0.10	
	Telephone Charges	3.20	
Jun-16-11	Telephone Charges	2.10	
	Telephone Charges	0.10	
	Telephone Charges	0.30	
Jun-17-11	Telephone Charges	0.10	
	Telephone Charges	0.10	
Jun-20-11	Telephone Charges	0.10	
	Postage	0.44	
Jun-23-11	Photocopies	0.80	
	Facsimile Charges	3.00	
	Telephone Charges	0.50	
San C	Postage	0.88	

	Invoice #:	59853	
Postage		0.88	Page 161 of 324
Westlaw Online Research Access		25.00	-
Westlaw Online Research Access		50.00	
Telephone Charges		0.50	
Telephone Charges		0.40	
Telephone Charges		1.30	
Totals		\$92.34	\$0.00
Current Fees & Disbursements		***************************************	\$3,494.84
Previous Balance			\$5,624.51
Previous Payments			\$5,624.51
BALANCE DUE			\$3,494.84

Jun-24-11

-27-11

Jun-30-11

ROSSWAY MOORE SWAN, P.L. THE MODERN ONE BUILDING 2101 INDIAN RIVER BOULEVARD, SUITE 200 VERO BEACH, FL 32960 Telephone (772) 231-4440 Facsimile (772) 231-4430

Mr. Timothy Michaud 1791 Wekiva Drive Melbourne, FL 32940

August 2, 2011

File #: 1682-001 Inv. #: 60315

Total Due:

\$1,014.10

RE: Post-judgment issues

Please write the FILE number on your check to insure proper crediting.

SUMMARY

*Balance Fwd:

\$3,494.84

Payment received:

Current Invoice Amount:

\$3,494.84) \$1,014.10

TOTAL DUE:

\$1,014.10

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	ATT'Y/L.A.
Jul-01-11	Lengthily telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding his meeting with minor child's therapist regarding past allegations, therapy placed on hold until issues resolved, steps to be taken to provide therapist with Dr. Day's Report, Mr. Rossway's contacting Attorney Orth for release of Report, and discussion regarding preparing Motion to Compel Mrs. Casey's payment of medical and therapy out-of-pocket costs for Riley	0.50	62.50	PCLA
	Lengthily telephone conference with Evelyn at Dr. Day's office to advise of Mrs. Casey recent report to Brevard DCF on June 17, 2011 after Riley's doctor visit and Dr. Pannaccione's request for Dr. Day's report and to speak to Dr. Day; provide Dr. Pannaccione's contact information to Evelyn; advise Mr. Michaud for need of Release to be sign for Dr. Day to speak to Dr. Pannaccione and is forthcoming	0.40	50.00	PCLA
	Telephone conference with Dr. Day's assistant regarding providing Motion for Contempt	0.20	25.00	PCLA

	Draft correspondence to Dr. Day regarding providing Motion for Contempt	0.20	Page 25.00	e 163 of 324 PCLA
	Work on issue regarding psychologist; work on issue regarding opposing counsel and potential stipulation of various issues	0.40	140.00	BWR
Jul-06-11	Explore Florida law reviews and treatises regarding "termination of parental rights"	0.80	80.00	CTLC
Jul-07-11	Receipt of Appellate's Motion for Attorney Fees and Reply Brief	0.10	12.50	PCLA
	Receipt and review of e-mailed Brevard Sheriff's Incident Report from June 17, 2011	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	N/C - Attempt to contact Mr. Michaud and leave message for return call	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Telephone call with Mr. Michaud for confirmation of forwarding Release to Dr. Day for communication with Riley's therapist, Mr. Michaud sending last two BSO reports to Dr. Day, not scheduling appointments with Riley and her therapist until the therapist communicates with Dr. Day and continues with therapeutic therapy regarding Riley's adjustment to living with Mr. Michaud; also, discussion regarding Mr. Rossway's reliance on Attorney Matheson's experience in determining whether to reply to Former Wife's Motion for Appellate Attorney's Fees	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	Complete search for law review and journal articles regarding termination of parental rights in Florida	0.70	70.00	CTLC
Jul-11-11	N/C - Office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding contact with Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant to schedule status conference and set hearings on Motion for Contempt and Motion for Release of Dr. Day's Report to Riley's therapist	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Jul-12-11	N/C - Attempt to contact Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant; forward e-mail to the Judicial Assistant to inquire if Judge Maxwell was retaining case	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Receipt of e-mail from Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant regarding status of the Judge retaining case and inability to confirm with Judge at this time	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Jul-15-11	Check on status of Attorney Orth's refusal to file any responsive pleadings; review and approve letter to mandating a response and raising issue regarding psychologist access to Dr. Day's report	0.10	35.00	BWR
Jul-18-11	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, draft correspondence to Attorney Orth requesting Former Wife's Answer to Amended Petition and inquiry as	0.30	37.50	PCLA

	to stipulation to release Dr. Day's report to minor child's		Page	e 164 of 324
x****	therapist			
	N/C - E-mail to Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant for status of Judge retaining case	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	N/C Review changes to letter and make demand upon opposing counsel	1.00	0.00	BWR
Jul-19-11	N/C - Draft Notice of Unavailability for Mr. Rossway	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Jul-20-11	N/C - Receipt of confirmation from Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant that the Judge is retaining the case and dates for hearing on Motion for Contempt; telephone conference with Attorney Orth's office to schedule hearing	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	N/C- Additional telephone conference with Attorney Orth's office to schedule hearing with Jennifer and advised that hearing date will have to be cleared with Mrs. Casey and Mr. Orth	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Ç.	N/C - Telephone conference with Attorney Orth's office confirming September 14, 2011 availability for hearing; e-mail to Judge Maxwell to request September 14, 2011 and time allowed for hearing	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Draft Notice of Hearing	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	N/C - Attempt to contact Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant to confirm hearing date, length of hearing, and if the Judge requires copies of motions	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	E-mail from and to Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant providing Case Number, Motions to be heard, and opposing counsel name, and request if Judge Maxwell requires a copy of Notice of Hearing and Motions to be heard	0.10	12.50	PCLA
Jul-21-11	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud to advise of hearing date, Motions to be heard, and request status of contact with DCF regarding the case being closed and obtaining a copy of their report for use at the hearing	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Jul-25-11	N/C - Receipt and review of e-mails by and between Mr. Michaud and Mrs. Casey	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Relay Mr. Rossway's instructions for research to Attorney Rollin regarding Former Wife's Objection to Hearing on Petition's Verified Motion for Contempt Et Al Dated June 30, 2011	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Scan and e-mail Former Wife's Answer to Amended Supplemental Petition for Modification	0.10	0.00	PCLA

Page 165 of 324

and Former Wife's Objection to Hearing on Verified	
Motion for Contempt to Mr. Michaud and advise of research of Objection	
-	

Jul-26-11

9-11(

Totals

Motion for Contempt to Mr. Michaud and advise of research of Objection			
Short telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding ability for Former Wife to object to hearing on contempt issues and her continued allegations regarding abuse and Mr. Michaud "buying" Dr. Day	0.10	12.50	PCLA
Research rules of appellate procedure and review Objection to Hearing On Petitioner's Verified Motion For Contempt	0.40	70.00	KMR
Receipt and review of Answer to Husband's Amended Verified Supplemental Petition for Modification of Final Judgment	0.10	35.00	BWR
Draft Motion to Strike Former Wife's Objection to Hearing	1.20	210.00	KMR
Finalize Motion to Strike	0.20	35.00	KMR
N/C - Prepare, copy, fax, and mail Former Husband's Motion to Strike Former Wife's Objection to Hearing	0.20	0.00	PCLA
N/C - Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, draft correspondence to Mr. Michaud enclosing RMTS' July 2011 invoice	0.20	0.00	PCLA

9.90

\$1,037.50

DISBURSEMENTS		Disbursements	Receipts
Aug-02-11	Overpayment of invoice 59853		105.16
Jul-01-11	Photocopies	24.00	
	Telephone Charges	3.10	
	Telephone Charges	2.30	
	Telephone Charges	0.20	
	Postage	7.44	
Jul-05-11	Photocopies	13.60	
	Postage	3.36	
77-11	Telephone Charges	0.20	
	Telephone Charges	1.20	
Jul-12-11	Telephone Charges	0.10	

		Invoice #:	60315	
Jul-18-11	Photocopies		0.10	Page 166 of 324
•	Facsimile Charges		2.00	
20-11	Telephone Charges		0.20	
<i>i</i> ,	Telephone Charges		0.80	
	Telephone Charges		0.10	
Jul-21-11	Photocopies		1.00	
	Facsimile Charges		3.00	
	Facsimile Charges		3.00	
	Telephone Charges		0.30	
Jul-22-11	Postage		1.76	
Jul-25-11	Photocopies		2.80	
	Postage		0.84	
Jul-26-11	Photocopies		2.60	
	Facsimile Charges		6.00	
	Postage		1.76	
	Totals		\$81.76	\$105.16
	Current Fees & Disbursements			\$1,014.10
	Previous Balance			\$3,494.84
	Previous Payments			\$3,494.84
	BALANCE DUE		arthur saint	\$1,014.10

ROSSWAY MOORE SWAN, P.L. THE MODERN ONE BUILDING 2101 INDIAN RIVER BOULEVARD, SUITE 200 VERO BEACH, FL 32960 Telephone (772) 231-4440 Facsimile (772) 231-4430

Mr. Timothy Michaud 1791 Wekiva Drive Melbourne, FL 32940

September 6, 2011

File #: 1682-001 Inv. #: 60723

iv. #. 00725

(

Total Due:

\$1,364.20

RE: Post-judgment issues

Please write the FILE number on your check to insure proper crediting.

SUMMARY

*Balance Fwd:

\$1,014.10

Payment received:

Ψ1,014.10

•

\$0.00)

Current Invoice Amount:

\$350.10

TOTAL DUE:

\$1,364.20

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	ATT'Y/L.A.
Aug-22-11	N/C - Attempt to contact Mr. Michaud and leave message	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding status of Brevard DCF case, Riley's counseling, and Ms. Casey's current cooperation	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Aug-25-11	Receipt of e-mail from Mr. Michaud regarding Former Wife's move to South Carolina; office conference with Mr. Rossway to advise of Ms. Casey new move and Mr. Michaud's concerns that Mrs. Casey will again pursuant a case in South Carolina; e-mail to Mr. Michaud requesting he obtain certified copies of Florida Order on temporary custody and Connecticut Order denying Ms. Casey Petition for Injunction	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	N/C - Follow-up e-mail from Mr. Michaud regarding Former Wife's move and obtaining certified copies of Orders	0.10	0.00	PCLA

			Pag	e 168 of 324
Aug-31-11	Receipt and review of Brevard County DCF's Report from June 15, 2011; e-mail to Mr. Michaud regarding unsigned report and case notes	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	Additional e-mails with Mr. Michaud regarding Riley's therapist and medical records for reflux	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Begin preparations for hearing on Motion for Contemp, including updating schedue and notebook of DCF and other reports	0.40	50.00	PCLA
	Begin work up of materials for contempt hearings; review information regarding DCF reports; work with paralegal on preparing information to be able to aggressively pursue protectionist actions for Mr. Michaud and minor child; work on issues to further restrict mother's access based upon conduct; work on issue regarding mother's relocation to South Carolina; begin review of file for listing of all failures by mother to comply with Court Orders over the past 2 years	0.50	175.00	BWR
	Totals	2.10	\$350.00	

DISBURSEMENTS		Disbursements	Receipts
-22-11	Telephone Charges	0.10	
	Totals	\$0.10	\$0.00
	Current Fees & Disbursements		\$350.10
	Previous Balance		\$1,014.10
	Previous Payments		\$0.00
	BALANCE DUE		\$1,364.20

ROSSWAY MOORE SWAN, P.L. THE MODERN ONE BUILDING 2101 INDIAN RIVER BOULEVARD, SUITE 200 VERO BEACH, FL 32960 Telephone (772) 231-4440 Facsimile (772) 231-4430

Mr. Timothy Michaud 1791 Wekiva Drive Melbourne, FL 32940

October 6, 2011

File #: 1682-001 Inv. #: 61208

Total Due:

\$4,835.56

RE: Post-judgment issues

Please write the FILE number on your check to insure proper crediting.

SUMMARY

*Balance Fwd:

\$1,364.20

Payment received:

\$0.00)

Current Invoice Amount:

\$3,471.36

TOTAL DUE:

\$4,835.56

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	ATT'Y/L.A.
Sep-09-11	N/C - Receive information from Attorney Orth; e-mails with Mr. Michaud	0.20	0.00	BWR
Sep-10-11	Work on upcoming hearing; work on potential strategy that may be employed by opposing counsel based upon Motion to Withdraw; plan strategy regarding Order requested so the court will, number one restrict former wife from having contact with school, doctors and others; number two, provide Mr. Michaud with the right and obligation to inform school officials doctors and all other officials that a Court Order is entered denying the mother's access to school records, medical records etc. until such time as a further Court Order is entered confirming the mother is no longer making false allegations against Mr. Michaud; number three, receive a Court Order specifically stating that the mother has made repeated continued false, scandalous and unsubstantiated claims against the former husband that have been exhaustively researched and investigated and have been found to be completely false and based upon a course of action taken by the mother to intentionally	0.75	262.50	BWR

interfere with the relationship between the father and daughter; Number four, placing language in the order

	requiring school officials and/or doctors to report directly to the Court any contacts made by the mother to		Page	e 170 of 324
	schools doctors etc. in violation of the Court Order			
Sep-12-11	Begin preparations for contempt hearing on September 14, 2011, including review and organization of Motions and exhibits	0.40	50.00	PCLA
	Receipt and review of Cross Notice of Hearing and Motion for Leave to Withdraw	0.10	35.00	BWR
	Draft Order on Former Wife's Motion to Strike and Former Husband's Objection to Motion to Strike	0.60	75.00	PCLA
	Begin drafting Interim Order on September 14, 2011 Hearing	0.90	112.50	PCLA
	N/C - Draft correspondence to Judge Maxwell regarding Fifth District Court of Appeal's Order denying Former Wife's Petition for Writ of Prohibition	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Sep-13-11	N/C - Update Pleading and Correspondence files in preparation of contempt hearing	0.30	0.00	PCLA
G.	N/C - Telephone conference with King Reporting to confirm court reporter for September 14, 2011 hearing at 2:00 p.m.	0.10	0.00	PCLA
•	Prepare for office conference with between Mr. Rossway and Mr. Michaud for preparation for hearing on Motion for Contempt	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	Finalize Orders, exhibits and case law for September 14, 2011 hearing	1.80	225.00	PCLA
	Office conference with Mr. Rossway for hearing review and meeting with Mr. Michaud for hearing preparations	1.40	175.00	PCLA
	Review hearing transcript for reference to therapy; prepare Bullet Points for Motion for Contempt, including Timeline of events; prepare short bullet points for Motion to Release Dr. Day's Report and Motion to Restrict Mother Information	2.30	287.50	PCLA
	Begin work with paralegal on extensive materials and timing issues for judge; extensive strategy meeting with Mr. Michaud to discuss extensive various issues concerning Motion for Contempt and additional contingencies including, potential of new attorney joining case; discussion regarding appellate issues, objections, and motions filed in case; discussions regarding long-term goals of litigation	2.00	700.00	BWR
Sep-14-11	Amend Bullet Points for Hearing pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, to include specific Orders violated	1.30	162.50	PCLA

	by Mrs. Casey; final hearing preparations with Mr. Rossway		Pag	e 171 of 32
	N/C - Travel to Viera Courthouse for hearing	0.80	0.00	PCLA
	Attend hearing on Motions for Contempt, release of Dr. Day's Report, and Limiting Mrs. Casey's Information regarding Minor Child; assist with exhibits and record Judge Maxwell's rulings	1.00	125.00	PCLA
	N/C - Return from Viera Courthouse from hearing	0.90	0.00	PCLA
	Extensive study in preparation of four Court Orders, exhibits, and legal arguments; review jurisdictional claims and defenses to be prepared to argue before the Court; review trial pleadings; review fully testimony and related information; final review of entire packet of materials for case	1.25	437.50	BWR
	N/C - Travel to the Viera Courthouse	0.80	0.00	BWR
	Study opening statement materials and review information for hearing; meeting with Mr. Michaud; discussions with opposing counsel; attend hearing, argue issues, and receive interim order from the Court; discussions with Mr. Michaud; provide input to paralegal regarding drafting of an order without need to order a transcript; discussion regarding fine points etc.	1.25	437.50	BWR
	N/C - Return to Vero Beach	0.90	0.00	BWR
Sep-16-11	Finalize draft of Interim Order on September 14, 2011 Hearing for review by Mr. Rossway	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's review, make revisions to Interim Order on September 15, 2011 Order and finalize for providing to Mr. Orth for approval	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	N/C - E-mail to Mr. Orth enclosing proposed Interim Order on September 14, 2011 Hearing and Order on Motion to Strike with request for response by September 19, 2011, and request for proposed Order on Motion to Withdraw; receipt of e-mail from Mr. Orth approval of proposed Orders	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Sep-19-11	N/C - Draft correspondence to Judge Maxwell enclosing proposed Order on Former Husband's Motion to Strike Former Wife's Objection to Hearing and Interim Order on September 14, 2011 Hearing	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Annual	Check on status of opposing attorney's withdrawal; receive approval regarding orders; send materials to	0.40	140.00	BWR

	judge; provide instruction to paralegal regarding future strategy of case to protect minor child and Mr. Michaud		Pag	e 172 of 324
23-11	Receipt and review of Attorney Orth's correspondence to Judge Maxwell enclosing proposed Order on Motion to Withdraw	0.10	35.00	BWR
	N/C - Draft correspondence to Mr. Michaud enclosing King Reporting Invoice No. 26614 for September 14, 2011 hearing	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Sep-29-11	Check on status of withdrawal of opposing counsel to be able to move case forward, dealing directly with former spouse on issues relating to the Court's hearing required before Christmas	0.20	70.00	BWR
	Totals	21.45	\$3,442.50	

DISBURSEME	ENTS	Disbursements	Receipts
Sep-13-11	Photocopies	22.30	
Sep-15-11	Photocopies	1.80	
	Postage	0.88	
'9-11	Photocopies	0.20	
	Postage	3.04	
Sep-21-11	Photocopies	0.20	
Sep-23-11	Postage	0.44	
	Totals	\$28.86	\$0.00
	Current Fees & Disbursements		\$3,471.36
	Previous Balance		\$1,364.20
	Previous Payments		\$0.00
	BALANCE DUE		\$4,835.56

ROSSWAY MOORE SWAN, P.L. THE MODERN ONE BUILDING 2101 INDIAN RIVER BOULEVARD, SUITE 200 VERO BEACH, FL 32960 Telephone (772) 231-4440 Facsimile (772) 231-4430

Mr. Timothy Michaud 1791 Wekiva Drive Melbourne, FL 32940

November 3, 2011

File #: 1682-001 Inv. #: 61618

Total Due: \$1,1

\$1,159.56

RE: Post-judgment issues

Please write the FILE number on your check to insure proper crediting.

SUMMARY

*Balance Fwd:

\$4,835.56

Payment received:

W4,000.00

Current Invoice Amount:

\$4,835.56) \$1,159.56

--,----

TOTAL DUE:

\$1,159.56

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	ATT'Y/L.A.
Oct-10-11	N/C - Scan and e-mail Order on September 14, 2011 Hearing and Order Granting Former Husband's Motion to Strike Former Wife's Objection to Hearing to Mr. Michaud	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Receipt and review of Interim Order on September 14, 2011 Hearing signed by Judge Maxwell on October 6, 2011	0.10	35.00	BWR
	Receipt and review of Order Granting Former Husband's Motion to Strike Former Wife's Objection to Hearing on Petitioner's Verified Motion for Contempt Et Al Dated June 30, 2011, signed by Judge Maxwell on October 6, 2011	0.10	35.00	BWR
Oct-11-11	E-mail from and to Mr. Michaud; telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding HIPPA releases for Dr. Edwards and Dr. Vicki, and further discussion regarding requirements for both Mr. Michaud and Riley's therapy as issues for counseling and duration	0.40	50.00	PCLA

			Pag	e 174 of 324
Oct-15-11	N/C - Update correspondence and pleading files	0.30	0.00	PCLA
-17-11	Receipt of e-mail from Mr. Michaud regarding Riley's therapy and issues with Dr. Vickie; review transcript of April 2011 hearing and e-mail to Mr. Michaud regarding requirements for therapy and Dr. Day's and Court's agreement of Dr. Vicki and Dr. Williamson and his Wife as therapists for Riley	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding Dr. Vickie Panaccione's continued contact with Mrs. Casey and possible conflicts of interest	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Continued and lengthily telephone call with Mr. Michaud regarding requirements that Riley be in therapy and attempting to contact Dr. Jeffrey Williamson, as ordered by the Court in April 14, 2011 transcript, and further discussion regarding Dr. Vickie Panaccione's possible position on issues in case due to Mrs. Casey's telephone calls and providing Reports from Dr. Huryn, North Carolina Sheriff, and Dr. Boos, and the issue that it appears Mrs. Casey has a copy of Dr. Day's report in violation of the Court's Orders as evident by e-mails received by Mr. Michaud from Mrs. Casey to Dr. Vickie	0.40	50.00	PCLA
	N/C - Receipt of e-mail from Mr. Michaud confirming initial consultation with Dr. Jeffrey Williamson on October 18, 2011	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Receipt and review of e-mail threads between Mrs. Casey, Mr. Michaud and Dr. Vicki Panaccione	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Pursuant to Mr. Rossway directions, review Motion and Order on Motion for Leave to Withdraw regarding incorrect contact information for Aimee Casey as previously disclosed at last hearing	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Oct-18-11	N/C - Office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding e-mails between Mr. Michaud, Mrs. Casey and Dr. Vickie, and indications that Mrs. Casey retains a copy of Dr. Day's report and is interfering with Riley's therapy and Mr. Michaud has needed to change therapists for Riley, and instructions to prepare Motion	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	E-mail from and to Mr. Michaud advising of Mr. Rossway's intent to file and set a hearing on Mrs. Casey's disseminating Dr. Day's report and interfering with Riley's therapy	0.10	12.50	PCLA
<u>(</u>	Draft correspondence to Attorney Orth advising of error in Order on Leave to Withdraw and request proposed Amended Order	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Oct-19-11	Receipt of e-mail from Attorney Orth's office attaching proposed Amended Order; review Order and make corrections; pursuant to Mr. Rossway review, e-mail	0.30	37.50	PCLA

	corrected Amended Order to Attorney Orth with request for copy of Amended Order and correspondence forwarding the corrected Amended Order to Judge Maxwell		Pag	e 175 of 324
	Work on emerging issues concerning Motion for Contempt based upon former wife's continued wrongfully contemptuous actions	0.50	175.00	BWR
Oct-20-11	N/C - Receipt of e-mail from Mr. Michaud regarding consultation with Dr. Williamson	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding his consultation with Dr. Williamson and his position on Dr. Day, and discussion regarding Dr. Vicki and Mrs. Casey providing all Dr. Boos, Dr. Huryn and critique of Dr. Day's report; office conference with Mr. Rossway	0.40	50.00	PCLA
	N/C - Receipt of e-mail from Mr. Michaud requesting telephone call with Mr. Rossway; attempt to contact Mr. Michaud to advise Mr. Rossway unavailability but intent to schedule a call as soon as possible	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Short office conference with Mr. Rossway to advise of Mr. Michaud concerns with retaining Dr. Williamson as Riley's therapist due to Dr. Williamson's position regarding Dr. Day, and discussion regarding preparing Motion regarding Mrs. Casey's providing reports to Dr. Vickie and to include contempt Mrs. Casey's apparent possession of Dr. Day's Report in violation of the Court's orders	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Meet with paralegal regarding strategy concerning notification of court of continued inappropriate actions by former wife; work on timing of such Motion for Contempt; work on filing Motion for Contempt but setting in December at same time court is requesting update hearing; receive extensive information regarding unusual meeting with new psychologists; evening review of upsetting phone conduct by ex-wife towards client	0.40	140.00	BWR
Oct-21-11	Receipt and review of copies of e-mails between Mr. Michaud and Mrs. Casey; telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding his telephone call and e-mails with Mrs. Casey regarding Riley's therapy with Dr. Vicki	0.20	25.00	PCLA
(Formulate strategy for Motion for Contempt; communication with court and with former wife requesting court set contempt hearing at the same time as court ordered hearing in December; formulate additional issues to be dealt with concerning wife's continued abhorrent behavior	0.30	105.00	BWR
O11	Begin drafting Motion for Contempt regarding Former Wife's contact and interference with Riley's therapist; review all Order restricting parties form Dr. Day's	1.40	175.00	PCLA

61618

Page 176 of 324

	Report and from discussing this case with persons not authorized by the Court		Pag	je 176 01 32
	N/C -Prepare Notice of Unavailability for Mr. Rossway	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Oct-27-11	Work on issues surrounding further Motion for Contempt; work on issue relating to sanction being that mother shall have no further contact with minor child until specific course of conduct prescribed by court at future hearing is followed regarding therapy completion of plan to keep mother from continuing to rule in therapeutic care of child based on mother's continued false abuse of allegations	0.50	175.00	BWR
	Totals	7.20	\$1,152.50	

DISBURSEMENT	S	Disbursements	Receipts
Oct-10-11	Postage	0.44	
Oct-11-11	Telephone Charges	2.40	
Oct-17-11	Telephone Charges	0.40	
	Telephone Charges	0.20	
8-11	Photocopies	0.10	
	Facsimile Charges	2.00	
Oct-20-11	Telephone Charges	0.20	
Oct-25-11	Postage	1.32	
	Totals	\$7.06	\$0.00
	Current Fees & Disbursements		\$1,159.56
	Previous Balance		\$4,835.56
	Previous Payments		\$4,835.56
	BALANCE DUE		\$1,159.56

ROSSWAY MOORE SWAN, P.L. THE MODERN ONE BUILDING 2101 INDIAN RIVER BOULEVARD, SUITE 200 VERO BEACH, FL 32960 Telephone (772) 231-4440 Facsimile (772) 231-4430

Mr. Timothy Michaud 1791 Wekiva Drive Melbourne, FL 32940

December 6, 2011

File #: 1682-001 Inv. #: 62103

Total Due:

\$2,874.76

RE: Post-judgment issues

Please write the FILE number on your check to insure proper crediting.

SUMMARY

*Balance Fwd:

\$1,159.56

Payment received:

\$0.00)

Current Invoice Amount:

\$1,715.20

TOTAL DUE:

\$2,874.76

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	ATT'Y/L.A.
Nov-01-11	Work on contempt issues and meet with paralegal regarding setting of hearings and related information	0.40	140.00	BWR
Nov-04-11	N/C - E-mail to and from Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant regarding Status Conference/Motion Hearing in December 2011 pursuant to Judge's orders	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Nov-08-11	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud to advise of hearing date, receive update on Mrs. Casey's telephone calls with Riley, and Mr. Michaud's request for Subpoena for Hearing directed to Amy Marto	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	N/C - Receipt of e-mail from Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant advising of date and time for status conference and motion hearing	0.10	0.00	PCLA
and the second of the second o	Draft Notice of Status Conference and Motion Hearing, to include Judge Maxwell's requirement for Riley to attend and contempt language	0.20	25.00	PCLA

62103

Telephone conference with Mrs. Casey to advise of hearing date and time and obtain Mrs. Casey's position that case in appellate court no hearing is required; prepare memo to file for use at hearing to confirm telephone conference with Mrs. Casey advising of date, time and location of hearing	0.20	Page 25.00	e 178 of 324 PCLA
Draft Subpoena for Hearing to Amy Marto	0.20	25.00	PCLA
N/C - Update pleading file	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Receipt of e-mail from King Court Reporting advising of Ms. Casey ordering an excerpt of the September 19, 2011 hearing transcript; e-mail to and from court reporter requesting clarification of content of excerpt ordered and costs; telephone conference with Mr. Michaud advising of ordered excerpt of hearing by Ms. Casey and request authority or order copy; e-mail to the court reporter requesting copy of excerpt of transcript	0.30	37.50	PCLA
Continue drafting and refining Motion for Contempt Regarding Former Wife's Interference with Minor Child's Court Ordered Therapy and for Violation of Prior Court Orders; review prior Orders violated by Former Wife	0.80	100.00	PCLA
Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, draft correspondence to Mrs. Casey regarding Court's order for status conference and enclosing copy of Interim Order on September 14, 2011 Hearing and Motion for Contempt, and confirming December 9, 2011 Status Conference/Motion Hearing in Melbourne Courthouse	0.30	37.50	PCLA
Review e-mails between Mr. Michaud, Mrs. Casey, and Dr. Vicki for possible exhibits for upcoming contempt hearing	0.30	37.50	PCLA
Receipt and review of additional e-mail threads between Mr. Michaud, Mrs. Casey, and Dr. Panaccione	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Pursuant to Mr. Rossway review, amend and finalize correspondence to Mrs. Casey regarding status conference to be provided via e-mail and U.S. Mail	0.10	12.50	PCLA
Review and corrections to additional Motion for Contempt; sign off on Notice for Hearing and letter to Mrs. Casey	0.30	105.00	BWR
Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's review, amend Former Husband's Third Verified Motion for Contempt; e-mail Motion to Mr. Michaud for review	0.40	50.00	PCLA
Receipt and review of excerpt of September 14, 2011 hearing regarding Mr. Rossway advising the Court at the September 14, 2011 hearing of Riley's status regarding	0.30	37.50	PCLA

Nov-09-11

Nov-10-11

	tutoring and counseling; short office conference with Mr. Rossway of content of hearing excerpt and Ms. Casey's possible issues for status conference regarding Riley's therapy		Pag	e 179 of 32
Nov-14-11	E-mail from and to Mr. Michaud regarding his review and signing of Third Verified Motion for Contempt	0.10	12.50	PCLA
	Amend Third Verified Motion for Contempt pursuant to Mr. Michaud's review and e-mail to Mr. Michaud for signing	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Review Transcript from Hearing of March 4, 2011 and hearing notes from September 14, 2011 regarding all Court's requirements for Riley's therapy, including duration, amount, and parameters of therapy	0.40	50.00	PCLA
	N/C - Correspondence to Mr. Michaud enclosing King Report Invoice for copy of Excerpt of Hearing on September 14, 2011	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Nov-15-11	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding finalizing Third Verified Motion for Contempt, and status of Riley's therapy with Dr. Williamson	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Review Dr. Day's Report for recommendations regarding therapy for Riley as cross reference of Judge Maxwell's directions at the September 14, 2011 hearing that Riley have therapy based upon "the recommendations in Dr. Day's Report"; e-mail to Mr. Michaud regarding Paragraph 4 of Page 3 of Dr. Day's Report regarding Riley's "play therapy" and participation by parents	0.50	62.50	PCLA
Nov-16-11	Receipt of signature page from Mr. Michaud; finalize Former Husband's Third Verified Motion for Contempt, Notice of Hearing, and correspondence to Mrs. Casey	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	N/C - E-mail Ms. Casey attaching Mr. Rossway's correspondence, Notice of Status Conference and Interim Order on September 14, 2011 Hearing, with additional copies provided via U.S. Mail	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Draft correspondence to Ms. Casey regarding Former Husband's Third Verified Motion for Contempt to be hearing at December 9, 2011 hearing	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	N/C - E-mail Ms. Casey Mr. Rossway correspondence and Former Husband's Third Verified Motion for Contempt, with additional copy of correspondence and Motion provided via U.S. Mail	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud confirming all pending Motions for Contempt to be heard at the December 9, 2011 hearing, and short discussion regarding Ms. Casey appearing pro se at the hearing	0.20	25.00	PCLA

	Review Motion for Contempt and approve same; review and approve letter to former wife	0.10	Page 35.00	180 of 324 BWR
Isov-17-11	Receipt of voice mail from Dr. Panaccione's office manager advising that they will not accept the Interim Order as sufficient to send the records to Judge Maxwell	0.10	12.50	PCLA
	Amend Objection to Subpoena for Hearing to remove Dr. Panaccione's prior agreement to send her records to the Court	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Receipt of e-mail from Attorney Orth's office requesting Mr. Rossway approval of Dr. Panaccione's testimony via telephone on December 9, 2011; advise Mr. Rossway	0.10	12.50	PCLA
Nov-23-11	Meeting with paralegal and provide instruction for upcoming hearing; confirm appropriate notice to mother; sign off on requests for HIPPA releases, etc.	0.30	105.00	BWR
Nov-29-11	N/C - Attempt to contact court reporter regarding transcribing Massachusetts hearing CD for upcoming contempt hearing	0.10	0.00	PCLA
(°	Review order regarding release of parties and minor child's counseling records to the court; draft correspondence to Dr. Edwards for Mr. Michaud's records; draft correspondence to Dr. Vickie Panaccione for Riley's records; e-mail to Mr. Michaud	0.70	87.50	PCLA
	N/C - Update pleading file; organize file, transcripts and case law	0.30	0.00	PCLA
	Begin review and organization of documents, pleadings, e-mails, 2011 reports, and other material for use at December 9, 2011 Status Conference/Motion Hearing,	1.30	162.50	PCLA
	Begin work on additional materials to present at extensive hearing set for December 9, 2011; work on issues relating to further contempt and previous contempt hearing; additional signature for documentation provided pursuant to court's orders regarding information from professionals	0.50	175.00	BWR
Nov-30-11	E-mails and telephone conference with Mr. Michaud providing status of obtaining therapist reports, transcription of Massachusetts hearing CD, and issues regarding Ms. Casey and preparations for upcoming status conference	0.40	50.00	PCLA
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's review amend and finalize correspondence to Dr. Panaccione regarding records	0.10	12.50	PCLA
	Telephone conference with court reporter's office regarding transcribing CD from Massachusetts hearing; prepare memo to court reporter providing style of case, parties involved, and additional parties mentioned at the	0.70	87.50	PCLA

Page 181 of 324

hearing, including attorneys, evaluators, etc.; office conference with court reporter to review issues with CD and information thereon and provide timeline for completion by December 8, 2011

Totals

12.00

\$1,697.50

DISBURSEME	ENTS	Disbursements	Receipts
Nov-08-11	Telephone Charges	1.10	
	Telephone Charges	0.10	
	Telephone Charges	0.40	
Nov-09-11	Telephone Charges	0.20	
Nov-14-11	Photocopies	0.20	
	Postage	0.44	
Nov-15-11	Postage	2.80	
	Postage	1.08	
Nov-16-11	Photocopies	4.40	
4	Photocopies	0.20	
	Facsimile Charges	3.00	
Nov-17-11	Postage	0.44	
Nov-29-11	Telephone Charges	0.10	
Nov-30-11	Photocopies	0.10	
	Telephone Charges	2.70	
	Postage	0.44	
	Totals	\$17.70	\$0.00
	Current Fees & Disbursements		\$1,715.20
	Previous Balance		\$1,159.56
	Previous Payments		\$0.00
(BALANCE DUE	er-denotes and	\$2,874.76

ROSSWAY MOORE SWAN, P.L. THE MODERN ONE BUILDING 2101 INDIAN RIVER BOULEVARD, SUITE 200 VERO BEACH, FL 32960

Telephone (772) 231-4440 Facsimile (772) 231-4430

Mr. Timothy Michaud 1791 Wekiva Drive Melbourne, FL 32940

January 4, 2012

File #: 1682-001 Inv. #: 62568

Total Due:

\$10,386.28

RE: Post-judgment issues

Please write the FILE number on your check to insure proper crediting.

SUMMARY

*Balance Fwd:

\$2,874.76

Payment received:

\$0.00)

Current Invoice Amount:

\$7,511.52

TOTAL DUE:

\$10,386.28

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	ATT'Y/L.A.
Dec-01-11	Telephone conference with Dr. Vicki's office manager, Andrea, regarding Dr. Vicki not producing a report or records due to "Non-Subpoena" form required to be signed by Mr. Michaud for Riley's therapy, and our request for letter to that effect and copy of Non-Subpoena form for providing to the Court on December 9, 2011 Status Conference	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Receipt and review of Attorney Orth's Notice of Appearance and Subpoena for hearing to Dr. Vicki Panaccione	0.10	35.00	BWR
	Short discussion with Mr. Rossway regarding Mr. Orth's reappearance in case, subpoena to Riley's therapist, and voicemail requesting a Guardian Ad Litem be assigned to case, and Dr. Panaccione's office indications that they would not comply with request for records and report on Riley's therapy	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Attempt to contact Mr. Michaud and leave message for return call	0.10	0.00	PCLA

			Page	183 of 32
	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding Attorney Orth reentering case, Dr. Panaccione Subpoena, Dr. Williamson's therapy with Riley, and obtaining Riley's Massachusetts and Florida school and Sylvan records for the hearing	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	Work on situation regarding Guardian Ad Litem issue and previous attorney re-entering case	0.20	70.00	BWR
Dec-02-11	Telephone conference with Dr. Vicki Panaccione's office manager requesting Court's order regarding providing therapy report to the Court, issues of Ms. Casey's Subpoena to Dr. Vicki to appear at the hearing	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Receipt and review of e-mailed school reports from Mr. Michaud and Dr. Vicki's "Non-Subpoena Agreement"	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Lengthily telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding school reports, Amy Marto's involvement with Riley, Dr. Vicki's position of testifying and the Court's opinion on therapy, Ms. Casey's motives in bringing Dr. Vicki to the hearing, and other issues regarding the upcoming hearing	0.50	62.50	PCLA
C.	N/C - E-mail to Attorney Orth's assistant requesting copy of their Motion for Appointment of Guardian Ad Litem referenced in their e-mail to the Judge's Judicial Assistant to be scheduled for the December 9, 2011 hearing	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Draft correspondence to Dr. Vicki regarding Interim Order on September 14, 2011 Hearing requiring parties to provide therapy reports	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Review of hearing transcript of March 4, 2011 regarding therapy, Court's jurisdiction and Ms. Casey to follow forthcoming order and record page and line notations for use at December 9, 2011 Status Conference	0.70	87.50	PCLA
	Begin drafting Objection to Former Wife's Subpoena for Appearance and Testimony of Dr. Vicki Panaccione	0.60	75.00	PCLA
	Receipt of voicemail from Dr. Vicki's office; telephone conference with Dr. Vicki's office manager; telephone conference with Dr. Vicki regarding sending report to Judge Maxwell directly and when report needs to be provided to the Judge, and issue of subpoena and conflict with prior commitment; advise Mr. Rossway	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	Receipt and review of Former Wife's Motion for Appointment of Guardian Ad Litem and Cross-Notice of Hearing	0.10	35.00	BWR
Sant'	N/C - Short office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding Former Wife's Cross-Notice of Hearing for December 9, 2011 Status Conference	0.20	0.00	PCLA

			Pag	e 184 of 324
	Draft Objection to Former Wife's Motion for Appointment of Guardian Ad Litem	0.60	75.00	PCLA
03-11	Begin preparations for Status Conference/Motion Hearing with gathering of exhibits of prior hearing on Motion for Contempt regarding Former Wife's failure to turn-over Riley in April 2010 reorganize and update bullet points	0.80	100.00	PCLA
Dec-05-11	N/C - Attempts to contact Dr. Panaccione's office assistant to request copy of signed Non-Subpoena Agreement and leave detailed messages	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's review, make minor revision to Objection to Former Wife's Subpoena and finalize for filing and copy to Judge Maxwell	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's review, amend Objection to Former Wife's Motion for Appointment of Guardian Ad Litem	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	Telephone conference with Dr. Panaccione's office manager regarding request for "order" specific to Dr. Panaccione in order to provide report for December 9, 2011 Status Conference, third request for signed Non-Subpoena Agreement, and additional request for Subpoena for hearing issued by Mr. Orth	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Begin review of information from several months ago to prepare for upcoming hearing; check on status of materials being worked on by paralegal and provide instruction regarding materials to be available for Court and timeline information; instruction regarding packets to be prepared for issues; review of additional information from second Motion for Contempt to inform Court of wife's previous actions; work on objection on Guardian Ad Litem issue on the basis of previous professional reviews and costs; provide instruction to paralegal for preparation materials for review by client for meeting later this week	1.00	350.00	BWR
Dec-06-11	Follow-up telephone conference with Dr. Panaccione's office requesting signed Non-Subpoena Agreement and Subpoena status	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Update Timeline and exhibits for Motion for Contempt for Ms. Casey's failure to turn-over Riley on April 18, 2011; prepare Examination Questions for Ms. Casey	2.10	262.50	PCLA
(_/ :	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding preparations for upcoming Status Conference/Motion Hearing	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Prepare document of Riley's status since April 12th, including activities, school, and health; telephone conference with Mr. Michaud; prepare exhibits of school reports since April 20, 2011	0.60	75.00	PCLA

Prepare items to be clarified at hearing including scope of Riley's therapy and timeline, timeline of Mr. Michaud's therapy, and where therapists are to forward reports; prepare itemization of issues to requested to be included in order on December 9, 2011 Status Conference, including therapy matters, restricting Ms. Casey from contact with teachers, therapists, and doctors, Mr. Michaud to have authority to advise teachers, doctor regarding Ms. Casey's conduct, find Former Wife in contempt for violation of orders, and specific language the Ms. Casey not seek change in jurisdiction to South Carolina or file additional reports	0.70	Pag€ 87.50	e 185 of 324 PCLA
Review transcript of March 4, 2011 hearing and Dr. Day's report regarding parenting coordinator and guardian ad litem; prepare notes for Status Conference/Hearing regarding Former Husband's opposition to appointment of guardian ad litem	0.40	50.00	PCLA
N/C - Conference with Patti Cain regarding emergency hearing regarding subpoena; conference with Mr. Rossway and Patti Cain regarding strategy for emergency hearing	0.50	0.00	KMR
Draft Examination Questions for Ms. Casey regarding February and June 2011 Reports to DCF and BCSD; prepare exhibits and orders regarding these reports, including doctor and emergency room records	1.90	237.50	PCLA
Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud for timeline of Riley's therapy with Dr. Williamson and note for inclusion in timeline to be prepared regarding Ms. Casey's interference in Riley's therapy	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Return call to Dr. Panaccione's office manager regarding status of their requested order specifically naming Dr. Panaccione to release report to the Court, and hearing to be held on December 8th at the Judge request to determine if Dr. Panaccione is to testify	0.20	25.00	PCLA
N/C - Telephone conference with Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant requesting 10:00 a.m. hearing on December 8, 2011 on Subpoena and Objection to Subpoena; advise Mr. Rossway; additional e-mail to Judicial Assistant; attempt to contact Mr. Orth's office and leave message; e-mail from and to Mr. Orth's assistant confirming hearing	0.30	0.00	PCLA
N/C - Office conference with Mr. Rossway and Mr. Rollin regarding hearing on Subpoena and Objection to Subpoena	0.30	0.00	PCLA
Prepare extensive Timeline for Christopher Casey's reporting to Brevard County Sheriff's Department in and Ms. Casey's report to the Department of Children and Families in June 20, 11 with review of DCF and BCSD's reports; start initial timeline of Mother's interference in Riley's therapy to include report to DCF correlates to	3.40	425.00	PCLA

Dec-07-11

25.00

0.20

PCLA

Page 186 of 324

testing and statements by Riley at June 29th therapy session; review transcript of March 4, 2011 hearing for reference by Mr. Orth or Ms. Casey to on-going investigation in Florida as reported by Mr. Casey; review Order and include specific language of violations by Ms. Casey on Timeline		Pag	e 186 of 3
Review file, notes, and objection to subpoena to prepare for emergency hearing	0.50	87.50	KMR
Attend emergency hearing regarding objection to subpoena	0.30	52.50	KMR
Prepare all proposed exhibits, bullet points, pleadings and orders for Mr. Rossway's pre-hearing office conference with Mr. Michaud; attend meeting and records additional information for hearing; post-meeting with Mr. Rossway for organization of all evidence/exhibits and documents for December 9th Status Conference/Motion Hearing	1.30	162.50	PCLA
N/C - Attempt to contact court reporter for status of the transcription of the CD of the Massachusetts' April 19, 2011 hearing; additional telephone call and e-mail	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Prepare additional examination questions for Former Wife regarding interference with Dr. Panaccione's therapy with Riley pursuant to pre-hearing meeting with Mr. Michaud and Mr. Rossway	1.10	137.50	PCLA
With review of all orders, transcript of March 4, 2011 hearing and exhibits, prepare extensive Timeline of Riley's therapy with Dr. Panaccione; include specific Orders and language regarding Former Wife violations; Court's orders in the Interim Order and Order on Emergency Change in Timesharing; prepare exhibits for contempt regarding Former Wife's interference in therapy	1.70	212.50	PCLA
Review all e-mails between Ms. Casey and Mr. Michaud, and with Dr. Panaccione regarding therapy; separate e-mails as exhibits of an abusive nature from Ms. Casey to Mr. Michaud	0.70	87.50	PCLA
N/C - Attend hearing with Mr. Rollin on Ms. Casey's Subpoena for Hearing to Dr. Panaccione and record Judge's ruling and Attorney Orth's statements regarding withdrawing of Subpoena due to financial cost of testimony of Dr. Panaccione and that the Doctor's testimony was to refute Mr. Michaud's Motion for Contempt regarding Ms. Casey's interference in Riley's therapy	0.30	0.00	PCLA

Office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding Dr.

regarding report on progress of Riley's therapy; pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, telephone conference with

Williamson's request to speak with Mr. Rossway

Dec-08-11

Page 187 of 324

Dr. Williamson to provide Mr. Rossway's advise that a report be prepared after additional therapy unless court requires earlier submission of a status report, and Mr. Rossway's intent to advise Court of Dr. Williamson's cooperation to provide a report at the Court's convenience and due to Mr. Michaud signing a HIPPA release		Pag	e 187 of 32
N/C - Receipt of e-mailed proposed Order on Object on to Subpoena and provide to Mr. Rossway for review and approval	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Telephone conferences and e-mails with Mr. Michaud for assistance with timelines for contempt and therapy issues	0.30	37.50	PCLA
Receipt of Mr. Michaud e-mail with correspondence from Riley's teacher; e-mail to Mr. Michaud	0.10	12.50	PCLA
N/C - Office conference with Mr. Rossway for review of status of preparations for December 9, 2011 Status Conference, including therapists providing reports	0.30	0.00	PCLA
Preparation for three-hour evidentiary hearing and Case Management Conference; receive information from associate regarding court's ruling on hearing successfully accepting position of former husband; review extensive evidentiary packets with paralegal; attend and participate in client preparation meeting; evening review of case pleadings	1.50	525.00	BWR
Early morning hearing preparations with Mr. Rossway; telephone conference with court reporter regarding delivery of CD of Massachusetts hearing; organize all exhibits upon Mr. Rossway's final review	0.80	100.00	PCLA
N/C - Travel to Melbourne Courthouse for Status Conference/Motion Hearing	0.90	0.00	PCLA
Attend Status Conference/Motion Hearing and assist with exhibits and record proceedings, prepare list of items to be clarified by Judge regarding therapy, contempt, trial, pre-trial, attorney's fees, release of therapy records, Former Wife possession of Dr. Day's Report, and record all items to be included in proposed Order on Status Conference	3.40	425.00	PCLA
N/C - Travel back to Vero Beach from hearing	0.90	0.00	PCLA
Very early morning final review of entire evidentiary file; review bullet points and notes in preparation for arguments; prepare anticipation responses to arguments to be made from other side; review evidence packet and materials to discuss with Mr. Michaud; meet with paralegal to review and confirm completeness of file, documents, legal issues and information	1.20	420.00	BWR

Dec-09-11

invoice #:

<i>p</i>	N/C - Travel to Melbourne Courthouse	0.90	Page _{0.00}	e 188 of 324 BWR
	Meeting with client; attend extensive hearing with Judge Maxwell; provide information to Court; oversight and input to Court in court proceeding and specific case management issues discussed with the Judge in the courtroom and separate meeting and discussions after trial had been reviewed by the Judge and during the period of time that the mother was meeting with the child; discussions with client, witnesses, etc.; provide instruction to paralegal regarding preparation of extensive Order of Court	3.40	1,190.00	BWR
	N/C - Return to Vero Beach	0.90	0.00	BWR
Dec-10-11	N/C - Reorganize file for pre-trial hearing in February 2012	0.40	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - E-mail to Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant to request two hour pre-trial hearing in February 2012 pursuant to the Judge's directions at the December 9, 2011 Status Conference	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Dec-12-11	Work on Order and issues relating to threatening e-mail; review letter prepared by paralegal and authorize	0.20	70.00	BWR
	N/C - Receipt and review of e-mails from and to Mr. Michaud regarding December 11, 2011 abusive e-mail from Ms. Casey to Ms. Marto; office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding correspondence to Attorney Orth with copy of e-mail and advise of motion to be filed restricting Ms. Casey all contact with minor child	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Draft correspondence to Attorney Orth regarding offensive e-mail sent to Ms. Marto	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Begin draft of basic initial Order on December Status Conference and Motion Hearing	0.60	75.00	PCLA
Dec-13-11	Continue drafting Order on December 9, 2011 Status Conference regarding "Findings of Facts" with review of hearing notes	1.40	175.00	PCLA
	N/C - Receipt and review of complete e-mail thread from Aimee Casey to Amy Marto from December 11 and 12, 2011; advise Mr. Rossway	0.10	0.00	PCLA
•	N/C - Additional e-mail to Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant regarding pre-trial hearing dates in February 2012 with curtsey copy to Attorney Orth's assistant	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Telephone conference with Attorney Orth's paralegal regarding status of Order on Status Conference, contact with appellate attorneys, and other matters; office	0.40	50.00	PCLA

Page 189 of 324

<u> </u>	conference with Mr. Rossway to advise of Attorney Orth's intent to withdraw and threat Ms. Casey made about Mr. Michaud		гау	e 109 01 3
	N/C - Work on threat issue	0.20	0.00	BWR
Dec-14-11	N/C - Short office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding correspondence to Attorney Orth regarding Ms. Casey's threat	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Draft portion of Order on December 9, 2011 Status Conference regarding "Ordered and Adjudged" with review of hearing notes pending transcript of Judge's Ruling	1.70	212.50	PCLA
	N/C - With approval of Mr. Michaud, telephone conference with King Reporting to order Judge Maxwell's rulings from the December 9, 2011 Status Conference	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Con-	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud with request to contact Dr. Williamson for a written opinion regarding Riley's therapy for providing to the Court as soon as possible, and discussion regarding Ms. Casey's abusive conduct and Mr. Orth's intent to withdraw from case again	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	Upon review by Mr. Rossway, amend proposed Order on December 9, 2011 Status Conference	0.40	50.00	PCLA
	Work on issue regarding potential threat against client; work on issues regarding Order; further drafting in Order and additional direction to paralegal regarding information to be prepared	0.50	175.00	BWR
Dec-15-11	N/C - Office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding Mr. Michaud's concerns with Mrs. Casey's actions and threats	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - E-mails to and from Attorney Orth's paralegal requesting response to proposed pre-trial conference dates; e-mail to Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant to confirm February 10, 2012 hearing	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Draft Notice of Pre-Trial Conference	0.20	25.00	PCLA
f	E-mail from and to Mr. Michaud regarding Mrs. Casey's threats and Mr. Rossway research into best avenue to address the issue	0.10	12.50	PCLA
	N/C - Additional office conference with Mr. Rossway for further discussion regarding Mrs. Casey's threats to Amy Marto and Mr. Michaud and information received from Attorney Orth's paralegal	0.20	0.00	PCLA

	Attend telephone conference with Mr. Rossway and Mr. Michaud regarding proceeding to address Mrs. Casey threats	0.40	Page 50.00	190 of 324 PCLA
	N/C - Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, e-mail to Attorney Orth's paralegal attaching draft proposed Order on December 9, 2011 Status Conference and Motion Hearing and advise that transcript of hearing pending and request Mr. Orth's comments	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Research rules of professional conduct regarding disclosure of death threat; telephone conference with ethics attorney Gail Ferguson; research case law regarding death threats not being privileged	0.40	70.00	KMR
	Continue work on situation regarding potential threat made against Mr. Michaud; provide instruction to associate; provide instruction to paralegal; provide information regarding drafting of demand	0.50	175.00	BWR
	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud	0.10	35.00	BWR
Dec-16-11	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, draft follow-up correspondence to Attorney Orth regarding Mr. Rossway's attempts to reach Attorney Orth regarding Ms. Casey's improper behavior, inappropriate e-mails to Ms. Marto, and threats regarding Mr. Michaud	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	N/C - Draft correspondence to Mr. Michaud enclosing King Reporting's invoice for their attendance at the December 9, 2011 hearing	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Review Rule regarding Temporary Injunctive Relief; pursuant to Mr. Rossway's initial review, amend correspondence to Attorney Orth regarding threats by Mrs. Casey	0.40	50.00	PCLA
	Leave voicemail message for opposing counsel; receive voicemail from opposing counsel; receive e-mail from opposing counsel; telephone conference with Mr. Michaud	0.30	105.00	BWR
Dec-19-11	N/C - Review Mr. Orth's e-mail to Mr. Rossway regarding Mrs. Casey's threats; office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding follow-up correspondence to Mr. Orth to request confirmation of reporting threat to the Bar and reminder to contact Mrs. Casey's appellate attorneys regarding Dr. Day's report; e-mail to Mr. Michaud to advise of Mr. Orth's e-mail	0.30	0.00	PCLA
	Work on death threat situation; work on issue regarding disclosure of Court Order privileged information to third parties regarding appellate proceeding; work on strategy to provide information and to seek to provide additional protection for Mr. Michaud	0.40	140.00	BWR

invoice #:

			Page	191 of 324
Dec-21-11	Receipt and review of Excerpt of December 9, 2011 Hearing with Judge's rulings	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	Receipt and review of Attorney Orth's e-mail regarding requested change to proposed Order regarding "if" Mrs. Casey's attorney had the Dr. Day Report not "who" provided it; advise Mr. Rossway	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Review Appendix to Initial Brief and Appellant's Initial Brief; draft correspondence to Attorney Orth clarifying the Judge's ruling and directives pursuant to the Expert of the Hearing, Mrs. Casey first admission of having the Report and later retraction, request to contact appellant attorneys again as their documents include Dr. Day's Report and they should know who provided it to them	0.60	75.00	PCLA
	Copy and highlight the Excerpt of the December 9, 2011 hearing and Appendix to Initial Brief for providing to Attorney Orth as clarification that Brownstone, P.A. did have Dr. Day's Report and the proposed Order should not be changed	0.30	37.50	PCLA
Dec-22-11	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's review, amend and finalize correspondence to Mr. Orth regarding proposed Order, Dr. Day's report in the hands of Mrs. Casey's appellant attorneys, and specific language of Mrs. Casey's threat	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	N/C - Mail and scan and e-mail Mr. Orth December 19, 2011 correspondence Mr. Rossway's December 22, 2011 response to Mr. Michaud; scan, fax, and mail Mr. Rossway December 22, 2011 response to Mr. Orth; receipt of e-mail from Attorney Orth's paralegal regarding receipt of correspondence	0.30	0.00	PCLA
Dec-27-11	Research case law regarding injunction in light of "death threat"	0.40	70.00	KMR
	N/C - Office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding moving forward with threat issues and appellate attorney's possession of Dr. Day's report and Attorney Orth refusal to contact Mrs. Casey's appellate attorney's further to obtain how they received the Report	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - E-mail to Attorney Orth's paralegal requesting status on approval of the proposed Order	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Receipt and review of Attorney Orth's e-mail advising that he would not be contacting Mrs. Casey's appellate attorney's further pursuant to his interpretation of the Court's orders at the December 9, 2011 hearing and review of the transcript of the hearing	0.10	0.00	BWR
	Draft correspondence to Judge Maxwell enclosing our proposed Order on December 9, 2011 Status Conference and advising that Mr. Orth will be providing the Former Wife's proposed Order, and providing Mr. Orth's objections to the proposed order that he determine	0.90	112.50	PCLA

	"how" Mrs. Casey's appellate attorneys obtained Dr. Day's Report; prepare copies of the Excerpt, Appellant's Index to Initial Brief, and Attorney Orth's correspondence for providing to Judge Maxwell		Page	192 of 324
	N/C - Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's review, make minor amendments to correspondence to Judge Maxwell and finalize attachments and proposed Order as enclosures	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Meet with paralegal and work on orders; work on response to Attorney Orth regarding withdrawal before getting to the bottom of information regarding leaks; report to appellate attorneys; provide input to associate regarding Motion for Injunction to protect Mr. Michaud from potential domestic violence and/or threats of death; review order to Court and letter to Judge prepared by paralegal	0.30	105.00	BWR
	N/C - Receipt and review of Attorney Orth's Motion for Leave to Withdraw	0.10	0.00	BWR
Dec-28-11	Research law regarding remedy for death threat; cross reference statutes regarding domestic violence and injunctions; research case law regarding injunction for fear of immanent harm; research case law regarding injunction for repeat violence including harassment and death threats	1.70	297.50	KMR
	Begin drafting Motion for Court to require Former Wife's appellate attorneys to disclose how they came into possession of Dr. Day's Report	0.40	50.00	PCLA
Dec-29-11	N/C - Attempt to contact Mr. Michaud and leave message; e-mail to Mr. Michaud	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Dec-30-11	Research ability to bring petition for injunction before family court judge as opposed to other judge	1.00	175.00	KMR
	Draft petition for protection against stalking, harassment, and death threats	3.20	560.00	KMR
	E-mail and telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding Mrs. Casey not contacting Riley, and provide status of preparations of injunction motion and motion to require appellate attorney's to disclose how they obtained Dr. Day's report	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Receipt of e-mails from Attorney Orth's paralegal regarding Mr. Rossway's proposed Order and e-mail to Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant advising of Mr. Orth one objection to Order; e-mail to Ms. Bailey advising that proposed Order was forwarded to Judge Maxwell on December 29, 2011 with Mr. Orth's objection and Mr. Rossway's cover letter, proposed Order, and attachments was faxed and mailed to Attorney Orth on December 29, 2011	0.10	12.50	PCLA

Dec-31-11	Saturday work on Verified Petition for Injunction for Protection Against arrest and Stalking and Death Threats prepared by associate; review correction to allegations to present to Judge Maxwell for a hearing within Family Court rather than domestic violence process	0.30	Pag 105.00	e 193 of 324 BWR
Jan-04-12	20% Courtesy write off per BWR		-1,824.50	BWR
	Totals	62.10	\$7,298.00	

DISBURSEMEN	ΓS	Disbursements	Receipts
Dec-01-11	Photocopies	0.20	
	Telephone Charges	0.10	
	Telephone Charges	1.30	
	Postage	0.88	
	Postage	0.44	
Dec-02-11	Photocopies	0.40	
	Facsimile Charges	5.00	
	Telephone Charges	0.90	
	Postage	0.44	
Dec-05-11	Photocopies	2.00	
	Photocopies	0.10	
	Facsimile Charges	4.00	
	Telephone Charges	0.20	
	Telephone Charges	0.20	
	Postage	1.32	
	Postage	1.76	
Dec-06-11	Photocopies	0.10	
	Facsimile Charges	5.00	
	Facsimile Charges	3.00	
Dec-07-11	Telephone Charges	1.00	
	Telephone Charges	1.10	
	Telephone Charges	0.30	
	Telephone Charges	0.20	

		myoice #:	02308	
	Telephone Charges		0.20	Page 194 of 324
Dec-08-11	Photocopies		0.80	
<u></u>	Photocopies		4.90	
<u> </u>	Photocopies		5.40	
	Photocopies		0.10	
	Telephone Charges		0.30	
	Telephone Charges		0.20	
	Telephone Charges		0.50	
Dec-09-11	Photocopies		2.80	
	Photocopies		0.10	
	Photocopies		1.20	
Dec-12-11	Photocopies		0.40	
	Facsimile Charges		3.00	
	Postage		0.44	
	Postage		0.44	
7	Postage		0.44	
13-11	Telephone Charges		2.30	
Dec-14-11	Telephone Charges		2.50	
Dec-15-11	Telephone Charges		1.60	
	Westlaw Online Research Access		20.00	
Dec-16-11	Photocopies		0.10	
	Photocopies		0.40	
	Photocopies		0.20	
	Photocopies		0.20	
	Facsimile Charges		2.00	
	Facsimile Charges		2.00	
	Telephone Charges		0.20	
	Telephone Charges		0.20	
	Postage		1.76	
	Postage		0.88	
Dec-21-11	Photocopies		3.80	

		mvoice #:	02308	
Dec-22-11	Photocopies		5.00	Page 195 of 324
	Facsimile Charges		5.00	J
e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e	Facsimile Charges		18.00	
\	Facsimile Charges		26.00	
	Postage		3.36	
	Postage		0.44	
Dec-27-11	Photocopies		0.60	
	Westlaw Online Research Access		30.00	
	Postage		4.00	
Dec-28-11	Westlaw Online Research Access		35.00	
Dec-29-11	Telephone Charges		0.20	
Dec-30-11	Westlaw Online Research Access		50.00	
Jan-04-12	20% Courtesy Write	-	53.38	
	Totals	\$2	13.52	\$0.00
	Current Fees & Disbursements			\$7,511.52
	Previous Balance			\$2,874.76
	Previous Payments			\$0.00
	BALANCE DUE		nga galancia and	\$10,386.28

ROSSWAY MOORE SWAN, P.L. THE MODERN ONE BUILDING 2101 INDIAN RIVER BOULEVARD, SUITE 200 VERO BEACH, FL 32960 Telephone (772) 231-4440 Facsimile (772) 231-4430

Mr. Timothy Michaud 1791 Wekiva Drive Melbourne, FL 32940

February 3, 2012

File #: 1682-001 Inv. #: 62994

Total Due:

\$699.27

RE: Post-judgment issues

Please write the FILE number on your check to insure proper crediting.

SUMMARY

*Balance Fwd:

\$10,386.28

Payment received:

Current Invoice Amount:

\$10,386.28)

\$699.27

TOTAL DUE:

\$699.27

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	ATT'Y/L.A.
Jan-03-12	Work on motion review materials prepared by paralegal and associate	0.40	140.00	BWR
Jan-04-12	E-mail Mr. Michaud regarding contacting Dr. Williamson for letter setting out therapy for Riley and timeline for therapy as required by Judge Maxwell at December 9, 2011 hearing	0.10	12.50	PCLA
	N/C - Draft cover letter to Mr. Michaud enclosing RMTS' December 2011 Invoice	0.30	0.00	PCLA
Jan-05-12	E-mails from and to Mr. Michaud regarding Dr. Williamson's statement on Riley's therapy and advise Mr. Michaud that the proposed Order on December 9, 2011 Status Conference was sent to the Judge	0.10	12.50	PCLA
Jan-09-12	Amend Petition for Injunction into Motion format for filing and copy to Judge Maxwell and finalize for review by Mr. Rossway	1.60	200.00	PCLA

Jan-10-12	N/C - Receipt of e-mail from Attorney Orth's office to Judge Maxwell requesting hearing dates for his Motion	0.10	Page _{0.00}	197 of 324 PCLA
	to Withdraw and to attend telephonically			
Jan-11-12	N/C - Receipt of e-mail from Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant with hearing date and requirement to attend hearing in person on Attorney Orth's Motion to Withdraw, e-mail from Attorney Orth's assistant requesting date for hearing, and e-mail to Attorney Orth's assistant with copy to Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant to advise of Mr. Rossway's pre-schedule appointments and hearing on proposed dates and Mr. Rossway out of town and unable to move items to schedule hearing	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Additional e-mail from and to Attorney Orth's assistant again advising that Mr. Rossway is out until January 17, 2012 and a response to objection to Mr. Orth's withdraw or setting a hearing will need to wait for his return	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Jan-12-12	Amend Motion for Injunction pursuant to attorney's review	0.50	62.50	PCLA
Jan-18-12	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, e-mail Attorney Orth's assistant with Mr. Rossway's request that a hearing be set on Attorney Orth's Motion to Withdraw	0.10	12.50	PCLA
	N/C - Open new Correspondence - Volume 6; update Pleading file	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	E-mail from Attorney Orth's assistant regarding hearing dates; e-mail to Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant regarding status of Order on December 6, 2011 Status Conference	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Jan-23-12	N/C - Draft correspondence to Mr. Michaud regarding past due King Reporting invoice	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Jan-25-12	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding review of Motion for Injunction, preparing Motion to Compel appellate attorney to disclose from whom they obtained Dr. Day's Report, and Mr. Michaud's request that portion of transcript of December 9ith hearing be provided to Dr. Williamson	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	N/C - Scan and e-mail Motion for Injunction and Transcript Excerpt of December 9, 2011 hearing to Mr. Michaud	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Jan-27-12	N/C - Telephone conference with Mr. Rossway; telephone conference with Mr. Michaud to relay that Dr. Day inquired about Riley, and short discussion regarding changes to Motion for Injunction	0.20	0.00	PCLA

	Discussion with Dr. Day	0.20	Pag _{70.00}	e 198 of 324 BWR
29-12	Review materials for motions to be filed with the Court for upcoming hearing; review materials prepared by paralegal; authorize completion and final format for filing early next week	0.40	140.00	BWR
Jan-31-12	Revise Motion for Injunction pursuant to Mr. Michaud's review	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	Initial drafting of Motion Compelling Appellate Attorney's to Disclose How Report was Obtained regarding background information	0.80	100.00	PCLA
	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud explaining requested injunctive relief in Motion, discussion regarding Mrs. Casey possible non-appearance at the February 10th hearing, and issue to be heard at the hearing regarding Dr. Day's report and Former Wife's appellate attorneys, and entry of the proposed Order from December 9, 2011 Status Conference	0.40	50.00	PCLA
	Review, refine, and approve verified motion	0.10	35.00	BWR
	Totals	6.80	\$922.50	

DISBURSEMENT	TS .	Disbursements	Receipts
Jan-31-12	Over payment of invoices		228.72
Jan-05-12	Photocopies	0.10	
	Postage	0.84	
Jan-23-12	Photocopies	0.20	
	Postage	0.45	
Jan-25-12	Telephone Charges	1.20	
Jan-27-12	Telephone Charges	0.30	
Jan-31-12	Telephone Charges	2.40	
		CALL PROPERTY OF THE PROPERTY	
	Totals	\$5.49	\$228.72

Invoice #: 62994

| Page 199 of 324 | S699.27 | S699.27 | Previous Balance | \$10,386.28 | Previous Payments | \$10,386.28 | S699.27 | S

ROSSWAY MOORE SWAN, P.L. THE MODERN ONE BUILDING 2101 INDIAN RIVER BOULEVARD, SUITE 200 VERO BEACH, FL 32960 Telephone (772) 231-4440 Facsimile (772) 231-4430

Mr. Timothy Michaud 1791 Wekiva Drive Melbourne, FL 32940

March 1, 2012

File #: 1682-001 Inv. #: 63358

114. 11. 0555

Total Due:

\$4,095.37

RE: Post-judgment issues

Please write the FILE number on your check to insure proper crediting.

SUMMARY

*Balance Fwd:

\$699.27

Payment received:

\$0.00)

Current Invoice Amount:

\$3,396.10

TOTAL DUE:

\$4,095.37

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	ATT'Y/L.A.
Feb-01-12	Office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding appellate attorneys motion, pending order, and preparations for hearing	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's review, amend Petition for Injunction and finalize for review and signature of Mr. Michaud	0.40	50.00	PCLA
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, draft Motion to Compel regarding Former Wife's appellate attorneys possession of Dr. Day's report	1.20	150.00	PCLA
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, draft Motion for Determination and Entry of Order on December 9, 2011 Status Conference/Motion Hearing	0.70	87.50	PCLA
	Amend Notice of Hearing to include Motion for Injunction, Motion to Compel, and Motion for Determination and Entry of Order	0.20	25.00	PCLA

Feb-02-12	Telephone conference with Dr. Edwards regarding his providing a report on Mr. Michaud's counseling; review Court orders for clarification on who Dr. Edwards is to provide his report - whether directly to Court or via Mr. Rossway; e-mail Dr. Edwards the address for delivery of counseling records to Judge Maxwell	0.40	Pag 50.00	e 201 of 324 PCLA
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's review, amend Motion to Compel to include certificate of service to appellate attorneys	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	N/C - Attempt to contact Mr. Michaud and leave message for return call regarding status of signing the Motion for Injunction	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Prepare exhibits to Motion to Compel	0.40	50.00	PCLA
Feb-03-12	Short office conference with Mr. Michaud for signing Petition for Injunction and advise motions to be heard on February 10, 2012	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	N/C - Prepare (4) copies of Motion for Injunction, Motion to Compel, Motion for Determination, and Notice of Hearing for filing	0.50	0.00	PCLA
-06-12	Review materials from opposing counsel; provide direction and input regarding materials for extensive two hour hearing set by the court; begin reviewing file for hearing	0.40	140.00	BWR
Feb-07-12	Office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding Attorney Orth's correspondence to Judge Maxwell to appear via telephone for his Motion to Withdraw, Former Wife's Motion for Continuance filed as pro se, and issues to be addressed at Pre-Trial hearing and hearing preparations, and to contact Mr. Michaud's appellate attorney for status of appeal	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	N/C - Telephone conference with Appellate Attorney Matheson for update on status of appeal; advise Mr. Rossway	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Scan and e-mail Attorney Orth's correspondence of February 6, 2012 to Judge Maxwell, and Former Wife's Motion to Continue and Response to Mr. Michaud	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - File maintenance - update pleading and correspondence files	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Organization of motions and exhibits for Pre-Trial and Motion Hearing scheduled for February 10, 2012; begin drafting summary of all Motions pending to be heard	0.60	75.00	PCLA

Feb-08-12	Continue working on preparations for hearing regarding Bullet Points for hearing and questions and exhibits for pending Motions; review Orders and prepare questions of compliance	2.60	Page 325.00	202 of 324 PCLA
	Prepare file, motions and exhibits for Mr. Rossway's pre-hearing meeting with Mr. Michaud	0.40	50.00	PCLA
Feb-09-12	N/C - Short office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding status of hearing preparations	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Receipt of past due King Reporting invoices; scan and e-mail to Mr. Michaud; telephone conference with Mr. Michaud to advise of priority of payment in light of court reporter's schedule appearance at February 10, 2012 hearing	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, draft Bullet Points for Pre-Trial Conference for providing to the Court, including outstanding motions and summary, issues to be addressed at trial, and expert witnesses	0.80	100.00	PCLA
	Attend pre-trial meeting with Mr. Rossway and Mr. Rossway and note additional preparations for the hearing, and for trial	0.80	100.00	PCLA
6.	Amend Bullet Points for Trial to include Former Wife's rehabilitation/reunification plan and retroactive child support; prepare copies of exhibits; prepare Notice of Filing Transcript of December 9, 2012 Ruling; review orders for all that denote sealing of Dr. Day's Report	1.30	162.50	PCLA
	Office conference with Mr. Michaud to discuss and prepare for Court Ordered evidentiary hearing; review and prepare for potential issues that may be raised; review motions, testimony, evidence, etc.	0.80	280.00	BWR
Feb-10-12	Early morning preparations for hearing, continued research of all orders for reference to sealing Dr. Day's Report	0.40	50.00	PCLA
	N/C - Travel to Melbourne Courthouse for pre-trial conference and motion hearing	0.80	0.00	PCLA
	Attend motion hearing and pre-trial conference and record Court rulings and assist with exhibits	2.40	300.00	PCLA
	N/C - Return to Vero Beach from Melbourne Courthouse	0.90	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Travel to Melbourne Florida to the Courthouse	0.80	0.00	BWR
	Meet with Mr. Michaud; discussions with opposing counsel regarding his motion to withdraw and evidentiary matters; attend and participate in	2.40	840.00	BWR

Page 203 of 324

motions before the Court; take testimony of opposing counsel regarding threats against Mr. Michaud; participate in hearing with Court and client regarding numerous issues including setting case for trial, mother's contemptuous actions and related information; receive trial court's specific instructions on the record regarding bringing case to conclusion for finality; receive additional instruction from Court on proceedings; order portion of record
bringing case to conclusion for finality; receive additional instruction from Court on proceedings; order

	N/C - Return to Vero Beach	0.90	0.00	BWR
Feb-13-12	Begin work on orders of the Court based upon extensive hearing on Friday	0.30	105.00	BWR
Feb-17-12	N/C - E-mail to King Reporting court reporter requesting February 10, 2012 hearing transcript	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Work on orders; approve ordering of transcript for completeness etc.	0.30	105.00	BWR
Feb-20-12	Work on extensive issues for extensive order from last hearing; provide instruction to paralegal regarding extensive drafting of issues and to confirm issues upon receipt of transcript of judge's order	0.40	140.00	BWR
21-12	Receipt of Transcript of Hearing from February 10, 2012 and begin drafting Order on Pre-Trial Hearing	0.40	50.00	PCLA
Feb-28-12	N/C - Review e-mail from Mr. Michaud; telephone call to client and leave voicemail	0.10	0.00	BWR
	Totals	23.70	\$3,360.00	

DISBURSEMENTS		Disbursements	Receipts
Feb-02-12	Telephone Charges	0.20	•
Feb-03-12	Photocopies	4.40	
	Photocopies	6.20	
	Facsimile Charges	13.00	
	Telephone Charges	0.20	
	Postage	9.25	
Feb-07-12	Telephone Charges	1.50	
9-12	Postage	1.35	

Totals	\$36.10	Page 204 of 324 \$0.00
Current Fees & Disbursements	_	\$3,396.10
Previous Balance		\$699.27
Previous Payments		\$0.00

BALANCE DUE

invoice #:

63338

\$4,095.37

ROSSWAY MOORE SWAN, P.L. THE MODERN ONE BUILDING 2101 INDIAN RIVER BOULEVARD, SUITE 200 VERO BEACH, FL 32960 Telephone (772) 231-4440 Facsimile (772) 231-4430

Mr. Timothy Michaud 1791 Wekiva Drive Melbourne, FL 32940

April 9, 2012

File #: 1682-001 Inv. #: 64056

Total Due:

\$6,326.12

RE: Post-judgment issues

Please write the FILE number on your check to insure proper crediting.

SUMMARY

*Balance Fwd:

\$4,095.37

Payment received:

Φ4,0/3.37

Current Invoice Amount:

\$0.00) \$2,230.75

TOTAL DUE:

\$6,326.12

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	ATT'Y/L.A.
Mar-02-12	N/C - Correspondence to Mr. Michaud enclosing King Reporting invoice for February 10, 2012 hearing and transcript of Judge's ruling	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Mar-05-12	E-mail from and to Mr. Michaud regarding trial dates	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	N/C - Follow-up e-mails with Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant for earlier trial dates; e-mail to Mr. Michaud to advise of August 1, 2, and 3, 2012 trial; advise Mr. Rossway	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Mar-06-12	N/C - Attempt to contact Mr. Michaud	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding trial, pending appeal, and Ms. Casey's continued non-contact with Riley, and job opportunity	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Review transcript of February 10, 2012 hearing for Judge's ruling on amendments to December 9, 2012	0.60	75.00	PCLA

proposed Order on December 9, 2011 Status Conference and Motion Hearing		Page	e 206 of 324
Review proposed Order on December 9, 2011 Status Conference regarding the Court's requested amendments at the February 10, 2012 hearing; short office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding amendments to proposed Order; amend Order to include subsequent findings of fact and ruling by the court on February 10, 2012 regarding Former Wife's appellate attorney's and their possession of Dr. Day's Report	0.80	100.00	PCLA
Begin drafting Findings of Facts to proposed Order Denying Former Wife's Motion to Continue and Response to Former Husband's Verified Motion for Injunction for Protection Against Harassment, Stalking, and Death Threats	0.50	62.50	PCLA
Begin review of Order Denying former wife's Motion to Continue and Order Granting former husband's Verified Motion for Injunction for Protection Against Harassment, Stalking, and Death Threats	0.40	140.00	BWR
N/C - Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's review, make minor amendment to Order on December 9, 2011 Status Conference and Motion Hearing and finalize for forwarding to Judge Maxwell	0.10	0.00	PCLA
N/C - Draft correspondence to Judge Maxwell enclosing proposed Order on December 9, 2011 Status Conference	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Continue final drafting of Order Denying Former Wife's Motion to Continue	0.70	87.50	PCLA
N/C - E-mail to Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant regarding a pre-trial order and timelines set by Judge Maxwell for disclosure of expert witnesses and discovery cut-off	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, begin drafting Order Granting Former Husband's Motion for Injunction for Protect on Against Harassment, Stalking, and Death Threats; research required language for injunctive relief for inclusion in Order	2.10	262.50	PCLA
Begin drafting Order on Pre-Trial Conference	0.60	75.00	PCLA
N/C - E-mail to Mr. Michaud reschedule his telephone call with Mr. Rossway	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, draft extensive Order on Pre-Trial Order with review of transcript of February 10, 2012 hearing	1.80	225.00	PCLA

Mar-07-12

Mar-08-12

	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway, begin drafting Former Husband's Motion for Court to Take Judicial Notice and proposed Order Granting Former Husband's Motion Court to Take Judicial Notice regarding Dr. Day's Report, Dr. Day's testimony at March 4, 2011 hearing, Dr. Edwards report, and Dr. Williamson's report	0.80	_{100.00} age	207 _P of 324
	Begin review of additional two orders prepared in draft form from previous hearing	0.30	105.00	BWR
Mar-09-12	Review and refine four orders; provide information to paralegal	0.40	140.00	BWR
Mar-12-12	N/C - Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's request, reschedule Mr. Michaud telephone call with Mr. Rossway to March 16, 2012	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's review, make revisions to Order on February 10, 2012 Pre-Trial Conference, Order Granting Former Husband's Motion for Injunction, Order Denying Former Wife's Motion to Continue, and Order on February 10, 2012 Pre-Trial Conference	0.80	100.00	PCLA
Mar-14-12	Complete extensive review, corrections, and additions to four specific extensive Court Orders to be sent to the Court on Friday; further refine orders to accurately reflect intent of Court; review of transcript information with paralegal	1.00	350.00	BWR
Mar-15-12	N/C - Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's reviews, make amends to and refine Order Granting Former Husband's Verified Motion for Injunction and Entry of Order of Temporary Injunction	0.70	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Draft correspondence to Judge Maxwell enclosing proposed amended Order on December 9, 2012 Status Conference and Motion Hearing with explanation of revisions	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Draft correspondence to Judge Maxwell enclosing Order Denying Former Wife's Motion to Continue	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Draft correspondence to Judge Maxwell enclosing proposed Order Granting Former Husband's Motion for Injunction and Order of Temporary Injunction	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Draft correspondence to Judge Maxwell enclosing proposed Order on February 10, 2012 Pre-Trial Conference	0.20	0.00	PCLA
16-12	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's review amend correspondences to Judge Maxwell and finalize with proposed Orders for sending to Judge Maxwell and Aimee Casey	0.40	50.00	PCLA

....

U .UJU

***************************************	0.1020
---	--------

Mar-19-12	Receipt of e-mail from Aimee Casey advising that she could not open e-mailed proposed Orders; e-mail to Aimee Casey resending proposed Order and advising of fee Adobe Acrobat program and request fax number	0.20	_{25.00} Page 208 of 3.	
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's review amend and finalize Motion for Court to Take Judicial Notice and proposed Order on Court Taking Judicial Notice of all reports and testimony of psychologists	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	N/C - Draft correspondence to Judge Maxwell enclosing copy of Motion for Court to Take Judicial Notice and proposed Order and advising that Ms. Casey was provided the proposed Order and to contact the Court directly with objections	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Mar-26-12	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, read Former Wife's seven Motions and Responses, in preparation of meeting on Former Husband's response, if any	0.50	62.50	PCLA
	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding Amy Marto, and advise of Former Wife's seven Motions and Responses; advise Mr. Rossway	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	N/C - Resend Former Wife's Motions and Responses to Mr. Michaud	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Update pleading file with Former Wife's seven Motions and Responses	0.30	0.00	PCLA
Mar-28-12	Receipt and initial review of Former Wife's Response to Order Denying Former Wife's Motion to Continue, Former Wife's Response to Order on December 9, 2011 Status Conference, Former Wife's Response to Order on February 10, 23012 Pre-Trial Conference, Former Wife's Response to Former Husband's Verified Motion for Injunction, Former Wife's Response to Order Granting Former Husband's Motion for the Curt to Take Judicial Notice, Former Wife's Second Request to Disqualify and/or Recuse the Trial Judge, and Former Wife's Second Emergency Motion to Stay Proceedings	0.40	140.00	BWR
	N/C - Scan and e-mail Former Wife's seven Responses and Motions to Mr. Michaud with the Former Wife's correspondence to Judge Maxwell	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Totals	16.60	\$2,212.50	

DISBURSEMENTS		Disbursements	Receipts
02-12	Postage	0.45	
Mar-06-12	Photocopies	5.80	

Photocopies	5.80	Page 209 of 324
Photocopies	0.90	Fage 209 01 324
Postage	0.45	
Photocopies	1.20	
Postage	2.65	
Telephone Charges	0.70	
Telephone Charges	0.30	
Totals	\$18.25	\$0.00
Current Fees & Disbursements	_	\$2,230.75
Previous Balance		\$4,095.37
Previous Payments		\$0.00
BALANCE DUE	_	\$6,326.12
	Photocopies Postage Photocopies Postage Telephone Charges Telephone Charges Totals Current Fees & Disbursements Previous Balance Previous Payments	Photocopies 0.90 Postage 0.45 Photocopies 1.20 Postage 2.65 Telephone Charges 0.70 Telephone Charges 0.30 Totals \$18.25 Current Fees & Disbursements Previous Balance Previous Payments

ROSSWAY MOORE SWAN, P.L. THE MODERN ONE BUILDING 2101 INDIAN RIVER BOULEVARD, SUITE 200 VERO BEACH, FL 32960 Telephone (772) 231-4440 Facsimile (772) 231-4430

Mr. Timothy Michaud 1791 Wekiva Drive Melbourne, FL 32940

May 8, 2012

File #: 1682-001 Inv. #: 64504

Total Due:

\$8,352.77

RE: Post-judgment issues

Please write the FILE number on your check to insure proper crediting.

SUMMARY

*Balance Fwd:

\$6,326.12

Payment received:

\$0.00)

Current Invoice Amount:

\$2,026.65

TOTAL DUE:

\$8,352.77

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	ATT'Y/L.A.
Apr-02-12	Office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding contacting Attorney Matheson, Mr. Michaud's appellate attorney, to advise of Ms. Casey's Second Request to Disqualify or Recuse Judge, and timeline for response and Judge's ruling, issue of Ms. Casey not verifying her Request or Emergency Motion to Stay Case	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Former Wife's Second Request to Disqualify or Recuse Trial Judge; pull Attorney Matheson's Answer for reference to Former Wife's Writ of Prohibition	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	N/C - Attempt to contact Mr. Michaud regarding timeline for responding to Former Wife's Second Request for Disqualification or Recusal of Trial Judge	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Office conference with Mr. Rollin to advise of timeline for preparation of Mr. Michaud's response to Second Request to Disqualify or Recuse Judge, Attorney Matheson's findings in her Brief, and requirements by law	0.20	0.00	PCLA

7"	Draft Memorandum of law regarding Mother's Second Motion for Recusal	1.10	192.50 Pag e	211 of 324 KMR
	Extensive review and work on March 23 packet of materials from former wife; review seven pleadings; work on issue relating to new Motion to Recuse and response; work on A.M. issue; meet with paralegal	1.00	350.00	BWR
Apr-03-12	Draft Response to Motion to Recuse	1.50	262.50	KMR
	Review Second Emergency Motion For Stay	0.40	70.00	KMR
	Draft Response to Former Wife's Motion for Stay	1.20	210.00	KMR
	Review and continue drafting extensive responses to Motion to Recuse; review of current case law and information; work on former husband's response to former wife's Second Emergency Motion to Stay	0.60	210.00	BWR
Apr-04-12	Telephone conference with Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant regarding Former Wife's five Responses and two Requests, and determine that Judge Maxwell did not receive the Former Wife's pleadings dated March 23rd and received by Mr. Rossway on March 28, 2012, and receive request for copies of Former Wife's pleadings and Former Husband's Response	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Check Brevard Clerk's website for date Former Wife's Motion received and entered	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Apr-05-12	Receipt and review of Order Granting Former Husband's Motion for Court to Take Judicial Notice	0.10	35.00	BWR
	N/C - Scan and e-mail copy of Order Granting Former Husband's Motion for Court to Take Judicial Notice to Mr. Michaud	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Apr-09-12	N/C - Review and revise response to motion to disqualify, memorandum of law, and response to motion for stay; research and print cases cited in papers which were not previously printed	0.80	0.00	KMR
	Lengthy telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding Amy Marto, Ms. Casey's second request regarding recusal of Judge Maxwell and to stay case	0.60	75.00	PCLA
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, finalize Response to Former Wife's Emergency Request to Stay Case for final review prior to forwarding to Judge Maxwell	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, review and amend Response to Former Wife Second Request to Disqualify	0.30	37.50	PCLA

04.204

	or Recuse Trial Judge to incorporate full case law cites; review Memorandum of Law for all cases referenced		Page	212 of 32
	N/C - Draft correspondence to Judge Maxwell enclosing the Former Wife's five Responses to proposed Orders and Former Wife's Request to Stay Case and to Disqualify Trial Judge, and enclosing Former Husband's Response to Former Wife's Emergency Request to Stay Case and Second Request to Disqualify and/or Recuse Trial Judge	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Review and sign-off on all materials to be sent to Judge George Maxwell including, Response to Motion for Recusal and other related documentation; provide instruction to paralegal regarding Court to be contacted regarding sending of materials based upon 30 day rule on Motion to Recuse Judge Maxwell in case the Court has not been notified of the motion having been filed in the clerk's office	0.40	140.00	BWR
Apr-10-12	N/C - Draft correspondence to Mr. Michaud enclosing RMTS March 2012 invoice	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Apr-11-12	Work on unique partial issue, and potential issues that may arise before trial	0.30	105.00	BWR
Anr-12-12	N/C - Office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding the separation of Mr. Michaud and Ms. Marto	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding Riley's therapy regarding Ms. Marto's separation from Mr. Michaud and Riley, and meeting to work through issues	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	N/C - Draft Notice of Unavailability	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Apr-16-12	N/C - Scan and e-mail Order Denying Motion to Disqualify Judge to Mr. Michaud	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Apr-19-12	Work on issue regarding outstanding orders; receive update from paralegal regarding client's personal arrangements be made to continue to provide the best interests of the minor child; receive information regarding grandmothers assistance	0.20	70.00	BWR
Apr-25-12	E-mail to Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant for status of four pending Orders before the Judge, and request if hearing is required on Former Wife's Responses to proposed Order and Request to Stay Case	0.20	25.00	PCLA
26-12	N/C - Receipt of e-mail from Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant regarding pending Orders waiting for Judge return to office; short office conference with Mr. Rossway to advise of status of Orders	0.20	0.00	PCLA

Totals

Page 213 of 324 \$1,945.00

LISBURSEMENTS		Disbursements	Receipts
Apr-02-12	Telephone Charges	1.10	
	Telephone Charges	0.20	
	Westlaw Online Research Access	15.00	
Apr-03-12	Westlaw Online Research Access	50.00	
Apr-04-12	Telephone Charges	0.50	
Apr-09-12	Photocopies	2.40	
	Photocopies	1.00	
	Photocopies	6.10	
	Photocopies	0.80	
	Postage	3.10	
Apr-12-12	Telephone Charges	0.10	
Apr-16-12	Postage	1.35	
	Totals	\$81.65	\$0.00
	Current Fees & Disbursements	Martin Constant	\$2,026.65
	Previous Balance		\$6,326.12
	Previous Payments		\$0.00
	BALANCE DUE		\$8,352.77

ROSSWAY MOORE SWAN, P.L. THE MODERN ONE BUILDING 2101 INDIAN RIVER BOULEVARD, SUITE 200 VERO BEACH, FL 32960 Telephone (772) 231-4440 Facsimile (772) 231-4430

Mr. Timothy Michaud 1791 Wekiva Drive Melbourne, FL 32940

June 4, 2012

File #: 1682-001 Inv. #: 64753

G / LD

Total Due: \$8,5

\$8,547.97

RE: Post-judgment issues

Please write the FILE number on your check to insure proper crediting.

SUMMARY

*Balance Fwd:

\$8,352.77

Payment received:

Current Invoice Amount:

\$0.00) \$195.20

.....

TOTAL DUE:

\$8,547.97

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	ATT'Y/L.A.
May-02-12	Receipt of Fifth DCA's Order on attorney's fees; research Fifth DCA's website for opinion; office conference with Mr. Rossway; research website docket for case; office conference with Mr. Rossway and advise of the Appellate Court entering an "Affirmed - Per Cuarum" ruling	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	N/C - Receipt of copy of e-mail to Mr. Michaud from his appellate attorney advising of ruling	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Receive ruling information from the 5th Circuit Court of Appeals; study ramifications of ruling; receive information from appellate lawyer; short conference with Mr. Michaud	0.30	105.00	BWR
May-03-12	N/C - Copy and forward four signed Orders to Mr. Michaud; update pleading file and appellate file	0.40	0.00	PCLA
May-04-12	Correspondence to Mr. Michaud enclosing past due invoice from King Reporting	0.20	25.00	PCLA

May-08-12	N/C - Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, draft correspondence to Mr. Michaud enclosing RMTS' May 8, 2012 billing statement for April 2012	0.30	Page _{0.00}	215 of 324
May-09-12	N/C - Out of office meeting with Mr. Rossway and Mr. Michaud regarding upcoming trail and preparations in light of 5th DCA's affirmation of Temporary Order	1.60	0.00	PCLA
May-14-12	Receipt of e-mail from Ms. Casey requesting copy of trial order; review file; telephone conference with Maxwell's Judicial Assistant for status of Order Setting Pre-Trial Procedure and Setting Trial; e-mail to Ms. Casey advising that trial order is issued by the Court; advise Mr. Rossway	0.40	0.00	PCLA
May-17-12	Telephone conference with Attorney Matheson regarding filing a Motion for Appellate Attorney's Fees, and suggestion to include her Motion to be heard at the August 2012 trial, and provide Ms. Casey's address, e-mail and telephone number for providing her with copies of the Motion	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Totals	3.80	\$192.50	

DISBURSEMENTS		Disbursements	Receipts
-03-12	Postage	0.85	
May-04-12	Postage	0.45	
May-14-12	Telephone Charges	0.50	
May-24-12	Telephone Charges	0.90	
	Totals	\$2.70	\$0.00
	Current Fees & Disbursements		\$195.20
	Previous Balance		\$8,352.77
	Previous Payments		\$0.00
	BALANCE DUE	f	\$8,547.97

ROSSWAY MOORE SWAN, P.L. THE MODERN ONE BUILDING 2101 INDIAN RIVER BOULEVARD, SUITE 200 VERO BEACH, FL 32960 Telephone (772) 231-4440 Facsimile (772) 231-4430

Mr. Timothy Michaud 1791 Wekiva Drive Melbourne, FL 32940

July 5, 2012

File #: 1682-001 Inv. #: 65286

Total Due:

\$639.05

RE: Post-judgment issues

Please write the FILE number on your check to insure proper crediting.

SUMMARY

*Balance Fwd:

\$8,547.97

Payment received:

\$8,547.97

Current Invoice Amount:

\$639.05

\$057.0

TOTAL DUE:

\$639.05

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	ATT'Y/L.A.
Jun-04-12	Receipt and review of Notice of Appearance of Former Wife's new counsel	0.10	35.00	BWR
Jun-05-12	N/C -Update file with Former Wife's new attorney's information	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Jun-06-12	Work on emerging situation regarding new attorney on file; meeting with paralegal regarding former attorney being approached; provide information regarding contact with former attorney concerning retaining lien and other issues	0.30	105.00	BWR
	N/C - Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, draft correspondence to Mr. Michaud enclosing RMTS' invoice for services provided in May 2012 with past due balance	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Scan and e-mail Notice of Appearance of Former Wife's new counsel to Mr. Michaud	0.10	0.00	PCLA

Jun-07-12	Receipt and review of Notice of Unavailability/Vacation of Counsel for Former Wife's new counsel	0.10	Page 35.00	217 of 324 BWR
12-12	N/C - Receipt and review of e-mails between Mr. Michaud and Ms. Casey	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, draft correspondence to Attorney Mercedes Wechsler, the former wife's new attorney, advising of requested changes to her proposed Agreed Order on Release of Dr. Deborah Day's Report	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	Receipt and review of amended proposed Agreed Order on Release of Deborah O. Day, PsyD's Report to Former Wife's Current Attorney; draft request for additional correction, provide Mr. Rossway's Florida Bar Number, and request final draft be e-mailed	0.30	37.50	PCLA
Jun-15-12	N/C - Draft correspondence to Attorney Wechsler enclosing signed Agreed Order on Release of Dr. Day's report	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Jun-18-12	N/C - Receipt of voicemail from Attorney Wechsler's assistant	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Jun-19-12	N/C - Receipt of voicemail from Attorney Wechsler's assistant regarding status of Stipulated Order for release of Dr. Day's report	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Jun-20-12	N/C - Receipt of voicemail from Attorney Wechsler's assistant requesting to set telephone call between Mr. Rossway and Attorney Wechsler	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Receipt of Order Setting Non-Jury Trial and Directing Pre-Trial Compliance; calendar all deadlines and dates	0.40	50.00	PCLA
Jun-21-12	Receipt and review of Attorney Wechsler's correspondence to Judge Maxwell enclosing proposed Agreed Order for Release of Deborah O. Day' PsyD's Report	0.10	12.50	PCLA
	Receipt of faxed Former Wife's Request for Updated 12.285 Disclosure; office conference with Mr. Rollin regarding Rules on discovery	0.20	25.00	PCLA
(r	Receipt of voicemail from Attorney Wechsler's assistant; attempt to return call and leave message that pursuant to Notice of Unavailability, Mr. Rossway is out of the office, telephone conference can be scheduled for July 6, 2012, and Mr. Rossway will address Former Wife's Request for Updated 12.285 Disclosure	0.10	12.50	PCLA
Jun-22-12	N/C - Attempt to return call to Attorney Wechsler's assistant	0.10	0.00	PCLA

N/C - Receipt of voicemail from Amy Marto requesting return call; office conference with Mr. Rollin who advised of receipt of call from Ms. Marto	0.10	Page _{0.00}	218 of 324 PCLA
Telephone conference with Ms. Martin egarding request that Mr. Michaud cease contacting her criminal autority and for the return of her dog from her prior marriage, advising that Mr. Michaud estused to return the dog and the has confacted the Melbourne police for assistance.	0.20	25.00	PCLA
N/C - Attempt to contact Mr. Michaud and leave message of importance to return call	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Additional telephone call with Ms. Marto who advised that due to Mr. Michaud's refusal to return calls from derself or the police, they are on their way to Mr. Michaud home, and Ms. Marto advising of her evidence of ownership, the police determining it is property their and statements regarding the minor child and Mr. Michaud's mappropriate autions regarding the degree.	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud for timeline for his return to his home from Orlando and to demonstrate the day to Michaud who has engaged the assistance of the Michaule police.	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Additional telephone conference with Ms. Marto to advise of Mr. Michaud's anticipated arrival at his home term over the dog to Ms. Marto and there is no account parties presence.	0.10	12.50	PCLA
Additional telephone conference to Mr. Michaud	0.10	12.50	PCLA
N/C - Office conference with Attorney Rollin regarding advising Attorney Wechsler of Mr. Rossway being on vacation, proposed date for telephone conference with Mr. Rossway, and that Mr. Rossway will address the Former Wife's Request for Updated 12.285 Disclosure, and request Mr. Rollin research discovery rules for the appropriateness of the request and timeline of response of ten days	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Telephone conference with Attorney Wechsler's assistant to schedule telephone conference between Mr. Rossway and Attorney Wechsler, and request for copy of pleading index as prior attorney's is incomplete and advise of need for directions from Mr. Rossway	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Draft correspondence to Mr. Michaud with 90 day past due invoice from King Reporting	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Pursuant to Trial Order, research Brevard County Clerk's Website for list of Parenting Class providers	0.30	37.50	PCLA

Jun-25-12

Jun-28-12

\$625.00

5.80

Page 219 of 324 for providing to Mr. Michaud; research pleading file for Mr. Michaud's Financial Affidavit and copy for providing to Mr. Michaud 0.10 12.50 **PCLA** Jun-29-12 Receipt and docket Attorney Wechsler's Notice of Unavailability **PCLA** 0.20 25.00 Receipt of and docket Order Setting Non-Jury Trial and Directing Pre-Trial Compliance Draft correspondence to Mr. Michaud inclosing the 0.40 50.00 **PCLA** Jun-30-12 Court's Trial Order, list of Brevard County Parenting Plan providers, and prior Financial Affidavit, and advise of requirements to attend mediation N/C - Update Pleading and Correspondence Files 0.30 0.00 **PCLA**

Totals

DISBURSEMENTS		Disbursements	Receipts
Jun-06-12	Photocopies	0.10	
	Postage	0.45	
2-12	Photocopies	0.10	
	Facsimile Charges	2.00	
Jun-14-12	Photocopies	1.00	
Jun-18-12	Postage	6.50	
Jun-21-12	Telephone Charges	0.30	
Jun-22-12	Telephone Charges	0.50	
	Telephone Charges	0.20	
	Telephone Charges	0.20	
	Telephone Charges	0.30	
Jun-25-12	Telephone Charges	0.70	
Jun-30-12	Postage	1.70	
	Totals	\$14.05	\$0.00

Invoice #:

65286

Current Fees & Disbursements	Page 220 of 324 \$639.05
Previous Balance	\$8,547.97
Previous Payments	\$8,547.97
BALANCE DUE	\$639.05

VERO BEACH . CORAL GABLES

ROSSWAY MOORE SWAN, P.L. THE MODERN ONE BUILDING 2101 INDIAN RIVER BOULEVARD, SUITE 200 VERO BEACH, FL 32960

Telephone (772) 231-4440 Facsimile (772) 231-4430

Mr. Timothy Michaud 1791 Wekiva Drive Melbourne, FL 32940

August 8, 2012

File #: 1682-001 Inv. #: 65740

Total Due: \$22,230.47

(

RE: Post-judgment issues

SUMMARY

Please write the FILE number on your check to insure proper crediting.

*Balance Fwd:

\$639.05

Payment received:

\$0.00)

Current Invoice Amount:

\$21,591.42

TOTAL DUE:

\$22,230.47

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	ATT'Y/L.A.
Jul-02-12	N/C - Telephone conference with Attorney Singer's assistant regarding appearing as an expert witness on attorney fees possibility for trial on August 3, 2012 or at a later date	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Jul-05-12	N/C - Finalize and e-mail Mr. Rossway's correspondence to Mr. Michaud enclosing King Reporting's past due invoice	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - E-mail to Mr. Michaud providing Mr. Rossway advice to obtain copy of his deposition from King Reporting ordered by the Former Wife	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Jul-06-12	Extensive conference with new attorney on case; discussion regarding Dr. Deborah Day's report; discussion regarding missing orders that would provide further information to opposing counsel regarding her client's inappropriate actions and court-ordered signing of HIPPA releases; discussion regarding there will be no continuance in the case; discussion regarding reluctance on the part of Mr. Michaud to cooperate regarding full exchange of information based upon poor and	0.50	175.00	BWR

	inappropriate actions of former spouse and previous counsel on case; discussion regarding deficiencies of case law to move case to trial based upon current facts that have been received by opposing counsel from Dr. Deborah Day		Page	e 222 of 324
Jul-08-12	Begin work on mediation issue and strategy	0.50	175.00	BWR
Jul-10-12	Receipt and initial review of Mr. Michaud's draft Financial Affidavit	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Jul-12-12	N/C - E-mail and voicemail from and to Attorney Wechsler's assistant regarding telephone conference with Mr. Rossway; receipt of faxed Notice of Production from Non-Party directed to Captain Hiram's and provide to Mr. Rossway	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Receipt and review of Former Wife's Notice of Production from Non-Party regarding Mr. Michaud's employment with Captain Hiram's	0.10	35.00	BWR
Jul-13-12	N/C - Research Attorney Wechsler's proposed mediator; office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding proposed mediator and mediation	0.30	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - E-mail Mr. Rossway's approval of mediation date and time to Attorney Wechsler	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Jul-14-12	Begin trial preparations	1.00	350.00	BWR
Jul-15-12	N/C - E-mail Mr. Michaud mediation date and time, and pre-mediation meeting with Mr. Rossway; receipt of confirmation e-mail from Mr. Michaud	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Prepare Notice of Filing Certificate of Completion of Parenting Class	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Jul-16-12	N/C - Additional e-mail from and to Attorney Wechsler's assistant regarding location for mediation	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Receipt and review of Former Wife's Family Law Financial Affidavit	0.20	70.00	BWR
	Prepare Former Husband's Second Family Law Financial Affidavit	0.90	112.50	PCLA
Ġ.	E-mails to and from Mr. Michaud regarding clarification of health insurance and business for preparing Financial Affidavit	0.10	12.50	PCLA
	N/C - Scan and e-mail Former Wife's Pre-Trail Statement and Family Law Financial Affidavit to Mr. Michaud	0.10	0.00	PCLA

Lengthy telephone conference with Mr. Michaud for review of his First Amended Financial Affidavit, Former Wife's witnesses including Amy Marto and her father and issues regarding Ms. Marto and her father testifying, and that of Dr. Camera and Dr. Panaccione, and other trial related issues	0.70	Page 87.50	223 of 324 PCLA
Calculate Mr. Michaud's average monthly payment to RMTS for Financial Affidavit	0.10	12.50	PCLA
Begin initial drafting of Former Husband's Pre-Trial Statement to include witnesses, exhibits, and issues to be addressed by the Court at trial	0.80	100.00	PCLA
Office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding Former Wife's trial witnesses and scheduling depositions witnesses, and discussion and review of Mr. Michaud's trial exhibits, witnesses, and issues to be addressed for inclusion in Pre-Trial Statement	0.40	50.00	PCLA
E-mail to Mr. Michaud advising of Mr. Rossway's intent to depose Amy Marto and her father, William Waterman, request of Ms. Marto's updated legal records, Dr. Williams not to be listed as a trial witness due to court's orders, and request for copy of Clerk's List of Exhibits entered into evidence at the March 2011 hearing	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Receive information from opposing counsel; pretrial statement issues; provide instruction to paralegal regarding additional materials to be incorporated in the pretrial statement	0.50	175.00	BWR
Complete review of updated, drafted Financial Affidavit, mediation issues, and pretrial statement materials; Provide authorization for filing financial Affidavit with appropriate caveats	1.50	525.00	BWR
Receipt of information regarding Amy Marto's record from Mr. Michaud	0.10	12.50	PCLA
Office conference with Mr. Rossway for review of Mr. Michaud's First Amended Financial Affidavit, and discussions regarding setting depositions and attorney's fee to be heard at trial or subsequent hearing and availability of expert witness	0.40	50.00	PCLA
Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's review, amend Former Husband's Financial Affidavit regarding his unemployment status	0.20	25.00	PCLA
N/C - Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding obtaining Clerk's schedule of exhibits accepted into evidence at March 4, 2012 trial	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Draft Notice of Filing Former Husband's First Amended Family Law Financial Affidavit	0.20	25.00	PCLA

Jul-17-12

UJ 140

	Office conference with Mr. Michaud for review of his First Amended Financial Affidavit, and discussion regarding trial preparations and issues raised by Former Wife's trial witnesses for further discussions with Mr. Rossway	0.80	Page 100.00	224 of 324 PCLA
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, draft correspondence to Attorney Wechsler regarding deposition of Amy Marto, and Mr. William Waterman, and request availability of Former Wife's additional witnesses for deposition	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Continue drafting Pre-Trial Statement to include additional witness, exhibits, and amend issues to be addressed by the Court at trial to elaborate in detail all pending Motions and outstanding issues, Court's prior findings of Former Wife's direct civil contempt with reference to corresponding Orders	2.40	300.00	PCLA
	N/C- Prepare copies of Former Husband's Pre-Trial Statement and Exhibit "A", Former Husband's First Amended Family Law Financial Affidavit (2 sets); prepare copies of Notice of Filing Former Husband; First Amended Family Law Financial Affidavit for faxing to Attorney Wechsler	0.40	0.00	PCLA
Jul-18-12	N/C - Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's review, finalize, copy, and fax Former Husband's Pre-Trial Statement to Court, Judge Maxwell, Attorney Wechsler, and Mr. Michaud	0.30	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's review, amend and finalize correspondence to Attorney Wechsler regarding taking the depositions of Ms. Casey's witnesses	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Jul-19-12	N/C - Receipt of faxed Clerk's Evidence Log from March 4, 2011 hearing from Mr. Michaud	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Jul-20-12	N/C - Telephone conference with King Court Reporting to schedule court reporter for trial	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Jul-21-12	E-mails from and to Mr. Michaud; lengthy telephone call with Mr. Michaud regarding depositions of Ms. Marto and her father and obtaining their addresses, mediation, Ms. Marto's testimony from March 2011, and other trial related matters	0.50	62.50	PCLA
	N/C - Pull Transcript from March 4, 2911 and scan and e-mail Amy Marto's testimony to Mr. Michaud	0.10	0.00	PCLA
(* ·	Receipt and review of Attorney Dorfman's (mediator) correspondence of July 16, 2012 setting out mediation requirements and information regarding mediation	0.10	35.00	BWR
And the second s	N/C - Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, review the mediator's information and requirements for compliance	0.10	0.00	PCLA

Jul-23-12	N/C - Office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding difficulties in obtaining Ms. Marto's address, and requesting information from the former wife's attorney to proceed with deposition	0.20	Page _{0.00}	225 of 324 PCLA
	Pursuant Mr. Rossway's directions, draft correspondence to Attorney Wechsler requesting Former Wife's witnesses contact information for depositions	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	Draft Subpoena Duces Tecum for Trial to be served on Blackstone, P.A., with request for their complete appellate file	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	Draft Subpoena for Deposition to William Waterman, Amy Marto's father, listed as a witness on Former Wife's Pre-Trial Statement	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Research on-line for information on Amy Marto; draft Subpoena for Deposition pending confirmation of address	0.40	50.00	PCLA
	Receipt of e-mail from Mr. Michaud regarding Dr. Williamson being unaware he is listed as Former Wife's trial witness, and Ms. Casey's recent demands regarding Riley's "age appropriate" playmates; e-mail Mr. Michaud regarding progress obtaining Ms. Marto's address	0.10	12.50	PCLA
	Preparations for trial; work on strategy issues in light of problems with deposition of Ms. Marks; work on issues to defuse potential volatile issues at trial, based upon new attorneys involvement, etc.; review and approve correspondence to opposing counsel	1.00	350.00	BWR
Jul-24-12	N/C - Telephone conference with Attorney Dorfman's assistant for office availability for depositions after mediation on July 27, 2012; telephone conference with King Court Reporting, and short discussion regarding mediation	0.30	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Telephone conference with King Court Reporting to schedule depositions for July 27, 2012 after mediation	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Office conference with Mr. Rossway; amend Subpoena for Trial directed to Brownstone, P.A. to include language that subpoena is pursuant to court order; telephone conference with process server; forward Subpoena with copy of Order to William T. Bressett for immediate service	0.30	37.50	PCLA
Ċ	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud; telephone conference with process server; amend Subpoena for Deposition for Ms. Marto to include her parents address in Sanibel; forward Subpoenas for Mr. Williams and Ms. Marto to process server for immediate service	0.30	37.50	PCLA

		Page	226 of 32
Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, begin drafting mediation statement to provide to mediator prior to July 27, 2012 mediation	0.60	75.00	PCLA
Continue drafting mediation statement; office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding providing the mediator with the April 6, 2011 Order as a partial summary of the case; review pleadings and orders for reference in the mediation statement; review reports and investigations for reference in the mediation statement	1.70	212.50	PCLA
Work on pretrial issues; work on deposition issues, subpoena, etc.; short meeting with paralegal regarding simplified materials for upcoming mediation	5.00	1,750.00	BWR
Continue final drafting of Mediation Statement to include additional background information after April 4, 2011 hearing, summary of Former Wife's numerous investigation and evaluations, in addition to current status of case as it relates to Mr. Michaud's position of Ms. Casey's contact with minor child	1.40	175.00	PCLA
N/C - Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, telephone conference with Attorney Singer's office and leave message for return call regarding testifying as to attorneys' fees on August 3, 2012	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Office conference with Mr. Rossway for trial preparation, including addressing Former Husband's request for attorneys' fees pursuant to pleadings filed and Order's entered by the court, inclusion of March 4, 2012 trial exhibits at trial, inability to locate Amy Marto for deposition, and other matters required in preparing for trial, mediation, and depositions	0.40	50.00	PCLA
Telephone conference with William Waterman regarding Subpoena for Deposition and his position; office conference with Mr. Rossway	0.30	37.50	PCLA
Telephone conference with Attorney Singer regarding her agreement to testifying as an expert regarding Former Husband's attorneys' fees	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Office conference with Erin Arena, Paralegal, regarding review and redacting of complete billing statements for use at trial; office conference with bookkeeping for complete records of case for review and determination of fees and costs, including breakdown of billing fees for attorneys, paralegals, law clerks, etc.	0.30	37.50	PCLA
Continue preparation for upcoming mediation and trial; provide information to paralegal to prepare witness list, exhibits, and provide updated information to Judge George Maxwell; review materials for mediator; provide responses to further request from mediator	1.00	350.00	BWR

Jul-25-12

		myoice #.	UJ/4U	
Jul-26-12	Begin review of extensive billing records for redaction	on 1.10	Page 22 137.50	27 of 324 EALA
	Work on revisions to Motion to Strike Witnesses and research case law regarding remedy for opposing patailure to produce witness for deposition		420.00	KMR
	Research taking judicial notice of pre-trial proceeding for Mr. Rossway	ngs 1.40	175.00	LBSA
	Telephone conference with Attorney Dorfman's assist regarding mediation and their request for additional documents, including the Final Judgment, Amended Marital Settlement Agreement, Husband's Financial Affidavit and Pre-Trial Statement, and advise that if Casey is not prepared to pay mediation fees it is Mr. Michaud's intent not to continue mediation		25.00	PCLA
	N/C - Pursuant to mediator's request, scan and e-mai requested documents and order	0.30	0.00	PCLA
	Pursuant to initial review by Mr. Rossway, make mir refinements to Mediation Statement	oor 0.30	37.50	PCLA
	Prepare for and attend pre-mediation and trial meeting with Mr. Rossway and Mr. Michaud and make note additional instructions for moving forward with trial preparations in the likelihood that mediation fails		175.00	PCLA
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, research all pleading files (6) and copy all Orders entered for preparing Notebook of Orders with index; begin draindex of Orders	1.70 fting	212.50	PCLA
	Final preparation of files and documents for mediation	on 0.30	37.50	PCLA
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, prepare initial draft of Objection and Motion to Strike Former Wife Trial Witnesses; review Objection with Attorney Rol for revisions		50.00	PCLA
	N/C - Receipt of voicemail from Attorney Sirianni fr Brownstone, P.A. requesting return call and advising intent to prepare an Affidavit regarding Dr. Day's Report; advise Mr. Rossway		0.00	PCLA

0.30

105.00

BWR

Review subpoena information regarding appellate attorney; receive telephone call from Attorney Lee Bennett from Gray Robinson law firm; discussion regarding Court's desire to determine source of report provided to appellate attorneys; discussion regarding affidavits and subpoenas; provide information that Circuit Judge George Maxwell required subpoenas for attendance of witnesses, etc.; review subpoenas

Work on appellate attorney, subpoena issue, and potential affidavit scenario; continue to press to determine who provided reports to appellate counsel	0.20	Pag [.] 70.00	e 228 of 324 BWR
Continue trial preparations; work on identification of various legal issues	0.80	280.00	BWR
Meeting with Mr. Michaud to prepare for mediation; discussion regarding issues relating to Ms. Marto; discussion regarding witnesses, defenses, and potential defensive tactics in light of potential allegations being made against Mr. Michaud at trial	1.50	525.00	BWR
Short office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding mediation and depositions; pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, prepare bullet points for mediation of requirements necessary for Former Wife to obtain timesharing with minor child	0.30	37.50	PCLA
N/C - Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud confirming mediation, and his receipt of text message from Amy Marto; advise Mr. Rossway	0.20	0.00	PCLA
N/C - Telephone call with Mr. Rossway; telephone conference with Attorney Dorfman's assistant regarding Mr. Rossway's delay for mediation	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Receipt of Attorney Sirianni's original Affidavit regarding Dr. Day's report via Federal Express; receipt of copy of e-mail to Mr. Rossway from Blackstone, PA's attorney regarding amending Attorney Sirianni's Affidavit	0.10	12.50	PCLA
N/C - Interoffice conference with Patti Cain regarding court reporting charges to be included in summary of costs; interoffice conference with bookkeeping department regarding changes to summary of costs	0.40	0.00	EALA
Continued review and redaction of billing entries regarding confidential information	3.80	475.00	EALA
Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, prepare Notice of Cancellation of Deposition of Non-Party	0.20	25.00	PCLA
N/C - Attempt to contact Mr. William Waterman and leave message of cancellation of deposition; telephone conference with King Court Reporting advising of cancellation of deposition	0.10	0.00	PCLA
N/C - Telephone conference with King Court Reporting to request copies of all invoices paid by Mr. Michaud	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Telephone conference with Clerk of the Court and Judge's chambers for attempts to confirm March 6, 2011 trial exhibits will be available to Judge Maxwell at trial on August 2, 2012	0.30	0.00	PCLA

Jul-27-12

invoice #;

N/C - Attempt to contact "Ed" and "Jessica" in the civil clerk's office - evidence department - and leave messages	0.10	Page _{0.00}	229 of 324 PCLA
Prepare Notice of Filing Affidavit of Service of Subpoena for Trial to Blackstone, P.A.	0.20	25.00	PCLA
N/C - Draft correspondence to Mr. Michaud enclosing William T. Bressett's Invoice 1879 for service of Subpoena for Trial on Brownstone, P.A.	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Post-mediation office conference with Mr. Rossway with updated trial preparations instructions and outcome of mediation regarding Former Wife's supervised timesharing	0.30	37.50	PCLA
Receipt of all King Reporting Invoices paid by Mr. Michaud; e-mail to and from Mr. Michaud with request for Dr. Day's total fees; calculate and update Former Husband's accounting of costs for trial to include King Reporting	0.60	75.00	PCLA
N/C - Travel to mediator's office in North Melbourne, Florida	1.20	0.00	BWR
Attend mediation in case; receive minimal success; discussions with Mr. Michaud regarding trial; receive information to help prepare for case	6.00	2,100.00	BWR
N/C - Return to Vero Beach	1.00	0.00	BWR
Download PCLaw accounting client ledger into excel spreadsheet to prepare analysis of fees; format data to allow for summarization and categorization of fees and costs; convert spreadsheet into Microsoft Word format to allow for redacting and presentation of schedules for use at trial for Former Husband's request for attorney's fees	4.50	450.00	GFLA
Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding pending receipt of Dr. Day's invoices, and Ms. Marto's information regarding Ms. Casey's access to Mr. Michaud's e-mails, request for Ms. Marto to file report against Mr. Michaud for abuse and other inducements by Ms. Casey to elicit Ms. Marto's help to disparage Mr. Michaud, Attorney Wechsler's knowledge of Ms. Casey's actions, and telephone conference with Ms. Marto; advise Mr. Rossway	0.40	50.00	PCLA
Additional telephone conference with Mr. Michaud requesting records of minor child's health insurance and pictures of minor child for use as exhibits at trial	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Review of pending Motions and entered Orders for reference at trial as to pending issues reserved on by the Court for trial; review prior bullet points on issues	1.70	212.50	PCLA

Jul-28-12

reserved for trial; prepare detailed bullet points of pending motions and issues		Page	e 230 of 324
Prepare Former Husband's Amended Pre-Trial Statement to include additional exhibits including photos, health insurance, BSO and DCF reports, and amend issues to be addressed to list all documents requesting attorney's fees and costs	0.90	112.50	PCLA
Begin initial organization of all trial exhibits and documents and note pending exhibits to be provided by Mr. Michaud: begin initial drafting of List of Former Husband's Trial Exhibit Index for review by Mr. Rossway prior to building Trial Notebooks	1.40	175.00	PCLA
Prepare list of Trial Exhibits for review by Mr. Rossway	0.90	112.50	PCLA
Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, begin initial review of transcripts and Orders to note page and line of Court's findings and rulings which support allegations of Former Wife's contempt of court regarding evaluations, HIPPA releases, Dr. Day's Report, etc.	0.60	75.00	PCLA
Begin compiling fees and costs accounting for all Mr. Michaud's outside costs in case as a component of Former Husband's request for attorney's fees and costs	0.60	75.00	PCLA
Review pleadings since March 4, 2011 for pertinent and supportive documents for inclusion in Former Husband's Important Pleadings Notebook for reference at trial	0.80	100.00	PCLA
Office conference with Mr. Rossway for trial preparations, including review of trial exhibits, Amended Pre-Trial Statement, and instruction for preparing a Parenting Plan, and other trial related matters	0.90	112.50	PCLA
Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's review amend list of trial exhibits; amend Former Husband's Amended Pre-Trial Statement	0.30	37.50	PCLA
Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, draft correspondence to Attorney Wechsler regarding changes to Former Husband's Amended Pre-Trial Statement	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, draft responsive correspondence to Attorney Wechsler regarding Request for Updated 12.285 Discovery	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Draft Notice of Filing March 4, 2011 Excerpt of Proceedings - Dr. Day's Testimony	0.10	12.50	PCLA
Attempt to contact Mr. Michaud and leave message regarding Dale Young's testifying at trial	0.10	12.50	PCLA

Jul-29-12

Continue working on trial preparations, including Exhibits and Trial Notebooks pursuant to review by Mr. Rossway	1.90	Page 237.50	e 231 of 324 PCLA
Telephone call with Mr. Michaud for update of providing insurance information, pictures and HIPPA releases, and further discussions regarding Amy Marto's information	0.40	50.00	PCLA
Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, begin initial drafting basic Parenting Plan to include parties and minor child's information and standard clauses	0.70	87.50	PCLA
Sunday work on trial preparations in light of failed mediation; work on Aimee Casey issue; work on a issues; begin review of extensive evidentiary materials; review and add to extensive pretrial issues for Court to review	2.00	700.00	BWR
Continued review of billing records for redaction of confidential information	1.90	237.50	EALA
Extensive review and study of evidence books for case; review Motion for Ruling to Show Cause; prepare for expected arguments from opposing counsel regarding case; review updated witness lists; review updated information concerning progression of case, orders, and issues for case to be tried	2.00	700.00	BWR
Office conference with Mr. Rossway for status progress of trial exhibits, bullet points, examination questions, and witnesses	0.30	37.50	PCLA
N/C - Telephone conference with Evidence Clerk at the Courthouse to request Former Husband's March 4, 2011 exhibits entered into evidence be provided to Judge Maxwell's chambers for August 1, 2012 trial, including all sealed psychological reports	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's review of exhibits, begin compiling Former Husband's Trial Exhibit Notebook (4)	1.10	137.50	PCLA
Prepare separate Notebook of Former Husband's March 4, 2011 Exhibits (4)	0.70	87.50	PCLA
Prepare separate Notebooks of Former Husband's Exhibit 15 - Former Wife's E-mail and attachments to Dr. Panaccione (4)	0.40	50.00	PCLA
N/C - Several E-mails to and from Mr. Michaud regarding additional pending exhibits to be included in Trial Notebooks, including pictures, HIPPA releases, insurance information, and Dr. Day's costs	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Receipt of insurance information from Mr. Michaud, Dr. Day's invoice, and Dr. Williamson's HIPPA release;	0.20	25.00	PCLA

Jul-30-12

amend all Trial Exhibit Notebo Attorney Matheson's fees, and in provide accounting with final a Attorney Matheson's fees	insurance information;		Page	e 232 of 324
Receipt of list of information de Casey and Ms. Marto; telephon Michaud regarding Ms. Marto's witness for trial; advise Mr. Ros	e conference with Mr. s possible appearance as	0.30	37.50	PCLA
Receipt of Former Wife's Supple of Former Wife's Supplemental conference with Mr. Rossway re new witness, Detective Whitfiel Order of Court's assessment of testimony and advise Mr. Rosswatermination of Detective Whitinvestigation	Witnesses; short office egarding Former Wife's ld of North Carolina; pull Detective Whitfield's way of Court	0.30	37.50	PCLA
N/C - Update Pleading and Cor organize trial boxes	respondence Files;	0.40	0.00	PCLA
N/C - Receipt of voice and e-ma Wechsler's assistant requesting the with Mr. Rossway and advise of unavailability due to emergency	telephone conference f Mr. Rossway	0.10	0.00	PCLA
N/C - E-mails and telephone co Singer's assistant regarding a po Attorney Singer to testify as to I fees; advise Mr. Rossway of Att for morning testimony on Augus	ossible time certain for Mr. Michaud's attorney's orney Singer's request	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's direct Affidavit of Attorney Sirianni and Brownstone, PA regarding recession Attorney Orth's office and Sirianni's position that he had not Report	nd Brownlee of ipt of Dr. Day's Report advise of Attorney	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Receipt, print and update Trial ? picture of minor child	Notebooks (4) with	0.30	37.50	PCLA
N/C - Additional telephone conf Michaud regarding witnesses, a advising of need for service of S	nd Mr. Rossway's	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's director Rule to Show Cause; office of Rossway regarding Petition; telement. Mr. Michaud regarding Petition	conference with Mr.	0.30	37.50	PCLA
Prepare witness files for Former		0.60	75.00	PCLA

to include specific questions, evidence, orders, affidavits, and exhibits for each witness

Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, review and highlight Attorney Paetra T. Brownlee's Affidavit and attachments for evidence of receipt of Dr. Day's Report from Attorney Orth's office; prepare copies of Affidavit and attachments for trial exhibit; short office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding evidence that Dr. Day's report was provided to Brownstone, P.A. by Attorney Orth; telephone conference with Mr. Michaud	0.40	Page 50.00	233 of 324 PCLA
Telephone conference with Brownstone, P.A.'s attorney's office regarding filing of Motion for Protective Order and advise that pursuant to Affidavits received, Mr. Rossway would provide Affidavits to Court on August 1, 2012 and advise of findings which may lead the Court to dismiss Brownstone from Subpoena; advise Mr. Rossway of forthcoming Motion for Protective Order	0.20	25.00	PCLA
N/C - E-mails with Attorney Singer's office regarding day and time for Ms. Singer's expert testimony and advise of providing RMTS invoices for review	0.20	0.00	PCLA
N/C - Follow-up e-mails to and from Mr. Michaud regarding HIPPA releases, invoices from Dr. Day and therapists, and pictures, and insurance information	0.20	0.00	PCLA
N/C - E-mails from and to Attorney Wechsler's assistant regarding scheduling a telephone conference with Mr. Rossway	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's review, amend and finalize Former Husband's Second Amended Pre-Trial Statement for providing to Judge Maxwell and Attorney Wechsler	0.40	50.00	PCLA
Receipt of Dr. Panaccione's HIPPA Release	0.10	12.50	PCLA
Receipt of pictures of Riley; prepare four sets of color pictures for inclusion in Trial Notebooks	0.30	37.50	PCLA
N/C - E-mail with Mr. Michaud confirming Dr. Williamson providing updated report on minor child for trial	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Receipt of Dr. Day's invoices for evaluation and testimony; prepare copies for Attorney's Fees and Costs Notebooks	0.30	37.50	PCLA
Receipt of faxed Former Wife's Supplemental Witness List including Sergeant John Whitfield and Former Wife's Supplemental Exhibit List to include Mr. Michaud's most recent Financial Affidavit; advise Mr. Rossway of Attorney Wechsler's updated trial information	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Receipt of Mr. Michaud insurance information for use in preparing Child Support Guidelines	0.10	12.50	PCLA

05/40

Prepare Former Husband's Notebook of all Orders entered in Case with review of six pleading files	1.60	Page 200.00	e 234 of 324 PCLA
Telephone conferences with Mr. Michaud regarding Amy Marto as trial witness, issues of service of Subpoena and information exchanged between Ms. Marto and Ms. Casey; office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding Ms. Marto	0.30	37.50	PCLA
Prepare Notice of Filing of Excerpt of Proceeding of March 4, 2012 - Dr. Day's Testimony	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Prepare Notice of Filing Return of Service of Subpoena served on Brownstone, P.A.	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Update Trial Notebooks to include Excerpt of Dr. Day's Testimony	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Receipt and review of Brownstone, P.A.'s Verified Petition for Rule to Show Cause	0.20	70.00	BWR
Prepare Notebooks of Former Wife's E-mail to Dr. Vickie Panaccione (4) for Exhibit at trial	0.40	50.00	PCLA
Prepare Notebooks of Former Husband's Exhibits of March 4, 2012 Hearing entered into evidence (4)	0.40	50.00	PCLA
N/C - Telephone conference with Clerk of Court regarding all exhibit previously entered and sealed report to be provided to Judge Maxwell's chambers for trial August 1, 2012	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Receipt and review of list of topic between Ms. Case and Ms. Marto and discuss with Mr. Rossway	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Receipt of fax from Attorney Wechsler regarding prior Request for Updated 12.285; office conference with Mr. Rossway and pursuant to Mr. Rossway directions, draft correspondence to Attorney Wechsler regarding Request for Updated 12.285 Disclosure advising that Former Husband's financial status has not changed except as noted in his First Amended Financial Affidavit	0.30	37.50	PCLA
Receipt of Dr. Panaccione's HIPPA release	0.10	12.50	PCLA
Final update of Trial Notebooks and Index (4) with HIPPA Releases, pictures, insurance information, etc. for Mr. Rossway review and approval	1.40	175.00	PCLA
Research case law regarding court being able to limit mother's contact with minor child	0.90	157.50	KMR
Final review of extensive billing records for redaction of confidential information	2.40	300.00	EALA

U) /4U

Morning preparation for three-day trial; review materials prepared regarding attorney's fees compiled by paralegal, Erin Arena and bookkeeping department; review materials prepared by paralegal, Patti Cain, concerning issues, refining evidence exhibits and issue dealing with Amy Marto	2.00	Page ^{700.00}	e 235 of 324 BWR
Afternoon preparations for trial; extensive meeting with client; extensive witness preparation; review affidavit materials and related information; review service of process issue; review motions filed by opposing counsel regarding failure to serve subpoena; receive information regarding Mr. Tom Collins and others to be subpoenaed for trial by opposing party; review additional information from client; prep client for trial testimony; interview witnesses	2.50	875.00	BWR
Evening review of materials for trial; review opening statement issues; review testimonial issues; review caselaw information pulled by associate regarding burden of proof and evidentiary burdens; prepare for strategy to move case and direction in a positive way for client; work on potential cross examination issues for former spouse.	1.25	437.50	BWR
Lengthy office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding trial preparations, and Blackstone, P.A., Amy Marto, and other witness Subpoenas, and receive specifics regarding Former Wife's timesharing for inclusion in Parenting Plan and Timesharing Schedule pursuant to mediation discussions	0.60	75.00	PCLA
Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding pre-trial meeting with Mr. Rossway and concerns with Ms. Marto appearing as witness for trial	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Prepare Subpoena for Trial for Ms. Marto; telephone conference with process server	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Prepare trial information and Notebooks for Mr. Rossway pre-trial meeting with Mr. Michaud	0.40	50.00	PCLA
Office conference with Mr. Michaud regarding status of service of Subpoena for Trial on Ms. Marto	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Receipt of fax from Attorney Wechsler requesting confirmation that Dale Young would not appear as witness; advise Mr. Rossway	0.10	12.50	PCLA
Receipt of fax from Attorney Wechsler with additional demand for updated mandatory disclosure; advise Mr. Rossway	0.10	12.50	PCLA
Receipt of Former Wife's Second Amended Witness including Tom Collins and other Hiram's employee and Exhibit Lists	0.20	70.00	BWR

Continue drafting Parenting Plan with standard information regarding jurisdiction, schooling, medical information, child's information, residence designation, location of minor child, and conflict resolution	0.90	Page 112.50	e 236 of 324 PCLA
Attend pre-trial conference with Mr. Rossway, client and witness, and record notes for preparing examination of the parties and witness, and addition trial preparations	2.00	250.00	PCLA
Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions draft extensive timesharing schedule for Parenting Plan, including communication, restrictions, supervision, costs for travel, and requirements for Ms. Casey prior to timesharing, and further revisions and refining of Parenting Plan for final review by Mr. Rossway and for inclusion in Trial Notebook	3.40	425.00	PCLA
Receipt and review of Former Wife's four different Child Support Guidelines; work on Former Husband's Child Support Guidelines with review of parties past and current Financial Affidavit, insurance amounts; prepare several calculations for Child Support Guidelines for April - September 2011, October - August 2012 and August 2012 forward; compare to Former Wife's Guideline amounts; determine arrearages for Former Wife owed to Former Husband	1.10	137.50	PCLA
Prepare and organize composite exhibits (4 sets) of redacted attorney's fees spreadsheet, invoices, other fees (Attorney McNally, Dr. Day, and Attorney Matheson); request bookkeeper prepare Summary of individual billing rate, actual rate and amount for each attorney, paralegal, and clerk; prepare Former Husband's Attorney's Fees and Costs Index for Notebooks	0.90	112.50	PCLA
Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, draft correspondence to Attorney Wechsler regarding service of Amy Marto, excusing Det. Dale Young from trial, and advise Mr. Michaud to bring all financial discovery in his custody to trial	0.30	37.50	PCLA
Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, draft Affidavit of Amy Marto and prepare refined list of issues for attachment	0.40	50.00	PCLA
Pursuant to review, amend Affidavit and attached list	0.20	25.00	PCLA
N/C - Copy and provide Mr. Michaud a copy of his Deposition Transcript for review	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding clarification of restrictions and supervised timesharing for Parenting Plan, and status of trial preparations	0.30	37.50	PCLA
Final trial preparations for early morning review with	0.70	87.50	PCLA

	Mr. Rossway, including organization of all trial notebooks, files, and other items		Page 237 of 324	
	Prepare composite files for Former Husband, Former Wife, and witnesses to include pertinent questions for each and supplemental exhibits in support of testimony/examination	0.80	100.00	PCLA
Aug-01-12	N/C - Telephone conference with Patti Cain; per instructions, email scanned fee and cost summaries to Kelli in Elise Singer's office	0.20	0.00	EALA
	N/C - Pursuant to paralegal, Patti Cain's request, attempt to contact Kelli in Attorney Singer's office, leave message that Ms. Singer is not needed to testify on Former Husband's attorney's fees on August 2, 2012	0.10	0.00	EALA
	Early morning pre-trial meeting with Mr. Rossway for review of Former Husband's proposed Parenting Plan and Timesharing Schedule, and final review exhibits and trial preparations; amend Parenting Plan pursuant to Mr. Rossway's review and include in Trial Notebooks	0.80	100.00	PCLA
	N/C - Travel to Viera Courthouse for first day of trial	1.10	0.00	PCLA
	Attend pre-trial meeting with Mr. Rossway and Mr. Michaud at Courthouse; attend trial and assist with exhibit, and record testimony of Mr. Michaud; provide Clerk with original Notices of Filing of transcripts	3.00	375.00	PCLA
	Attend working lunch with Mr. Rossway and Mr. Michaud for review of trial regarding examination of Mr. Michaud and upcoming examination of Ms. Casey and Ms. Marto	1.30	162.50	PCLA
	Attend afternoon potion of trial for assistance with exhibits and testimony of Aimee Casey and Amy Marto	4.00	500.00	PCLA
	Return to Vero Beach	0.90	112.50	PCLA
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, prepare Bullet Points and Orders for Judge's ruling Former Wife's direct civil contempt regarding failure to turn over child and intimation of second Massachusetts proceeding	1.20	150.00	PCLA
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, prepare Bullet Points, Pending Motions, and Orders regarding Former Wife's violations of court order regarding Dr. Day's Report, interference with minor child's therapy, and failure to provide HIPPA Releases and Reports	0.80	100.00	PCLA
	Prepare Ore Tenus request and Orders regarding Former Wife's contempt for non-payment of Former Huband's air fare costs; prepare Bullet Points on Former	0.60	75.00	PCLA

Husband's requests for attorney's fees and supporting Pleadings		Page	238 of 324
Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions in light of testimony of the Former Wife, Former Husband and Judge Maxwell's statements at close of first day of trial, modify Parenting Plan and Timesharing Schedule to include additional hours of supervised timesharing, additional telephone and/or Skype communication to include extended family, and include supervised timesharing outside Brevard County with approval of Father, and other minor changes	0.70	87.50	PCLA
N/C - Travel to Brevard County Courthouse	1.10	0.00	BWR
Final preparation for trial; meeting with Mr. Michaud; attend first full day of trial; present opening statements, witnesses, including client, opposing party, and Amy Marto; meeting with judge and continue work on trial materials	8.00	2,800.00	BWR
N/C - Returned to Vero Beach	0.90	0.00	BWR
Early morning trial preparations with Mr. Rossway, including review and refining of Amended Parenting Plan and Timesharing Schedule for settlement purposes at trial, and review of all Bullet Points regarding Former Wife's direct civil contempt, and pending Motions and Order for Former Wife's further contemptuous actions, and pending issues; pursuant to Mr. Rossway's dictation on way to Courthouse, record specific issues to be address upon examination cross of the Former Wife and at closing	1.40	175.00	PCLA
N/C - Travel to Viera Courthouse for second day of trial	0.80	0.00	PCLA
Courthouse review of amended Parenting Plan and Timesharing Schedule with Mr. Michaud	0.40	50.00	PCLA
Attend second day of trial for conclusion of testimony by Ms. Casey and Mr. Michaud, record testimony and assist with exhibits, and Judge's instructions for preparation of draft proposed final judgment	3.40	425.00	PCLA
N/C - Attend post-trial lunch with Mr. Rossway and Mr. Michaud	1.00	0.00	PCLA
N/C - Return to Vero Beach	0.90	0.00	PCLA
N/C - Receipt of William T. Bressett's Affidavits of Service and Invoices for service on Amy Marto, Mr. Waterman,	0.10	0.00	PCLA

Aug-02-12

rs	Disbursem	ents	Receipts
Totals	157.15	\$21,392.38	
20% Write off on amount owed (combined total on inv. 65740 & 65286)	0.00	-36.09	LBSA
20% Write off on amount owed (combined total on inv. 65740 & 65286)	0.00	-92.80	GFLA
20% Write off on amount owed (combined total on inv. 65740 & 65286)	0.00	-1,979.71	PCLA
20% Write off on amount owed (combined total on inv. 65740 & 65286)	0.00	-237.15	EALA
20% Write off on amount owed (combined total on inv. 65740 & 65286)	0.00	-119.09	KMR
20% Write off on amount owed (combined total on inv. 65740 & 65286)	0.00	-3,092.78	BWR
N/C - Debriefing luncheon meeting with Mr. Michaud; return to Vero Beach	1.90	0.00	BWR
Meet with Mr. Michaud before trial; extensive meeting with judge and opposing counsel; complete second portion of trial including, additional testimony and information from judge; receive instructions from Court regarding written final arguments and receive charge to prepare initial proposed Final Judgment, etc.	3.50	1,225.00	BWR
N/C - Travel to Viera Courthouse	1.00	0.00	BWR
Early morning pretrial preparation for second day of trial; work on contempt issue materials with paralegal; review all contempt motions and materials prepared late last light by paralegal; work on issues for further testimony and potential cross examination of witnesses; work on potential defensive claims to be made by opposing counsel; review materials for closing arguments and final preparations; work on anticipated close of evidence today, rather than Friday, based upon tone and pace of case and comments of Judge regarding trial	1.00	350.00	BWR
Re-organize file and gather relevant materials from trial for use for preparing draft proposed final judgment		0.00	PCLA
Pe organize file and gether relevant metaviels from trial	0.60		e 239 of 324

14-12

DISBURSEM	ENTS	Disbursements	Receipts
12-نر	Photocopies	0.20	
	Postage	0.45	

		Invoice #: 65740	
Jul-13-12	Telephone Charges	0.20	Page 240 of 324
Jul-16-12	Photocopies	0.80	
	Postage	1.29	
Jul-17-12	Facsimile Charges	17.00	
	Telephone Charges	0.30	
	Postage	6.80	
Jul-18-12	Photocopies	2.70	
	Facsimile Charges	6.00	
	Facsimile Charges	2.00	
Jul-24-12	Photocopies	0.10	
	Facsimile Charges	2.00	
	Telephone Charges	0.40	
	Telephone Charges	0.10	
Jul-25-12	Telephone Charges	0.20	
	Telephone Charges	1.50	
1	Postage	0.45	
J 5-12	Photocopies	4.40	
	Telephone Charges	0.10	
	Telephone Charges	1.00	
	Westlaw Online Research Access	35.00	
Jul-27-12	Photocopies	0.40	
	Photocopies	0.20	
	Facsimile Charges	2.00	
	Telephone Charges	0.80	
	Telephone Charges	0.10	
	Telephone Charges	0.10	
	Telephone Charges	0.90	
	Telephone Charges	0.30	
	Telephone Charges	0.20	
(Telephone Charges	0.20	
	Postage	1.35	

		Invoice #: 03740	
	Postage	0.45	Page 241 of 324
Jul-28-12	Telephone Charges	0.30	
29-12	Telephone Charges	0.20	
Jul-30-12	Photocopies	2.40	
	Photocopies	0.10	
	Photocopies	93.70	
	Photocopies	15.00	
	Photocopies	66.00	
	Photocopies	9.80	
	Photocopies	1.70	
	Facsimile Charges	2.00	
	Facsimile Charges	8.00	
	Facsimile Charges	7.00	
	Telephone Charges	1.30	
	Telephone Charges	0.30	
()	Telephone Charges	0.20	
¥ .	Telephone Charges	0.60	
	Postage	1.95	
Jul-31-12	Photocopies	1.60	
	Photocopies	0.40	
	Photocopies	3.60	
	Photocopies	2.40	
	Photocopies	0.90	
	Photocopies	1.80	
	Photocopies	0.20	
	Photocopies	19.90	
	Photocopies	39.80	
	Facsimile Charges	2.00	
	Telephone Charges	0.10	
V.	Telephone Charges	4.90	
	Telephone Charges	0.10	

Invoice #:

	Invoice #:	65740	
Telephone Charges		0.80	Page 242 of 324
Westlaw Online Research Access		20.00	J
Write down photocopies	-2	00.00	
Totals	\$1	99.04	\$0.00
Current Fees & Disbursements			\$21,591.42
Previous Balance			\$639.05
Previous Payments			\$0.00
BALANCE DUE			\$22,230.47

-08-12

VERO BEACH . CORAL GABLES

ROSSWAY MOORE SWAN, P.L. THE MODERN ONE BUILDING 2101 INDIAN RIVER BOULEVARD, SUITE 200 VERO BEACH, FL 32960 Telephone (772) 231-4440 Facsimile (772) 231-4430

Mr. Timothy Michaud 1791 Wekiva Drive Melbourne, FL 32940

November 5, 2012

File #: 1682-001 Inv. #: 66765

RE: Post-judgment issues

Total Due: \$8,992.26

Please write the FILE number on your check to insure proper crediting.

SUMMARY

*Balance Fwd:

\$22,230.47

Payment received:

\$22,230.47)

Current Invoice Amount:

\$8,992.26

TOTAL DUE:

\$8,992.26

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	ATT'Y/L.A.
Aug-03-12	Begin work on proposed Final Judgment bullet points pursuant to Judge Maxwell's order	0.80	280.00	BWR
Aug-06-12	N/C Draft correspondence to Mr. Michaud enclosing process server, William T. Bressett's invoices for service of Subpoenas on William Waterman and Amy Marto in Sanibel, and service on Amy Marto in Vero Beach	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Draft Notice of Filing Affidavit of Service and Subpoena for Deposition - William J. Waterman; draft Notice of Filing Affidavit of Non-Service and Subpoena for Deposition - Amy Lynn Marto; and draft Notice of Filing Affidavit of Service and Subpoena for Trial - Amy Marto	0.40	50.00	PCLA
	N/C - Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding Dr. Williamson	0.20	0.00	BWR
Aug-07-12	Continue work on proposed Final Judgment	0.75	262.50	BWR

Invoice #: 66765

Aug-08-12	N/C - Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, draft correspondence to Mr. Michaud regarding RMTS' invoice and services for July 2012	0.30	Page _{0.00}	244 of 324 PCLA
Aug-09-12	Work on findings of fact provisions for Final Judgment	0.75	262.50	BWR
Aug-10-12	N/C - Draft correspondence to Mr. Michaud enclosing King Reporting Invoices 30598 and 30599 for the court reporter's attendance at trial on August 1 and 2, 2012	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Attend telephone conference with between Mr. Rossway and Attorney Wechsler and record her requests regarding timesharing and therapists report issues; attend Mr. Rossway telephone call with Mr. Michaud	0.30	0.00	PCLA
	Receipt and review of Attorney Wechsler's correspondence to Judge Maxwell attaching Notice of Filing Proof of Delivery of Dr. Brian Sullivan's reports and communicating her concerns that the records have not been located	0.10	35.00	BWR
	Work on issues regarding Final Judgment; telephone conference with opposing counsel; telephone conference with Tim Michaud	0.80	280.00	BWR
14-12	N/C - Receipt of e-mail from Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant confirming receipt of Former Wife's two therapist's reports; advise Mr. Rossway	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Aug-15-12	Receipt and review of Attorney Wechsler's correspondence of August 13, 2012 regarding interim supervised timesharing for the Former Wife	0.10	35.00	BWR
	N/C - Office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding Attorney Wechsler's correspondence of August 13, 2012 requesting additional timesharing for Ms. Casey, and advise of Judge Maxwell's receipt of Ms. Casey's therapists reports	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Aug-16-12	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding scheduling supervised timesharing once a month with Mr. Michaud and Coastal Behavioral Therapy with next offered weekend of September 1 and 2, 2012	0.40	50.00	PCLA
	N/C - Office conference with Mr. Rossway; draft e-mail to Attorney Wechsler advising of Mr. Rossway's receipt of her correspondence regarding additional timesharing for Ms. Casey	0.30	0.00	PCLA
(C.	N/C - Scan and e-mail Attorney Wechsler's correspondence to Mr. Michaud and request telephone conference upon review	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Additional telephone conference with Mr. Michaud to discuss parameters for Ms. Casey's requested	0.30	37.50	PCLA

	timesharing regarding supervision and timeline, and advise that Judge Maxwell has received Ms. Casey's two therapist's reports for no details have been provided by the Court, and further discussion regarding Ms. Marto		Page	245 of 324
Aug-20-12	Receipt of faxed correspondence from Attorney Wechsler regarding revisions to Ms. Casey's prior proposed additional timesharing for Labor Day Weekend, and provide to Mr. Rossway and scan and e-mail to Mr. Michaud	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding response to Ms. Casey's revised request for timesharing to be supervised by "friends", and attempts to contact Delight McGregarian, neutral timesharing supervisor	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	N/C - Attempt to contact Coastal Behavioral Therapy and leave message for return call	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, begin drafting response to Attorney Wechsler's August 20, 2012 correspondence pursuant to Mr. Michaud's directions and pending return call from Ms. McGregarian, timesharing supervisor	0.70	87.50	PCLA
	N/C - E-mail to Mr. Michaud for time of day for Ms. Casey's timesharing	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Prepare Final Judgment format, and begin drafting party, minor child, case, and trial information	0.70	87.50	PCLA
	Receipt and review of Attorney Wechsler's August 20, 2012 correspondence of Ms. Casey's amended requests for timesharing	0.10	35.00	BWR
Aug-21-12	Work on Final Judgment issue; sign off on letter regarding visitation access for mother during period of time that Final Judgment is being prepared	0.50	175.00	BWR
	N/C - Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's review, amend and finalize correspondence to Attorney Wechsler regarding Labor Day timesharing	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, begin review of extensive trial note and organization format for Final Judgment to draft case history, including relevant motions and orders, and all issues to be addressed in Final Judgment	1.20	150.00	PCLA
Aug-22-12	N/C - Prepare Notice of E-Mail Designation Pursuant to Florida Rule of Judicial Administration 2.516	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Aug-23-12	Receipt of Attorney Wechsler's voice mail regarding issues with agreed to supervisor for timesharing and suggested alternatives; short office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding response	0.10	12.50	PCLA

Invoice #: 66765

	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud to relay Attorney Wechsler's proposed alternatives to previously agreed to supervisor, and Mr. Michaud's issues with the suggested alternatives, and his intent to speak to Coastal Behavior Services to discuss how to utilize their services for supervising Ms. Casey's timesharing	0.20	Pa g 25.00	PCLA
	N/C - Update pleading file with numerous pleadings filed during trial	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Aug-24-12	Receipt of e-mailed correspondence dated August 24, 2012 from Attorney Wechsler regarding Labor Day timesharing, and provide to Mr. Rossway	0.10	12.50	PCLA
	N/C - E-mail Attorney Wechsler's August 24, 2012 correspondence to Mr. Michaud	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's previous directions and Mr. Michaud's position, draft correspondence to Attorney Wechsler responding to August 23rd voicemail and August 24th correspondence	0.80	100.00	PCLA
(c	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, continue with drafting proposed Final Judgment to include extensive history of case, including Ms. Casey's initial Florida and North Carolina pleadings challenging Florida jurisdiction, abuse allegations, and suspension of timesharing	1.50	187.50	PCLA
	Receipt and review of Attorney Wechsler's August 24, 2012 correspondence regarding additional suggestions for supervised timesharing	0.10	35.00	BWR
Aug-27-12	Continue working on Final Order to include background information regarding abuse investigations in North Carolina and Florida, Mr. Michaud's filing for modification, and appointment of Dr. Day and Ms. Casey's relocation, to include reference to all Order entered and restrictions placed on discussion of proceedings with third parties; review Order to confirm dates and language	1.80	225.00	PCLA
Aug-29-12	N/C - Office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding status of draft proposed final judgment for providing to Attorney Wechsler	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, draft correspondence to Attorney Wechsler to advise of timeline for providing closing argument and draft proposed final judgment	0.40	50.00	PCLA
	Review response and demand for entry of Final Judgment from opposing counsel, meet with paralegal; direct response to include shortness of time requests and indication that Final Judgment will be approximately three weeks	0.30	105.00	BWR

Aug-30-12	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud to advise of Attorney Wechsler demand for proposed final judgment in light of her client's inability to meet supervised timesharing requirements, and provide Mr. Rossway's agreements on RMTS' fees	0.20	Page 25.00	247 of 324 PCLA
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's review, amend correspondence to Attorney Wechsler and finalize	0.10	12.50	PCLA
Aug-31-12	Work on Final Judgment issues relating to judicial notice issues to track proceedings for future judges to review, if necessary in the future; task paralegal with pulling additional factual information from previous on the record proceedings for complete tracking of former wife's actions	0.80	280.00	BWR
Sep-05-12	Preparation of further provisions for incorporation into Final Judgment after review of extensive material pulled from court file by paralegal	0.90	315.00	BWR
Sep-10-12	N/C - Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud and email correspondence with Mr. Michaud regarding inquiry from Ms. Wechsler's office regarding parent-teacher conference and confirmation from Mr. Michaud that no conference is to take place	0.10	0.00	CRLA
	N/C - Work on situation regarding school issue; receive and review fax; short meeting with paralegal	0.20	0.00	BWR
Sep-12-12	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding status of proposed Final Order, communication between Ms. Casey and Riley, supervised visitation issues, restricting Ms. Casey from contacting Mr. Michaud's employers, and related Final Order issues	0.40	50.00	PCLA
	Continue drafting Final Order regarding wife's continued actions in pursuing abuse allegations in Massachusetts, and Mr. Michaud's continued restriction from timesharing, and entry of Dr. Day's Report	1.40	175.00	PCLA
Sep-13-12	Continue drafting Final Order with review of prior Orders after Former Wife's move to Massachusetts for specific violations by the Former Wife, Mr. Michaud's winter break timesharing and Ms. Casey's additional abuse allegations thereafter, Mr. Michaud's filing of emergency mouton for temporary change in timesharing, March 2011 trial and Ms. Casey's actions and violation of temporary order refusal to turn over minor child, instituting Massachusetts proceedings, instigating continued allegations of abuse in Massachusetts and Florida	4.30	537.50	PCLA
	N/C - Short office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding status of Final Order	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Sep-14-12	N/C - Office conference with bookkeeping department to confirm discount on Mr. Michaud's invoice	0.10	0.00	PCLA

			Page	e 248 of 324
	Additional refining and drafting of initial draft proposed Final Order regarding contempt for non-payment of court ordered reimbursement to Husband and determination of Husband's award of attorney's fees for Massachusetts hearing, the Former Wife's appeal and the Former Husband's award of attorney's fees, and begin drafting on the Former Wife's violation of the minor child's therapy	1.60	200.00	PCLA
Sep-17-12	Continue drafting Final Order on Modification of Final Judgment regarding Former Wife's contempt for false testimony and possession of Dr. Day's Report, disseminating the Report and other documents to the minor child's therapist in violation of Court orders, contempt for failure to provide her therapy reports by time of trial	0.80	100.00	PCLA
Sep-18-12	Continue drafting extensive Findings of Facts portion of Final Order regarding orders appointment of therapists, Former Wife's violations of HIPPA reports, reports provided and sealed, orders finding Former Wife in direct civil contempt for failure to turn over minor child, awarding Mr. Michaud cost reimbursement, and deferring award of attorney's fees, Former Wife's appellate proceedings, court's release of Dr. Day's report to Mr. Michaud and restraining order	2.80	350.00	PCLA
3-19-12 دست	Continue drafting Final Judgment regarding all Former Wife's draft language regarding court taking judicial notice of prior evidence, and begin specific trial testimony of Former Wife at trial regarding signing of HIPAA releases and reports sent, parenting coordinator, guardian ad litem, possession of Dr. day's report, and minor child's need for weekly therapy, skepticism as to minor child's well being, agreements as to supervised timesharing and costs, and Former Husband at trial as to minor child's health, position of third parties brought into case when Dr. Edwards available, Dr. Edward's summary report, and regarding appellate attorney's possession of Dr. Day's Report	3.70	462.50	PCLA
Sep-20-12	Continue work on extensive Final Judgment to review full findings of facts	0.50	175.00	BWR
	Continue drafting Final Order and set out in detail the Former Husband's Parenting Plan and the Former Wife's Reunification Plan; begin drafting language regarding the Former Wife retaining and paying a media specialist, the Former Wife's lack of communication with minor child and Former Husband and her issues with the Former Husband; and, begin inserting Court's findings on all trial issues	2.70	337.50	PCLA
21-12	E-mail from and to Mr. Michaud regarding status of draft proposed Final Order	0.10	12.50	PCLA
	Draft Final Judgment language regarding child support	0.80	100.00	PCLA

general de la companya de la company	guidelines and calculate arrears; draft Court's findings on support		Page	e 249 of 324
22-12	Office conference with Mr. Rossway for review of extensive 17 page draft "findings of facts" portion of proposed Final Judgment	0.50	62.50	PCLA
	Make revisions and refinements to Final Judgment pursuant to review by Mr. Rossway; draft language regarding parties employment and Former Wife's bankruptcy, health insurance, out-of-pocket costs, daycare expenses, and current support; employment of parties, and the Former Husband's costs expended during pendency of case; begin drafting "Ordered and Adjudge" portion of Final Judgment regarding each of the Former Wife's civil contempt specific to each Order violated	4.40	550.00	PCLA
	Detailed Saturday review of entire compiled extensive first draft of complete Final Judgment; review all findings of fact; refine and improve extensive proposed Final Judgment; provide instruction to paralegal regarding exhibits and additional portion of the Judgment entitled Order and Adjudged and attachment issue	0.75	262.50	BWR
24-12	N/C - Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding amounts of health insurance for the minor child	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Final Judgment - work on refining language regarding Former Wife's claims for reimbursement for health insurance and daycare, and Former Husband's asserted position regarding his therapy and daycare out-of-pocket costs; continue drafting the Court's rulings regarding Former Wife continued therapy and minor child's continued therapy at direction of Dr. Edwards, Dr Edward's as party to receive all concerns regarding minor child, denying guardian ad litem and parenting coordinator	1.60	200.00	PCLA
	N/C - Prepare Mr. Rossway's Notice of Unavailability for November and December 2012	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Sep-26-12	N/C - Receipt of e-mail service of Former Wife's Motion to Require Former Husband to File a Closing Argument and Final Judgment; provide to Mr. Rossway	0.20	0.00	PCLA
(C.	Receipt and review of Former Wife's Motion to Require Former Husband to File Closing Argument and Final Judgment; office conference with paralegal regarding response to Attorney Wechsler	0.10	35.00	BWR
Sep-27-12	Review extensive further draft of all findings of fact and ordered and adjudged section of document as prepared by paralegal, review and approve and refine drafting	0.75	262.50	BWR

Page 250 of 324

language, provide instruction for associate and paralegal Erin Arena to review document in totality for clarity and accuracy; provide instruction to paralegal regarding drafting letter to the judge and to opposing counsel regarding formatting and notification to court that extensive 46 page proposed final judgment has been provided to opposing counsel		9	
Office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding supervised timesharing and providing draft proposed Final Judgment by Friday, September 28, 2012; continue drafting "Orders" portion of Final Judgment regarding Former Husband's Parenting Plan, restrictions placed on Former Wife from disclosing case and reports, etc. to third parties, Former Wife's limited access to minor child's caregivers and school personal, Former Husband's ability to temporarily suspend timesharing upon violation of Final Judgment	1.40	175.00	PCLA
Telephone conference with Attorney Wechsler's paralegal regarding hearing on Former Wife's Motion to Compel, our providing draft proposed Final Judgment on September 28th, issues with costs for Former Wife for neutral timesharing supervisor, and alternatives the Former Wife needs to proposed, and Former Husband's non-issue with supervised timesharing just waiting for proposed neutral supervisor from Former Wife	0.30	37.50	PCLA
Complete drafting Court's "Orders" of proposed Final Judgment regarding ability for Former Wife to seek modification, reimbursement of Former Husband's out-of-pocket costs, denial of Former Wife's request for reimbursement of daycare and health insurance costs; and, draft extensive language regarding child support payments by the Former Wife through the State Disbursement Unit, and payment of support arrears, percentage of parties' contribution to out-of-pocket costs	2.70	337.50	PCLA
Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's instructions, review extensive draft Final Judgment on Modification on Former Husband's Verified Amended Supplemental Petition for Modification of Final Judgment of Dissolution of Marriage	1.90	237.50	EALA
Amend and refine Final Judgment pursuant to review, and include findings of fact and order regarding Former Husband's request for dependant tax exemption, and award of attorney's fees pursuant to Rosen v. Rosen	2.90	362.50	PCLA
Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's further review, make further amendments and refinements to draft Final Judgment	0.80	100.00	PCLA
E-mails to Mr. Michaud requesting out-of-pocket costs for therapy; insert amount of out-of-pocket costs	0.40	50.00	PCLA
Office conference with Firm bookkeeper to confirm calculations of all arrearages based on Former Wife's child support guidelines worksheets	0.40	50.00	PCLA

Sep-28-12

Oct-01-12

Draft correspondence to Attorney Wechsler regarding proposed draft Final Judgment and request for revisions in different color font	0.30	Page 37.50	251 of 324 PCLA
Draft correspondence to Judge Maxwell advising of proposed draft Final Judgment provided to Attorney Wechsler and request telephonic hearing on Former Wife's therapy reports	0.30	37.50	PCLA
N/C - Scan and e-mail proposed Final Judgment to Mr. Michaud and Attorney Wechsler with correspondence to Judge Maxwell and Attorney Wechsler; scan and e-mail correspondence to Judge Maxwell	0.40	0.00	PCLA
Receipt and review of Former Wife's Motion to Compel Former Husband's Closing Argument and Proposed Final Judgment	0.20	70.00	BWR
Receipt of Attorney Wechsler's e-mailed correspondence to Mr. Rossway requesting our closing argument prior to her providing her's so that she has the opportunity to response to our's; provide to Mr. Rossway for response	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Receipt and review of Attorney Wechsler's October 1, 2012 correspondence demanding Former Husband's closing argument	0.10	35.00	BWR
N/C - E-mail to Mr. Michaud to provide Mr. Rossway's suggestion to order transcript of Ms. Casey's testimony from August 1 and 2, 2012 trial; E-mail from Mr. Michaud to order transcript; telephone conference with King Court Reporting to obtain cost for transcript	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, draft correspondence to Attorney Wechsler confirming notes from trial that Closing Argument will be provided to the Judge with final draft of proposed Final Judgment; review notes from trial	0.00	0.00	PCLA
N/C - Receipt of e-mail confirmation from Mr. Michaud of his ordering transcript from King Reporting of Ms. Casey's testimony at trial	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, draft correspondence to Attorney Wechsler regarding Mr. Rossway's confirmation, from review of notes and otherwise, that he will be providing his written Closing Argument to Judge Maxwell with the final draft of the proposed Final Judgment	0.30	37.50	PCLA
Receive communication from opposing counsel regarding her perception that final argument was to be presented with extensive proposed Final Judgment; provide response	0.20	70.00	BWR

Oct-02-12

Oct-03-12	Short office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding pulling trial case law and preparing closing argument to be provided to Judge Maxwell with proposed final judgment	0.10	Pag 12.50	e 252 of 324 PCLA
Oct-11-12	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding Ms. Casey's communication issues, setting up supervised timesharing, Dr. Williamson's disagreement with implementing a guardian ad litem or parenting coordinator in case, and other issues arising during pendency of a final judgment being entered	0.40	50.00	PCLA
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, draft correspondence to Attorney Wechsler regarding timesharing	0.40	50.00	PCLA
	E-mail from Mr. Michaud regarding contact with Delight McGregarian; e-mails between Mr. Michaud and Ms. Casey regarding telephone contact with minor child; e-mail to Mr. Michaud	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Amend correspondence to Attorney Wechsler regarding information received from Delight McGregarian	0.30	37.50	PCLA
Oct-22-12	N/C - Receipt of copies of e-mails from Mr. Michaud with minor child's recent report card, and e-mail between Mr. Michaud and Ms. Casey regarding Wednesday's telephone contact; e-mail to Mr. Michaud to inquire if school report sent to Ms. Casey pursuant to Order	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	E-mail with Mr. Michaud regarding November 2, 2012 hearing on Attorney Wechsler requiring Mr. Rossway to file his Closing Argument	0.10	12.50	PCLA
Oct-23-12	N/C - Forward King Reporting invoice for appearance at trial to Mr. Michaud for payment	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Oct-25-12	Review several e-mails forwarded by Mr. Rossway regarding Ms. Casey's efforts to hold an evidentiary hearing on her Motion to Reopen Evidence and review attachments regarding same	0.40	70.00	KMR
	Work on response to Motion to Reopen Evidence; draft Motion to Strike Amended Notice of Hearing	2.30	402.50	KMR
	Research objections to issuance of subpoena for testimony	0.40	70.00	KMR
	N/C - Receipt of e-mail from Mr. Michaud regarding receipt of Summons; e-mail Mr. Michaud to request copy of Summons	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Additional e-mails from and to Mr. Michaud confirming November 1st hearing and Ms. Marto's Subpoena and need to appear for hearing	0.10	12.50	PCLA

N/C - Receipt, print and save of e-mailed Amended Notice of Hearing, Motion to Reopen Evidence, Request for Judicial Notice and Notice of Filing Return of Service; e-mail Motion to Reopen Evidence to Mr. Michaud	0.20	Pago 0.00	e 253 of 324 PCLA
Advise Mr. Rollin of issues regarding Ms. Marto's Subpoena without attendance fee and need for reasonable notice for inclusion in Motion to Strike	0.10	12.50	PCLA
Review Motions filed by ex wife and provide materials immediately to staff attorney and paralegal for immediate response and Motion to Strike due to setting of Hearing without coordination and setting Evidentiary Hearing on a Non-Evidentiary Motion; provide instruction for expedited response	0.30	105.00	BWR
Work on response to Motion to Reopen Evidence (review trial notes, pleadings, papers, file notes, etc.)	1.00	175.00	KMR
Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding response to Motion to Reopen Evidence	0.90	157.50	KMR
Draft Motion to Quash Subpoena	1.20	210.00	KMR
N/C - Leave voice message for Mr. Michaud to call me	0.10	17.50	KMR
Leave voice message for Mr. Cary regarding service of subpoena	0.10	17.50	KMR
Draft Response to Motion to Reopen Evidence	2.00	350.00	KMR
Research case law regarding reopening of the case to present additional evidence	0.60	105.00	KMR
Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding response to Motion to Reopen Evidence and related issues	0.40	70.00	KMR
Scan and e-mail transcript of testimony from trial to Mr. Michaud	0.20	35.00	KMR
Short office conference with Mr. Rollin regarding trial notes and information regarding Amy Marto	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Telephone conference with King Court Reporting for status of transcript of Former Wife's testimony and advise of need for transcript of Husband's testimony regarding Amy Marto on rush basis	0.10	12.50	PCLA
Additional office conference with Mr. Rollin to advise of transcripts and provide Ms. Marto's attorney's information	0.20	25.00	PCLA

Oct-26-12

Page 254 of 324

profession and the second				
	Pursuant to Mr. Rollin's directions, additional telephone conference with King Reporting to order Mr. Michaud's trial testimony regarding Amy Marto	0.10	12.50	PCLA
	N/C - Telephone conference with King Reporting and obtain status of Federal Express delivery of transcript of Former Wife's Testimony	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Review three Response Motions and responses; provide input and direction to paralegal regarding identification of length of time for court-ordered hearing and to confirm that hearing was not scheduled as an Evidentiary Hearing; provide input to paralegal regarding information necessary to defend hearing including potential transcript indicating that attorneys were not to present their final arguments with their initial proposed Final Judgments	0.30	105.00	BWR
Oct-27-12	Prepare case law for hearing on Former Husband's Motion to Strike Service of Subpoena and Motion to Reopen Evidence	0.30	37.50	PCLA
Y.	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, draft Cross-Notice of Hearing on Former Husband's Motion to Strike Service of Subpoena and Former Wife's Amended Notice of Hearing	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	N/C - Copy, scan and file Former Husband's Motion to Strike Service of Subpoena, Response to Former Wife's Motion to Reopen Evidence, and Former Husband's Motion regarding Former Wife's Amended Notice of Hearing	0.30	0.00	PCLA
	Begin review of Former Wife's trial testimony	0.30	37.50	PCLA
Oct-29-12	Review e-mail regarding face-book messages provided by Mr. Michaud	0.10	17.50	KMR
	Analyze issue regarding service of process raised by Mr. Rossway	0.40	70.00	KMR
	Analyze issue regarding verification of motion raised by Mr. Rossway	0.10	17.50	KMR
	Telephone conference with office assistant at Mr. Reed Cary's office regarding response to subpoena for testimony	0.10	17.50	KMR
	Telephone conference with Mr. Cary regarding attendance of Ms. Marto at hearing on November 1	0.20	35.00	KMR

	Receipt of e-mails from Mr. Michaud regarding Ms. Casey's derogatory face book statements regarding Mr. Michaud	0.10	Pa g 12.50	e 255 of 324 PCLA
	Receipt and review of Mr. Michaud trial testimony regarding Amy Casey; advise Mr. Rollin of review of testimony and no evidence of statements made Attorney Wechsler attributed to Mr. Michaud regarding Amy Marto	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	Continue review of Ms. Casey's trial testimony for specific statements regarding Ms. Marto and the minor child, and other statements pertinent to the draft Final Judgment	0.60	75.00	PCLA
Oct-30-12	N/C - Contact Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant to obtain length of time for November 1, 2012 hearing; advise Mr. Rossway that Attorney Wechsler set a 15 minute hearing	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Review materials in contemplation of hearing; receive transcript ordered by opposing counsel; work on countering arguments by getting additional transcript language if possible	0.75	262.50	BWR
Oct-31-12	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's instructions, telephone conference with King Reporting for excerpt transcript of Judge's instructions regarding Closing Argument and Final Judgment	0.10	12.50	PCLA
	Receipt and review of excerpt transcript of Judge instructions at close of trial	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	Prepare file, exhibits, motions, notices, correspondence and transcripts for November 1, 2012 hearing	1.40	175.00	PCLA
	N/C - Update pleading and correspondence files for hearing	0.30	0.00	PCLA
Nov-05-12	25% Courtesy discount per Brad Rossway		-2,951.88	BWR
	Totals	78.45	\$8,855.62	
DISBURSEMENTS		Disbursem	ients	Receipts
Aug-06-12	Postage		0.45	
Aug-07-12	Photocopies		3.00	
No. of the last of	Postage		3.30	
	Fedex from Tim Michaud to Patti Cain, Rossway Moore		9.49	

		Invoice #:	66765	
Aug-10-12	Postage		0.45	Page 256 of 324
Aug-20-12	Telephone Charges		1.30	
	Telephone Charges		0.20	
	Telephone Charges		0.10	
Aug-21-12	Postage		0.45	
Aug-22-12	Postage		1.35	
Aug-23-12	Telephone Charges		0.70	
Aug-27-12	Postage		0.45	
Aug-30-12	Telephone Charges		1.10	
	Postage		0.45	
Sep-12-12	Telephone Charges		1.80	
Sep-24-12	Telephone Charges		0.30	
Sep-25-12	Postage		0.45	
Oct-02-12	Postage		0.45	
Oct-10-12	Telephone Charges		0.10	
-16-12	Photocopies		0.20	
	Postage		0.45	
Oct-25-12	Photocopies		0.90	
	Westlaw Online Research Access		35.00	
Oct-26-12	Photocopies		1.80	
	Telephone Charges		0.40	
	Westlaw Online Research Access		25.00	
Oct-29-12	Photocopies		0.30	
	Westlaw Online Research Access		45.00	
	Postage		1.70	
	Totals		\$136.64	\$0.00

Invoice #:

66765

Page 257 of 324 \$8,992.26 Current Fees & Disbursements \$22,230.47 Previous Balance \$22,230.47 Previous Payments \$8,992.26 BALANCE DUE

VERO BEACH - CORAL GABLES

ROSSWAY MOORE SWAN, P.L. THE MODERN ONE BUILDING 2101 INDIAN RIVER BOULEVARD, SUITE 200 VERO BEACH, FL 32960 Telephone (772) 231-4440 Facsimile (772) 231-4430

Mr. Timothy Michaud 1791 Wekiva Drive Melbourne, FL 32940

December 11, 2012

File #: 1682-001 Inv. #: 67490

Total Due: \$9,152.52

RE: Post-judgment issues

Please write the FILE number on your check to insure proper crediting.

SUMMARY

*Balance Fwd:

\$8,992.26

Payment received:

\$0.00)

Current Invoice Amount:

\$160.26

TOTAL DUE:

\$9,152.52

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	ATT'Y/L.A.
Nov-01-12	Extensive morning preparations for numerous scheduled hearings before the Hon. George Maxwell; telephone conference with client; review case law and issues to raise with court; prepare to defend issues relating to Mr. Michaud's conduct and law firm's conduct; review all Motions, Responses etc.; review materials from proposed Final Judgment to provide explanation to Judge George Maxwell	1.40	490.00	BWR
	N/C - Travel to the Viera Courthouse	1.00	0.00	BWR
	General discussions with the Court; attend extensive Motion concerning various issues raised; present argument and receive favorable ruling from court; work with client to provide supervised access visit in an effort to continue to try to be cooperative with attorney and her client, despite difficulties from opposing side arriving at acceptable solution to provide limited amount of contact while providing security to show the Court that client is being reasonable and accommodating	1.50	525.00	BWR

0/490

N/C - Return to Vero Beach	1.00	Page _{0.00}	259 of 324 BWR
N/C - Short office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding hearing preparations and confirming it is a fifteen minute hearing	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions review correspondence file and prepare a timeline of end of trial and providing extensive initial draft proposed Supplemental Final Judgment to opposing counsel, Attorney Wechsler's filing of her Motion to Compel draft final judgment and Notice of Hearing; prepare copies of transcripts and highlight testimony of Mr. Michaud, Ms. Casey, and Judge Maxwell; telephone conference with King Report to determine if Former Wife requested copies of transcripts; assist Mr. Rossway with review of issues and exhibits for hearing	2.10	125.00	PCLA
N/C - Telephone conference with Mr. Rossway, after hearing, for outcome of hearing, and instructions regarding Final Judgment, timesharing, and correspondence to Attorney Wechsler to retract Motion to Reopen Evidence, other issues from November 3rd hearing	0.40	0.00	PCLA
N/C - Prepare Notice of Unavailability	0.20	0.00	PCLA
N/C - Office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding drafting proposed Order, review of Judge ruling at hearing, agreements for supervised access, and requirements to provide final judgment to the court	0.20	0.00	PCLA
N/C - Reorganize file and documents post hearing	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, draft correspondence to Attorney Wechsler regarding supervised access for former wife for November 2nd and 3rd; telephone conference with Mr. Michaud to confirm locations and times for access	0.50	35.00	PCLA
N/C - Telephone conference with King Court Reporting to order Judge's ruling on closing arguments and final judgment from November 3, 2012 hearing	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Amend font and remove comment lines for each paragraph of Supplemental Final Judgment pursuant to the ruling at November 3rd hearing in preparations of providing (e-mailing) to Judge Maxwell	0.40	25.00	PCLA
N/C - Receipt of e-mail from Mr. Michaud with locations of Ms. Casey's access; amend correspondence to Attorney Wechsler to include addressees for locations of access	0.20	0.00	PCLA

Nov-02-12

-05-12

Nov-06-12

Work on issues regarding Court Order and supervise time-sharing	0.30	Pag€ 105.00	260 of (BW)
Work on Order	0.20	70.00	BWI
N/C - Telephone conference with King Reporting for status of excerpt transcript of Judge's ruling regarding filing Supplemental Final Judgment	0.10	0.00	PCLA
N/C - Telephone conference with King Reporter, Angel, to clarify excerpt of hearing Mr. Rossway would like to order and advise of need for transcript as soon as possible; advise Mr. Rossway of reporter's attempt to provide transcript by end of day, November 4th	0.10	0.00	PCLA
N/C - Receipt and review Attorney Wechsler's November 4, 2012 correspondence with a request to schedule supervised timesharing for Ms. Casey, and her family, with the minor child for Thanksgiving and Christmas; e-mail to Mr. Michaud for status of past weekend timesharing between the minor child and Ms. Casey and inquire if supervisor is available for the upcoming holidays; advise Mr. Rossway	0.20	0.00	PCLA
N/C - Scan and e-mail Mr. Michaud the King Reporting Invoice No. 31955 for excerpt transcript of Judge's ruling at August 2, 2012 trial regarding written Closing Arguments and Supplemental Final Judgment to be provided to the Court	0.10	0.00	PCLA
N/C - Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, draft correspondence to Mr. Michaud enclosing RMTS' November 4, 2012 invoice	0.30	0.00	PCLA
Receipt and review excerpt transcript of Judge's ruling on November 1, 2012; draft proposed Order Denying Former Wife's Motion to Require Former Husband to File A Closing Argument	0.50	62.50	PCLA
N/C - Receipt and review of Mr. Michaud's e-mail providing status on Ms. Casey's November 2nd and 3rd timesharing, and his position on requested additional unsupervised visitation, need to required the use of the agreed to supervisor, and for coordination of timesharing to be between the parties; provide to Mr. Rossway	0.10	0.00	PCLA
E-mail from and to Mr. Michaud regarding allocation of minor child's insurance costs pursuant to child support guidelines percentages	0.10	12.50	PCLA
N/C - Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's review, amend and inalize proposed Order for providing to Attorney Wechsler for approval	0.20	0.00	PCLA

67490

	W0 0 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1			261 of 324
ger Poort	N/C - Scan and e-mail proposed Order to Attorney Wechsler for comment and/or approval	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Review and approve Order and materials to be sent to opposing counsel to review; client provided very specific instructions regarding supervised visits; provide instruction to paralegal to prepare letter to outline clearly former wife's obligations if she wishes to have supervised visits	0.30	105.00	BWR
Nov-07-12	Review objections to proposed Order from November 1, 2012 hearing from opposing counsel; provide instruction to paralegal for response to Court	0.10	35.00	BWR
Nov-08-12	Review two letters to opposing counsel; review e-mail from opposing counsel challenging Order; refine letter to inform attorney that Mr. Michaud's order will be presented to the Court tomorrow at noon and request her Order; review language concerning supervised access and letter and approve final demand to be made to opposing lawyer; review and approve letter concerning Mr. Michaud's ability to provide text and e-mails of any non privileged matter to both attorneys in the case	0.40	140.00	BWR
	N/C - Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, additional e-mail Attorney Wechsler requesting response to proposed Order	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Receipt and review of e-mail from Attorney Wechsler with her comments and requested changes to the proposed Order Denying Former Wife's Morton to Require Former Husband to Provide Closing Argument; provide to Mr. Rossway	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Additional review of excerpt transcript of hearing; office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding requested Attorney Wechsler's requested changes to proposed Order, agreements regarding Mr. Michaud including Attorney Wechsler in e-mails to Mrs. Casey regarding Riley, and responding to Attorney Wechsler correspondence regarding holiday timesharing	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, draft correspondence to Attorney Wechsler confirming agreement regarding Mr. Michaud including Attorney Wechsler and Mr. Rossway on e-mails with Mrs. Casey regarding minor child and request written confirmation of agreements	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, draft correspondence to Attorney Wechsler regarding Mr. Michaud's position of Ms. Casey's request for holiday timesharing, provide information regarding November 2 and 3, 2012 timesharing, and continued objection to utilizing Mrs. Casey's friends to supervise in light of Mrs. Casey's July 2012 Face book posting	0.40	50.00	PCLA

	N/C - Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud to confirm prior timesharing issues and obtain authority to include reference to Mrs. Casey's Facebook posting in correspondence to Attorney Wechsler	0.10	Page _{0.00}	262 of 324 PCLA
	N/C - Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, draft further correspondence to Attorney Wechsler regarding agreed to changes to proposed Order Denying Former Wife's Motion to Require Former Husband to Provide Closing Argument, and objection to other requested changes pursuant to hearing transcript excerpt	0.30	0.00	PCLA
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway and Attorney Wechsler request, amend proposed Order	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Nov-09-12	N/C - Receipt of e-mail from Attorney Wechsler's office advising of her unavailably to review correspondence received on November 11, 2012 until November 12, 2012	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Nov-12-12	N/C - Scan and e-mail King Reporting Invoice No. 32029 to Mr. Michaud with request to pay directly	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions review the Former Wife's Motion to Reopen Evidence and the transcripts of Mr. Michaud and Mrs. Casey's testimony for inaccurate and false statements; draft correspondence to Attorney Wechsler requesting she withdraw Former Wife's Motion to Re-Open Evidence due to false statements attributed to Mr. Michaud in her pleadings	0.60	75.00	PCLA
	Receipt and review of Attorney Wechsler's e-mail requesting amendment to proposed Order to include requirement to provide proposed Final Judgments within 15 days of entry of Order; e-mail to and from Mr. Rossway; office conference with Mr. Rollin	0.10	12.50	PCLA
Nov-13-12	N/C - Scan and resend Mr. Rossway's November 9, 2012 correspondence regarding upcoming holidays and timesharing	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, office conference with Attorney Rollin to resolve pending issues with proposed Order	0.30	0.00	PCLA
	Pursuant to Attorney Rollin's directions, amend proposed Order on Former Wife's Motion to Require closing argument to include agreement to provide the court with counsel's proposed Supplemental Final Judgment on or before November 26, 2012 pending approval by Attorney Wechsler	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	N/C - Receipt of voicemail from Attorney Wechsler's office; e-mail to Attorney Wechsler's assistant confirming Mr. Rollin's telephone call with Attorney Wechsler on November 14, 2012	0.00	0.00	PCLA

0/470

	N/C - Conference with Patti Cain regarding drafting of proposed order; telephone conference with receptionist for Ms. Wechsler's office regarding timing of submitting proposed Final Judgments to Court	0.30	Page _{0.00}	263 of 324 KMR
Nov-14-12	Telephone conference with Attorney Wechsler regarding date to submit proposed Final Judgment to Court and potential Amended Motion to Reopen Evidence that removed statements wrongly attributed to the parties as testimony	0.30	45.00	KMR
	Telephone conference with Attorney Wechsler regarding guardian ad litem as means to address her concerns with Ms. Marto being in the home and belief that Riley needs counseling to deal with loss of Mother and Mother's family; discuss agreement for regular counseling in exchange for withdrawal of Motion to Reopen Evidence	0.40	50.00	KMR
	Finalize Order Denying Former Wife's Motion to Compel Closing Argument and Proposed Final Judgment and provide to Attorney Wechsler for final approval	0.10	12.50	PCLA
	Pursuant to Mr. Rollin's directions, review transcript of Ms. Casey's trial testimony regarding supervised timesharing and agreement to pay cost	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	N/C - Office conference with Mr. Rollin to provide Ms. Casey's testimony at trial regarding agreement to use supervisor for access and pay the cost, and discussion regarding Attorney Wechsler request for amending proposed access schedule, and revising her Motion to Reopen Evidence	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Nov-15-12	N/C - E-mail to Attorney Wechsler's assistants requesting status of Attorney Wechsler's approval of second amended proposed Order to include date to provide the Court with proposed/counter-proposed Supplemental Final Judgments	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Nov-16-12	N/C - Office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding lack of response from Attorney Wechsler to proposed amended Order; pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, e-mail to Attorney Wechsler advising of Mr. Rossway's intent to forward proposed Order to Judge Maxwell on November 19, 2012 if no response is received	0.20	0.00	PCLA
·	Review and approve packet of materials to send to the Judge next week	0.20	70.00	BWR
Nov-19-12	N/C - Receipt of Attorney Wechsler's approval of proposed Order; draft correspondence to Judge Maxwell enclosing Husband's proposed Order on Former Wife's Motion to Require Former Husband to File Closing Statement	0.30	0.00	PCLA

			Page	264_of_324
Nov-27-12	Work on Final Judgment preparation of materials and send letter to opposing counsel regarding Final Judgments are due and provided to the judge tomorrow	0.20	70.00	BWR
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, draft correspondence to Attorney Wechsler advising of providing Former Husband's proposed Supplemental Final Judgment to Judge Maxwell on November 28, 2012 and request for copy of Former Wife's cross-proposed Supplemental Final Judgment pursuant to Court ruling	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Final detailed review and amending of proposed Supplemental Final Judgment; prepare exhibits of prior orders; amend Parenting Plan to a "Court Ordered Plan" to be attached to as an exhibit	1.30	162.50	PCLA
Nov-28-12	N/C - Prepare Supplemental Final Judgment for scanning, e-mailing and mailing to Judge Maxwell, Attorney Wechsler, and Mr. Michaud	0.40	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud to advise of forwarding Supplemental Final Judgment to Judge Maxwell	0.10	12.50	PCLA
Nov-29-12	Revise letter to Ms. Wechsler regarding withdrawal of motion with scandalous and incorrect statements	0.80	140.00	KMR
	N/C - Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's instructions, review Former Wife's Closing Argument	0.60	0.00	KMR
	N/C - Telephone conference with Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant to clarify if Attorney Wechsler forwarded the Former Wife's Supplemental Final Judgment	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Receipt and print-out of Former Wife's e-mailed cover letter to Judge Maxwell, Counter- Proposed Supplemental Final Judgment, and Closing Argument	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Receipt of Former Wife's proposed documents e-mailed from Judge Maxwell's office; cursory review Former Wife's Closing Argument and Counter-Proposed Supplemental Final Judgment and note included reference to Ms. Marto as a "drug addict" in contradiction to information that the Former Husband never referenced Ms. Marto in this manner; e-mail Former Wife's Closing Argument and Counter-Proposed Supplemental Final Judgment to Mr. Michaud; advise Mr. Rollin of Attorney Wechsler's statements in her documents to the Court	0.50	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Office conference with Mr. Rossway to advise of Attorney Wechsler's use of "drug addict" in proposed Final Judgment and Closing Argument; pursuant to Mr. Rollin's directions pull excerpt transcripts from trial for Mr. Michaud and transcript of Aimee Casey's testimony	0.20	0.00	PCLA

0.45

	from trial for forthcoming correspondence to Attorney		Page	e 265 of 324
	Wechsler N/C - Scan and e-mail Mr. Rossway's correspondence to Attorney Wechsler together with transcripts (2), with copy to Mr. Michaud	0.30	0.00	PCLA
Nov-30-12	Research potential violation by Ms. Wechsler of Bounds of Advocacy	0.70	122.50	KMR
	Research potential violation by Ms. Wechsler of Rules of Professional Conduct	0.80	140.00	KMR
	Draft correspondence to Ms. Wechsler addressing violations of the rules of professional conduct	1.00	175.00	KMR
	N/C - Exchange e-mail correspondence with Mr. Rossway regarding letter to Ms. Wechsler addressing ethical violations	0.10	0.00	KMR
	Receipt of e-mail from Mr. Michaud regarding his concerns with Attorney Wechsler's misquoted statements included in Closing Argument and proposed Supplemental Final Judgment and forward to Mr. Rossway	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Begin review of highlighted portions of counter Final Judgment; provide input to Mr. Rollin concerning Demand Letter now that information contained in proposed Final Judgment is scandalously false and review letter to be sent to Attorney demanding withdrawal of information; receive email from client demanding action, etc.	0.50	175.00	BWR
Jan-02-13	Write off 25% per agreement	0.00	-1,705.79	BWR
	Write off 25% per agreement	0.00	-642.66	KMR
	Write off 25% per agreement	0.00	-702.39	PCLA
	Totals	25.90	\$141.66	
DISBURSEMEN	TS	Disbursem	ents	Receipts
Nov-01-12	Photocopies	8.40		
(Telephone Charges	:	2.70	
	Telephone Charges	(0.10	

Postage

		Invoice #:	67490	
Nov-02-12	Telephone Charges		0.80	Page 266 of 324
	Telephone Charges		0.40	G
;-05-12	Postage		1.30	
Nov-08-12	Telephone Charges		0.30	
Nov-13-12	Telephone Charges		0.20	
Nov-20-12	Postage		0.65	
Nov-28-12	Postage		3.30	
	Totals	\$	18.60	\$0.00
	Current Fees & Disbursements		щелини	\$160.26
	Previous Balance			\$8,992.26
	Previous Payments			\$0.00
	BALANCE DUE		-	\$9,152.52

VERO BEACH . CORAL GABLES

ROSSWAY MOORE SWAN, P.L. THE MODERN ONE BUILDING 2101 INDIAN RIVER BOULEVARD, SUITE 200 VERO BEACH, FL 32960 Telephone (772) 231-4440 Facsimile (772) 231-4430

Mr. Timothy Michaud 1791 Wekiva Drive Melbourne, FL 32940

February 6, 2013

File #: 1682-001 Inv. #: 68066

Total Due:

\$688.43

RE: Post-judgment issues

Please write the FILE number on your check to insure proper crediting.

SUMMARY

*Balance Fwd:

\$9,152.52

Payment received:

\$9,152.52)

Current Invoice Amount:

\$688.43

TOTAL DUE:

\$688.43

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	ATT'Y/L.A.
Nov-12-12	N/C - E-mail from Attorney Wechsler requesting re-email Mr. Rossway's November 9, 2012 correspondence; scan and resend	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Dec-03-12	Review and work on Demand Letter to opposing counsel; work on strategy to move to strike Motion and inform judge that Motion should be dealt with before entry of Final Judgment	0.20	70.00	BWR
Dec-04-12	Revise letter to Ms. Wechsler regarding misrepresentations	0.60	105.00	KMR
	N/C - E-mail correspondence from Attorney Rollin to Mr. Michaud; receipt of e-mail from Mr. Michaud regarding Former Wife's inappropriate question to minor child	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Pursuant to Mr. Michaud's request, e-mail additional copy of Former Wife's Closing Argument and "counter-proposed" Supplemental Final Judgment	0.10	0.00	PCLA

68066

Dec-05-12	N/C - Receipt and review e-mails between Mr. Michaud and Ms. Casey regarding inappropriate questioning of the minor child by Ms. Casey in her telephone contact December 3, 2012	0.10	Pag _{0.00}	e 268 of 324 PCLA
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, telephone conference with Mr. Michaud to provide Mr. Rossway's advice not to attempt to sanction attorneys prior to entry of Supplemental Final Judgment and appeal time has run as it may be detrimental to Mr. Michaud	0.50	62.50	PCLA
Dec-06-12	Receive and review correspondence from Ms. Wechsler regarding intent to amend Motion to Reopen Evidence	0.10	17.50	KMR
	N/C - Review of obnoxious, inappropriate voicemail message left by ex-spouse; review letter from Attorney Wechsler	0.10	0.00	BWR
	N/C - Receipt and review Mr. Michaud's e-mails with Ms. Casey requesting coordination for her timesharing for the Christmas; advise Mr. Rossway	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Receipt and review Mr. Michaud's e-mail regarding Ms. Casey's inappropriate and abusive telephone call at 7:41 a.m., December 6, 2012; advise Mr. Rossway	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Ģ	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, begin initial draft of correspondence to Attorney Wechsler regarding Ms. Casey's position on holiday timesharing, her demand that Mr. Michaud have no communication with her, and her abusive telephone call	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Dec-10-12	N/C - Office conference with Bradley Rossway regarding letter to Ms. Wechsler regarding inappropriate 6 minute phone call from Ms. Casey to Mr. Michaud	0.10	0.00	KMR
	N/C - Scan and e-mail King Court Reporting past-due invoice for the August 1 and 2, 2012 trial to Mr. Michaud for payment	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Scan and e-mail William T. Bressett's past due invoice for service on Amy Marto (2), William Waterman, Robert Sirianni, Esquire, and Paetra Brown, Esquire	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Dec-11-12	Review and revise letter to Ms. Wechsler regarding six minute phone call from Ms. Casey	1.50	262.50	KMR
Dec-13-12	N/C - Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, draft correspondence to Mr. Michaud enclosing RMS invoice dated December 11, 2012	0.30	0.00	PCLA
Dec-18-12	Receipt of e-mail from Mr. Michaud regarding status of Attorney Wechsler withdrawing Motion to Re-Open Evidence; office conference with Mr. Rollin; office	0.10	12.50	PCLA

	conference with Mr. Rossway; e-mail to Mr. Michaud advising that Attorney Wechsler has not withdrawn Motion		Page	269 of 324
Dec-20-12	Draft Motion to Strike Motion to Reopen Evidence	0.50	87.50	KMR
Dec-31-12	Review Motion	0.20	70.00	BWR
Jan-04-13	Receipt and review of e-mail between Mr. Michaud and Mr. Casey regarding proposed timesharing for Martin Luther King holiday; e-mail to Mr. Michaud advising of requirement that timesharing be supervised by himself or another person he approves in light of cost for professional supervisor; advise Mr. Rossway	0.10	12.50	PCLA
	Work on Motion to Court	0.50	175.00	BWR
Jan-08-13	N/C - Receipt and review e-mails between Mr. Michaud, Mr. Casey and Mrs. Casey regarding attempts to schedule timesharing with the minor child; advise Mr. Rossway	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, draft Motion to Strike	0.80	100.00	PCLA
	N/C - Update pleading and correspondence files	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Jan-09-13	Work on refining and completing Motion	0.30	105.00	BWR
	N/C - Office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding revisions to Motion to Strike Former Wife's Motion to Reopen Case to include specific transcript pages and that transcript to be provided to court at the hearing	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's review and instructions, amend and refine Motion to Strike with review of transcript of Mr. Michaud's testimony at trial regarding Ms. Marto	0.30	37.50	PCLA
Jan-10-13	Further review of materials for extensive Motion to Strike and letter to client	0.30	105.00	BWR
	Additional refining to Motion to Strike pursuant to Mr. Rossway further review; research all prior orders for the Court's requirements of confidentiality and privacy in this case	0.70	87.50	PCLA
	N/C - Prepare Notice of Unavailability; scan, e-file, and e-mail Notice to Clerk, opposing counsel, and client	0.20	0.00	PCLA

00000

	N/C -Draft correspondence to Judge Maxwell, enclosing Former Wife's Motion to Reopen Evidence and Former Husband's Motion to Strike Former Wife's Motion to Reopen Evidence	0.20	Page _{0.00}	e 270 of 324 PCLA
	N/C - Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's review, amend correspondence to Judge Maxwell	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Jan-11-13	N/C - Scan, E-File, e-mail and forward Former Husband's Motion to Strike to the Clerk, Judge Maxwell, Attorney Wechsler, and Mr. Michaud	0.30	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Receipt of e-mail from Mr. Michaud	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Jan-17-13	Receipt of Attorney Wechsler's Notice of Unavailability and calendar dates	0.10	12.50	PCLA
Jan-23-13	N/C - Office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding status of hearing on Motion to Strike; attempt to contact Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant; e-mail to Judicial Assistant requesting time for 30 minute hearing, and discussion regarding Mr. and Mrs. Casey's e-mails to Mr. Michaud regarding timesharing over Martin Luther King weekend and continued objections to use of Delight as supervisor, requesting Mr. Michaud to find a supervisor and threats to file a motion stating Mr. Michaud is interfering with the relationship between the minor child and Ms. Casey	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Jan-25-13	N/C - Telephone conference with Attorney Wechsler's office for availability for hearing; e-mail to Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant requesting hold on possible date in March 2013 for hearing on Former Husband's Motion to Strike	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, draft correspondence to Mr. Michaud enclosing past due King Reporting Invoices from August and November 2012	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Jan-28-13	N/C -E-mail to and from Attorney Wechsler's assistant to continue to coordinate Attorney Wechsler's availability for the hearing on Former Husband's Motion to Strike	0.10	0.00	PCLA .
	N/C - E-mail from Attorney Wechsler's office confirming availability for a hearing on March 14, 2013; e-mail to Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant confirming hearing date and time and requesting if hearing will be in Viera or Melbourne	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Feb-06-13	50% Courtesy write down per Brad Rossway		-686.25	BWR
	Totals	10.30	\$686.25	

DISBURSEMENT	r'S	Disbursements	Page 271 of 324 Receipts
3-05-12	Telephone Charges	2.30	
Dec-06-12	Photocopies	0.10	
Dec-13-12	Photocopies	0.10	
	Postage	0.65	
Jan-10-13	Postage	0.45	
Jan-25-13	Telephone Charges	0.30	
	Postage	0.45	
Feb-06-13	50% Courtesy Write off	-2.17	
	Totals	\$2.18	\$0.00
	Current Fees & Disbursements	-	\$688.43
	Previous Balance		\$9,152.52
	Previous Payments		\$9,152.52
	BALANCE DUE	-	\$688.43

·

VERO BEACH . CORAL GABLES

ROSSWAY MOORE SWAN, P.L. THE MODERN ONE BUILDING 2101 INDIAN RIVER BOULEVARD, SUITE 200 VERO BEACH, FL 32960 Telephone (772) 231-4440 Facsimile (772) 231-4430

Mr. Timothy Michaud 1791 Wekiva Drive Melbourne, FL 32940

March 4, 2013

File #: 1682-001 Inv. #: 68437

Total Due:

\$1,295.79

RE: Post-judgment issues

Please write the FILE number on your check to insure proper crediting.

SUMMARY

*Balance Fwd:

\$688.43

Payment received:

\$0.00)

Current Invoice Amount:

\$607.36

TOTAL DUE:

\$1,295.79

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	ATT'Y/L.A.
Feb-05-13	N/C - Scan, e-file, e-mail, and mail Notice of Hearing to Clerk of Court, Judge, Attorney Wechsler, and Mr. Michaud; prepare Memo to Clerk	0.30	0.00	PCLA
Feb-08-13	Work on situation regarding attorney remove herself from case and provide instruction to paralegal regarding upcoming hearing	0.30	105.00	BWR
Feb-11-13	Work on issue relating to lawyer's responsibilities, disclose potential illegal activity, discussions with associate attorney; review and approve letter to send to opposing counsel	0.20	70.00	BWR
Feb-12-13	Draft correspondence to Ms. Wechsler regarding potential ethical issues	1.10	192.50	KMR
reb-13-13	Revise letter to Ms. Wechsler pursuant to Mr. Rossway's request	0.20	35.00	KMR
Feb-25-13	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding his bank account being hacked and transfer of money, and	0.30	37.50	PCLA

	Vtext.com text sent and same time to Mr. Michaud, and		Page	e 273 of 324
C	Mr. Michaud's belief it is Amy Casey and has contacted bank and police department; advise Mr. Rossway			
	N/C - Additional e-mail from Mr. Michaud with bank statement showing additional transfer of funds	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Feb-26-13	Receipt of telephone call from Ms. Casey's "new" attorney, Jeffrey Glenn Thompson, and their request for copies of proposed Final Judgments and closing arguments; pull Martindale Hubble and Florida Bar information on Attorney Thompson; advise Mr. Rossway and provide information	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	N/C - Update file with Attorney Thompson's information	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Extensive discussion with Tim regarding his case and issues relating to Mrs. Casey's allegations; extensive discussions regarding Mrs. Casey's potential improper and potentially illegal access to Bank of America bank accounts and receive information regarding police investigation and Bank of America investigation; receive specific authorization from client to release appropriate information to refute allegations made by Mrs. Casey and draft authorization release document to be notarized by client	0.50	0.00	BWR
27-13	Telephone conference with Attorney Thompson's secretary with second request for our draft proposed Final Judgment provided to Judge Maxwell, and advise that Mr. Rossway will need to speak with Attorney Thompson regarding this matter upon his return to the office on March 11, 2013; advise Mr. Rossway	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Receipt and review of e-served Former Wife's Motion for Appointment of Parenting Coordinator and for Other Relief	0.10	12.50	PCLA
	Receipt and review of amended e-served Former Wife's Motion for Appointment of Parenting Coordinator	0.10	12.50	PCLA
Feb-28-13	Office conference with Mr. Rossway; telephone conference with Attorney Thompson's secretary with request in writing of withdraw of Former Wife's Motion to Reopen Evidence, setting their Motion for Parenting Coordinator and Other Relief on our hearing scheduled March 14, 2013, and scheduling telephone conference between attorneys to discuss case and providing our draft proposed final judgment	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Telephone conference with Attorney Thompson's assistant regarding Mr. Rossway agreement to set Former Wife's Motion for Appointment of Parenting Coordinator for hearing on March 14, 2013 upon written notice of withdraw of Former Wife's Motion to Reopen Evidence, and Mr. Rossway's telephone conference with Attorney Thompson; advise Mr. Rossway of Attorney	0.20	25.00	PCLA

Page 274 of 324

Thompson's agreement to file formal withdraw of Motion to Reopen Evidence		Γαζ	je 274 01 32
Office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding Attorney Thompson's Motion for Parenting Coordinator and to prepare a response	0.10	12.50	PCLA
Receipt and review of Notice of Withdraw of Former Wife's Motion to Reopen Evidence and Notice of Hearing on Former Wife's Motion for Appointment of Parenting Coordinator and Other Relief; advise Mr. Rossway	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Totals	4.40	\$602.50	

DISBURSEMENT	s	Disbursements	Receipts
Feb-05-13	Postage	0.46	
Feb-25-13	Photocopies	0.60	
Feb-26-13	Telephone Charges	2.50	
Feb-27-13	Telephone Charges	0.50	
	Telephone Charges	0.10	
28-13	Photocopies	0.40	
	Telephone Charges	0.10	
	Telephone Charges	0.10	
	Telephone Charges	0.10	
	Totals	\$4.86	\$0.00
	Current Fees & Disbursements		\$607.36
	Previous Balance		\$688.43
	Previous Payments		\$0.00
	BALANCE DUE	_	\$1,295.79

VERO BEACH . CORAL GABLES

ROSSWAY MOORE SWAN, P.L. THE MODERN ONE BUILDING 2101 INDIAN RIVER BOULEVARD, SUITE 200 VERO BEACH, FL 32960 Telephone (772) 231-4440 Facsimile (772) 231-4430

Mr. Timothy Michaud 1791 Wekiva Drive Melbourne, FL 32940

April 2, 2013

File #: 1682-001 Inv. #: 68824

Total Due:

\$4,243.91

RE: Post-judgment issues

Please write the FILE number on your check to insure proper crediting.

SUMMARY

*Balance Fwd:

\$1,295.79

Payment received:

\$0.00)

Current Invoice Amount:

\$2,948.12

TOTAL DUE:

\$4,243.91

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	ATT'Y/L.A.
Mar-01-13	N/C - Office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding preparations for hearing and drafting proposed order on Motion to Strike	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding further information on Ms. Casey in town and issues with Mr. Michaud's e-mails; advise Mr. Rossway	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Mar-04-13	Conference with Mr. Rossway for further review of hearing preparations to include copies of proposed Final Judgment regarding Former Wife's Motion for Appointment of Parenting Coordinator and e-mails evidencing Mr. Michaud's attempts to facilitate Ms. Casey's timesharing	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Begin preparations for upcoming hearing	0.40	140.00	BWR
Mar-06-13	E-mail from and to Mr. Michaud regarding appointment for minor child with Dr. Williamson, and information	0.10	12.50	PCLA

and the second s	obtained regarding Ms. Casey's new counsel and proposed parenting coordinator		Page	e 276 of 324
	E-mail with Mr. Michaud regarding providing Dr. Williamson with Mrs. Casey's newest motion for appointment parenting coordinator and for minor child to receive psychotherapy due to separation from her mother, for Dr. Williamson to review for update report to the Court	0.10	12.50	PCLA
Mar-07-13	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, begin drafting Former Husband's Response to Former Wife's Motion for Appointment of Parenting Coordinator and For Other Relief; review notes from trial and proposed Final Judgment regarding the issue of the Former Wife's request for a parenting coordinator having been addressed at trial	1.90	237.50	PCLA
Mar-09-13	Continue drafting Former Husband's Response with review of prior orders, transcript of hearing, proposed final judgement to insert dates, and references	0.70	87.50	PCLA
Mar-11-13	Extensive telephone conference with new opposing counsel in case; review additional information regarding response to be filed concerning inaccurate statements made in Motion filed by new attorney, and discussion with new attorney regarding various aspects of previous court rulings; provide information that Dr. Debra Day's report is to be sealed and not disseminated	0.40	140.00	BWR
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's review, additional review of transcripts and order to use as references in Response to Former Wife's Motion for Appointment of Parenting Coordinator and Other Relief regarding psychotherapy for the minor child	0.70	87.50	PCLA
	Begin drafting proposed Order on Former Wife's Motion for Appointment of Parenting Coordinator	0.40	50.00	PCLA
Mar-12-13	N/C - Receipt of e-mail from Mr. Michaud; attempt to contact Mr. Michaud	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding response to Former Wife's Motion for Appointment of Parenting Coordinator, Former Wife's failure to attempt to schedule timesharing when in Melbourne, and preparations for upcoming hearing, and minor child's current visit to Dr. Williamson and his concerns regarding Former Wife's proposed parenting coordinator; advise Mr. Rossway of Dr. Williamson's concerns	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	Begin preparing file and exhibits for hearing on Motion to Strike Former Wife's Motion to Reopen Evidence and Former Wife's Motion for Appointment of Parenting Coordinator, including review of orders, transcripts, and	1.80	225.00	PCLA

e-mails and highlight pertinent information for use at hearing relevant to each pending motion		Page	e 277 of 324
N/C - Attempt to contact Dr. Williamson's office and leave message	0.10	0.00	PCLA
N/C - Telephone conference with Dr. Williamson's assistant to attempt to schedule telephone conference	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's final review, amend Response to Motion for Appointment of Parenting Coordinator	0.20	25.00	PCLA
N/C - Scan, e-file and e-mail Former Husband's Response to Former Wife's Motion for Appointment of Parenting Coordinator and for Other Relief to the Clerk, Judge, Attorney Thompson, and Mr. Michaud	0.30	0.00	PCLA
Preparation for Motion to Strike Hearing and defense of Motion for Parenting Coordinator and for additional psychological counseling for minor child; preparation for potential defensive allegations to be made by Mrs. Casey and provide input to paralegal for materials to be prepared to present case and ask court to enter Final Judgment of dissolution of marriage	0.75	262.50	BWR
Early morning preparations for hearing with Mr. Rossway, including review of proposed order and amendments thereto, review and amending of bullet points of issues, and review of exhibits	0.70	87.50	PCLA
N/C - Travel to Viera Courthouse	1.10	0.00	PCLA
Attend hearing and assist with documents and exhibits, and record Judge's ruling; post hearing meeting with Mr. Rossway, Mr. Michaud and Attorney Thompson to negotiate and record agreements regarding the Former Wife's supervised timesharing for March 15, 16, and 17, 2013 with Mr. Michaud to act as supervisor; receive instructions from Mr. Rossway on updating and finalizing proposed Supplemental Final Judgment for providing to Judge Kanarek	1.25	156.25	PCLA
N/C - Travel back to RMS	0.90	0.00	PCLA
N/C - Reorganize file post hearing	0.30	0.00	PCLA
Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, draft correspondence to Attorney Thompson setting out agreements for dates and times of Ms. Casey's supervised timesharing	0.40	50.00	PCLA
N/C - Attempt to contact Mr. Michaud regarding times for upcoming timesharing	0.10	0.00	PCLA

Mar-13-13

-14-13

Telephone conference with Attorney Thompson regarding status of Ms. Casey's approval/acceptance of available timesharing for March 15, 16, and 17 and proposed Stipulation	0.10	12.50	PCLA
Receipt of voicemail from Attorney Thompson's office regarding Ms. Casey's intent to adhere to Mr. Michaud's offered timesharing; telephone conference with Attorney Thompson's office to request agreement in writing regarding Ms. Casey's supervised timesharing	0.10	12.50	PCLA
Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud to advise of Ms. Casey's agreement regarding supervised timesharing for March 15, 16, and 17, 2013	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Receipt of e-mailed confirmation letter from Attorney Thompson regarding Ms. Casey's timesharing; short call to Mr. Michaud to advise that timesharing for the weekend if confirmed; advise Mr. Rossway	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Amend Supplemental Final Judgment on Modification pursuant to Judge Maxwell's instructions at the hearing of March 14, 2013 including alternative supervisors for timesharing, calculate additional support since trial, and review in entirety; amend Parenting Plan regarding additional alternative supervisors for timesharing	1.90	237.50	PCLA
Early morning review of materials for hearing, review proposed Order granting Motion to Strike with specific language indicating that client never made disparaging remarks regarding Ms. Marto; review pleadings, review arguments for Court etc.	0.60	210.00	BWR
N/C - Travel to Viera Courthouse	1.10	0.00	BWR
Meet with client; discussions with opposing counsel; attend hearing; receive instruction from Judge regarding Order granting Motion to Strike to be incorporated into Final Judgment; meetings with client and opposing counsel; provide instruction to paralegal regarding materials to be prepared for Final Judgment to be sent to Judge Maxwell on Monday morning	1.25	437.50	BWR
N/C Travel to return to Vero Beach	0.90	0.00	BWR
Review proposed Final Judgment with drafted additional changes pursuant to the Judge's orders; review updated information concerning entry date of Final Judgment including updated amounts for child support that will be due and owing; identify additional issues for the judge to place into completed Final Judgment; review completed, final twenty-five page document; review	0.90	315.00	BWR

Mar-16-13

	Invoice #:	68824	
extensive voicemail from Dr. Williamson on issues regarding minor child		Page	e 279 of 324
Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's final review, amend prop Supplemental Final Judgment to include language regarding the March 14, 2013 hearing on Former W Motion for Appointment of Parenting Coordinator a Judge ruling	ife's	50.00	PCLA
Draft correspondence to Judge Maxwell setting out changes to the Supplemental Final Judgment and Parenting Plan, and required determinations by the Judge regarding the findings of contempt against the Former Wife		75.00	PCLA
Draft Income Withholding Order and Notice to Payor telephone conference with Attorney Thompson's offit to request the Wife's employer information; telephor conference with Clerk for the Court identifier numbers e-mail and address for Income Withholding Order; telephone conference with Mr. Michaud for Ms. Cassocial security and employer; additional e-mail to Attorney Thompson; research address for Ms. Casey employer	ice ne er, ey's	200.00	PCLA
Pursuant to Mr. Rossway review and missing information for Ms. Casey, amend correspondence to Judge Maxwell	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Telephone conference with Attorney Thompson's off in response to request for copies of both parties' proposed Final Judgments and that no information we provided regarding her employment or social securit number, and advise that at the March 14, 2013 hearing Attorney Thompson was advised that Ms. Casey's prattorney provider her with complete file, and that the Judge recognized that he had both proposed Final Judgments; advise Mr. Rossway	vas Y ng ior	25.00	PCLA
N/C - Copy, scan, e-mail and, mail correspondence to Judge Maxwell, Supplemental Final Judgment, Parenting Plan, Child Support Guidelines, and Incommon Withholding Order to Judge Maxwell; e-mail (restrict copy to Attorney Thompson	ne	0.00	PCLA
Receipt of Former Wife's social security number from Mr. Michaud; amend Income Withholding Order and e-mail to Judge Maxwell		25.00	PCLA
Receipt of third request for copies of Former Husbar and Former Wife's proposed Final Judgments from Attorney Thompson despite their acknowledgment o precept of two boxes of documents from Ms. Casey; advise Mr. Rossway	f	12.50	PCLA

0.90

112.50

PCLA

Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, and Attorney Thompson's request for proposed Supplemental Final

...ar-18-13

Mar-19-13

	Judgments, highlight all counter-proposed language in Former Wife's Counter-Proposed Final Judgment; draft correspondence to Attorney Thompson;		Pag	e 280 of 324
	N/C - Fax correspondence to Attorney Thompson and Former Wife's Counter-Proposed Final Judgment after restricting editing of Final Judgment	0.40	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Scan and resend proposed Final Judgment and attachments to Mr. Michaud	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Review and approve materials to be sent to opposing counsel and to Judge Maxwell, provide Income Withholding Order, proposed Judgment, and related materials	0.10	35.00	BWR
	Telephone message for Mr. Thompson's office; return telephone call and speak with paralegal regarding materials provided and confirm scanned Final Judgment was presented and sent to Mr. Thompson's office	0.10	35.00	BWR
Mar-26-13	N/C - Receipt of e-mail from Mr. Michaud regarding scrivener's error in proposed Supplemental Final Judgment regarding date of minor child tuning 6 and month of Dr. Day's Report; pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, amend Supplemental Final Judgment and e-mail to Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant with apology for error and inconvenience; with restricted copy to Attorney Thompson	0.30	0.00	PCLA
Mar-27-13	Receipt and review of Attorney Thompson's proposed Stipulated Order on Supervised Timesharing, and provide to Mr. Rossway for review with copy to Mr. Michaud for comment	0.10	12.50	PCLA
Mar-28-13	Review all materials sent to Judge Maxwell; review invalid stipulation sent; review stipulation in conjunction with parenting plan attached to Final Judgment and provide stipulation materials to Patti Cain for reworking concerning temporary stipulation to be in effect only until Final Judgment is entered in this case	0.30	105.00	BWR
Mar-29-13	E-mail from Mr. Michaud with points to be included in Stipulation regarding temporary supervised timesharing; advise Mr. Rossway	0.10	12.50	PCLA
	E-mails from Mr. Michaud regarding April deadline for payment of arrears and child support; e-mail to Mr. Michaud advising of Court's ability to amend documents	0.10	12.50	PCLA
(N/C - Short office conference with Mr. Rossway for instructions to draft proposed Stipulation of the parties on temporary supervised timesharing to incorporate Mr. Michaud's requested conditions	0.20	0.00	PCLA

Invoice #:

68824

Page 281 of 324 -734.75 BWR

Apr-02-13

20% Courtesy discount per Brad Rossway

Totals

27.35

\$2,939.00

DISBURSEME	NTS	Disbursements	Receipts
Mar-11-13	Telephone Charges	1.20	
Mar-12-13	Telephone Charges	0.10	
	Telephone Charges	0.10	
	Telephone Charges	0.30	
Mar-14-13	Telephone Charges	0.20	
Mar-15-13	Telephone Charges	0.20	
	Telephone Charges	0.20	
	Telephone Charges	0.20	
Mar-18-13	Telephone Charges	0.30	
	Telephone Charges	0.30	
	Telephone Charges	1.40	
	Telephone Charges	0.20	
	Telephone Charges	0.20	
	Telephone Charges	0.10	
	Telephone Charges	1.00	
	Telephone Charges	0.40	
	Postage	2.72	
	Totals	\$9.12	\$0.00
	Current Fees & Disbursements		\$2,948.12
	Previous Balance		\$1,295.79
	Previous Payments		\$0.00
	BALANCE DUE		\$4,243.91

VERO BEACH . CORAL GABLES

ROSSWAY MOORE SWAN, P.L. THE MODERN ONE BUILDING 2101 INDIAN RIVER BOULEVARD, SUITE 200 VERO BEACH, FL 32960 Telephone (772) 231-4440 Facsimile (772) 231-4430

Mr. Timothy Michaud 1791 Wekiva Drive Melbourne, FL 32940

May 6, 2013

File #: 1682-001 Inv. #: 69327

Total Due: \$5,165.47

RE: Post-judgment issues

Please write the FILE number on your check to insure proper crediting.

SUMMARY

*Balance Fwd:

\$4,243.91

Payment received:

W7,273.71

Current Invoice Amount:

\$0.00) \$921.56

(

TOTAL DUE:

\$5,165.47

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	ATT'Y/L.A.
Apr-02-13	Work on stipulation issue; provide instruction to paralegal regarding completion of stipulation in contemplation of supervised visitation before entry of Final Judgment and after Final Judgment is entered	0.20	70.00	BWR
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, draft a Stipulation for Interim Supervised Timesharing for the Former Wife, incorporating Mr. Michaud's required stipulations	1.10	137.50	PCLA
Apr-03-13	Continue drafting Stipulation with review of proposed Parenting Plan; draft Order Approving Stipulation	0.50	62.50	PCLA
	N/C - Short telephone call with Mr. Michaud to confirm requesting terms for Stipulation	0.10	0.00	PCLA
V	N/C - Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, draft correspondence to Mr. Michaud enclosing April 2, 2013 RMS invoice	1.70	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - E-mail Mr. Michaud the	0.10	0.00	PCLA

	proposed Stipulation on Former Wife's Interim Supervised Timesharing for review		Page	e 283 of 32
	N/C - E-mail from and to Mr. Michaud regarding review of Stipulation and telephone conference with Mr. Rossway	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Apr-04-13	Pursuant to Mr. Michaud's e-mailed comments, amend Stipulation on Former Wife's Interim Supervised Timesharing	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Receipt, print and review e-mailed Motion for Reconsideration of Child Support, Motion to Deviate from Child Support Guidelines and Motion for Unsupervised Timesharing; short office conference with Mr. Rossway; forward Motions to Mr. Michaud	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	N/C - Receipt and review of Attorney Thompson's correspondence to Judge Maxwell with requested revisions to proposed Final Judgment, and attached transcript of Wife's testimony regarding the hiring of a "media specialist"	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud to review former wife's recent filings regarding unsupervised timesharing and reduction of child support to accommodate cost of supervisor for timesharing, and scheduling hearing to keep case moving forward towards entry of supplemental final judgment	0.50	175.00	BWR
Apr-05-13	N/C - Attend telephone conference between Mr. Rossway and Mr. Michaud for update on case and new pleadings from Ms. Casey	0.50	0.00	PCLA
	Receive three Motions from opposing counsel; receive input from client regarding current updated situation and circumstances; at client's request, provide update regarding information on Michaud- Casey matter	0.50	175.00	BWR
Apr-08-13	N/C - E-mail from and to Mr. Michaud regarding Amy Marto; advise Mr. Rossway	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding Ms. Marto and status of Final Judgment, and Ms. Casey's recent Motions;	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	Telephone conference with Judge Maxwell's office for status of Final Judgment and hearing on Former Wife's Motions; advise Mr. Rossway	0.10	12.50	PCLA
C	N/C - Receipt of voicemail from Attorney Thompson's office regarding scheduling hearing dates on Former Wife's Motions	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Receipt of e-mail from Attorney Thompson regarding approval of Stipulation but advising that Brevard	0.10	12.50	PCLA

69327

6	Sheriffs will not supervise Ms. Casey's timesharing and other charge \$500; Advise Mr. Rossway and forward to Mr. Michaud		Page	284 of 324
	N/C - Receipt of e-mail from Attorney Thompson's assistant with hearing dates in June on Former Wife's Motions; short office conference with Mr. Rossway	0.10	12.50	PCLA
	N/C - Receipt of e-mailed Notice of Hearing; forward to Mr. Michaud	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Receive additional information regarding Mr. Michaud's personal situation	0.10	35.00	BWR
	N/C - Receipt of voice mail from Attorney Thompson's office for request to set hearing on former wife's pending motions; obtain hearing dates from Judge Maxwell's office and coordinate with Attorney Thompson for June 21, 2013 hearing	0.30	0.00	PCLA
Apr-22-13	Scan and e-mail to Mr. Michaud a copy of William T. Bressett, process server's past due Invoice for Service of Trial and Deposition Subpoenas in July 2012	0.10	12.50	PCLA
Apr-23-13	N/C - Short office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding pending Supplemental Final Judgment and upcoming hearing on Former Wife's Motions, and Mr. Michaud to take minor child to Dr. Edwards prior to hearing	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Apr-24-13	Receipt of e-mail from Attorney Thompson's office regarding resetting hearing on Wife's Motions; telephone conference with Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant; telephone call with Attorney Thompson's assistant regarding June 24, 2013 hearing date and Ms. Casey request for timesharing; e-mail to Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant to confirm June 24th hearing date; receipt of e-mail from Attorney Thompson's office requesting Judge Maxwell's office wait to confirm date until timesharing is scheduled; e-mail from Judge Maxwell's office confirming June 24th hearing; advise Mr. Rossway	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Apr-25-13	E-mail to Mr. Michaud advising of revised hearing date on Wife's Motions and request for timesharing	0.10	12.50	PCLA
	Receipt of Mr. Michaud's agreement for timesharing for June 22 and 23; e-mail to Attorney Thompson's assistant setting out requirements for Ms. Casey's supervised timesharing weekend prior to hearing	0.20	25.00	PCLA
29-13	Receipt of e-mail from Ms. Casey's attorney requesting Mr. Michaud's friends, who currently provide some babysitting, to supervise Ms. Casey's timesharing for June 22 and 23, 2013; forward request to Mr. Michaud for response; receipt of Mr. Michaud's e-mail advising of his friends position to not become involved with	0.20	25.00	PCLA

Invoice #:

69327

Page 285 of 324

Ms. Casey; e-mail Attorney Thompson Mr. Michaud's response		_	
Pursuant to Mr .Rossway's directions, draft correspondence to Attorney Thompson regarding the Wife further request for Mr. Michaud's friends to supervise Ms. Casey's timesharing	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	-		
Totals	8.40	\$917.50	

DISBURSEME	ENTS	Disbursements	Receipts
Apr-03-13	Telephone Charges	0.20	
	Postage	0.66	
Apr-05-13	Telephone Charges	2.30	
Apr-08-13	Telephone Charges	0.50	
Apr-24-13	Telephone Charges	0.20	
	Telephone Charges	0.20	
	Totals	\$4.06	\$0.00
	Current Fees & Disbursements		\$921.56
	Previous Balance		\$4,243.91
	Previous Payments		\$0.00
	BALANCE DUE		\$5,165.47

VERO BEACH . CORAL GABLES

ROSSWAY MOORE SWAN, P.L. THE MODERN ONE BUILDING 2101 INDIAN RIVER BOULEVARD, SUITE 200 VERO BEACH, FL 32960 Telephone (772) 231-4440 Facsimile (772) 231-4430

Mr. Timothy Michaud 1791 Wekiva Drive Melbourne, FL 32940

July 5, 2013

File #: 1682-001 Inv. #: 70235

Total Due: \$10,093.02

RE: Post-judgment issues

Please write the FILE number on your check to insure proper crediting.

SUMMARY

*Balance Fwd:

\$5,165.47

Payment received:

\$0.00)

Current Invoice Amount:

\$4,927.55

TOTAL DUE:

\$10,093.02

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	ATT'Y/L.A.
May-02-13	Review communications regarding contact and time-sharing and respond to April email requesting time-sharing	0.10	35.00	BWR
	N/C - Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's review amend correspondence to Attorney Thompson regarding timesharing; e-mail to Attorney Thompson and Mr. Michaud	0.20	0.00	PCLA
May-03-13	Telephone conference with Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant regarding Judge's request for telephonic hearing with Mr. Rossway and Attorney Thompson for review of Final Judgment and Former Wife's requested revisions; telephone conference with Attorney Thompson's office for availability; office conference with Mr. Rossway; pull proposed Supplemental Final Judgment and Former Wife's pending Motions	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	Attend telephonic hearing between Judge Maxwell, Mr. Rossway and Attorney Thompson for review or requested amendments to the Supplemental Final Judgment by the Former Wife; record Judge's rulings	0.90	112.50	PCLA

regarding requested amendments to proposed Supplemental Final Judgment; office conference with Mr. Rossway for review of required changes to proposed Supplemental Final Judgment		Pag	e 287 of 324
Amend Supplemental Final Judgment pursuant to Judge Maxwell's rulings	0.70	87.50	PCLA
Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's review of hearing notes, make minor revisions to Supplemental Final Judgment and highlight revisions for easy review by Attorney Thompson	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Draft correspondence to Judge Maxwell setting out page and paragraph of specific revisions to the Supplemental Final Judgment pursuant to his directives and rulings	0.30	37.50	PCLA
N/C - E-mail amended Supplemental Final Judgment to Attorney Thompson with request for reply by end of day in order that Final Judgment may be forwarded to Judge Maxwell pursuant to his directions	0.10	0.00	PCLA
N/C - Receipt of e-mail from Attorney Thompson's assistant advising that he is out of office until May 6, 2013; advise Mr. Rossway	0.10	0.00	PCLA
N/C - Receipt of e-mail from Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant advising of Judge Maxwell out of the office May 6 through May 10, 2013; advise Mr. Rossway	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Receive telephone message from Judge's Judicial Assistant requesting immediate hearing with Mr. Thompson; short meeting with paralegal to review proposed Final Judgment and participate in extensive telephonic hearing with Judge Maxwell and opposing counsel to discuss extensive issues and receive specific instruction regarding narrowing of certain paragraphs pursuant to Judge's very specific instructions; work with paralegal on changes	0.90	315.00	BWR
Telephone conference with client to discuss material portion of Judge's instructions concerning Final Judgment	0.20	70.00	BWR
Review changes to Final Judgment and authorize sending materials to opposing counsel with notification that changes will be sent to Judge Maxwell on Saturday	0.30	105.00	BWR
N/C - Receipt of copy of Ms. Casey's e-mail to Mr. Michaud requesting dates for Riley's appointments and status of summer activities/daycare	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Receipt of Attorney Thompson's e-mail with additional requested changes to proposed Supplemental Final Judgment and request if Mr. Rossway will object to Former Wife's pending Motions scheduled to be heard	0.20	25.00	PCLA

May-13-13

Page 288 of 324

		Fage 200 of 52		
June 24, 2013; office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding Judge's ruling on entering the Final Judgment and Former Wife's option to file modification, and preparing Final Judgment to be e-mailed to Judge Maxwell for entry with Attorney Thompson's additional request revisions				
N/C - Receipt of Former Wife's Re-Notice of Hearing for June 24, 2013 and calendar; advise Mr. Rossway; e-mail Re-Notice of Hearing to Mr. Michaud	0.10	0.00	PCLA	
Review amended proposed Supplemental Final Judgment in regard to Attorney Thompson's additional requested changes regarding Dean Tong and Ms. Casey's therapy together with Ms. Casey's testimony transcript and notes on Judge's ruling from May 3, 2013; pull Dean Tong's bio and website to verify his "title"; make revisions to Judgment	0.60	75.00	PCLA	
N/C - E-mail King Reporting's Invoice for the March 25, 2013 hearing to Mr. Michaud for payment	0.10	0.00	PCLA	
Research appellate opinion	0.10	17.50	KMR	
Office conference with Mr. Rossway for review of changes to Supplemental Final Judgment pursuant to Attorney Thompson's request, and to forward to Judge Maxwell	0.20	25.00	PCLA	
Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, recalculate Ms. Casey's current support arrears though May 1, 2013 and amend Final Judgment to reflect Ms. Casey support arrears to date of providing the proposed Supplemental Final Judgment to Judge Maxwell	0.70	87.50	PCLA	
Draft correspondence to Judge Maxwell providing that all ordered changes have been made, Attorney Thompson's requested changes were made with exception of monthly amount of Former Wife's payment of support arrears, and advise of amendment to update Former Wife's current support arrears	0.50	62.50	PCLA	
Office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding 20% guideline for additional monthly support, and pursuant to further review by Mr. Rossway, amend Final Judgment and correspondence to Judge Maxwell to amend amount of monthly support arrearage payment	0.40	50.00	PCLA	
Work on Final Judgment issues; meet with paralegal to go over most recent changes to Final Judgment and requested changes from opposing counsel; review letter to judge and related information; refine and add to same	0.40	140.00	BWR	
Work on further changes to Final Judgment pursuant to request from opposing attorney; provide letter to Judge and opposing attorney concerning agreed changes and	0.30	105.00	BWR	

May-14-13

May-15-13

Page 289 of 324

changes that were	not agreed	upon f	for Judge's
consideration			

May-16-13

May-20-13

May-21-13

May-22-13

May-23-13

Consideration			
Receive objection emails from opposing counsel continuing to make the same argument as previously espoused; late evening phone call to paralegal to provide instruction for response letter to be prepared first thing in the morning and to allow Judge Maxwell to know that former wife continues to object to every single matter brought before the Court and to clarify the counsel made a misrepresentation in his communication to the Court	0.20	70.00	BWR
N/C - Scan and e-mail Mr. Rossway's correspondence to Judge Maxwell with Supplemental Final Judgment, all exhibits, Attorney Thompson's May 8, 2013 e-mail to Judge Maxwell, Attorney Thompson's e-mail explanation of requested changes; copy Attorney Thompson and Mr. Michaud with all documents	0.60	0.00	PCLA
N/C - Reorganize all drafts, correspondence, notes and documents related to drafting and amending the Supplemental Final Judgment	0.30	0.00	PCLA
Receipt and review of e-mail from Attorney Thompson advising of his displeasure that all of his suggested changes were not included in the proposed Supplemental Judgment sent to Judge Maxwell; telephone conference with Mr. Rossway	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, draft correspondence to Judge Maxwell advising that all changes the to the enclosed Supplemental Final Judgment pursuant to his rulings in the May 3, 2013 telephone hearing, together with Attorney Thompson's May 8 e-mail, are provided for his review	0.40	50.00	PCLA
N/C - Short office conference with Mr. Rossway for instructions to prepare response to Attorney Thompson regarding Former Wife's pending motions	0.10	0.00	PCLA
N/C - Receipt of additional e-mails between Ms. Casey and Mr. Michaud regarding minor child and print for file	0.10	0.00	PCLA
N/C - Receipt of e-mails between Mr. Michaud and Ms. Casey regarding minor child's summer activities and care	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, draft correspondence to Attorney Thompson regarding Former Wife's pending motions for unsupervised timesharing and waiver of child support in lieu of timesharing travel expenses; review and print excerpt copy of transcript regarding Former Wife's testimony for providing to Attorney Thompson	0.80	100.00	PCLA

10233

	N/C - Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's review, amend and refine correspondence to Attorney Thompson	0.20	Page _{0.00}	e 290 of 324 PCLA
	N/C - E-mail Mr. Rossway's correspondence to Attorney Thompson and Mr. Michaud	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Jun-05-13	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, contact Attorney Singer's paralegal for suggested supervisors for timesharing; pursuant to Attorney Singer's request prepare e-mail of requirements and information for supervised timesharing and name of Melbourne off-duty officer experienced in supervising timesharing	0.40	50.00	PCLA
Jun-06-13	Begin preparations for next hearing; work on issue regarding supervisors to be provided to the court	0.30	105.00	BWR
	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding hearing, potential supervisors for timesharing, and issues with Ms. Casey's telephone calls and face time with	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	Telephone conference with Mark Jennewein, Melbourne Police Officer, regarding off-duty work as supervisor of timesharing, cost, availability of additional off-duty police and/or sheriff's in Brevard and Palm Bay, and provide a little background of guidelines for Ms. Casey's timesharing, and request for written statement of names and contact information for all available off-duty police/sheriff's and costs for services with possibility of need of their services the weekend of the hearing, June 22 and 23, 2013	0.40	50.00	PCLA
Jun-07-13	Advise Mr. Rossway of several off-duty Brevard Policy and Sheriffs available to provide supervision for Ms. Casey's timesharing and fee being lower than Delight McGregarian	0.10	12.50	PCLA
	E-mail to Mr. Michaud regarding off-duty police officer Mark Jennewein's ability to supervise timesharing	0.10	12.50	PCLA
	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding Officer Jennewein, and other police officers, availability to supervise, Mr. Michaud's intent to contact the Sheriff's department for additional off-duty Sheriff available to supervise Ms. Casey, and discussion regarding offering Ms. Casey supervised timesharing the weekend just before the hearing scheduled for June 23, 2013	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Jun-13-13	Begin preparation for hearing; receive Stipulation of Withdrawal; work on response, etc.	0.40	140.00	BWR
4-13	Telephone conference with Lisa of Jeffrey Thompson's office relaying that Mr. Rossway can not consider agreeing to withdrawal without first seeing motion and ascertain that Mr. Thompson will not be cancelling the hearing set for June 24th as "they are her hearings"	0.10	12.50	CRLA

e #: 70235

Jun-17-13	Research case law supporting opposition to withdrawal	0.20	Pag 35.00	e 291 of 324 KMR
	N/C - Short office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding responsive letter to Attorney Thompson to Attorney's Motion to Withdraw as counsel for Ms. Casey	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, draft correspondence to Attorney Thompson regarding his Motion to Withdraw being set on together with Former Wife's pending Motions June 24, 2013	0.10	12.50	PCLA
	N/C - Attempt to contact Mr. Michaud regarding Attorney Thompson's Motion to Withdraw, and contact with off-duty officers for supervised timesharing; e-mail to Mr. Michaud with Mr. Rossway's correspondence to Attorney Thompson and request for return call regarding Brevard off-duty officers	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Telephone call with King Court Reporting for June 24, 2013 hearing; e-mail Amended Notice of Hearing to King Reporting	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Receipt of e-mail from Attorney Thompson's assistant with attached correspondence to Judge Maxwell and proposed Order on Withdraw; office conference with Mr. Rossway; pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, provide Mr. Rollin instructions for research on ability to object to Attorney Thompson's withdraw due to Former Wife's pending Motions to be heard June 24, 2013	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Begin preparation for hearings	0.30	105.00	BWR
Jun-18-13	Research case law regarding due process right of a party to object to withdrawal of opposing counsel	0.50	87.50	KMR
	Draft Objection to Motion For Ex Parte Order for Withdrawal	1.20	210.00	KMR
	Pursuant to Mr. Rollin's request, review file for statements by Attorney Thompson to withhold entry of Supplemental Final Judgment pending hearing on Former Wife's outstanding Motions to be heard June 24, 2013	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	Pull copies of e-mails between the parties regarding Ms. Casey seeking information regarding the minor child's caregiver and activities for the Summer; prepare e-mails for June 24, 2013 hearing	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	Prepare bullet points for Former Wife's Motion to Allow Unsupervised Parenting Time; prepare exhibits for hearing	0.70	87.50	PCLA

Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, review and amend Objection to Attorney's Ex Parte Motion to Withdrawal	0.20	Page 25.00	e 292 of 324 PCLA
N/C - Attempt to contact Officer Jennewein and leave message for return call	0.10	0.00	PCLA
N/C - Draft correspondence to Judge Maxwell enclosing Former Husband's Objection to Attorney's Motion for Ex Parte Withdraw	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud for his current income, day care/summer camp, and health insurance; prepare Child Support Guidelines with Former Wife having South Carolina state taxes; run reports and update headings	0.60	75.00	PCLA
N/C - Scan, e-file, and e-mail Former Husband's Objection to Attorney's Motion for Ex Parte Withdraw with Clerk of Court, Judge Maxwell, Attorney Thompson, and Mr. Michaud	0.30	0.00	PCLA
N/C - Update Pleading File	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Prepare Bullet Points for Attorney Thompson's Motion to Withdraw; prepare exhibits, including case law	0.50	62.50	PCLA
Prepare Bullet Points for Motion to Deviate from Child Support Guidelines; prepare exhibits	0.40	50.00	PCLA
Prepare Bullet Points for Motion to Reconsider Child Support Guidelines; pull child support guidelines filed by Former Wife at trial to determine if South Carolina state tax was considered	0.50	62.50	PCLA
Begin preparations for upcoming hearing; work on issue relating to attorney's letter indicating he has the unilateral right to withdraw from case; task associate with preparing appropriate response to send to Judge objecting to withdrawal	0.50	175.00	BWR
N/C - E-mails with Attorney Thompson's assistant regarding correct time for June 24, 2013 hearing; e-mail to King Court Reporting advising of correct time for hearing	0.10	0.00	PCLA
E-mail to Officer Mark Jennewein requesting return call or e-mail at his earliest convenience	0.10	12.50	PCLA
Receipt of e-mail from Attorney Thompson's assistant regarding setting Motion to Withdrawal prior to hearing on June 24, 2013; office conference with Mr. Rossway; e-mail to Attorney Thompson's assistant advising of Mr. Rossway's unavailability; receipt of Notice of Hearing for June 24, 2013 on Attorney's Motion to Withdrawal	0.20	25.00	PCLA

Jun-19-13

70235

Receipt and review of Mr. Michaud's pay stub and benefit form; e-mail to Mr. Michaud regarding status of his contacting the Sheriff's Department for availability of investigative off-duty officer to supervise timesharing	0.20	Pag o 25.00	e 293 of 324 PCLA
Office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding receipt of Supplemental Final Judgment signed by Judge Maxwell on "July" 14, 2013; pursuant to instructions, attempt to contact Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant; e-mail from Judicial Assistant requesting e-mailed copy of the proposed Supplemental Final Judgment; line-by-line review copy of previously proposed Judgment provided to Judge Maxwell against Judge Maxwell's signed Judgment to determine exact copy prior to providing to Judge Maxwell; e-mail Supplement Final Judgment and "Amended" first page of Judgement to Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant with copy to Attorney Thompson	0.70	87.50	PCLA
N/C - Additional office conference with Mr. Rossway; e-mails from and to Judge's Judicial Assistant; receipt of "Amended Supplemental Final Judgment" page; e-mail to Judicial Assistant requesting re- signed signature page	0.20	0.00	PCLA
N/C - Office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding filing a Suggestion of Mootness regarding Former Wife's pending Motions and June 24, 2013 hearing in light of entry of Supplemental Final Judgement	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Telephone conference with Officer Mark Jennewein regarding supervising Ms. Casey's timesharing, his contact of other officers who are available	0.10	12.50	PCLA
Begin drafting Former Husband's Notice of Suggestion of Mootness	0.40	50.00	PCLA
N/C - Conference with Mr. Rossway to discuss Judge rendering Final Judgment and mootness of pending motions	0.20	0.00	KMR
Pursuant to Attorney Rollin's instruction, research issue of pending motion deem moot after entry of final judgment	1.40	175.00	MELC
Final drafting and refining of Notice of Suggestion of Mootness	0.30	37.50	PCLA
Prepare Mr. Rossway's correspondence to Attorney Thompson requesting cancellation of June 24, 2013 hearing	0.40	50.00	PCLA
N/C - Office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding inclusion of case law in Notice of Suggestion of Mootness; office conference with Mr. Rollin for case law	0.20	0.00	PCLA

Jun-20-13

Research case law regarding mootness of pending motions at time of final judgment	0.70	Page 122.50	294 of 324 KMR
N/C - Short office conference with Mr. Rossway and Mr. Rollin regarding Notice of Suggestion of Mootness, case law, and telephone to Attorney Thompson	0.10	0.00	PCLA
N/C - Receipt, review and print Memo on case law research by law clerk	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Amend Notice of Mootness and include case law cites; prepare case law for hearing	0.30	37.50	PCLA
Attend telephone conference between Mr. Rossway and Mr. Michaud regarding entry of Supplemental Final Judgment, Former Wife's pending Motions scheduled for June 24th and filing Former Husband's Notice of Suggestion of Mootness, and short discussion regarding off-duty officers available for Former Wife's timesharing in the event the issue rises on June 24th	0.40	50.00	PCLA
N/C - Attend Mr. Rossway's telephone conference with Attorney Thompson's office regarding response to request to cancel June 24, 2013 hearing due to entry of Supplemental Final Judgment	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Draft Notice of Hearing for June 24, 2013 on Former Husband's Notice of Suggestion of Mootness	0.20	25.00	PCLA
N/C - Scan, e-file, and e-mail Former Husband's Notice of Suggestion of Mootness to Clerk of Court, Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant, and Attorney Thompson	0.20	0.00	PCLA
N/C - E-mail Supplemental Final Judgment, Mr. Rossway's correspondence to Attorney Thompson, Notice of Suggestion of Mootness, and Notice of Hearing to Mr. Michaud	0.10	0.00	PCLA
N/C - Receipt and print e-mailed Substitution of Counsel from Attorney Julia Graves' office, and provide to Mr. Rossway; e-mail to Attorney Graves' paralegal to request if Substitution has been provided to Judge Maxwell; e-mail from paralegal advising they tried to call the Judge and received a voicemail	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Receipt of e-mail from Attorney Graves paralegal agreeing that the Former Wife's Motions scheduled for June 24, 2013 are moot and for this office to prepare a stipulation; office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding request we prepare a stipulation to cancel the hearing and that the Stipulation and Order has not been provided to Judge Maxwell; e-mail to Attorney Graves advising that Former Wife's current counsel needs to file a Notice of Cancellation of Hearing and/or prepare the Stipulation and advise Mr. Rossway prior to close of business if the hearing is cancelled or provide a Stipulation signed by Former Wife's counsel	0.30	37.50	PCLA

N/C - Update Pleading file	0.20	Page 0.00	e 295 of 324 PCLA
Receipt of e-mail from Attorney Thompson advising he does not have authority from Ms. Casey to cancel hearing or take any other action on her behalf; advise Mr. Rossway	0.10	12.50	PCLA
N/C - Provide Attorney Graves' paralegal with Judge Maxwell's contact information	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Preparation for hearings; telephone conference with client; attempt to contact Attorney Thompson; review and approve Notice of Hearing and suggestion of mootness	0.75	262.50	BWR
Receive information indicating new attorney will be joining case; instruct paralegal to send materials to Attorney Graves; telephone call to Attorney Gray's office; telephone call to Attorney Graves cell phone and receive return telephone call from Attorney Graves to discuss Monday hearing and cancellation of such hearing	0.20	70.00	BWR
Prepare case law demonstrating Mootness of former wife's pending motions; research on the Legal Principle of Standing and Advisory Opinions	0.75	93.75	MELC
E-mail from and to Mr. Michaud regarding Attorney Graves purposes as the new attorney in the case and possible appeal, and advise of Attorney Graves agreement and intent to have June 24 hearing cancelled, and Mr. Rossway's intent to provide the off-duty officers as supervisors for Ms. Casey's timesharing, and moving forward with hearing on attorney's fees and to have the Court determine sanctions against Ms. Casey for her several direct civil contempt's	0.20	25.00	PCLA
N/C - Receipt and review of copy of Attorney Graves e-mail with attached Notice of Appearance and Notice of Cancellation of Hearing; advise Mr. Rossway	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, prepare his correspondence to Judge Maxwell advising of Attorney Graves Notice of Appearance and Notice of Cancellation of Hearing, and advising of no objection to withdraw of Attorney Thompson	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Draft Notice of Cancellation of Hearing on Objection to Attorney Thompson's withdraw and Notice of Suggestion of Mootness for Former Wife's Pending Motions	0.20	25.00	PCLA
N/C - Scan and e-mail Mr. Rossway's correspondence to Judge Maxwell, Attorney Graves, Attorney Thompson and Mr. Michaud	0.20	0.00	PCLA

22-13

Jun-24-13

در۲۷۱

	N/C - Scan and e-file Notice of Cancellation to Clerk, Attorney Graves and Attorney Thompson	0.20	_{0.00} Page	e 296 of 324
	N/C - E-mails from and to Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant confirming cancellation of all pending motions for June 24, 2013; e-mail to King Court Reporting to advise of cancelled hearing	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Telephone conference with Officer Jennewein regarding entry of Final Judgement, contacting Mr. Michaud to meet, and offering timesharing to Ms. Casey in July and need for hourly rate; e-mail Mr. Michaud's telephone number to Office Jennewein, and copy Mr. Michaud	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Jun-25-13	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, draft correspondence to Attorney Graves providing contact information for off-duty Brevard police and sheriffs available to supervise Ms. Casey's timesharing and offer third week in July for Ms. Casey's timesharing pursuant to Supplemental Final Judgment	0.10	12.50	PCLA
Jun-26-13	Telephone conference with Judi Graves to provide her with a background of the case and with former wife of Mr. Michaud; continued agreement and encouragement to foster supervised visitation with his daughter and his ex-wife; provide further background to Ms. Graves regarding various information that she may not be aware of concerning the efforts that Kim has made during the case to attempt to facilitate contact between Mrs. Casey and her daughter	0.20	70.00	BWR
	N/C - Pursuant to Attorney Graves request, e-mail a copy of the Amended Final Judgment with Exhibits	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Draft correspondence to Attorney Graves setting out supervised timesharing and advise of off-duty Officers available to supervise Ms. Casey's timesharing	0.50	62.50	PCLA
	N/C - Attempt to contact Officer Jennewein to confirm hourly fee for supervising Mrs. Casey's timesharing and leave voicemail; e-mail to Officer Jennewein	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding Mr. Rossway's telephone call with Attorney Graves, proposed timesharing to be offered and cost, moving for attorney's fees and sanctions, appeal, and calculating amount Mrs. Casey owes Mr. Michaud, including interest, for Massachusetts airfare	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	Receipt of e-mail from Officer Jennewein agreed to an hourly rate of \$37.50 to supervise Mrs. Casey's timesharing; amend correspondence	0.10	12.50	PCLA
Jun-27-13	Begin work on post judgment matters; telephone conference with attorney Judy Graves's office; provide information to paralegal regarding identification of all remaining contempt issues to be used as basis for post	0.30	105.00	BWR

Page 297 of 324

judgment discovery and ultimate setting of our hearing on attorneys' fees based upon Court's ruling

Totals

33.70

\$4,776.25

DISBURSEMEN	TS	Disbursements	Receipts
May-03-13	Telephone Charges	0.20	
	Telephone Charges	0.30	
	Telephone Charges	2.20	
May-14-13	Westlaw Online Research Access	10.00	
	Westlaw Online Research Access	5.00	
May-21-13	Telephone Charges	0.10	
	Telephone Charges	0.70	
May-22-13	Telephone Charges	0.70	
May-23-13	Telephone Charges	2.60	
J ~-05-13	Telephone Charges	0.30	
J 76-13	Telephone Charges	2.30	
Jun-17-13	Telephone Charges	0.20	
	Westlaw Online Research Access	20.00	
Jun-18-13	Telephone Charges	0.90	
	Telephone Charges	0.20	
	Westlaw Online Research Access	40.00	
Jun-19-13	Telephone Charges	0.20	
Jun-20-13	Photocopies	0.70	
	Westlaw Online Research Access	40.00	
Jun-21-13	Telephone Charges	1.70	
	Telephone Charges	0.10	
	Westlaw Online Research Access	20.00	
Jun-24-13	Telephone Charges	0.60	
26-13	Telephone Charges	0.20	
	Telephone Charges	2.10	

Totals	\$151.30	Page 298 of 324 \$0.00
Current Fees & Disbursements		\$4,927.55
Previous Balance		\$5,165.47
Previous Payments		\$0.00
BALANCE DUE	-	\$10,093.02

VERO BEACH . CORAL GABLES

ROSSWAY MOORE SWAN, P.L. THE MODERN ONE BUILDING 2101 INDIAN RIVER BOULEVARD, SUITE 200 VERO BEACH, FL 32960 Telephone (772) 231-4440 Facsimile (772) 231-4430

Mr. Timothy Michaud 1791 Wekiva Drive Melbourne, FL 32940

August 5, 2013

File #: 1682-001 Inv. #: 70690

Total Due:

RE: Post-judgment issues

Please write the FILE number on your check to insure proper crediting.

r tense write the range number on your eneed to insure proper creating

SUMMARY

*Balance Fwd:

\$10,093.02

\$11,242.14

Payment received:

\$0.00)

Current Invoice Amount:

\$1,149.12

TOTAL DUE:

\$11,242.14

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	ATT'Y/L.A.
Jul-01-13	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding Ms. Casey's demand for unsupervised timesharing for the minor child's upcoming birthday, additional reporting threats by Ms. Casey, and Mr. Michaud's approval of Mr. Rossway speaking with Attorney Thompson	0.30	37.50	PCLA
Jul-02-13	Receipt and review of e-mailed Former Wife's Motion for Rehearing; forward to Mr. Michaud	0.10	12.50	PCLA
	Short office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding response to Former Wife's Motion for Rehearing and incorrect statements contained therein	0.10	12.50	PCLA
Jul-08-13	N/C -Prepare and file Mr. Rossway's Notice of Unavailability	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Jul-09-13	E-mail from and to Mr. Michaud regarding Ms. Casey's new accusations against her prior attorney and Judge Maxwell, along with Mr. Rossway	0.10	12.50	PCLA

10070

Jul-12-13	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding moving forward with hearing on attorney's fees and contempt issues, and further correspondence to Attorney Graves on status of Ms. Casey's timesharing in July 2013	0.20	_{25.00} Pag	e 300 of 324 PCLA
	Begin work on attorney's fees' collection and determination of amount by George Maxwell, Circuit Judge; provide information to paralegal regarding discovery and setting of hearing etc.	0.70	245.00	BWR
Jul-15-13	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, telephone conference with to King Court Reporting to inquire as to cost of November 1, 2012 hearing transcript and if Former Wife ordered complete trial transcript; telephone conference with Mr. Michaud for approval to obtain November 1, 2012 transcript and advise of request for transcript; advise Mr. Rossway of trial transcript ordered	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Jul-16-13	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding additional report to DCF, assumed by Mrs. Casey, regarding bruise on minor child's chin, and visit to Mr. Michaud's home, and Mr. Michaud's intent to obtain report; and, discussion regarding Mrs. Casey's support arrears and moving for Income Withholding Order	0.30	37.50	PCLA
(17-13	Further work on attorney fees' issue and communications with opposing counsel regarding Income Deduction Order	0.30	105.00	BWR
Jul-18-13	Receipt of Mr. Michaud's e-mail with attached Clerk's print-out of Ms. Casey's outstanding support	0.10	12.50	PCLA
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, draft correspondence to Attorney Graves requesting status of offer of timesharing	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	E-mail from and to Mr. Michaud regarding purpose of correspondence to Attorney Graves on Mrs. Casey's choice not to take timesharing with Riley	0.10	12.50	PCLA
	Receipt and review Transcript from November 1, 2012 hearing, ordered by Mrs. Casey, for any relevant information	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	E-mail from and to Mr. Michaud regarding appointment with DCF and determining that call made from "mandatory reporter" not Mrs. Casey; advise Mr. Rossway	0.10	12.50	PCLA
?2-13	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's review, make minor revisions to correspondence to Attorney Graves regarding timesharing	0.10	12.50	PCLA
	N/C - Scan and e-mail King Court Reporting Invoice	0.10	0.00	PCLA

Page	301	of	324
------	-----	----	-----

	No. 35581 for copy of November 1, 2012 hearing transcript to Mr. Michaud for payment		9	
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, draft Motion for Entry of Income Withholding Order; draft Ex Parte Order Entering Income Withholding Order	1.30	162.50	PCLA
	N/C - Scan and e-mail Mr. Rossway's correspondence to Attorney Graves and Mr. Michaud regarding Mrs. Casey's missed timesharing for July 2013	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's review, make minor revisions to Former Husband's Motion for Ex Parte Entry of Income Withholding Order	0.10	12.50	PCLA
	N/C - Draft correspondence to Judge Maxwell regarding Former Husband's Motion for Ex Parte Entry of Income Withholding Order	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Telephone conference with Judy Graves	0.20	70.00	BWR
Jul-23-13	N/C - Scan, and e-mail Former Husband's Motion for Ex Parte Entry of Income Withholding Order, and proposed Order to Attorney Graves; e-file Former Husband's Motion to Clerk of Court; copy Former Husband's Motion, proposed Order, and proposed Income Withhold Order to Judge Maxwell	0.30	0.00	PCLA
	Short telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding Ms. Casey's past due support for June and July 2013 most likely to be a running deficit and not paid until end of child support as further arrears	0.10	12.50	PCLA
Jul-24-13	N/C - Telephone conference with Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant for two hour hearing dates and times for attorney's fees and determination of sanctions for contempt; e-mail to Attorney Graves for availability	0.30	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Receipt of Attorney Graves confirmation of availability for hearing; e-mail to Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant to schedule the two hour hearing for October 17, 2013 for attorney's fees and determination of sanctions for Former Wife's contempt	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Jul-26-13	Review Final Judgment for orders of the Court for Mrs. Casey to repay Mr. Michaud his Massachusetts attorney's fees and travel expenses within 30 days of entry of the Final Judgment, and for counts for civil contempt, and awards of attorneys fees in preparation of hearing on determination of sanctions and award of attorney's fees, in addition to preparing a Motion for Contempt for Mrs. Casey's failure reimburse Mr. Michaud his Massachusetts fees and costs	0.40	50.00	PCLA
	Prepare Notice of Hearing on Determination of Award of Former Husband's Appellate and Trial Attorney's	0.30	37.50	PCLA

<u> </u>	Fees, and Determination of Sanctions for the Former Wife's Contempt's Against the Court		Page	302 of 324
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, drafting Motion for Contempt for Former Wife's Failure to Pay Restitution Pursuant to Amended Supplemental Final Judgment	0.60	75.00	PCLA
Jul-27-13	N/C - Organize, open and update new Case Law, Pleadings, and Correspondence Files	0.50	0.00	PCLA
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's review, include statement from Supplemental Final Judgment regarding Court's retaining jurisdiction to enforce the Final Judgment; E-mail Motion to Mr. Michaud with request to review and advise of any changes or, to signing, notarize and return for filing, and advise of two hour hearing to be set on Former Husband's Award of Attorney's Fees, Determination of Sanctions Against Former Wife for Civil Contempt of Court, and Motion for Contempt and Sanctions regarding restitution	0.20	25.00	PCLA `
Jul-29-13	Receipt of e-mail from Mr. Michaud with requested addition to Motion for Contempt; review Supplemental Final Judgment and amend Motion to include statement regarding interest on unpaid reimbursement due Mr. Michaud	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Sign off on Motion for Contempt	0.10	35.00	BWR
Jul-30-13	Receipt of Mr. Michaud's signed Verification to Motion for Contempt; finalize Motion for filing	0.10	12.50	PCLA
	N/C - Scan, e-file, and e-mail Notice of Hearing and Motion for Contempt to Clerk of Court, Judge Maxwell, Attorney Graves, King Reporting and Mr. Michaud	0.30	0.00	PCLA
	Totals	8.90	\$1,142.50	

.

DISBURSEMENTS		Disbursements	Receipts
Jul-15-13	Telephone Charges	0.50	
	Telephone Charges	0.20	
	Telephone Charges	0.50	
	Telephone Charges	0.20	
£2-13	Postage	5.22	
	Totals	\$6.62	\$0.00

/0690

Current Fees & Disbursements	Page 303 of 324 \$1,149.12
Previous Balance	\$10,093.02
Previous Payments	\$0.00
BALANCE DUE	\$11,242.14

VERO BEACH . CORAL GABLES

ROSSWAY MOORE SWAN, P.L. THE MODERN ONE BUILDING 2101 INDIAN RIVER BOULEVARD, SUITE 200 VERO BEACH, FL 32960 Telephone (772) 231-4440 Facsimile (772) 231-4430

Mr. Timothy Michaud 1791 Wekiva Drive Melbourne, FL 32940

September 5, 2013

File #: 1682-001 Inv. #: 71159

Total Due:

\$7,612.64

RE: Post-judgment issues

Please write the FILE number on your check to insure proper crediting.

SUMMARY

*Balance Fwd:

\$11,242.14

Payment received:

Current Invoice Amount:

\$5,000.00) \$1,370.50

TOTAL DUE:

\$7,612.64

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	ATT'Y/L.A.
Aug-02-13	Work on Post Judgment issues and review letter from Attorney Graves; instructions to paralegal	0.30	105.00	BWR
	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding Mrs. Casey's proposed timesharing, and provide Mr. Rossway's advice to try and comply with due diligence research of the proposed supervisor	0.40	50.00	PCLA
	Research requirement of expert witness for contempt fees	0.40	70.00	KMR
Aug-05-13	Receipt of e-mail from Mr. Michaud advising of his meeting with Mrs. Casey's proposed timesharing supervisor, and that the proposed supervisor was recommended by a psychologist in Melbourn and does not know Attorney Graves; advise Mr. Rossway	0.10	12.50	PCLA
Aug-06-13	Letter to Judy Graves after review of emails and drafts	0.20	70.00	BWR

	Invoice #:	/1159	
N/C - Office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding providing response to Attorney Graves regarding her suggested timesharing supervisor, and suggesting Mr. Michaud act as supervisor for upcoming weekend for fee to be paid in advance	r.	Page _{0.00}	2305 of 324 PCLA
Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, review Final Judgment and Parenting Plan for requirements of supervisor for timesharing; draft correspondence to Attorney Graves regarding upcoming supervised timesharing	0.70	87.50	PCLA
Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding hemeeting with Ms. Dukeman, Mrs. Casey's proposed supervisor; amend correspondence to Attorney Grav pursuant to Mr. Michaud's further information regard Dr. Siebold and Ms. Dukeman	es	25.00	PCLA
N/C - Scan and e-mail Mr. Rossway's correspondence Attorney Graves and Mr. Michaud	e to 0.10	0.00	PCLA
Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, review Attorned Graves correspondence to Mr. Rossway of August 7, 2013 and forward to Mr. Michaud		12.50	PCLA
Telephone conference with Mr. Rossway for review Attorney Graves correspondence, and instructions to prepare response to Attorney Graves regarding incorinformation, Mr. Michaud's approval as a supervisor timesharing by the Court, and need for contact information for new proposed supervisor	rect	25.00	PCLA
E-mail from and to Mr. Michaud regarding issues wi timesharing and proposed supervisors, and Mr. Michaud's issues with conflicts between Final Judgm and Parenting Plan		25.00	PCLA
Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's instructions, draft correspondence to Attorney Graves requesting containformation for John Clark, advise that minor child vnot involved in Mr. Michaud's meeting with Nancy Dukeman, and Mr. Michaud was sanctioned and order to act as supervisor for Mrs. Casey, and is ready willing, and able to provide timesharing for August 10th and 11th as act as supervisor	vas er	50.00	PCLA
E-mails from and to Mr. Michaud; telephone confere with Mr. Michaud regarding timesharing requirementhe Parenting Plan and Mr. Rossway's intent to cooperate with timesharing pending the Court addressing the Former Wife's Motion for Rehearing, entry of the Income Deduction Order, and the attornefee hearing, the to address the discrepancies between Final Judgment and Parenting Plan; and, discussion regarding Mr. Rossway's response to Attorney Grave August 7, 2013 correspondence	ts in cy's the	37.50	PCLA

Aug-08-13

Aug-13-13	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding Mrs. Casey's certified letter to minor child's school demanding information and to attend conferences by telephone in violation of the Amended Supplemental Final Judgment, and school contacted Mr. Michaud who	0.20	Page 25.00	e 306 of 324 PCLA
	obtain copy; advise Mr. Rossway Receipt of e-mail from Attorney Graves with contact information for proposed timesharing supervisor; e-mail information to Mr. Michaud with request to contact supervisor to schedule meeting, and request copy of Mrs. Casey's letter to child's school to provide to Attorney Graves	0.10	12.50	PCLA
Aug-15-13	Receive communications from Attorney Graves' office; work on access situation, etc.	0.20	70.00	BWR
Aug-16-13	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding Ms. Casey calling this firm for contact information for proposed supervisor of her timesharing, and that Mr. Michaud is waiting for contact from proposed supervisor	0.20	25.00	PCLA
C.	Office conference with Mr. Rossway; e-mail to Attorney Graves that Mr. Michaud attempted to contact Mr. Clark and is waiting his response, and if received will move towards attempting to scheduled Ms. Casey's supervised timesharing, and to advise of Ms. Casey contacting RMS and request she advise client not to call us in the future	0.20	0.00	PCLA
Aug-19-13	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud to advise of Income Deduction Order entered, pending hearing on attorney's fees and Ms. Casey's contempt for additional past due monies owed Mr. Michaud, and status of contact with Mr. Clark the proposed timesharing person	0.10	12.50	PCLA
	N/C - Scan and e-mail Income Deduction Order to Mr. Michaud	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding Mr. Clark's initial contact with Mr. Michaud at 9:00 p.m., Friday, August 9th and his unavailability to supervise Mrs. Casey's timesharing	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Work on supervisor situation	0.20	70.00	BWR
Aug-20-13	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, draft correspondence to Attorney Graves regarding Mr. Clark's unavailability to supervise timesharing August 17 and 18, 2013; and, Mrs. Casey's violation of Court Order by contacting daughter's school requesting all records and to attend progress conferences; review Supplemental Final Judgment	0.70	87.50	PCLA

	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding Mr. Rossway's directions to include DCF report in correspondence to Attorney Graves, Mrs. Casey's violation of Final Judgment, and status of supervised timesharing	0.40	Page 50.00	e 307 of 324 PCLA
Aug-21-13	N/C - Update Correspondence and Pleading files	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's review, amend and refine correspondence to Attorney Graves regarding Mrs. Casey's violations of court orders and Mr. Michaud's continued attempts to meet with proposed timesharing supervisor	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	E-mails from and to Attorney Graves assistant regarding their intent to set a hearing during Mr. Rossway's unavailability on Attorney Graves withdrawing from the case; e-mail to Attorney Graves with request for a copy of her Motion to Withdraw; advise Mr. Rossway	0.10	12.50	PCLA
	N/C - Scan and e-mail Mr. Rossway's correspondence to Attorney Graves and Mr. Michaud	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Aug-22-13	Office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding possible stipulation for Attorney Graves to withdraw with specific language to be included to preserve attorney fees, sanctions, and contempt hearing, and to prepare additional contempt motion regarding wife's contacting child school and causing further report to be made to the DCF in July 2013	0.10	12.50	PCLA
	Telephone conference with Judy Grave to discuss her attempt to withdraw from case; extensive discussions regarding request to see Motion to Withdraw before any stipulation can be entered into; discussion that any stipulation would have to include that Mrs. Casey is aware of the upcoming hearings in October and that attorney's withdrawal will not in any way slowdown, stop, or delay the Contempt Hearings and Attorney's Fees' Hearing's schedule; discussion with counsel that appropriate response will be filed once she files her Motion; provide instruction to paralegal regarding defensive position to ensure the October hearing occurs	0.30	105.00	BWR
Aug-23-13	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, draft correspondence to Attorney Graves regarding Mr. Michaud's approval of Ms. Casey's proposed supervisor for timesharing, and that all further coordination for Ms. Casey's timesharing should be between the parties	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	Receipt and review of faxed correspondence from Mrs. Casey to Judge Maxwell regarding her lack of timesharing with the minor child; e-mail correspondence to Mr. Michaud an advise of correspondence to be sent to Attorney Graves approving Mr. Clark as the supervisor for Mrs. Casey's timesharing and provide Mr. Clark's available dates	0.20	25.00	PCLA

Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, draft Response to Attorney Graves' Motion to Withdraw	0.40	_{50.0} ₽age	30&@ <u>f</u> 324
Receipt and review of e-mail between Mr. Michaud and Mrs. Casey regarding timesharing; e-mail from Mr. Michaud regarding his concerns with Mr. Clark, and timesharing availability; return e-mail to Mr. Michaud advising of Mr. Rossway to address bonding, insurance issue and background check of Mr. Clark upon return to office	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Receipt and review Mrs. Casey's correspondence to Mr. Rossway with request to require Mr. Michaud to hold timehsharing on August 24 and 25, 2013 forward to Mr. Michaud; e-mail to Attorney Graves with copy of Mrs. Casey letter requesting they advise their client that Mr. Rossway will not response as he is out of the office and that she is represented by counsel	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Receipt and review of Mrs. Casey's additional correspondence to Judge Maxwell regarding her objection to Attorney Graves' withdrawing as her attorney, and that Emergency Motion to Show Cause has been prepared by Attorney Graves and it should be required to be filed	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding coordinating timesharing with Mr. Clark with Mrs. Casey to be included to alleviate miscommunication on Mr. Clark's availability, also discussion regarding upcoming timesharing, and Mrs. Casey advising court that a Emergency Motion to Show Cause has been prepared by Attorney Graves on behalf of Ms. Casey regarding timesharing	0.50	62.50	PCLA
Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, begin drafting Former Husband's Response to Former Wife's Correspondence to the Court and to the Former Husband; research file for all timelines for proposed supervisors and timesharing	0.60	75.00	PCLA
Work on defense of withdrawal attempts by attorney; review information filed by Mrs. Casey and sent to Judge Maxwell; provide further instruction to paralegal for response to claims including attaching exhibits showing former husband's extensive attempts to set up access with the supervisor	0.50	175.00	BWR
Telephone conference with Attorney Singer's paralegal with request for Attorney Singer to be the expert for attorney's fees at the October 17, 2013 hearing, and agreement pending settlement to trail set for October 17th	0.20	25.00	PCLA
N/C - Update correspondence file	0.10	0.00	PCLA

Aug-26-13

\$5,000.00

\$7,612.64

Aug-28-13	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's review, amend Response to Attorney Graves Motion to Withdraw	0.30	Pa 37.50	age 309 of 324 PCLA
	Prepare preliminary Report on all time entries in case in preparation of attorney's fees hearing	0.40	50.00	PCLA
Sep-05-13	20% Courtesy write off per BWR		-333.00	BWR
	Totals	11.30	\$1,332.00	
DISBURSEMEN	TS	Disbursen	nents	Receipts
Aug-02-13	Westlaw Online Research Access	3	0.00	
Aug-06-13	Telephone Charges		0.10	
	Telephone Charges		2.00	
Aug-08-13	Telephone Charges		1.00	
Aug-16-13	Telephone Charges		1.60	
Aug-19-13	Telephone Charges		0.60	
-20-13	Telephone Charges		2.40	
26-13	Telephone Charges		0.80	
	Totals	\$3	8.50	\$0.00
	Current Fees & Disbursements			\$1,370.50
	Previous Balance			\$11,242.14

Previous Payments

BALANCE DUE

VERO BEACH . CORAL GABLES

ROSSWAY MOORE SWAN, P.L. THE MODERN ONE BUILDING 2101 INDIAN RIVER BOULEVARD, SUITE 200 VERO BEACH, FL 32960 Telephone (772) 231-4440 Facsimile (772) 231-4430

Mr. Timothy Michaud 1791 Wekiva Drive Melbourne, FL 32940

October 8, 2013

File #: 1682-001 Inv. #: 71638

RE: Post-judgment issues

Total Due:

\$2,505.60

Please write the FILE number on your check to insure proper crediting.

SUMMARY

*Balance Fwd:

\$7,612.64

Payment received:

\$7,612.64)

Current Invoice Amount:

\$2,505.60

TOTAL DUE:

\$2,505.60

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	ATT'Y/L.A.
Sep-03-13	N/C - Receipt of e-mail from Mr. Michaud advising that Income Deduction Order is in effect	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Sep-04-13	Further drafting on Former Husband's Response to Wife's correspondence to Judge Maxwell regarding timesharing	0.40	50.00	PCLA
	Work on issues for upcoming attorney's fees hearing	0.75	262.50	BWR
Sep-05-13	N/C - Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, draft cover letter to Mr. Michaud enclosing RMS' September 5, 2013 Invoice	0.30	0.00	PCLA
	E-mail to Mr. Michaud requesting status of scheduling timesharing; further e-mails to and from Mr. Michaud regarding Mrs. Casey's communications with Dr. Williamson, and the closing of the July 2013 DCF report	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Sep-06-13	Receipt of e-mail from Mr. Michaud requesting Dr. Williamson copy us with Mrs. Casey's correspondence;	0.10	12.50	PCLA

	receipt and review of Aimee Casey's July 23, 2013 correspondence to Dr. Williamson; advise Mr. Rossway		Page	311 of 32
	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding his communication with Dr. Williamson and Ms. Casey's e-mail to Dr. Williamson, and Dr. Williamson just receiving copy of Supplemental Final Judgment and intent to contact Mrs. Casey; advise Mr. Rossway of Dr. Williamson's receipt of Judgment and to communicate with Mrs. Casey	0.30	37.50	PCLA
Sep-09-13	N/C - E-mail to Mr. Michaud to schedule telephone conference with Mr. Rossway on September 10, 2013	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Review Final Judgment and Parenting Plan and note discrepancies and gather other documents for Mr. Rossway's telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding	0.30	37.50	PCLA
Sep-10-13	Attend telephone call with Mr. Rossway and Mr. Michaud regarding timesharing issues and moving forward with preparations for attorney's fee hearing	0.30	37.50	PCLA
/	Telephone conference with client regarding strategy for moving forward and acceptance of expert; review email sent to psychologist	0.30	105.00	BWR
11-13	Receipt of Attorney Grave's Notice of Hearing on Counsel's Motion to Withdraw; advise Mr. Rossway; e-mail to Judge Maxwell's Judicial Assistant to advise that hearing was not coordinated and Attorney Graves was advised of Mr. Rossway's unavailability and request hearing be reset to previously scheduled hearing on October 17, 2013	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Receipt of e-mail from Attorney Graves regarding continued attempts to have the September 16th hearing go forward despite Mr. Rossway and Mr. Rollin's unavailability; e-mail to Attorney Graves confirming review of communications between our offices on scheduling the hearing on her Motion to Withdraw, and Mr. Rossway instructions to attempt to reschedule the hearing when Mr. Rollin's is available	0.10	12.50	PCLA
	Additional e-mail from Attorney Graves indicating that RMS did not need to be at the hearing and if she cannot withdraw on September 16, 2013 she will move to have the October 17, 2013 hearing reset due to her unavailability; office conference with Mr. Rossway for response, and meeting with Mr. Rossway and Attorney Smith, who will cover hearing	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	N/C - Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, e-mail Attorney Graves advising that we will have an attorney at the hearing on September 17th on her Motion to Withdraw	0.10	0.00	PCLA

	Work on emerging issue regarding Motion to Withdraw; meeting with paralegal and locate attorney to handle expedited Motion to Withdraw; meeting with Blake Smith to provide instruction on his direction to Court; provide instruction that paralegal attend to provide Judge Maxwell any additional information if necessary	0.20	Pag [,] 70.00	e 312 of 324 BWR
Sep-12-13	Conference with Patti Cain, review pleadings	1.30	195.00	RBS
	Read Amended Supplemental Final Judgment	0.60	90.00	RBS
	Short office conference with Attorney Smith to provide background information on the case and the upcoming hearing on Attorney Graves Motion to Withdraw, and provide pleadings for review	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Sep-13-13	Meeting with Patti Cain, read Brooks v. State 980 So.2d 1095 and Garden v. Garden 834 So.2d 190	0.50	75.00	RBS
	Office conference with Attorney Smith regarding issues and preparations for hearing	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	E-mail to Attorney Graves office to inquire if Ms. Casey will be attending the hearing and if a copy of Husband's Notice for Hearing for October 17, 2013 was provided to Ms. Casey	0.10	12.50	PCLA
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, draft proposed Order Granting Former Wife's Counsel's Motion to Withdraw to include language that the withdraw is without prejudice to the October 17, 2013 hearing to go forward	0.70	87.50	PCLA
Sep-16-13	Review correspondence from Aimee Casey; Travel to Brevard County Courthouse, appearance before Judge Maxwell regarding Motion to Withdraw, made argument regarding October 17th hearing, return to office.	3.90	585.00	RBS
	N/C - Travel to Viera for hearing on Former Wife's counsel, Judge Graves' Motion to Withdraw	1.20	0.00	PCLA
	Attend hearing on Attorney Graves' Motion to Withdraw, and assist Attorney Smith, and record statements; discussion with Attorney Smith regarding Dean Tong who appeared at the hearing as a witness, with his assistant, and a friend of Mrs. Casey	1.00	125.00	PCLA
" " " " " " " " " " " " " " " " " " "	N/C - Travel back to Vero Beach	1.20	0.00	PCLA
	Receipt of e-mails from Mrs. Casey and between Mrs. Casey and Mr. Michaud; e-mail to Mr. Michaud regarding out come of hearing, Dean Tong, and Mrs. Casey's statements regarding timesharing	0.20	25.00	PCLA

Sep-17-13	E-mails from and to Mr. Michaud regarding Mr. Clark, timesharing, and hearing on Attorney Graves Motion to Withdraw, and Mr. Clark	0.30	_{37.50} Page	e 313 of 324 PCLA
Sep-18-13	Conference with Patti Cain to discuss Mr. Michaud's recent communication his case so that we can form plan of action to verify facts and advise Mr. Michaud	0.70	122.50	KMR
	Receipt of e-mails from Mrs. Casey and Mr. Michaud regarding timesharing and Mr. Clark; office conference with Attorney Rollin for review of timesharing issues since entry of Supplemental Final Judgment	0.70	0.00	PCLA
	E-mails from and to Mrs. Casey advising that pursuant to Mr. Rossway's Notice of Unavailability, Mr. Rossway is out of the office until October 1, 2013, and Mr. Michaud's request for a background check is done in good faith and in the best interest of the minor child	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Sep-19-13	N/C - Update pleading and correspondence files	0.20	0.00	PCLA
	Receipt and review of Mrs. Casey's correspondence to Mr. Rossway of September 19, 2013 requesting no hearings be scheduled without coordination with her	0.10	12.50	PCLA
	Pursuant to Mr. Rollin's, review file to find John Clark's phone number; telephone conference with Mr. Clark for his thoughts and standing on acting as supervisor for September 28 and 29, 2013 timesharing, and obtain background information, and to withhold decision on additional supervision of timesharing	0.50	62.50	PCLA
	Receipt and review of e-mail from Mr. Clark with article on abuse case he was involved in; e-mail requesting Mr. Clark resend his Photo ID; receipt of e-mail from Mr. Michaud of e-mails to and from Mr. Clark regarding request for background check	0.10	12.50	PCLA
	Draft correspondence to Mr. Michaud regarding advise	0.70	87.50	PCLA
	Telephone conference with Dr. Williamson's assistant regarding need to touch base with Dr. Williamson on his position on Mrs. Casey's timesharing at this time	0.10	12.50	PCLA

	Additional telephone conference with Mr. Clark and receipt of photo; confirm background check performed on employees of Big Brother Big Sisters and Mr. Clark is the Community Base Case Manager	0.10	Page 12.50	314 _{PCL} A24
Sep-20-13	Receipt of voicemail from Dr. Williamson with his thoughts on Mrs. Casey and his perception of requirements for her timesharing	0.10	12.50	PCLA
	Telephone conference with Dr. Williamson regarding Final Judgment Requirement regarding affidavit and therapy not contingent on Mrs. Casey's timesharing, Dr. Williamson's thoughts on Mrs. Casey's possible issues of concern, and advise of Court's strong position that Mrs. Casey have supervised timesharing, and our contacting Mr. Clark and his association and his required background check for his current and past employment	0.40	50.00	PCLA
Sep-23-13	Receipt and review of Former Wife's Notice of Appearance, Notice of Substitution of Counsel, and 11 page Emergency Order to Show Cause for Contempt and Request fa Parent Coordinator and Modification to the Parenting Plan	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	N/C - Scan and e-mail Former Wife's Notices and Emergency Order to Mr. Michaud	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	E-mail to Mrs. Casey to advise of RMS Notice of Designation of E-mail and request all future filings and correspondence be provided via e-mail; e-mail from Mrs. Casey acknowledging request	0.10	12.50	PCLA
	Receipt of Mrs. Casey's Notice of Compliance with Rule 2.516 and Designation of E-Mail Address	0.10	12.50	PCLA
Sep-24-13	Conference with Patti Cain to discuss emergent timesharing issues and controversy with Mr. Michaud	0.20	45.00	KMR
	Review and revise proposed letter to Mr. Michaud	0.60	45.00	KMR
	E-mail from and to Mr. Michaud regarding Dr. Day's fees and child support not received for September	0.10	12.50	PCLA
(₂ ,	Pursuant to Mr. Rollin's review, amend and finalize correspondence to Mr. Michaud regarding September 28 and 29, 2019 timesharing	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	Receipt of e-mail from Mr. Michaud advising of meeting face-to-face with Mr. Clark and advising "I feel as confident as I can"; e-mail to Mr. Michaud to confirm if timesharing was to proceed; e-mail from Mr. Michaud	0.20	25.00	PCLA

Page 315 of 324

	confirmation Mrs. Casey's supervised timesharing for September 28 and 29, 2013; e-mail to Mrs. Casey confirming her supervised timesharing with minor child was still going forward to be supervised by John Clark, and copy Mr. Michaud and Mr. Clark		. 29	
Sep-29-13	Review extensive communications and additions to file relating to Mrs. Casey's continued actions and review notes from paralegal regarding hearing and media specialist involvement; review requests from Mrs. Casey on various matters	0.70	245.00	BWR
Oct-08-13	15% Courtesy write off per BWR		-429.75	BWR
	Totals	21.95	\$2.435.25	

DISBURSEMENT	s	Disbursements	Receipts
Sep-04-13	Postage	0.66	
Sep-06-13	Telephone Charges	2.60	
Sep-17-13	1682-001 Michaud, R. Blake Smith, Travel Expense, Br	revard 65.39	
-19-13	County Courthouse Telephone Charges	0.20	
	Telephone Charges	0.20	
Sep-20-13	Telephone Charges	0.20	
	Telephone Charges	1.10	
	Totals	\$70.35	\$0.00
	Current Fees & Disbursements		\$2,505.60
	Previous Balance		\$7,612.64
	Previous Payments		\$7,612.64
	BALANCE DUE		\$2,505.60

ROSSWAY MOORE SWAN, P.L. THE MODERN ONE BUILDING 2101 INDIAN RIVER BOULEVARD, SUITE 200 VERO BEACH, FL 32960 Telephone (772) 231-4440 Facsimile (772) 231-4430

Mr. Timothy Michaud 1791 Wekiva Drive Melbourne, FL 32940

November 7, 2013

File #: 1682-001 Inv. #: 72072

RE: Post-judgment issues

Total Due: \$5,812.50

Please write the FILE number on your check to insure proper crediting.

SUMMARY

*Balance Fwd:

\$2,505.60

Payment received:

Current Invoice Amount:

\$3,306.90

\$0.00)

TOTAL DUE:

\$5,812.50

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	ATT'Y/L.A.
Oct-01-13	Prepare Mr. Rossway's correspondence to Ms. Casey regarding further timesharing and other requests regarding the minor child to be addressed with Mr. Michaud, and issues regarding pending motions to be addressed to Mr. Rossway	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	N/C - Update Pleading file with Mrs. Casey's recent filed pleadings	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Receipt and review of Mrs. Casey's Supplemental Petition for Modification of Child Support in Respect to Determination of Awards and Fees Pursuant to Amended Supplemental Final Judgment; advise Mr. Rossway	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	N/C - Copy Mr. Michaud with Mrs. Casey's Supplemental Petition for Modification of Child Support	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - E-mail to Attorney Singer's paralegal regarding status of Attorney Singer's availability to appear as expert witnesses for attorney's fees hearing	0.10	0.00	PCLA

Oct-02-13	Receipt of e-mail from Attorney Singer's paralegal advising that a confirmation of Attorney Singer's availability will be provided today; e-mail requesting Attorney Singer's estimated fee	0.10	Page 3 ²	17 of 324 PCLA
	Receipt of e-mail from Mr. Michaud advising of receipt of support indicating Ms. Casey is still employed	0.10	12.50	PCLA
	N/C - E-mails from and to Attorney Singer's paralegal with confirmation of Attorney Singer's availability for October 17; advise Mr. Rossway	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Receipt and review of Mr. Clark's Report of September 28 and 29, 2013 timesharing; advise Mr. Rossway of positive report	0.10	12.50	PCLA
Oct-07-13	Work on materials for upcoming attorney's fees hearing and begin work on strategy to defeat potential last-minute attorney from appearing to try to slow down attorney's fees hearing	0.50	175.00	BWR
	Receipt of e-mails from Mrs. Casey with her "third" request for minor child's report card; e-mail to Mr. Michaud to status of providing Mrs. Casey with e-mail and request for status of scheduling October timesharing; advise Mr. Rossway of Mrs. Casey providing copies of e-mails	0.10	12.50	PCLA
	N/C - Receipt of e-mail between Mr. Michaud and Mrs. Casey regarding Mr. Michaud's request for Mrs. Casey's opinion of minor child's behavior/actions during recent timesharing in light of Mrs. Casey's written concerns of child's behavior to Dr. Williamson, and Mrs. Casey's refusal to provide answer	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	N/C - E-mail from Mr. Michaud confirming minor child's interim report card was forwarded to Mrs. Casey and confirming Mrs. Casey's October 26 and 27, 2013 timesharing	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Oct-09-13	Download four year accounting client ledger in PCLA into excel spreadsheet to prepare analysis of fees; format data to allow for separation of fees and costs for use at attorney's fees and cost hearing	2.30	287.50	PCLA
	Begin review and redacting of confidential information for 236 page billing statement	1.30	162.50	PCLA
Oct-10-13	Download accounting four year client ledger into Excel spreadsheet to prepare analysis of costs; format data to allow for summarization and categorization of costs for use at hearing on attorney's fees and costs; redact unrecoverable costs and summarize costs and totals	1.70	212.50	PCLA
	Telephone conference with King Court Reporting with request for all paid invoices for appearances and	0.10	12.50	PCLA

	transcripts; receipt of e-mail from King Court Reporting with update of invoice from December 2011 to current		Page 3	18 of 324
	Insert all King Court Reporting invoices into Cost Report Spreadsheet; re-categorize costs and total	0.70	87.50	PCLA
	Insert hourly rate of all timekeepers in Fees Report Spreadsheet	0.40	50.00	PCLA
	E-mail from and to Mrs. Casey clarifying for her that the "Petition for Modification" filed on the Court Records was her Petition filed October 2, 2012	0.20	25.00	PCLA
	Work with Bookkeeper for Effective Rate Report for all timekeepers; amend report to include fee incurred versus billed fees, and timekeepers hourly rate versus effective rates	0.50	62.50	PCLA
Oct-11-13	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, begin preparing Motion to Dismiss or In the Alternative to Strike Former Wife's Petition for Modification; research Florida Rule 12.540 and Rule 1.540, Florida Civil Rules of Procedure	0.90	112.50	PCLA
Oct-12-13	Saturday work with paralegal on extensive materials for upcoming hearing; review situation regarding Court's Order and award of fees, including contempt and sanctions; review voluminous first draft of extensive Exhibit Book	0.75	262.50	BWR
	Continue work on accounting of attorney's fees and costs for hearing, including summary of Massachusetts attorney, Dr. Day, and appellate attorney; separate costs paid by Mr. Michaud and billed by RMS;	2.10	262.50	PCLA
	Begin preparing Affidavit of Bradley W. Rossway as to Attorney's Fees and Costs	0.80	100.00	PCLA
	Office conference with Mr. Rossway for review of attorneys fees and costs notebook and reports, discuss and review draft of Motion to Dismiss or Strike Former Wife's Petition to Modify, and discussion regarding other issues for hearing including financial sanctions against wife for contempt, and pending Motion for Rehearing and Former Wife's Motion for Order to Show Cause regarding timesharing and determine Mr. Michaud's testimony with recollection of correspondence sufficient for defense of Former Wife's allegations	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	Continue drafting Former Husband's Motion to Dismiss or Strike pursuant to Mr. Rossway's review and instructions	0.30	37.50	PCLA
Oct-14-13	Continue work on attorney's fees hearing; receive e-mail from Attorney Campbell indicating his potential entry into case	0.70	245.00	BWR

			9 of 324
Review Amended Supplemental Final Judgment and reseach need to break out cotempt fees	1.00	175.00	KMR
Amend and finalize Former Huband's Motion to Dismiss or Strike Former Wife's Petition for Modification	0.10	12.50	PCLA
Receipt Mr. Michaud's e-mailed letter from the Florida Department of Children and Families, August 27, 2013 advising of closing July 15, 2013 investigation as unfounded; advise Mr. Rossway	0.10	12.50	PCLA
Continue preparing Affidavit of Attorney's Fees and Costs pursuant to discussions and clarification from Mr. Rossway	0.40	50.00	PCLA
Telephone conference with Attorney Singer's paralegal to advise that Notebook of Accounting of Attorney's Fees and Costs to be provided un-redacted and will need to be changed out prior to hearing	0.10	12.50	PCLA
E-mail to Mr. Michaud to advise of Attorney Singer's estimated fee for her review and expert testimony regarding Mr. Michaud's attorneys' and expert fees, and costs for case, with request to make payment prior to hearing, and inquire if Mr. Michaud can obtain DCF's latest investigation report	0.10	12.50	PCLA
Work with Firm's bookkeeper for review reports to determine discrepancy in total amount billed by timekeepers and invoices, and determine it to be write-downs; run reports for Courtesy Write-Down, Summary of all fees and costs, and Effective Rate Report	1.20	150.00	PCLA
N/C - Prepare copy of Former Husband's Attorneys and Expert Fees, and Costs Notebook for providing to Attorney Singer for her review prior to hearing	0.50	0.00	PCLA
N/C - Office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding sanctions for contempt; office conference with Mr. Rollin regarding breaking out time entries and amount for each separate count for contempt	0.20	0.00	PCLA
N/C - Office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding Ms. Casey's ninth attorney, Mark Campbell's contacting Mr. Rossway, and discussion regarding Judge Maxwell's statements at the hearing on Attorney Graves' withdraw regarding extending hearing on attorney's fees in the event Ms. Casey obtained a new attorney	0.20	0.00	PCLA
N/C - Attempts to contact Mr. Michaud and leave voicemail regarding Former Wife's new attorney and request call back; e-mail Mr. Michaud to request call	0.10	0.00	PCLA
Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding Ms. Casey's new attorney Mark Campbell, and Judge's	0.20	25.00	PCLA

statements at hearing that her new attorney an extension of the October 17, 2013 hearing		Page	e 320 of 324
N/C - Telephone conference with Judge Ma Judicial Assistant and obtain alternative hea office conference with Mr. Rossway		0.00	PCLA
N/C - Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, contact Attorney Campbell and request a ret		0.00	PCLA
N/C - Office conference with Mr. Rossway; conference with Judge Maxwell's Judicial A cancel October 17th hearing and reset on D 2013	ssistant to	0.00	PCLA
Prepare Re-Notice of Hearing	0.10	12.50	PCLA
N/C - Organize all exhibits, and copies of p upcoming hearing; update Pleading and Cor Files		0.00	PCLA
N/C - Scan and E-File Re-Notice of Hearing of Court; scan and e-mail Mr. Rossway's cowith Notice of Hearing to Ms. Casey, Attorn Campbell, Mr. Michaud; e-mail Notice of King Court Reporting and Judge Maxwell	rrespondence ney	0.00	PCLA
E-mail from and to Mr. Michaud regarding Graves' withdrawal from case pursuant to Ju and Judge's statements that upon Ms. Casey new attorney, that if they asked for an exten October 17th hearing would be reset	udge's ruling, obtaining a	12.50	PCLA
Receipt of Attorney Campbell's mailed and Notice of Limited Appearance, Motion for Time and proposed Order on extension of t conference with Mr. Rossway	Extension of	25.00	PCLA
N/C - E-mail to Attorney Campbell to sched telephone call with Mr. Rossway for October		0.00	PCLA
N/C - E-mail to Mr. Michaud attaching Atto Campbell's Notice of Limited Appearance a for Extension of Time and advise of Mr. Ro upcoming telephone conference with Attorn	and Motion ossway's	0.00	PCLA
Receipt and review e-mails provided by Mr e-mails with Mr. Michaud regarding her rec FCAT scores for the minor child; advise Mr. Casey's continuing to copy us with e-m	quest for r. Rossway of	0.00	PCLA
Receipt of Former Wife's Withdrawal of Pe Modification of Child Support in Respect to Determination of Awards and Fees Pursuan	0	12.50	PCLA

Oct-16-13

Oct-17-13

72072

	Amended Supplemental Final Judgment, and forward to Mr. Michaud		Page 321 of 324	
Oct-22-13	Receipt, print and read several e-mails and phone shots between Mr. Michaud and Ms. Casey regarding school FCAT report and telephone call with minor child	0.20	25.00	PCLA
Oct-23-13	Extensive phone conference with Attorney Mark Campbell regarding upcoming Attorneys' Fees Hearing in December	0.50	175.00	BWR
Oct-30-13	N/C - Update correspondence and parties' e-mail files	0.10	0.00	PCLA
	Receipt and review Mr. Clark's timesharing report for October 26 and 27, 2013	0.00	0.00	PCLA
	Continue preparations of Wife's Certificate of Compliance with Mandatory Disclosure; begin redacting all personal information and account numbers; e-mail to Ms. Nairn to request current auto loan statement	1.40	175.00	PCLA
Oct-31-13	Telephone conference with Mr. Michaud regarding new DCF investigation regarding minor child's behavior in school, obtaining investigation into who are last two reports, and obtaining information through order of court; advise Mr. Rossway; e-mail to Mr. Michaud requesting he obtain name for investigators in order for Mr. Rossway to correspond with DCF regarding false allegations	0.30	37.50	PCLA
	Totals	23.55	\$3,157.50	

DISBURSEMENTS		Disbursements	Receipts
Oct-10-13	Photocopies	32.00	
Oct-14-13	Photocopies	66.20	
	Photocopies	0.20	
	Telephone Charges	0.20	
	Telephone Charges	0.10	
	Telephone Charges	0.10	
	Westlaw Online Research Access	50.00	
Oct-15-13	Telephone Charges	0.30	
	Telephone Charges	0.30	
	Totals	\$149.40	\$0.00

Invoice #: 72072

Page 322 of 324
\$3,306.90

\$2,505.60
\$0.00

\$5,812.50

BALANCE DUE

Previous Balance

Previous Payments

Current Fees & Disbursements

VERO BEACH . CORAL GABLES

ROSSWAY MOORE SWAN, P.L. THE MODERN ONE BUILDING 2101 INDIAN RIVER BOULEVARD, SUITE 200 VERO BEACH, FL 32960

Telephone (772) 231-4440 Facsimile (772) 231-4430

Mr. Timothy Michaud 1791 Wekiva Drive Melbourne, FL 32940

December 5, 2013

File #: 1682-001 Inv. #: 72272

Total Due: \$8,195.00

(

RE: Post-judgment issues

Please write the FILE number on your check to insure proper crediting.

SUMMARY

*Balance Fwd:

\$5,812.50

Payment received:

\$0.00)

Current Invoice Amount:

\$2,382.50

TOTAL DUE:

\$8,195.00

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	ATT'Y/L.A.
Nov-01-13	E-mails from and to Mr. Michaud regarding contact from minor child's school and with DCF investigator regarding inquiry to minor child's school requesting information on minor child's behavior, grades, and if any other issues to report	0.10	12.50	PCLA
Nov-02-13	Continue redacting billing statement for attorney/client privilege for attorney's fee hearing	0.50	62.50	PCLA
Nov-06-13	Review Supplemental Request for Production prepared by paralegal, Patti Cain	0.40	70.00	KMR
	Pursuant to Mr. Rossway's directions, draft Supplemental Request for Production of Documents	1.60	200.00	PCLA
	Pursuant to Mr. Rollin's review, amend Supplemental Request for Production of Documents	0.40	50.00	PCLA
Nov-07-13	N/C - Office conference with Mr. Rossway regarding redacting and identifying all billing regarding each contempt issues; office conference with Erin Arena	0.30	0.00	PCLA

	for assistance and regarding large project to isolate specific bill for each contempt issues, and redacting four years of billing		Page 3	324 of 324
Nov-09-13	Review Supplemental Final Judgement for all sanctions for contempt the Court will be addressing, and pull related Orders; begin review of all billing entries for segregating to determine fees incurred for each for each issue of contempt for sanctions to be determined by the Court	4.20	525.00	PCLA
Nov-11-13	Redact confidential information from billing statements	3.20	400.00	EALA
Nov-21-13	Receipt and review of Brevard DCF Report regarding July 15, 2013 abuse call; advise Mr. Rossway of DCF's findings of no indications of abuse and closing case	0.10	12.50	PCLA
	Continue and complete review of all time entries for segregating for designated sanctions in Final Judgment to determine fees for each sanction	2.50	312.50	PCLA
	Begin organizing all time entries for individual sanctions	0.90	112.50	PCLA
Nov-26-13	Continued redaction of billing records	2.10	262.50	EALA
	Work on determination of attorney's fees incurred for individual contempt charges using Excel Spreadsheets	2.90	362.50	PCLA
	Totals	19.20	\$2,382.50	
	Current Fees & Disbursements			\$2,382.50
	Previous Balance			\$5,812.50
	Previous Payments			\$0.00
	BALANCE DUE		1	\$8,195.00